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April 18, 2012
To: John Szerlag, City Manager
From: Susan A. Leirstein, Purchasing Director

Timothy L. Richnak, Public Works Director

Subject: Standard Purchasing Resolution 1: Award To Low Bidders —
Traffic Control Signs and Posts

Background

On March 15, 2012, bid proposals were received to furnish one-year requirements of traffic control
signs and posts. ltems were competitively bid in accordance with City Charter and Code with 92
vendors notified via the MITN system and five (5) companies responding. Quantities stated on the
bid tabulation are estimated and shall be purchased at quoted unit prices, on an as needed basis.

All items bid were separated into ten proposal categories, A — J and due to minimum shipment
requirements, contracts are to be awarded on a proposal by proposal basis. Proposal G is a set-up
fee to fabricate non-standard signs for all sizes listed in the contract. Therefore, all vendors
awarded sign material contracts shall also be awarded Proposal G.

Recommendation

City management recommends awarding contracts to provide one-year requirements of Traffic
Control Signs and Posts on a proposal by proposal basis to the following three (3) low total
bidders: 1) Vulcan Signs of Foley, AL for Proposals A, B, C, D, G, and H; 2) Lightle Enterprises of
Ohio of Frankfort, OH for Proposal E, F, G and |; and 3) MD Solutions of Plain City, OH for
Proposal J for an estimated total cost of $32,385.00 at unit prices contained in the bid tabulation,
opened March 15, 2012.

Fund Availability

Funds are available in the Operating Budgets of the Public Works Streets Division.
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CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 12-06
Opening Date -- 3/15/12 BID TABULATION Pg. 1 of 4
Date Reviewed -- 3/16/12 sl TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS
VENDOR NAME: MD Solutions Custom Carrier &
Products Corp Gable Inc
ITEM EST QTY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
PROPOSAL A: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE 3M HIGH INTENSITY ON ALUMINUM
1. 25 36" YIELD (R1-2) No Bid $ 17.04 | No Bid
2. 25 30" STOP (R1-1) $ 24.17
3. 10 36" STOP (R1-1) $ 35.49
4, 10 18" x 6" All Way (R1-4) $ 4.26
PROPOSAL A: EST TOTAL -- $ 1,427.75
PROPOSAL B: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE, 3M Diamond Grade, DG3 Reflective, Fluorescent Yellow Green
1. 10 36" S2-1  School Crossing No Bid $ 63.19 | No Bid
2. 20 30" S1-1  School Advanced $ 44.07
3. 10 36" S1-1  School Advanced $ 63.19
4, 10 24"x12"  Directional Arrow (W16-7p) $ 14.92
PROPOSAL B: EST TOTAL -- $ 2,294.40
PROPOSAL C: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - ONE COLOR -SIGN
1. 10 12" X 18" One Color No Bid $ 6.68 | No Bid
2 10 12" X24" One Color $ 9.01
3 10 12" X 36" One Color $ 12.67
4 10 18" X 6" One Color $ 4.26
5 20 18" X 18" One Color $ 10.16
6 10 24" X 24" One Color $ 16.87
7 100 24" X 30" One Color $ 21.02
8 10 24" X 36" One Color $ 24.50
9 75 30" X 30" One Color $ 25.58
10 10 36" X 36" One Color $ 36.57
11 10 48" X 24" One Color $ 32.74
12. 20 12" X 30" High Intensity $ 10.55
13. 20 12" X 36" High Intensity $ 12.67
14. 10 12" X 48" High Intensity $ 16.87
15. 10 18" X 60" High Intensity $ 30.70
16. 10 18" X 72" High Intensity $ 36.57
PROPOSAL C: EST TOTAL -- $ 6,962.50
PROPOSAL D: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE, TWO OR MORE COLORS-SIGN
1. 10 12" X 12" Two Color No Bid $ 6.04 | No Bid
2. 25 12" X 18" Two Color $ 7.12
3. 10 30" X 30" Three Color $ 28.32
PROPOSAL D: EST TOTAL -- $ 521.60
PROPOSAL E: 3M STANDARD PRE-PRINTED TRAFFICSIGN FACES
1. 750 12" X 12" No Parking Symbol R8-3A Faces | No Bid $ 3.16 | No Bid
2. 25 24" x 24" No Parking Symbol R8-3A Faces $ 7.75
3. 10 30" Stop Faces $ 10.76
4, 10 36" Yield Faces $ 7.27
PROPOSAL E: EST TOTAL -- $ 2,744.05
PROPOSAL F: DOUBLE FACED, HIGH INTENSITY TWO SIDED ON WHITE -SIGN
1. 25 9" X 30" Extruded Aluminum White $ 1879 | $ 18.23 | No Bid
2. 25 9" X 36" Extruded Aluminum White $ 2216 | $ 22.04
3. 25 9" X 42" Extruded Aluminum White $ 2552 | % 25.71
4, 50 6" X 24" Extruded Aluminum White $ 1174 | $ 9.84
5. 50 6" X 30" Extruded Aluminum White $ 1420 | $ 12.30
6. 25 6" X 36" Extruded Aluminum White $ 16.66 | $ 14.58
7. 10 6" X 42" Extruded Aluminum White $ 19.08 | $ 17.01
PROPOSAL F: EST TOTAL -- $ 3,566.05 [ $ 3,291.10




CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 12-06

Opening Date -- 3/15/12 BID TABULATION Pg. 2 of 4
Date Reviewed -- 3/16/12 TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS
VENDOR NAME: MD Solutions Custom Products Carrier &
Corporation Gable Inc
PROPOSAL G: SET UP FEES No Bid $45.00 Blank
PROPOSAL H: SOUARE TUBULAR SIGNPOSTS - PERFORATED - GALVANIZED STEEL - FHWA APPROVEL
1. 100 12 Ft X 1 3/4" - 14 Gauge $ 24811 $ 2431 $ 24.77
2. 100 9 Ft X 13/4" - 14 Gauge $ 1890 | $ 18.18 | $ 18.72
3. 200 3 Ft X 2" Base - 12 Gauge $ 9491 $ 9.08| $ 9.92
4, 50 15 Ft X 1-3/4" - 14 Gauge $ 3133 $ 30.30 | $ 37.15
PROPOSAL H: EST TOTAL -- $ 7,835.50 [ $ 7,580.00 | $ 8,190.50
PROPOSAL |: ROUND GALVANIZED STEEL POST, 2" NOMINAL SIZE .125 WALL THICKNESS
1. 100 12 FT Galvanized steel round post No Bid No Bid No Bid
PROPOSAL I: EST TOTAL --
PROPOSAL J: U-CHANNEL SIGNPOSTS
1. 50 12 FT - 3lbs Galvanized Steel $ 2781 | $ 30.04 No Bid
2. 100 12 FT - 3lbs Green Painted Steel $ 2250 | $ 23.19
3. 100 10 FT - 2lbs Green Painted Steel $ 13.00 | $ 13.32
4. 50 14 FT - 3lbs Green Painted Steel $ 2649 | $ 27.06
PROPOSAL J. EST TOTAL -- $ 6,265.00 | $ 6,506.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS | $ 6,265.00
DELIVERY: Minimum Shipment $500.00 $1,000.00 None
# of Days 30 30; post 80 30
CONTACT INFO: Hrs of Operation: 8:30-5pm 7-5pm 7-4:30pm
24 Hr Phone Number: Blank 800-367-1492 248-477-8700
DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE: Marked Blank Catalog #5 L-1
PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
WARRANTY: Standard 3M 1 year
DELIVERY: 3-5 weeks 30; post 80 30 days
EXCEPTIONS: Blank Listed in Bid None
ALL OR NONE AWARD YorN N N Y
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT: YorN Y Y Y
ATTEST:
Susan Riesterer HIGHLIGHTED ITEMS DENOTES LOW TOTAL BIDDER BY PROPOSAL

Emily Frontera

Kurt Bovensiep

Susan Leirstein Susan Leirstein CPPO CPPB
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CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 12-06

Opening Date -- 3/15/12 BID TABULATION Pg. 3 of 4
Date Reviewed -- 3/16/12 TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS
VENDOR NAME: Lightle Vulcan Signs
Enterprises of Ohio
ITEM EST QTY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
PROPOSAL A: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE 3M HIGH INTENSITY ON ALUMINUM
1. 25 36" YIELD (R1-2) $ 2054 [ $ 16.88
2. 25 30" STOP (R1-1) $ 2760 [ $ 23.35
3. 10 36" STOP (R1-1) $ 39.74 [ $ 33.88
4, 10 18" x 6" All Way (R1-4) $ 3421 $% 3.30
PROPOSAL A: EST TOTAL - $ 1,635.10 | $ 1,377.55

PROPOSAL B: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE, 3M Diamond Grade, DG3 Reflective, Fluorescent Yellow Green

D

1. 10 36" S2-1  School Crossing $ 63.00 [ $ 56.24
2. 20 30" S1-1  School Advanced $ 43751 % 39.10
3. 10 36" S1-1  School Advanced $ 63.00 | $ 56.24
4, 10 24"x12"  Directional Arrow (W16-7p) $ 14.00 | $ 13.29

PROPOSAL B: EST TOTAL -- $ 2,275.00 | $ 2,039.70

PROPOSAL C: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - ONE COLOR -SIGN

1. 10 12" X 18" One Color $ 6.85| 9% 6.05
2 10 12" X24" One Color $ 913 [ $ 8.15
3 10 12" X 36" One Color $ 13.70 [ § 12.80
4 10 18" X 6" One Color $ 342 (% 3.30
5 20 18" X 18" One Color $ 10.27 [ § 9.15
6 10 24" X 24" One Color $ 18.26 | $ 15.68
7 100 24" X 30" One Color $ 2283 % 19.60
8 10 24" X 36" One Color $ 2739 § 23.52
9 75 30" X 30" One Color $ 2853 | § 24.50
10 10 36" X 36" One Color $ 41.08 [ § 35.28
11 10 48" X 24" One Color $ 36.52 | § 31.36
12. 20 12" X 30" High Intensity $ 1141 [ § 11.25
13. 20 12" X 36" High Intensity $ 13.70 [ § 12.80
14. 10 12" X 48" High Intensity $ 18.26 | $ 15.68
15. 10 18" X 60" High Intensity $ 3424 | § 29.40
16. 10 18" X 72" High Intensity $ 41.08 [ § 35.28

PROPOSAL C: EST TOTAL -- $ 7,629.65 [ $ 6,626.50

PROPOSAL D: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SOUARE, TWO OR MORE COLORS-SIGN
1. 10 12" X 12" Two Color $ 4851] 9% 4.65
2. 25 12" X 18" Two Color $ 7231 9% 6.47
3. 10 30" X 30" Three Color $ 3169 [ $ 25.64
PROPOSAL D: EST TOTAL -- $ 546.15 | $ 464.65
PROPOSAL E: 3M STANDARD PRE-PRINTED TRAFFICSIGN FACES
1. 750 12" X 12" No Parking Symbol R8-3A Faces | $ 210 | $ 2.35
2. 25 24" x 24" No Parking Symbol R8-3A Faces | $ 840 | 9% 7.92
3. 10 30" Stop Faces $ 11.56 | $ 11.63
4, 10 36" Yield Faces $ 833 |% 7.24
PROPOSAL E: EST TOTAL -- $ 1,983.90 | $ 2,149.20
PROPOSAL F: DOUBLE FACED, HIGH INTENSITY, TWO SIDED ON WHITE - SIGN
1. 25 9" X 30" Extruded Aluminum White $ 1435 $ 14.70
2. 25 9" X 36" Extruded Aluminum White $ 1722 | $ 17.62
3. 25 9" X 42" Extruded Aluminum White $ 20.09 | $ 20.63
4, 50 6" X 24" Extruded Aluminum White $ 8.10 | $ 8.25
5. 50 6" X 30" Extruded Aluminum White $ 10.13 | $ 10.34
6. 25 6" X 36" Extruded Aluminum White $ 1215 $ 12.33
7. 10 6" X 42" Extruded Aluminum White $ 14.18 | $ 14.48
PROPOSAL F: EST TOTAL -- $ 2,648.55 | $ 2,706.30




CITY OF TROY

Opening Date -- 3/15/12
Date Reviewed -- 3/16/12

BID TABULATION
TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS

ITB-COT 12-06
Pg. 4 of 4

VENDOR NAME: Lightle Vulcan Signs
Enterprises of Ohio
PROPOSAL G: SET UP FEES $ 5.00 Call for Quote
PROPOSAL H: SOUARE TUBULAR SIGNPOSTS - PERFORATED - GALVANIZED STEEL - FHWA APPROVEL
1. 100 12 Ft X 1 3/4" - 14 Gauge $ 31.38| $ 23.52
2. 100 9 Ft X 1 3/4" - 14 Gauge $ 23541 % 17.64
3. 200 3 Ft X 2" Base - 12 Gauge $ 1125 $ 8.76
4, 50 15 Ft X 1-3/4" - 14 Gauge $ 39.23 | $ 29.40
PROPOSAL H: EST TOTAL -- $ 9,70350 | $ 7,338.00
PROPOSAL |: ROUND GALVANIZED STEEL POST, 2" NOMINAL SIZE .125 WALL THICKNESS
1. 100 12 FT Galvanized steel round post $ 36.40 No Bid
PROPOSAL I: EST TOTAL -- $ 3,640.00
PROPOSAL J: U-CHANNEL SIGNPOSTS
1. 50 12 FT - 3lbs Galvanized Steel $ 33.65| % 34.27
2. 100 12 FT - 3lbs Green Painted Steel $ 27.36 | $ 28.62
3. 100 10 FT - 2lbs Green Painted Steel $ 1520 | $ 15.90
4, 50 14 FT - 3lbs Green Painted Steel $ 31921 $ 33.38
PROPOSAL J: EST TOTAL - $ 753450 [ $  7,834.50
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS $ 8,272.45 | $  17,846.40
DELIVERY: Minimum Shipment $500.00 $50.00
# of Days 30 3-5 days stock items
30-45 days non-stock items
CONTACT INFO: Hrs of Operation: 8-4:30pm 7-4pm CST

24 Hr Phone Number:

DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE:
PAYMENT TERMS:

Marked

WARRANTY:

DELIVERY:

EXCEPTIONS:

Y orN
Y orN

ALL OR NONE AWARD
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:

G:\ITB-COT 12-06 Traffic Control Signs & Posts

740-703-6740

800-633-6845

Blank Blank
Net 30 days Net 30 days
Standard Standard
3-5 days stock items
30 days ARO 30-45 days non-stock items
Square posts min 1000# bundles of 25
Blank U-Channel posts min 1000# bundles of 50
N N
Y Y






