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CCIITTYY  CCOOUUNNCCIILL  AAGGEENNDDAA  IITTEEMM  
 

 
October 23, 2012 
 
 
To:   Michael W. Culpepper, Acting City Manager     
  
From:  Susan A. Leirstein, Purchasing Director 
  Timothy L. Richnak, Public Works Director 
 
Subject: Standard Purchasing Resolution 1: Award To Low Bidders – Water System Materials 
 
 
 
Background 
 
On October 15, 2012, bid proposals were received to furnish one-year requirements of water system 
materials.  Items were competitively bid in accordance with City Charter and Code with 210 vendors 
notified via the MITN website, and three (3) companies responded.  All items recommended 
represent the lowest bidder for each line item. Quantities are estimated and shall be purchased at 
quoted unit prices, on an as needed basis. 
 
 
Recommendation 
 
City management recommends awarding contracts to the following low bidders:  Gunners Meters & 
Parts of Pontiac, MI; SLC Meter Service, Inc of Davisburg, MI and EJ USA, Inc. of East Jordan, MI for 
an estimated total cost of $25,275.00, $7,264.75 and $69,231.00 respectively, at unit prices 
contained in the bid tabulation opened October 15, 2012. 
 
In addition, staff recommends Gunners Meters & Parts be awarded the contract to provide Item.6 – 
Mueller Improved Fire Hydrant Parts which are manufactured by Hydraflo and equal to Mueller at 
prices as contained on their parts list dated July 2011. 
 
 
Fund Availability 
 
Funds are available in the Water Department Operating Budgets. 
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 CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 12-20
Opening Date -- 10/15/12 BID TABULATION Page 1 of 2
Date Reviewed - 10/23/12 WATER SYSTEM MATERIALS

VENDOR NAME:

EST UNIT UNIT
ITEM # QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
ITEM #1 CURB BOX ITEMS

1 300 Ext Curb Box w/45" or 42" Stationary Rod 33.90$          10,170.00$       
MANUFACTURER
MODEL

ITEM #2 WATER SERVICE PARTS
1 250 1" CORPORATION STOPS w/nuts 32.90$          8,225.00$         
2 100 3/4"x 1" CCU or 3-part Union 13.90$          1,390.00$         
3 150 3/4"x 1" PBC or Piggy Back Coupling 11.50$          1,725.00$         
4 100 1" CCU or 3-part Unions 16.90$          1,690.00$         
5 100 1" CBS or Curb Stops 54.90$          5,490.00$         

MANUFACTURER
MODEL

ITEM #3 FULL CIRCLE REPAIR CLAMPS
1 25 8"x 12" FS1 OD 8.99"-9.79" Ductile Iron Pipe 200.00$        5,000.00$         

MANUFACTURER
MODEL

ITEM #4 VALVE BOX PARTS
2 25 D-Box Top Section 26" 57.50$          1,437.50$         56.05$       1,401.25$      
3 25 D-Box Lid 14.50$          362.50$            13.47$       336.75$         

MANUFACTURER

ITEM #5 MANHOLE FRAMES AND COVERS
1 100 EJIW 1040ZPT Frame & Cover - Sanitary 365.00$        36,500.00$       355.29$     35,529.00$    
2 100 EJIW 1040Z Frame & Cover - Water 325.00$        32,500.00$       319.64$     31,964.00$    

MANUFACTURER

ITEM #6
DISCOUNT
Parts Price List
Dated

ESTIMATED TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS:

CONTACT INFORMATION:
Hrs of Operation
24 Hr Phone No.

PAYMENT TERMS:

WARRANTY:

DELIVERY:
EXCEPTIONS:

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:  Signed - Y or N
ADDENDUM:  Attached - Y or N

PROPOSAL:  One-Year Requirements of Water System Materials
ATTEST:
Susan R. Riesterer HIGHLIGHTED AREAS DENOTE LOW BIDDERS
Emily Frontera
Susan Leirstein Susan Leirstein CPPO CPPB
Rick Shepler Purchasing Director
G:/WaterSystemMaterial ITB-COT 12-20

PARTS FOR MUELLER IMPROVED FIRE HYDRANTS DMS
5% 25%

all parts Hydraflow See attached EJIW

Ford

NoneListed in bid

12 Months

July 2011 Not As Specified

EJ USA, Inc.

A Y McDonald
4701B, 4758, 4755, 6104

A Y McDonald
5613

Gunners Meters

1-2 weeks

0 Net 30

313-215-5640 Steve Terry
8:00 am - 5:00 pm8-5 M-F

248-545-6304

Net 30

East Jordan Iron Works

East Jordan Iron Works

25,275.00$                                69,231.00$                          

Yes Yes

1 year

1-2 weeks

and Parts

Yes Yes

No Quote

No Quote
No Quote
No Quote
No Quote
No Quote

No Quote



 CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 12-20
Opening Date -- 10/15/12 BID TABULATION Page 2 of 2
Date Reviewed - 10/23/12 WATER SYSTEM MATERIALS

VENDOR NAME:

EST UNIT
ITEM # QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL
ITEM #1 CURB BOX ITEMS

1 300 Ext Curb Box w/45" or 42" Stationary Rod 34.04$          10,212.00$       
MANUFACTURER
MODEL

ITEM #2 WATER SERVICE PARTS
1 250 1" CORPORATION STOPS w/nuts 34.14$          8,535.00$         
2 100 3/4"x 1" CCU or 3-part Union 14.13$          1,413.00$         
3 150 3/4"x 1" PBC or Piggy Back Coupling 11.43$          1,714.50$         
4 100 1" CCU or 3-part Unions 16.71$          1,671.00$         
5 100 1" CBS or Curb Stops 55.99$          5,599.00$         

MANUFACTURER
MODEL

ITEM #3 FULL CIRCLE REPAIR CLAMPS
1 25 8"x 12" FS1 OD 8.99"-9.79" Ductile Iron Pipe 155.17$        3,879.25$         

MANUFACTURER
MODEL

ITEM #4 VALVE BOX PARTS
2 25 D-Box Top Section 26" 
3 25 D-Box Lid

MANUFACTURER

ITEM #5 MANHOLE FRAMES AND COVERS
1 100 EJIW 1040ZPT Frame & Cover - Sanitary
2 100 EJIW 1040Z Frame & Cover - Water

MANUFACTURER

ITEM #6
DISCOUNT
Parts Price List
Dated

ESTIMATED TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS:

CONTACT INFORMATION:
Hrs of Operation
24 Hr Phone No.

PAYMENT TERMS:

WARRANTY:

DELIVERY:
EXCEPTIONS:

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:  Signed - Y or N
ADDENDUM:  Attached - Y or N

PROPOSAL:  One-Year Requirements of Water System Materials

FOB
Listed in bid

7,264.75$                                  

8:00 am - 5:00 pm
(248) 240-1070

Net 30

Standard

Ford Meter Box
F52 - 979 - 125

East Jordan Iron Works

East Jordan Iron Works

PARTS FOR MUELLER IMPROVED FIRE HYDRANTS

SLC Meter Service

A Y McDonald
5613/5660

All brass bid as Ford Meter Box

No

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

Yes

No Bid
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