
 
November 19, 2012 
 
To:   Brian M. Kischnick, City Manager     
  
From:  Susan A. Leirstein, Purchasing Director 

Timothy L. Richnak, Public Works Director 
Kurt Bovensiep, Superintendent Parks, Streets, and Drains 

 
Subject: Standard Purchasing Resolution 1: Award To Low Bidder– Outdoor Light Maintenance 

and Repair 
 
Background 

On November 14, 2012, bids were opened to provide two (2) year requirements of street, parking 
lot, and athletic field light maintenance, LED installation and replacement with an option to renew 
for one additional year.  One-hundred seven (107) vendors were notified via the MITN website 
with four (4) bidders responding. Harlan Electric Company, of Rochester Hills, MI was the low 
total bidder. 
 
All bidders were given the opportunity to respond with their level of interest in furnishing all labor, 
materials, tools, equipment, transportation services and traffic controls for outdoor light 
maintenance and repairs. 
 
ITB-COT12- 22 to complete the Outdoor Light Maintenance Program was competitively bid as 
required by City Charter and Code. The award is contingent upon the recommended bidder’s 
submission of proper contracts and bid documents, including bonds, insurance certificates and all 
other specified requirements.  

 
Recommendation 

City management recommends awarding a contract to provide two (2) year requirements of street, 
parking lot, and athletic field light maintenance, LED installation and replacement with an option to 
renew for one additional year to the low total bidder, Harlan Electric Company, of Rochester Hills, 
MI for an estimated total cost of $118,036.40, at unit prices contained in the bid tabulation with all 
work not to exceed budgetary limitations.  

 
Fund Availability 

Funds are available in the various operating and capital accounts of the Public Works department. 
 
Prepared by: Marina Basta-Farouk, Project Manager 
 
G:\Bid Award 12/13 New Format\ Award Standard Purchasing Resolution 1 OutdoorLighting ITB-COT 12-22.doc  
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CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 12-22
Opening Date --11/14/12 BID TABULATION          Pg 1 of 8
Date Reviewed -- 11/18/12 STREET LIGHTING

VENDOR NAME:
CHECK # --
CHECK AMOUNT --

PROPOSAL A:  MAINTENANCE
EST UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY/YEAR Labor Only Total Labor Only Total 

1 500 14.40$         7,200.00$        58.00$             29,000.00$  

2 80 21.55$         1,724.00$        88.00$             7,040.00$    

3 60 21.55$         1,293.00$        58.00$             3,480.00$    

4 100 43.10$         4,310.00$        48.00$             4,800.00$    

5 20 14.40$         288.00$           58.00$             1,160.00$    

6 50 14.40$         720.00$           58.00$             2,900.00$    

7 20 43.10$         862.00$           70.00$             1,400.00$    

8 200 21.55$         4,310.00$        60.00$             12,000.00$  

9 5 86.25$         431.25$           100.00$           500.00$       

Estimated Total Proposal A - Labor

EST UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY/YEAR Material Only Total Material Only Total 

10-A 350 11.92$         4,172.00$        11.50$             4,025.00$    

10-B 150 11.92$         1,788.00$        11.50$             1,725.00$    

11-A 60 89.17$         5,350.20$        78.50$             4,710.00$    

11-B 20 89.17$         1,783.40$        68.50$             1,370.00$    

12 60 96.82$         5,809.20$        19.50$             1,170.00$    

13-A 100 6.90$          690.00$           10.00$             1,000.00$    

13-B 10 6.90$          69.00$             10.00$             100.00$       

13-C 10 27.85$         278.50$           14.50$             145.00$       

14 50 5.60$          280.00$           14.50$             725.00$       

15 120 0.52$          62.40$             0.70$               84.00$         

16 160 0.42$          67.20$             0.40$               64.00$         

17 160 0.42$          67.20$             0.40$               64.00$         

18 40 0.18$          7.20$               0.28$               11.20$         

19 1 295.00$       295.00$           440.00$           440.00$       

20 1 3,477.00$    3,477.00$        3,900.00$        3,900.00$    

21 1 873.85$       873.85$           780.00$           780.00$       

22 1 1,229.00$    1,229.00$        1,270.00$        1,270.00$    

23 1 256.00$       256.00$           200.00$           200.00$       

24 1 256.00$       256.00$           200.00$           200.00$       

Estimated Total Proposal A - Materials

25 Hourly labor rate per Crew 40 140.00$       5,600.00$        140.00$           5,600.00$    

Estimated Grand Total Proposal A-Labor & Materials

Replace Lamp

Replace Ballast

Replace Starter

Replace Fuse 

Replace Lens

Replace Photo Cell

21,138.25$                            62,280.00$                             

53,549.40$                            

400 WATT Lamp 1

26,811.15$                            21,983.20$                             

No. 8 AWG Cable Black

15' Mastarm

40' Self-weathering Steel Pole

Starter

5, 10, 15 AMP Fuse

30 amp Fuse

89,863.20$                             

564787
$2,500

No. 10 AWG Cable Bare

40' Wood Light Pole

250 WATT Lamp 1

400 WATT Ballast

Replace Breakers

Tighten and Lubricate

Remove & Replace Fixture

Northern Sign Co. Inc.
9028106081

$2,500

250 WATT Ballast

250 Watt HPS Fixture

400 Watt HPS Fixture

Photo Cell

1 1/2" Rigid Plastic Conduit

No. 8 AWG Cable Red

Harlan Electric Company

100 amp Fuse

8' Mastarm



CITY OF TROY
Opening Date --11/14/12 BID TABULATION ITB-COT 12-22
Date Reviewed -- 11/18/12 STREET LIGHTING          Pg 2 of 8

VENDOR NAME:
PROPOSAL A:  MAINTENANCE CONTINUED

25 Hourly labor rate per Crew
40 Hrs Regular Time

Overtime Time
Holiday Time

26 Journeyman Electrician
Regular Time
Overtime Time
Holiday Time

27 Hourly rate for Backhoe
Regular Time
Overtime Time
Holiday Time

28 Hourly rate for Service Truck with Crane
Regular Time
Overtime Time
Holiday Time

29 Non-Contract Replacement Parts: Discount + or -
Parts List:
Dated:

OR Invoices will be supplied Y or N
Parts quoted are manufactured by:

PROPOSAL B:  INSTALLATION AND REPLACEMENT
EST

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY/YEAR

1 1 ea

2 1 ea

3 1 ea

4 1 ea

5 1 ea

6 1 ea

7 1 ea

8 1 ea

9 1 ea

10 1 ea
11 Hourly labor rate per Crew 40 $140.00 5,600.00$        N/a

Estimated Total Proposal B

194.00$                                 
247.00$                                 

190.00$                                 
240.00$                                 

140.00$                                 140.00$                                 
PRICE/HOUR/CREW PRICE/HOUR/CREW

70.00$                                   
100.00$                                 
130.00$                                 

70.00$                                   
95.00$                                   

130.00$                                 

PRICE/HOUR/ELECTRICIAN PRICE/HOUR/ELECTRICIAN

PRICE/HOUR INCL OPERATOR

130.00$                                 
160.00$                                 
195.00$                                 

PRICE/HOUR INCL OPERATOR

110.00$                                 
145.00$                                 
175.00$                                 

PRICE/HOUR INCL OPERATOR

140.00$                                 
170.00$                                 
205.00$                                 

PRICE/HOUR INCL OPERATOR

110.00$                                 
145.00$                                 
175.00$                                 

Y
N/a

Harlan Electric Co Northern Sign Co. Inc.

+5%
N/a
N/a

+15%

Install 40' Light Wood Pole with 
mast arms-with one luminaire
Install 40' Light Wood Pole with 
mast arms-with two luminaires
New installation of 40' Street 
Light Pole with concrete 
foundation

Remove existing self-weathering 
steel Light Pole

Remove Existing wood Light Pole

Remove Concrete Foundations
Installation of Concrete 
Foundations
Install 40' Light Ornamental Pole 
with mast arms-with one 
luminaire
Install 40' Light Ornamental Pole 
with mast arms-with two 
luminaires

Cut & Weld Street Light Base H 
Base for EH-409

14,399.00$                            No Bid

Lump Sum Total Price for One 
(1)

Lump Sum Total Price for One 
(1)

337.00$                                 

337.00$                                 

715.00$                                 

1,335.00$                              

735.00$                                 

950.00$                                 

900.00$                                 

1,065.00$                              

2,095.00$                              

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

330.00$                                 No Bid



CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 12-22
Opening Date --11/14/12 STREET LIGHTING          Pg 3 of 8
Date Reviewed -- 11/18/12VENDOR NAME:

PROPOSAL B:  INSTALLATION AND REPLACEMENT CONTINUED
11 Hourly labor rate per Crew

40 Hrs Regular Time
Overtime Time
Holiday Time

12 Journeyman Electrician
Regular Time
Overtime Time
Holiday Time

13 Hourly rate for Backhoe
Regular Time
Overtime Time
Holiday Time

14 Hourly rate for Service Truck with Crane
Regular Time
Overtime Time
Holiday Time

15 Non-Contract Replacement Parts: Discount + or -
Parts List:
Dated:

OR Invoices will be supplied Y or N
Parts quoted are manufactured by:

PROPOSAL C:  REPLACEMENT AND INSTALLATION OF LED FIXTURE
EST Unit Unit

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY/YEAR Price Total Price Total

1 1 987.00$       987.00$           1,070.00$        1,070.00$    

2 12 987.00$       11,844.00$      1,070.00$        12,840.00$  

3 36 987.00$       35,532.00$      1,070.00$        38,520.00$  

4 20 86.25$         1,725.00$        100.00$           2,000.00$    

Estimated Total Proposal C

Estimated Grand Total Proposals A - C

PRICE/HOUR/CREW PRICE/HOUR/CREW

140.00$                                 140.00$                                 
194.00$                                 190.00$                                 
247.00$                                 240.00$                                 

PRICE/HOUR/ELECTRICIAN PRICE/HOUR/ELECTRICIAN

70.00$                                   70.00$                                   
100.00$                                 95.00$                                   
130.00$                                 130.00$                                 

PRICE/HOUR INCL OPERATOR PRICE/HOUR INCL OPERATOR

130.00$                                 110.00$                                 
160.00$                                 145.00$                                 
195.00$                                 175.00$                                 

PRICE/HOUR INCL OPERATOR PRICE/HOUR INCL OPERATOR

N/a
N/a

140.00$                                 110.00$                                 
170.00$                                 145.00$                                 
205.00$                                 175.00$                                 

N/a

+5% +15%

Remove existing fixture and 
replace with CREE/BETA LED 
Type III parking lot luminare with 
fixture pole bracket or approved 
equal - labor and material
Remove existing fixture and 
replace with CREE/BETA LED 
Type II parking lot luminare with 
fixture pole bracket or approved 
equal - labor and material
Remove existing fixture and 
replace with CREE/BETA LED 
type V parking lot luminare with 
fixture pole bracket or approved 
equal - labor and material
Remove existing fixture and 
replace with LED road way labor 
only/per fixture

50,088.00$                            54,430.00$                             

118,036.40$                          -$                                       

Harlan Electric Co Northern Sign Co. Inc.

Y



CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 12-22
Opening Date --11/14/12 BID TABULATION          Pg 4 of 8
Date Reviewed -- 11/18/12 STREET LIGHTING

VENDOR NAME:

CONTACT INFORMATION: Hrs of Operation
24-Hr Phone #

WORK CERTIFIED TO BE 100% of contract
COMPLETE WITHIN THE Proposal A
TIME ALLOWABLE Proposal B

Proposal C

PROPOSED PAYMENT SCHEDULE:

INSURANCE: Can Meet
Cannot Meet

RESPONSE TIME:

WARRANTY:

EXCEPTIONS:

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT: Y or N

PROPOSAL:  FURNISH ALL LABOR, TOOLS, EQUIPMENT, TRANSPORTATION SERVICES AND TRAFFIC
CONTROLS TO PROVIDE TWO-YEAR REQUIREMENTS OF STREET, PARKING LOT, AND
ATHLETIC FIELD LIGHT MAINTENANCE, LED INSTALLATION AND REPLACEMENT WITH AN 
OPTION TO RENEW FOR ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR.

ATTEST: HIGHLIGHTED AREA DENOTES LOW TOTAL BIDDER
Marina Basta-Farouk _______________________________
Susan Riesterer Susan Leirstein CPPO CPPB
Susan Leirstein Purchasing Director
G:ITB-COT 12-22 Street lighting

Y

None

Y

30 days

48 hours

As Specified

Blank

48 hours

7:00 am to 5:00 pm
248-333-7938

X

Net 30 days

X

X

X

X

7:30 am to 4:00 pm
248-379-5446

X
X
X

Harlan Electric Co Northern Sign Co. Inc.



CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 12-22
Opening Date --11/14/12 BID TABULATION          Pg 5 of 8
Date Reviewed -- 11/18/12 STREET LIGHTING

VENDOR NAME:

CHECK # --
CHECK AMOUNT --

PROPOSAL A:  MAINTENANCE
EST UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY/YEAR Labor Only Total Labor Only Total 

1 500 75.00$         37,500.00$      130.00$           65,000.00$  

2 80 125.00$       10,000.00$      195.00$           15,600.00$  

3 60 125.00$       7,500.00$        195.00$           11,700.00$  

4 100 100.00$       10,000.00$      130.00$           13,000.00$  

5 20 100.00$       2,000.00$        130.00$           2,600.00$    

6 50 75.00$         3,750.00$        130.00$           6,500.00$    

7 20 150.00$       3,000.00$        225.00$           4,500.00$    

8 200 250.00$       50,000.00$      195.00$           39,000.00$  

9 5 150.00$       750.00$           260.00$           1,300.00$    

Estimated Total Proposal A - Labor

EST UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY/YEAR Material Only Total Material Only Total 

10-A 350 14.71$         5,148.50$        25.00$             8,750.00$    

10-B 150 14.71$ 2,206.50$ 25.00$ 3,750.00$

159,200.00$                            

400 WATT Lamp 1

250 WATT Lamp 1

Replace Lens

Replace Photo Cell

Replace Breakers

Tighten and Lubricate

Remove & Replace Fixture

124,500.00$                            

$2,500 $2,500

Replace Lamp

Replace Ballast

Replace Starter

Replace Fuse 

Michigan State Corby Energy Services Inc.
Electric LLC

95619 494216

10 B 150 14.71$        2,206.50$       25.00$             3,750.00$   

11-A 60 84.00$         5,040.00$        125.00$           7,500.00$    

11-B 20 92.00$         1,840.00$        118.00$           2,360.00$    

12 60 50.00$         3,000.00$        50.00$             3,000.00$    

13-A 100 10.00$         1,000.00$        7.00$               700.00$       

13-B 10 10.00$         100.00$           5.60$               56.00$         

13-C 10 30.00$         300.00$           23.00$             230.00$       

14 50 25.00$         1,250.00$        25.00$             1,250.00$    

15 120 0.75$           90.00$             0.85$               102.00$       

16 160 0.40$           64.00$             0.45$               72.00$         

17 160 0.40$           64.00$             0.45$               72.00$         

18 40 0.30$           12.00$             0.35$               14.00$         

19 1 400.00$       400.00$           425.00$           425.00$       

20 1 4,000.00$    4,000.00$        2,750.00$        2,750.00$    

21 1 800.00$       800.00$           1,000.00$        1,000.00$    

22 1 1,300.00$    1,300.00$        1,500.00$        1,500.00$    

23 1 375.00$       375.00$           335.00$           335.00$       

24 1 375.00$       375.00$           335.00$           335.00$       

Estimated Total Proposal A - Materials

25 Hourly labor rate per Crew 40 180.00$       7,200.00$        250.00$           10,000.00$  

Estimated Grand Total Proposal A-Labor & Materials

15' Mastarm

250 Watt HPS Fixture

400 Watt HPS Fixture

27,365.00$                              34,201.00$                              

159,065.00$                            203,401.00$                            

No. 8 AWG Cable Red

No. 8 AWG Cable Black

No. 10 AWG Cable Bare

40' Wood Light Pole

40' Self-weathering Steel Pole

8' Mastarm

Starter

5, 10, 15 AMP Fuse

30 amp Fuse

100 amp Fuse

Photo Cell

1 1/2" Rigid Plastic Conduit

250 WATT Lamp 1

400 WATT Ballast

250 WATT Ballast



Opening Date --11/14/12 CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 12-22
Date Reviewed -- 11/18/12 STREET LIGHTING          Pg 6 of 8

VENDOR NAME:
PROPOSAL A:  MAINTENANCE CONTINUED

25 Hourly labor rate per Crew
40 Hrs Regular Time

Overtime Time
Holiday Time

26 Journeyman Electrician
Regular Time
Overtime Time
Holiday Time

27 Hourly rate for Backhoe
Regular Time
Overtime Time
Holiday Time

28 Hourly rate for Service Truck with Crane
Regular Time
Overtime Time
Holiday Time

29 Non-Contract Replacement Parts: Discount + or -
Parts List:
Dated:

OR Invoices will be supplied Y or N
Parts quoted are manufactured by:

PROPOSAL B:  INSTALLATION AND REPLACEMENT
EST

Graybar plus 15% + 6% N/a

Lump Sum Total Price for One Lump Sum Total Price for One 

Graybar
11/13/2012

Y

150.00$                                   125.00$                                   
175.00$                                   160.00$                                   

+15% +15%

150.00$                                   150.00$                                   

PRICE/HOUR INCL OPERATOR PRICE/HOUR INCL OPERATOR

125.00$                                   110.00$                                   

PRICE/HOUR INCL OPERATOR PRICE/HOUR INCL OPERATOR

100.00$                                   85.00$                                     
125.00$                                   120.00$                                   

80.00$                                     75.00$                                     
115.00$                                   98.00$                                     
150.00$                                   130.00$                                   

260.00$                                   375.00$                                   
325.00$                                   500.00$                                   

PRICE/HOUR/ELECTRICIAN PRICE/HOUR/ELECTRICIAN

Michigan State Electric LLC Corby Energy Services Inc.

PRICE/HOUR/CREW PRICE/HOUR/CREW

180.00$                                   250.00$                                   

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY/YEAR

1 1 ea

2 1 ea

3 1 ea

4 1 ea

5 1 ea

6 1 ea

7 1 ea

8 1 ea

9 1 ea

10 1 ea
11 Hourly labor rate per Crew 40 $180.00 7,200.00$        $250.00 10,000.00$  

Estimated Total Proposal B

Cut & Weld Street Light Base H 
Base for EH-409 2,000.00$                                1,750.00$                                

18,850.00$                              24,850.00$                              

Install 40' Light Wood Pole with 
mast arms-with two luminaires 1,400.00$                                1,450.00$                                
New installation of 40' Street 
Light Pole with concrete 
foundation 2,400.00$                                3,400.00$                                

Install 40' Light Ornamental Pole 
with mast arms-with two 
luminaires 1,500.00$                                1,150.00$                                
Install 40' Light Wood Pole with 
mast arms-with one luminaire 1,200.00$                                1,450.00$                                

Installation of Concrete 
Foundations 950.00$                                   2,250.00$                                
Install 40' Light Ornamental Pole 
with mast arms-with one 
luminaire 1,250.00$                                1,150.00$                                

Remove Existing wood Light 
Pole 350.00$                                   750.00$                                   

Remove Concrete Foundations 300.00$                                   750.00$                                   

p
(1)

p
(1)

Remove existing self-weathering 
steel Light Pole 300.00$                                   750.00$                                   
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VENDOR NAME:

PROPOSAL B:  INSTALLATION AND REPLACEMENT CONTINUED
11 Hourly labor rate per Crew

40 Hrs Regular Time
Overtime Time
Holiday Time

12 Journeyman Electrician
Regular Time
Overtime Time
Holiday Time

13 Hourly rate for Backhoe
Regular Time
Overtime Time
Holiday Time

14 Hourly rate for Service Truck with Crane
Regular Time
Overtime Time
Holiday Time

15 Non-Contract Replacement Parts: Discount + or -
Parts List:
Dated:

OR Invoices will be supplied Y or N Y

+15% +15%
Graybar

11/13/2012

125.00$                                   110.00$                                   
150.00$                                   125.00$                                   
175.00$                                   160.00$                                   

125.00$                                   120.00$                                   
150.00$                                   150.00$                                   

PRICE/HOUR INCL OPERATOR PRICE/HOUR INCL OPERATOR

150.00$                                   130.00$                                   

PRICE/HOUR INCL OPERATOR PRICE/HOUR INCL OPERATOR

100.00$                                   85.00$                                     

PRICE/HOUR/ELECTRICIAN PRICE/HOUR/ELECTRICIAN

80.00$                                     75.00$                                     
115.00$                                   98.00$                                     

180.00$                                   250.00$                                   
260.00$                                   375.00$                                   
325.00$                                   500.00$                                   

Electric LLC

PRICE/HOUR/CREW PRICE/HOUR/CREW

Michigan State Corby Energy Services Inc.

OR Invoices will be supplied Y or N
Parts quoted are manufactured by:

PROPOSAL C:  REPLACEMENT AND INSTALLATION OF LED FIXTURE
EST Unit Unit

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY/YEAR Price Total Price Total

1 1 1,125.00$    1,125.00$        1,500.00$        1,500.00$    

2 12 1,125.00$    13,500.00$      1,450.00$        17,400.00$  

3 36 1,125.00$    40,500.00$      1,385.00$        49,860.00$  

4 20 300.00$       6,000.00$        275.00$           5,500.00$    

Estimated Total Proposal C

Estimated Grand Total Proposals A - C

Remove existing fixture and 
replace with CREE/BETA LED 
type V parking lot luminare with 
fixture pole bracket or approved 
equal - labor and material
Remove existing fixture and 
replace with LED road way labor 
only/per fixture

61,125.00$                              74,260.00$                              

239,040.00$                            302,511.00$                            

Y
Graybar plus 15% + 6% N/a

Remove existing fixture and 
replace with CREE/BETA LED 
Type III parking lot luminare with 
fixture pole bracket or approved 
equal - labor and material
Remove existing fixture and 
replace with CREE/BETA LED 
Type II parking lot luminare with 
fixture pole bracket or approved 
equal - labor and material
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STREET LIGHTING

VENDOR NAME:

CONTACT INFORMATION: Hrs of Operation
24-Hr Phone #

WORK CERTIFIED TO BE 100% of contract
COMPLETE WITHIN THE Proposal A
TIME ALLOWABLE Proposal B

Proposal C

PROPOSED PAYMENT SCHEDULE:

INSURANCE: Can Meet
Cannot Meet

RESPONSE TIME:

WARRANTY:

EXCEPTIONS:

As Specified

Blank Blank

X X

Negotiable 48 hours

X

100% of invoice within Monthly
10 days

X X
X
X

5 am - 9 pm 7 am to 5 pm
517-541-9890 313-350-2420

Michigan State Corby Energy Services Inc.
Electric LLC

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT: Y or N

PROPOSAL:  FURNISH ALL LABOR, TOOLS, EQUIPMENT, TRANSPORTATION SERVICES AND TRAFFIC
CONTROLS TO PROVIDE TWO-YEAR REQUIREMENTS OF STREET, PARKING LOT, AND
ATHLETIC FIELD LIGHT MAINTENANCE, LED INSTALLATION AND REPLACEMENT WITH AN 
OPTION TO RENEW FOR ONE ADDITIONAL YEAR.

G:ITB-COT 12-22 Street lighting

Y Y
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