
October 21, 2005  
 
To:   John Szerlag, City Manager 
 
From:  Brian P. Murphy, Assistant City Manager/Services 
  Jeanette Bennett, Purchasing Director 
  Timothy L. Richnak, Public Works Director 
 
Re: Agenda Item - Standard Purchasing Resolution 1:  Bid Award – 

Low Bidders   – Traffic Control Signs and Posts 
 
RECOMMENDATION 
Bid proposals were opened October 19, 2005, for one (1) year requirements of 
Traffic Control Signs and Posts with an option to renew for one (1) year.  After 
reviewing the bid proposals, City management recommends awarding contracts 
to the lowest bidders at an estimated total cost of $27,444.00 per year, at unit 
prices contained in the attached bid tabulation.  These signs and posts are 
required for new installations, as well as for repair and replacement.  Material to 
be ordered throughout the year as needed. 
 
SUMMARY 
VULCAN SIGNS – FOLEY, AL 
 
I ESTIMATED       UNIT 
ITEM       QTY  DESCRIPTION   PRICE  
PROPOSAL A:  Complete signs, single face, 3M High Intensity on Aluminum 
1.  50   36” Yield    $ 16.95 
2.  50   30” Stop    $ 24.17 
3.  10   36” Stop    $ 34.77 
 
PROPOSAL B:  Complete Signs, Standard, Warning Diamond, Rectangular or 
Square- One Color EG on Aluminum 
1. 20   12”x36”    $   8.97 
2. 30   18”x18”    $   6.75 
3. 50   24”x30””    $ 14.95 
4. 50   30”x30”    $ 18.69 
5. 10   36”x36”    $ 26.91 
6. 10   48”48”     $ 47.84 
 
PROPOSALC:  Complete Signs, Standard, Warning Diamond, Rectangular or 
Square- Two Color EG on Aluminum 
2. 50   12”x18”    $   5.08 
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SUMMARY – continued 
 
VULCAN SIGNS – FOLEY, AL 
PROPOSAL E:  Complete signs, Double Faced, Two Sided on White – One Color 
1. 40   9”x30” Extruded Hi Int Wht  $ 15.10 
2. 40   9”x36” Extruded Hi Int Wht  $ 18.16 
3. 40   9”x42” Extruded Hi Int Wht  $ 21.19 
4. 40   6”x24” Extruded Hi Int Wht  $    8.35 
5. 100   6”x30” Extruded Hi Int Wht  $    9.36 
6. 100   6”x36” Extruded Hi Int Wht  $ 11.23 
7. 50   6”x42” Extruded Hi Int Wht  $ 13.09 
 
PROPOSAL F:  Set up fees for any listed size to fabricate a non-standard sign. 
         Call for pricing. 
 

ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL -   $10,694.60 
 
OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC. – LOGAN, OH 
PROPOSAL B:  Complete Signs, Standard, Warning Diamond, Rectangular or 
Square- One Color EG on Aluminum 
7. 50   12”X30” Hi Int w/Round Corners $   7.73 
8.   100   12”X36” Hi Int w/Round Corners $   9.27 
9. 20   12”X42” Hi Int w/Round Corners $ 10.82 
10. 100   12”X48” Hi Int w/Round Corners $ 12.36 
 
PROPOSALC:  Complete Signs, Standard, Warning Diamond, Rectangular or 
Square- Two Color EG on Aluminum 
1. 50   12”x12” 2-Color   $   3.44 
 
PROPOSAL F:  Set up fees for any listed size to fabricate a non-standard sign.  
         No Charge 
 

ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL -   $2,937.90 
 
ROCAL, INC – FRANKFORT, OH 
PROPOSAL D:  3M Standard Pre-Printed Traffic Sign Faces. 
1. 500   12”x12” No Parking Symbol $   1.22 
    R8-3A 
 

ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL -   $610.00 
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UNISTRUT DETROIT SERVICE CO. – WAYNE, MI 
PROPOSAL G:  Square Tubular Sign Posts – Perforated – Galvanized Steel – 
FHWA Approved 
1. 100   12 FT x 1-3/4” – 14 gauge  $ 17.28 
2. 100     9 FT x 1-1/2” – 14 gauge  $ 13.20 
 

ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL -   $3,048.00 
 

ALLIED MUNICIPAL SUPPLY – TAYLORVILLE, IL 
PROPOSAL G:  Square Tubular Sign Posts – Perforated – Galvanized Steel – 
FHWA Approved 
3. 100   3 FT x 2” Base – 12 gauge  $   8.38 
4.  100   3 FT x1 ¾” Base – 12 gauge $   7.14 
 
 
PROPOSAL H:  Round Galvanized Steel Post, 2” nominal size, 2-1/8” ID, 2-3/8” 
OD, .125 wall thickness, 3 lbs per lineal foot 
1. 100   12 FT Round Steel Post  $ 20.31  
    Galvanized 
 

ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL -   $3,583.00 
 
DORNBOS SIGN & SAFETY INC. – CHARLOTTE, MI 
PROPOSAL I:  U-Channel Sign Posts 
1. 50   12 FT – 3lb Galvanized Post  $ 25.27 
2. 100   12 FT – 3lb Green Post  $ 19.89 
3. 300   10 FT – 2lb Green Post  $ 11.06 
 

ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL -   $6,570.50 
 
 
BUDGET 
Funds are available in the Streets Department 2005-2006 Operating Budget. 
 
 
101 Vendors Notified on the MITN System 
    9 Bid Responses Rec’d 
 

 
 

Prepared by: Emily Frontera, Administrative Aide 



CITY OF TROY    ITB-COT 05-47
Opening Date -- 10/19/05 BID TABULATION Pg. 1 of 6
Date Prepared -- 10/24/05 TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS

VENDOR NAME: VULCAN OSBURN ROCAL ALLIED

SIGNS ASSOCIATES INC MUNICIPAL

INC SUPPLY

ITEM EST QTY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
PROPOSAL A: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE 3M HIGH INTENSITY ON ALUMINUM NO BID

1. 50 36" YIELD 16.95$          19.80$        19.98$          
2. 50 30" STOP 24.17$          25.25$        27.09$          
3. 10 36" STOP 34.77$          36.36$       39.01$         

PROPOSAL A:  EST TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS -- 2,403.70$     -$            -$            

PROPOSAL B: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - ONE COLOR - SIGN NO BID
1. 20 12" X 36" One Color 8.97$            9.27$          10.80$          
2. 30 18" X 18" One Color 6.75$            6.95$          8.10$           
3. 50 24" X 30" One Color 14.95$          15.45$        18.00$          
4. 50 30" X 30" One Color 18.69$          19.31$        22.50$          
5. 10 36" X 36" One Color 26.91$          27.81$        32.40$          
6. 10 48" X 48" One Color 47.84$          49.44$        57.60$          
7. 50 12" X 30 Hi Int W/Round Corners 10.13$           7.73$          11.10$          
8. 100 12" X 36 Hi Int W/Round Corners 12.15$           9.27$          13.32$          
9. 20 12" X 42 Hi Int W/Round Corners 14.18$           10.82$       15.54$          
10. 100 12" X 48 Hi Int W/Round Corners 16.20$           12.36$       17.76$          

PROPOSAL B:  EST TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS-- 2,811.40$     2,765.90$   -$            

PROPOSAL C: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE, TWO OR MORE COLORS-SIGN
1. 50 12" X 12" Two Color 3.70$             3.44$          3.60$           
2. 50 12" X 18" Two Color 5.08$            5.16$          5.40$           

PROPOSAL C:  EST TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS-- 254.00$        172.00$      -$            NO BID

PROPOSAL D: 3M STANDARD PRE-PRINTED TRAFFIC SIGN FACES NO BID
1. 500 12" X 12" No Parking Symbol R8-3A *        $1.42 1.61$          1.22$          

PROPOSAL D:  EST TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS-- -$              -$            610.00$        

PROPOSAL E: DOUBLE FACED, TWO SIDED ON WHITE - SIGN NO MESSAGE NO BID
1. 40 9" X 30" Extruded High Intensity White 15.10$          16.50$        16.80$          
2. 40 9" X 36" Extruded High Intensity White 18.16$          19.80$        19.96$          
3. 40 9" X 42" Extruded High Intensity White 21.19$          23.10$        23.14$          
4. 40 6" X 24" Extruded High Intensity White 8.35$            13.20$        9.96$           
5. 100 6" X 30" Extruded High Intensity White 9.36$            16.50$        12.43$          
6. 100 6" X 36" Extruded High Intensity White 11.23$          19.80$        14.98$          
7. 50 6" X 42" Extruded High Intensity White 13.09$          23.10$        17.43$          

PROPOSAL E:  EST TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS-- 5,225.50$     -$            -$            

PROPOSAL F: SET UP FEES CALL FOR PRICING NONE CALL FOR PRICING BLANK

PROPOSAL G: SQUARE TUBULAR SIGN POSTS - PERFORATED - GALVANIZED STEEL - FHWA APPROVED
1. 100 12 Ft X 1 3/4" - 14 Gauge NO BID NO BID NO BID 18.56$        
2. 100   9 Ft X 1 1/2" - 14 Gauge NO BID NO BID NO BID 13.46$        
3. 100   3 Ft X 2 " Base - 12 Gauge NO BID NO BID NO BID 8.38$         
4. 100   3 Ft X 1 3/4 " Base - 12 Gauge NO BID NO BID NO BID 7.14$         

PROPOSAL G:  EST TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS-- 1,552.00$   



CITY OF TROY    ITB-COT 05-47
Opening Date -- 10/19/05 BID TABULATION Pg. 2 of 6
Date Prepared -- 10/24/05 TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS

VENDOR NAME: VULCAN OSBURN ROCAL ALLIED

SIGNS ASSOCIATES INC MUNICIPAL

INC SUPPLY

PROPOSAL H: ROUND GALVANIZED STEEL POST, 2" NOMINAL SIZE .125 WALL THICKNESS
1. 100 12 FT Galvanized steel round post NO BID NO BID NO BID 20.31$       

PROPOSAL H:  EST TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS-- 2,031.00$   

PROPOSAL I: U-CHANNEL SIGN POSTS ONE SHIPMENT ONLY

1. 50 12 FT - 3lbs Silver Galvanized Steel 27.46$           NO BID 26.56$          26.08
2. 100 12 FT - 3lbs Green Painted Steel 22.69$           NO BID 22.38$          23.04
3. 300 10 FT - 2lbs Green Painted Steel 12.60$           NO BID 12.95$          12.59

PROPOSAL I:  EST TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS-- -$              -$            -$           

ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS: 10,694.60$   2,937.90$   610.00$        3,583.00$   
DELIVERY: - WAIVED - 

Minimum Shipment $50.00 NONE 1,000$          $1,000
# of Days 3-5 DAYS STD; 30 DAYS 45-60 DAYS 30-60 DAYS 30-45 ARO

NON STANDARD

CONTACT INFO: Hrs of Operation: M-F / 7-4 8-5PM EST 8-4:30 7-4PM
24 Hr Emergency # N/A (800)523-8917 BLANK BLANK

TERMS: NET 30 DAYS NET 30 DAYS NET 30 N30

WARRANTY: STD 3M STD 3M STD N/A
3-5 DAYS STOCK

DELIVERY: 30 DAYS NON-STANDARD 45-60 DAYS 30-60 DAYS ARO 30-45 ARO

EXCEPTIONS: AS OF 11/1/05, HEAT COMPLETE ENGR BLANK BLANK
ACTIVATED MAT'L GRADE SIGNS ARE

IS NO LONGER PRESSURE 

AVAILABLE SENSITIVE NOT HEAT

ACTIVATED

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:   Y or N YES YES YES YES

ATTEST: BOLDFACE TYPE DENOTES LOW BIDDER
  Emily Frontera
  Cheryl Stewart
  Thomas Rosewarne
  Linda Bockstanz
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CITY OF TROY    ITB-COT 05-47
Opening Date -- 10/19/05 BID TABULATION Pg. 3 of 6
Date Prepared -- 10/24/05 TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS

VENDOR NAME: DORNBOS UNISTRUT SUBCON CARRIER &

SIGN & INTERN'L CABLE INC

SAFETY INC

ITEM EST QTY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
PROPOSAL A: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE 3M HIGH INTENSITY ON ALUMINUM NO BID

1. 50 36" YIELD 28.00$           NO BID 20.54$          
2. 50 30" STOP 30.00$           NO BID 24.96$          
3. 10 36" STOP 40.00$          NO BID 36.40$         

PROPOSAL A:  EST TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS -- -$              -$            

PROPOSAL B: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - ONE COLOR - SIGN NO BID
1. 20 12" X 36" One Color 13.00$           NO BID 12.32$          
2. 30 18" X 18" One Color 9.50$             9.24$           
3. 50 24" X 30" One Color 21.00$           20.54$          
4. 50 30" X 30" One Color 26.00$           25.67$          
5. 10 36" X 36" One Color 37.50$           36.97$          
6. 10 48" X 48" One Color 66.25$           65.13$          
7. 50 12" X 30 Hi Int W/Round Corners 14.00$           10.27$          
8. 100 12" X 36 Hi Int W/Round Corners 16.50$           12.32$          
9. 20 12" X 42 Hi Int W/Round Corners 19.00$           14.37$          
10. 100 12" X 48 Hi Int W/Round Corners 22.00$           NO BID 16.43$          

PROPOSAL B:  EST TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS-- -$              -$            

PROPOSAL C: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE, TWO OR MORE COLORS-SIGN
1. 50 12" X 12" Two Color 4.15$             NO BID 4.37$           NO BID
2. 50 12" X 18" Two Color 6.25$             NO BID 27.47$          NO BID

PROPOSAL C:  EST TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS-- -$              -$            

PROPOSAL D: 3M STANDARD PRE-PRINTED TRAFFIC SIGN FACES NO BID
1. 500 12" X 12" No Parking Symbol R8-3A 2.50$            NO BID 4.37$          

PROPOSAL D:  EST TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS-- 1,250.00$     2,185.00$     
PROPOSAL E: DOUBLE FACED, TWO SIDED ON WHITE - SIGN NO BID

1. 40 9" X 30" Extruded Hight Intensity White 18.65$           NO BID 19.76$          
2. 40 9" X 30" Extruded High Intensity White 22.32$           23.92$          
3. 40 9" X 36" Extruded High Intensity White 26.25$           27.04$          
4. 40 9" X 42" Extruded High Intensity White 10.49$           10.92$          
5. 100 6" X 24" Extruded High Intensity White 13.15$           14.87$          
6. 100 6" X 30" Extruded High Intensity White 16.00$           20.02$          
7. 50 6" X 36" Extruded High Intensity White 19.25$           23.92$          

6" X 42" Extruded High Intensity White
PROPOSAL E:  EST TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS-- -$              -$            

PROPOSAL F: SET UP FEES $10.00 / SETUP BLANK NO CHARGE NO BID

PROPOSAL G: SQUARE TUBULAR SIGN POSTS - PERFORATED - GALVANIZED STEEL - FHWA APPROVED
1. 100 12 Ft X 1 3/4" - 14 Gauge NO BID 17.28$       NO BID 26.10$        

($144.00CF/FT)
2. 100   9 Ft X 1 1/2" - 14 Gauge NO BID 13.20$       NO BID 26.72$        

($132.00CF/FT)
3. 100   3 Ft X 2 " Base - 12 Gauge NO BID 8.76$          NO BID 10.65$        
4. 100   3 Ft X 1 3/4 " Base - 12 Gauge NO BID 7.58$          NO BID 9.90$          



PROPOSAL G:  EST TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS-- 3,048.00$   

CITY OF TROY    ITB-COT 05-47
Opening Date -- 10/19/05 BID TABULATION Pg. 4 of 6
Date Prepared -- 10/24/05 TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS

VENDOR NAME: DORNBOS UNISTRUT SUBCON CARRIER

SIGN & DETROIT INTERN'L & GABLE INC

SAFETY SERVICE CO

PROPOSAL H: ROUND GALVANIZED STEEL POST, 2" NOMINAL SIZE .125 WALL THICKNESS
1. 100 12 FT Galvanized steel round post 40.00$          NO BID NO BID NO BID

PROPOSAL H:  EST TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS--

PROPOSAL I: U-CHANNEL SIGN POSTS
1. 50 12 FT - 3lbs Silver Galvanized Steel 25.27$          NO BID NO BID NO BID
2. 100 12 FT - 3lbs Green Painted Steel 19.89$          NO BID NO BID NO BID
3. 300 10 FT - 2lbs Green Painted Steel 11.06$          NO BID NO BID NO BID

PROPOSAL I:  EST TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS-- 6,570.50$     

ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS: 6,570.50$     3,048.00$   N/A N/A
DELIVERY:

Minimum Shipment NONE MINIMUM NONE $1,000
# of Days 14-30 10 DAYS 30 DAYS 10 DAYS

CONTACT INFO: Hrs of Operation: 7-5PM 8 HOURS 8-5PM  ET M-F  8-4PM
24 Hr Emergency # (517)543-4001 (734)788-9452 (616)304-2208 (248)477-8700

TERMS: NET 30 BLANK NET 30 0

WARRANTY: 3M BLANK STD 3M ONE YEAR

DELIVERY: 14-30 DAYS BLANK 30 DAYS 10 DAYS

EXCEPTIONS: ATTACHED TO BID NONE ONE LOT BLANK
PRICING

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:   Y or N YES YES NO YES

BOLDFACE TYPE DENOTES LOW BIDDER

G:\ITB-COT 05-47 Traffic Control Signs & Posts



CITY OF TROY    ITB-COT 05-47
Opening Date -- 10/19/05 BID TABULATION Pg. 5 of 6
Date Prepared -- 10/24/05 TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS

VENDOR NAME: MICHIGAN

STATE

INDUSTRIES

ITEM EST QTY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
PROPOSAL A: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE 3M HIGH INTENSITY ON ALUMINUM

1. 50 36" YIELD 87.75$           
2. 50 30" STOP 87.75$           
3. 10 36" STOP 87.75$          

PROPOSAL A:  EST TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS --

PROPOSAL B: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - ONE COLOR - SIGN
1. 20 12" X 36" One Color 35.25$           
2. 30 18" X 18" One Color 47.00$           
3. 50 24" X 30" One Color 70.50$           
4. 50 30" X 30" One Color 105.75$         
5. 10 36" X 36" One Color 105.75$         
6. 10 48" X 48" One Color 188.80$         
7. 50 12" X 30 Hi Int W/Round Corners 29.25$           
8. 100 12" X 36 Hi Int W/Round Corners 29.25$           
9. 20 12" X 42 Hi Int W/Round Corners 39.00$           
10. 100 12" X 48 Hi Int W/Round Corners 39.00$           

PROPOSAL B:  EST TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS--

PROPOSAL C: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE, TWO OR MORE COLORS-SIGN
1. 50 12" X 12" Two Color 11.75$           
2. 50 12" X 18" Two Color 23.50$           

PROPOSAL C:  EST TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS--

PROPOSAL D: 3M STANDARD PRE-PRINTED TRAFFIC SIGN FACES
1. 500 12" X 12" No Parking Symbol R8-3A 6.15$            

PROPOSAL D:  EST TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS--

PROPOSAL E: DOUBLE FACED, TWO SIDED ON WHITE - SIGN N/A
1. 40 9" X 30" Extruded High Intensity White
2. 40 9" X 36" Extruded High Intensity White
3. 40 9" X 42" Extruded High Intensity White
4. 40 6" X 24" Extruded High Intensity White
5. 100 6" X 30" Extruded High Intensity White
6. 100 6" X 36" Extruded High Intensity White
7. 50 6" X 42" Extruded High Intensity White

PROPOSAL E:  EST TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS--

PROPOSAL F: SET UP FEES N/A

PROPOSAL G: SQUARE TUBULAR SIGN POSTS - PERFORATED - GALVANIZED STEEL - FHWA APPROVED
1. 100 12 Ft X 1 3/4" - 14 Gauge N/A
2. 100   9 Ft X 1 1/2" - 14 Gauge
3. 100   3 Ft X 2 " Base - 12 Gauge
4. 100   3 Ft X 1 3/4 " Base - 12 Gauge

PROPOSAL G:  EST TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS--



CITY OF TROY    ITB-COT 05-47
Opening Date -- 10/19/05 BID TABULATION Pg. 6 of 6
Date Prepared -- 10/24/05 TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS

VENDOR NAME: MICHIGAN

STATE

INDUSTRIES

PROPOSAL H: ROUND GALVANIZED STEEL POST, 2" NOMINAL SIZE .125 WALL THICKNESS
1. 100 12 FT Galvanized steel round post N/A

PROPOSAL H:  EST TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS--

PROPOSAL I: U-CHANNEL SIGN POSTS N/A
1. 50 12 FT - 3lbs Silver Galvanized Steel
2. 100 12 FT - 3lbs Green Painted Steel
3. 300 10 FT - 2lbs Green Painted Steel

PROPOSAL I:  EST TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS--

ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS: N/A
DELIVERY:

Minimum Shipment BLANK
# of Days 30-45

CONTACT INFO: Hrs of Operation: 8-5PM
24 Hr Emergency # (517)780-6217

TERMS: NET 30

WARRANTY: BLANK

DELIVERY: 30-45 DAYS

EXCEPTIONS: BLANK

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:   Y or N YES

PROPOSAL - One Year Requirements of Traffic Control Signs and Posts with an Option to Renew for One
Additional Year

____________________________
Jeanette Bennett
Purchasing Director
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