January 16, 2006

To: John Szerlag, City Manager

From: Brian P. Murphy, Assistant City Manager/ Services
Jeanette Bennett, Purchasing Director
Timothy L. Richnak, Public Works Director

Subject: Agenda Item — Standard Purchasing Resolution 1: Award to Low
Bidders — Water System Materials

RECOMMENDATION
On December 27, 2005, bid proposals were opened to furnish one-year
requirements of Water System Materials. After reviewing these proposals, City
management recommends awarding contracts to the following low bidders at
estimated total costs:

e SLC Meter Service Inc. of Davisburg, Ml $16,470.00
e East Jordan Iron Works Inc. of Oak Park, Ml $24,578.00
e Gunners Meters & Parts of Pontiac, Ml $ 5,175.00

e Cambridge Brass of Cambridge, Ontario Canada $50,687.00

e National Waterworks Inc. of Shelby Township, Ml $13,687.00
plus Mueller fire hydrant parts discounted at 5%.

Unit prices are contained on the attached bid tabulation.

SUMMARY

All items recommended represent the lowest bidder for each item. Estimated
guantities of materials shall be purchased at quoted unit prices, and ordered on
an as needed basis. Informal quotes will be taken for Item #10, Gas Pipe, as no
formal bids were received.

BUDGET
Funds are available in the Water Department Operating Budget.

119 Vendors Notified via the MITN System
5 Bid Responses Rec'd
1 Late Bid

Prepared by: Emily Frontera, Administrative Aide
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Opening Date -- 12-27-05
Date Prepared -- 12/29/05

CITY OF TROY
BID TABULATION

VENDOR NAME:

WATER SYSTEM MATERIALS

ITB-COT 05-57
Pg.10f9

SLC METER SERVICE INC

EAST JORDAN IRON WORKS

EST UNIT UNIT
ITEM # QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
CURB BOX ITEMS
1A 60 2 X 11/2" BLACK BUSHING $ 2251 % 135.00 | $ 3.20 [ $ 192.00
1B. 500 2" MINNEAPOLIS CURB BOX W/STEMS $ 23.00 | $ 11,500.00 | NO QUOTE
1C. 10 2" Curb Box (Mueller #H10300-9902) N/B $ 23.46 | $ 234.60
1D. 20 31/2 x 3 BLACK BUSHING N/B NO QUOTE
MANUFACTURER GENERAL FOUNDRY AY MCDONALD
MODEL 5614
CORPORATION STOPS
2A. 500 1" CORPORATION STOPS with nuts $ 1553 | $ 7,765.00 | $ 17.721$ 8,860.00
2B. 50 1 1/2" CORPORATION STOPS with nuts $ 4251 | $ 2,12550 | $ 52.88 [ $ 2,644.00
2C. 80 2" CORPORATION STOPS with nuts $ 7432 1% 594560 | $ 87.69]|% 7,015.20
MANUFACTURER FORD AY MCDONALD
MODEL 4701
CURB STOPS (Ball Valve Type)
3A. 500 1" CURB STOPS with nuts $ 3223 1% 16,115.00 | $ 3451|% 17,255.00
3B. 50 1 1/2" CURB STOPS with nuts $ 69.24|$ 3,462.00 (% 76.66 [$  3,833.00
3C. 80 2" CURB STOPS with nuts $ 112.03|$ 8,96240|3% 12449]|$% 9,959.20
MANUFACTURER FORD AY MCDONALD
MODEL 6100
FULL CIRCLE REPAIR CLAMPS
4A. 30 6" X 8" Range 6.84-7.64 -Double Band $ 5766 | $ 1,729.80($% 101.12]|$ 3,033.60
4B. 15 6" x 12" Range 6.84-7.64 -Double Band $ 8194 |$ 1,22910($ 14432($ 2,164.80
4C. 10 6" x 15" Range 6.84-7.64 -Double Band $ 93.69 | $ 936.90 [$ 18268 |% 1,826.80
4D. 10 6" x 8" FS2 Range 6.84-7.64 - DoubleBand |$ 69.66 [ $ 696.60 |$ 156.05|% 1,560.50
4E. 10 8" x 7" Range 8.99-9.79 - Double Band $ 58.90 | $ 589.00($ 11051|%$ 1,105.10
4F. 4 8" x 12" Range 8.99-9.79 - Double Band $ 86.02]% 34408 |$ 160.74 | $ 642.96
4G. 10 8" x 15" Range 8..99-9.79 -Double Band $ 100.49 | $ 1,00490|$ 209.15|% 2,091.50
4H. 2 16" x 15" FS2 Range 6.84-7.64 - DoubleBand | $ 182.86 | $ 365.72 | NO QUOTE
41, 2 3" x 12" Range 3.46-3.70 - Single Band $ 36.75 | $ 7350 | $ 76.43 | $ 152.86
MANUFACTURER FORD ROMAC
MODEL SS2
TRANSITION COUPLING
5A. 12 8" Trans Coupling Range 8.54 x 9.85 N/B $ 13868|$% 1,664.16
BRASS FITTINGS
BA. 120 1" Copper to Copper Union w/nuts $ 9.62|$ 115440 % 1192 |$ 1,430.40
6B. 60 1" x 90 Degree Bend non-swivel w/outnuts |[$  10.30 | $ 618.00 | $ 1225 | $ 735.00
6C. 25 1 1/2" Copper to Copper Union w/nuts $ 2642]% 660.50 | $ 32711 $ 817.75
6D. 25 2" Copper to Copper Union w/nuts $ 4310|$ 1077501 % 53.36 [ $ 1,334.00
6E. 80 2" x 90 Degree Bend non-swivel w/outnuts | $ 55.88 |$ 4,470.40 | $ 72.751% 5,820.00
6F. 10 3/4" Copper to Copper Union w/nuts $ 550 | $ 55.00 | $ 6.80 | $ 68.00
MANUFACTURER FORD AY MCDONALD
MODEL 4758 & 4761Q

NOTE:

BOLD AND HIGHLIGHTED ITEMS DENOTE LOW BIDDERS




Opening Date -- 12-27-05
Date Prepared -- 12/29/05

CITY OF TROY
BID TABULATION

VENDOR NAME:

WATER SYSTEM MATERIALS

ITB-COT 05-57

Pg. 2 of 9

SLC METER SERVICE INC

EAST JORDAN IRON WORKS

EST UNIT UNIT
ITEM # QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
BRONZE TAPPING SADDLES
TA. 32 1" x 8" Tap Saddle w/CC thread $ 56.20 | $ 1,798.40 | $ 69.58 | $ 2,226.56
7B. 50 2" x 8" Tap Saddle w/CC thread $ 6441 |3% 322050 | 9% 79.751$% 3,987.50
7C. 20 1" x 6" Tap Saddle w/CC thread $ 4541 | $ 908.20 | $ 56.23 | $ 1,124.60
7D. 10 11/2" x 6" Tap Saddle w/CC thread $ 51.92 | $ 519.20 [ $ 64.28 | $ 642.80
7E. 10 2" x 6" Tap Saddle w/CC thread $ 57.04 | $ 57040 | $ 70.63 | $ 706.30
7F. 10 11/2 x 12" Tap Saddle w/CC thread $ 91.90 | $ 919.00($ 11380|% 1,138.00
7G. 50 2" x 12" Tap Saddle w/CC thread $ 93.57 | $ 467850 | % 11585|% 5,792.50
DUCTILE IRON PIPE
7H. 10 1" x 16" D.I. Tap Saddle w/CC thread $ 19953 | 9% 199530 |$ 247.06|$ 2,470.60
7. 3 11/2"x 16" D.l. Tap Saddle w/CC thread $ 21172 |$ 635.16 | $ 262.16 | $ 786.48
7J. 10 2" x 16" D.l. Tap Saddle w/CC thread $ 23396|% 233960(% 289.70|% 2,897.00
CONCRETE STEEL PIPE NO BID
7K. 20 1" x 16" Service Saddle s/CC thread $ 20770 [$ 4,154.00
7L. 10 1 1/2" x 16" Service Saddle w/CC thread $ 23275|% 2,327.50
7M. 10 2" x 16" Service Saddle w/CC thread $ 25550 (% 2,555.00
MANUFACTURER AY MCDONALD
MODEL 3825 & 452
VALVE BOX PARTS NO BID
8A. 12 24" D-BOX BOTTOM $ 30.30 | $ 363.60
8B. 25 D-BOX RISER - SCREW IN TYPE #69 $ 29.40 | $ 735.00
MANUFACTURER EJIW
MODEL 6860
WATER MAIN FITTINGS NO BID
9A. 2 12" WATER MAIN CAP - DI $ 5490 | $ 109.80
9B. 1 12" Mechanical Gasket cut in Sleeve - DI NO QUOTE
9C. 5 6" Mechanical Gasket cut in Sleeve - DI NO QUOTE
aD. 25 12" MJ Gasket $ 145 $ 36.25
9E. 1 6" x 11 1/4 Degree Bend $ 43.20 | $ 43.20
9F. 1 6" MJ x 4" Spigots Reducer $ 3240 | $ 32.40
9G. 20 6" D.l. Gland Pack Kit Regular $ 11.70 | $ 234.00
9H. 20 8" Gland Pack Kit Regular $ 1350 [ $ 270.00
9l. 2 8" x 11 1/4 - Degree Bend $ 67.50 | $ 135.00
9J. 2 8" x 22 1/4 - Degree Bend $ 70.65 | $ 141.30
oK. 5 8" Split Rings $ 1495 $ 74.75
oL. 6 6" 90-Deg MJ Anchoring Elbow $ 100.74 | $ 604.44
OM. 25 6" - 8" Operating Nut Valve MUVOPN8 NO QUOTE
ON. 2 3" Water Main Plug MJ - Ductile Iron $ 1242 | $ 24.84

MANUFACTURER
MODEL

TYLER/UNION

TYLER/UNION




Opening Date -- 12/27/05
Date Prepared -- 12/29/05

CITY OF TROY
BID TABULATION
WATER SYSTEM MATERIALS

VENDOR NAME:

ITB-COT 05-57
Pg.30f 9

SLC METER SERVICE INC

EAST JORDAN IRON WORKS

EST UNIT UNIT
ITEM # QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
GAS PIPE NO BID NO QUOTE
10A. 3lgth 1 1/4" Black Steel Pipe FT
10B. 3lgth 1" Black Steel Pipe FT
10C. 3lgth 2" Black Steel Pipe FT
MANUFACTURER
MODEL
MANHOLE FRAMES & COVERS NO BID
11A. 12 1046Z 36" x 4" Frame $ 117.75|% 1,413.00
11B. 12 1046ZPT Frame $ 12942 |$ 1,553.04
11C. 80 1040Z M/H Frame $ 13529|$% 10,823.20
11D. 80 1040ZC M/H Cover $ 96.87 | $ 7,749.60
MANUFACTURER EJIW
MODEL EJIW
12 PARTS FOR MUELLER FIRE HYDRANTS NO BID NO QUOTE
DISCOUNT %
Parts Price List
Dated
ESTIMATED TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS: $ 16,470.06 $ 24,578.02
CONTACT INFORMATION:
Hrs of Operation 7:30 - 5pm Mon-Fri 7-4pm
24 Hr Phone No. (734) 320-0215 (313) 255-3914
TERMS: NET 30 DAYS NET 30
WARRANTY: STANDARD MFG BLANK
DELIVERY DATE: 2-4 WEEKS BLANK
EXCEPTIONS: BLANK BLANK
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT: Completed - Y or N YES YES
AMENDMENT/ADDENDUM #1: Y or N NO YES
ATTEST: PROPOSAL - ONE (1) YEAR REQUIREMENTS OF WATER SYSTEM MATERIALS

Emily Frontera

Cheryl Stewart

Linda Bockstanz

G:/WaterSystemMaterial ITB-COT 05-57




Opening Date -- 12-27-05
Date Prepared -- 12/29/05

CITY OF TROY
BID TABULATION
WATER SYSTEM MATERIALS

VENDOR NAME:

ITB-COT 05-57
Pg. 4 of 9

GUNNERS METERS & PARTS

NATIONAL WATERWORKS

EST UNIT UNIT
ITEM # QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
CURB BOX ITEMS
1A 60 2 X 11/2" BLACK BUSHING $ 125($ 75.00 | $ 230 $ 138.00
1B. 500 2" MINNEAPOLIS CURB BOX W/STEMS $ 33.00|$ 16,500.00 | $ 25.05|$% 12,525.00
1C. 10 2" Curb Box (Mueller #H410300-9902) $ 88.00 | $ 880.00 | $ 30.03 | $ 300.30
1D. 20 31/2 x 3 BLACK BUSHING $ 5.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 10.36 | $ 207.20
MANUFACTURER MCDONALD AY MCDONALD
MODEL 5613
CORPORATION STOPS
2A. 500 1" CORPORATION STOPS with nuts $ 16.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 15.87|$ 7,935.00
2B. 50 1 1/2" CORPORATION STOPS with nuts $ 4400 $ 2,200.00 | $ 4123 |$ 2,061.50
2C. 80 2" CORPORATION STOPS with nuts $ 77.00 | $ 6,160.00 | $ 75.65[$% 6,052.00
MANUFACTURER MCDONALD
MODEL
CURB STOPS (Ball Valve Type)
3A. 500 1" CURB STOPS with nuts $ 33.00|$ 16,500.00 | $ 36.96 | $ 18,480.00
3B. 50 1 1/2" CURB STOPS with nuts $ 72.00|1$ 3,600.00 | $ 72941 $ 3,647.00
3C. 80 2" CURB STOPS with nuts $ 116.00 | $ 9,280.00 [$ 11797 |3$ 9,437.60
MANUFACTURER MCDONALD MUELLER
MODEL H15154 / B25154
FULL CIRCLE REPAIR CLAMPS NO BID
4A. 30 6" X 8" Range 6.84-7.64 -Double Band $ 4594 [ $ 1,378.20
4B. 15 6" x 12" Range 6.84-7.64 -Double Band $ 68.27 | $ 1,024.05
4C. 10 6" x 15" Range 6.84-7.64 -Double Band $ 86.52 | $ 865.20
4D. 10 6" x 8" FS2 Range 6.84-7.64 - Double Band $ 61.32 | $ 613.20
4E. 10 8" x 7" Range 8.99-9.79 - Double Band $ 52.38 | $ 523.80
4F, 4 8" x 12" Range 8.99-9.79 - Double Band $ 75.99 | $ 303.96
4G. 10 8" x 15" Range 8..99-9.79 -Double Band $ 98.76 | $ 987.60
4H. 2 16" x 15" FS2 Range 6.84-7.64 - Double Band $ 16111 ($ 322.22
41, 2 3" x 12" Range 3.46-3.70 - Single Band $ 35.52 | $ 71.04
MANUFACTURER SMITH BLAIR
MODEL 262/ 265
TRANSITION COUPLING
5A. 12 8" Trans Coupling Range 8.54 x 9.85 $ 150.00|($ 1,800.00($ 116.03|$ 1,392.36
BRASS FITTINGS
BA. 120 1" Copper to Copper Union w/nuts $ 9.00|$ 1,080.00 | $ 10.06 | $ 1,207.20
6B. 60 1" x 90 Degree Bend non-swivel w/outnuts | $  10.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 1083 | $ 649.80
6C. 25 1 1/2" Copper to Copper Union w/nuts $ 2500][% 625.00 [ $ 217719 694.25
6D. 25 2" Copper to Copper Union w/nuts $ 40.00|$ 1,000.00]$ 4531 ]|$ 1,132.75
6E. 80 2" x 90 Degree Bend non-swivel w/outnuts |$ 55.00 [ $ 4,400.00 | $ 60.00 |$ 4,800.00
6F. 10 3/4" Copper to Copper Union w/nuts $ 6.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 577 | $ 57.70
MANUFACTURER MCDONALD MUELLER

MODEL




Opening Date -- 12-27-05
Date Prepared -- 12/29/05

CITY OF TROY
BID TABULATION

VENDOR NAME:

WATER SYSTEM MATERIALS

ITB-COT 05-57

Pg.50f9

GUNNERS METERS & PARTS

NATIONAL WATERWORKS

EST UNIT UNIT
ITEM # QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL

BRONZE TAPPING SADDLES NO BID
7A. 32 1" x 8" Tap Saddle w/CC thread $ 5895|% 1,886.40
7B. 50 2" x 8" Tap Saddle w/CC thread $ 6764 | % 3,382.00
7C. 20 1" x 6" Tap Saddle w/CC thread $ 4762 | $ 952.40
7D. 10 11/2" x 6" Tap Saddle w/CC thread $ 5445 | $ 544,50
7E. 10 2" x 6" Tap Saddle w/CC thread $ 59.85 | $ 598.50
7F. 10 11/2 x 12" Tap Saddle w/CC thread $ 96.44 | $ 964.40
7G. 50 2" x 12" Tap Saddle w/CC thread $ 98.20 [ $ 4,910.00

DUCTILE IRON PIPE NO BID
7H. 10  1"x 16" D.I. Tap Saddle w/CC thread $ 217.94|$ 2,179.40
71. 3 11/2"x 16" D.l. Tap Saddle w/CC thread $ 231.2413% 693.72
7J. 10 2" x 16" D.l. Tap Saddle w/CC thread $ 25554 [$% 2,555.40

CONCRETE STEEL PIPE NO BID
7K. 20 1" x 16" Service Saddle s/CC thread $ 10250|$% 2,050.00
7L. 10 1 1/2" x 16" Service Saddle w/CC thread $ 10250|$ 1,025.00
7M. 10 2" x 16" Service Saddle w/CC thread $ 10250|$% 1,025.00

MANUFACTURER

MODEL

VALVE BOX PARTS NO BID
8A. 12 24" D-BOX BOTTOM $ 35.68 | $ 428.16
8B. 25 D-BOX RISER - SCREW IN TYPE #69 $ 33.73 | $ 843.25

MANUFACTURER UNION/TYLER

MODEL 6860

WATER MAIN FITTINGS NO BID
9A. 2 12" WATER MAIN CAP - DI $ 60.27 | $ 120.54
9B. 1 12" Mechanical Gasket cut in Sleeve - DI $ 59475 $ 594.75
9cC. 5 6" Mechanical Gasket cut in Sleeve - DI $ 24649 % 1,232.45
aD. 25 12" MJ Gasket $ 1491 $ 37.25
9E. 1 6" x 11 1/4 Degree Bend $ 46.86 | $ 46.86
9F. 1 6" MJ x 4" Spigots Reducer $ 38.07 | $ 38.07
9G. 20 6" D.I. Gland Pack Kit Regular $ 1269 | $ 253.80
9H. 20 8" Gland Pack Kit Regular $ 1495 | $ 299.00
9l 2 8" x 11 1/4 - Degree Bend $ 7321 1% 146.42
9J. 2 8" x 22 1/4 - Degree Bend $ 76.63 [ $ 153.26
9K. 5 8" Split Rings $ 3550 | $ 177.50
oL. 6 6" 90-Deg MJ Anchoring Elbow $ 10564 | % 633.84
OM. 25 6" - 8" Operating Nut Valve MUVOPNS $ 1112 [ $ 278.00
ON. 2 3" Water Main Plug MJ - Ductile Iron $ 13.50 | $ 27.00

MANUFACTURER

MODEL




Opening Date -- 12/27/05
Date Prepared -- 12/29/05

CITY OF TROY
BID TABULATION
WATER SYSTEM MATERIALS

ITB-COT 05-57
Pg. 6 of 9

VENDOR NAME: GUNNERS METERS & PARTS NATIONAL WATERWORKS
EST UNIT UNIT
ITEM # QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
GAS PIPE NO BID NO QUOTE
10A. 3lgth 1 1/4" Black Steel Pipe FT
10B. 3lgth 1" Black Steel Pipe FT
10C. 3lgth 2" Black Steel Pipe FT
MANUFACTURER
MODEL
MANHOLE FRAMES & COVERS NO BID
11A. 12 1046Z 36" x 4" Frame $ 13950|% 1,674.00
11B. 12 1046ZPT Frame $ 32701|$% 392412
11C. 80 1040Z M/H Frame $ 16027 | $ 12,821.60
11D. 80 1040ZC M/H Cover $ 11477]3% 9,181.60
MANUFACTURER EJIW
MODEL EJIW
12 PARTS FOR MUELLER FIRE HYDRANTS NO BID
DISCOUNT 5%
Parts Price List IMPROVED HYD
Dated 1/31/2005
ESTIMATED TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS: $ 5,175.00 $ 13,686.83
CONTACT INFORMATION:
Hrs of Operation 8-5pm 7-4pm
24 Hr Phone No. (248) 545-6304 (586) 754-5783
TERMS: NET 30 DAYS NET 30 DAYS
WARRANTY: 1 YEAR MANUFACTURER
DELIVERY DATE: 1-2 WEEKS 7-10 DAYS ARO
EXCEPTIONS: BLANK LISTED IN BID
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT: Completed - Y or N YES YES
AMENDMENT/ADDENDUM #1: Y or N NO NO

G:/WaterSystemMaterial ITB-COT 05-57




Opening Date -- 12-27-05
Date Prepared -- 12/29/05

CITY OF TROY
BID TABULATION

VENDOR NAME:

WATER SYSTEM MATERIALS

ITB-COT 05-57
Pg. 7 0of 9

CAMBRIDGE BRASS

EST UNIT
ITEM # QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL
CURB BOX ITEMS NO BID
1A. 60 2 X 1 1/2" BLACK BUSHING
1B. 500 2" MINNEAPOLIS CURB BOX W/STEMS
1C. 10 2" Curb Box (Mueller #H10300-9902)
1D. 20 3 1/2 x 3 BLACK BUSHING
MANUFACTURER
MODEL
CORPORATION STOPS
2A. 500 1" CORPORATION STOPS with nuts $ 1439]|% 7,195.00
2B. 50 1 1/2" CORPORATION STOPS with nuts $ 39441% 1,972.00
2C. 80 2" CORPORATION STOPS with nuts $ 6418]|% 5,134.40
MANUFACTURER CAMBRIDGE BRASS
MODEL 302 & 301 SERIES
CURB STOPS (Ball Valve Type)
3A. 500 1" CURB STOPS with nuts $ 25.00]|% 12,500.00
3B. 50 1 1/2" CURB STOPS with nuts $ 56.88|% 2,844.00
3C. 80 2" CURB STOPS with nuts $ 849]|% 6,796.00
MANUFACTURER CAMBRIDGE BRASS
MODEL 262 BALL VALVE
FULL CIRCLE REPAIR CLAMPS NO BID
4A. 30 6" X 8" Range 6.84-7.64 -Double Band
4B. 15 6" x 12" Range 6.84-7.64 -Double Band
4C. 10 6" x 15" Range 6.84-7.64 -Double Band
4D. 10 6" x 8" FS2 Range 6.84-7.64 - Double Band
4E. 10 8" x 7" Range 8.99-9.79 - Double Band
4F. 4 8" x 12" Range 8.99-9.79 - Double Band
4G. 10 8" x 15" Range 8..99-9.79 -Double Band
4H. 2 16" x 15" FS2 Range 6.84-7.64 - Double Band
4. 2 3" x 12" Range 3.46-3.70 - Single Band
MANUFACTURER
MODEL
TRANSITION COUPLING
5A. 12 8" Trans Coupling Range 8.54 x 9.85 NO BID
BRASS FITTINGS
6A. 120 1" Copper to Copper Union w/nuts $ 892|% 1,070.40
6B. 60 1" x 90 Degree Bend non-swivel w/out nuts | N/A
6C. 25 1 1/2" Copper to Copper Union w/nuts $ 2390[% 597.50
6D. 25 2" Copper to Copper Union w/nuts $ 3630|3% 907.50
6E. 80 2" x 90 Degree Bend non-swivel w/out nuts | N/A
6F. 10 3/4" Copper to Copper Union w/nuts $ 463 | $ 46.30

MANUFACTURER
MODEL

CAMBRIDGE BRASS

118 SERIES




Opening Date -- 12-27-05
Date Prepared -- 12/29/05

CITY OF TROY
BID TABULATION

VENDOR NAME:

WATER SYSTEM MATERIALS

ITB-COT 05-57
Pg. 8 of 9

CAMBRIDGE BRASS

EST UNIT
ITEM # QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL
BRONZE TAPPING SADDLES
7A. 32 1" x 8" Tap Saddle w/CC thread $ 5209|% 1,666.88
7B. 50 2" x 8" Tap Saddle w/CC thread $ 5969]|% 2,984.50
7C. 20 1" x 6" Tap Saddle w/CC thread $ 4350 % 870.00
7D. 10 11/2" x 6" Tap Saddle w/CC thread $ 4921|% 492.10
7E. 10 2" x 6" Tap Saddle w/CC thread $ 5407 |% 540.70
TF. 10 11/2 x 12" Tap Saddle w/CC thread $ 8324|% 832.40
7G. 50 2" x 12" Tap Saddle w/CC thread $ 8475 $ 4,237.50
DUCTILE IRON PIPE NO BID
7H. 10 1" x 16" D.I. Tap Saddle w/CC thread
71. 3 11/2"x 16" D.I. Tap Saddle w/CC thread
7J. 10 2" x 16" D.l. Tap Saddle w/CC thread
CONCRETE STEEL PIPE NO BID
7K. 20 1" x 16" Service Saddle s/CC thread
7L. 10 11/2" x 16" Service Saddle w/CC thread
7M. 10 2" x 16" Service Saddle w/CC thread
MANUFACTURER CAMBRIDGE BRASS
MODEL 810 SERIES
VALVE BOX PARTS NO BID
8A. 12 24" D-BOX BOTTOM
8B. 25 D-BOX RISER - SCREW IN TYPE #69
MANUFACTURER
MODEL
WATER MAIN FITTINGS NO BID
9A. 2 12" WATER MAIN CAP - DI
9B. 1 12" Mechanical Gasket cut in Sleeve - DI
9C. 5 6" Mechanical Gasket cut in Sleeve - DI
aD. 25 12" MJ Gasket
9E. 1 6" x 11 1/4 Degree Bend
9F. 1 6" MJ x 4" Spigots Reducer
9G. 20 6" D.l. Gland Pack Kit Regular
9H. 20 8" Gland Pack Kit Regular
9l 2 8" x 11 1/4 - Degree Bend
9J. 2 8" x 22 1/4 - Degree Bend
9K. 5 8" Split Rings
L. 6 6" 90-Deg MJ Anchoring Elbow
9M. 25 6" - 8" Operating Nut Valve MUVOPN8
ON. 2 3" Water Main Plug MJ - Ductile Iron

MANUFACTURER
MODEL




Opening Date -- 12/27/05
Date Prepared -- 12/29/05

CITY OF TROY
BID TABULATION

VENDOR NAME:

WATER SYSTEM MATERIALS

ITB-COT 05-57
Pg.9of 9

CAMBRIDGE BRASS

EST UNIT
ITEM # QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL
GAS PIPE NO BID
10A. 3lgth 1 1/4" Black Steel Pipe FT
10B. 3lgth 1" Black Steel Pipe FT
10C. 3lgth 2" Black Steel Pipe FT
MANUFACTURER
MODEL
MANHOLE FRAMES & COVERS NO BID
11A. 12 1046Z 36" x 4" Frame
11B. 12 1046ZPT Frame
11C. 80 1040Z M/H Frame
11D. 80 1040ZC M/H Cover
MANUFACTURER
MODEL
12 PARTS FOR MUELLER FIRE HYDRANTS NO BID
DISCOUNT %
Parts Price List
Dated
ESTIMATED TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS: $ 50,687.18
CONTACT INFORMATION:
Hrs of Operation 8-4:30pm

24 Hr Phone No.

TERMS:

WARRANTY:

DELIVERY DATE:

EXCEPTIONS:

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT: Completed - Y or N

AMENDMENT/ADDENDUM #1: Y or N

G:/WaterSystemMaterial ITB-COT 05-57

(519) 673-2810

2% 15th M-F

40 YEARS

7 DAYS

1" BALL VALVE ON CURB STOPS

YES

NO

Jeanette Bennett
Purchasing Director
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Downioading History for ITB-COT 05-57 WaterSyth

The report below shows all fax and e-mail vendors that matched this document when it was originally issued.
it also shows all vendors that have downloaded or ordered the document and any subsequent amendments as

of 1/12/2006.

Document Title:

erne Year Requirements on Water System Materials

Date Issued: || 112912005 ]
[ Close Date: || 1272712005 B
[ Date Amendment #1 was issued: [l 12/15/2005 ]

Click on the table headings for "Account Nurmber” or "Company name™ to re-sort this report by that column.
You may also click on any vendor account number to view their account information.

awte| _ companyname Servies | ccumenc. || amentments
[ 15881 JIA&B TRUCKING INC. | E-mail | ]
| 13751 ||A&S Industrial Coating Inc || E-mail |
| 19689 [[A. A. D. Contracting Co. || E-mai i
| 11428 ]|Adj Excavating, Inc E-mail B
| 18057 [ladvanced air services,inc. E-mail ||
23080 [[Aggressive Systems inc. | E-mail )i g |
18171 ||Aggressive Systems, inc. [ E-mail || 12/16/2005 | ]
[ 12984 JlAjax Materials Corporation | E-maill || 12/14/2005 | |
16797 ||Al's Utility Contracting Incorporated | E-mail ] )
20470 ||American Excavating Contractors Fax #112/15/2005
[ 14279 [|Amerinational Community Services | E-mail ||
[ 18540 [JAMG Health Services Free | 11/30/2005
| 14471 [iAngelo lafrate Construction Company E-mail ||
[ 20776 |[Asphalt Sealcoating, Inc. E-mail | |
10851 ||BEI Associates Inc. E-mail || |
13292 |[Best Plumbing Specialties, inc. || E-mail || 127152005 | ]
[ 21103 [IBob Myers Excavating, Inc. | E-mail || il ]
“ 12695 IBOILERS, CONTROLS & EQUIPMENT, l E-mail l ' #1 12/19/2005
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11742 ||[Bowen Paving, Inc. Fax #112/15/2005
[[ 20153 ][C & H Site Development | E-mail
[ 12687 ||C & S Engineers, Inc E-mail || I |
20972 ||C.D Barnes Associates E-mail || | |
| 12040 [|C.P.I. Contracting, Inc. |l E-mail || [ ]
—1
" 14787 ||Cambridge Brass E-mail 12/16/2005 JLM 12/16/2005 |
| 19504 _|[Capital Waste, Inc. | E-mail 1N
|r14990 Carrigan Development Inc. Fax || #112/15/2005 JI
22068 {[CITY OF DEARBORN HEIGHTS |{ Free I 1212005 || N
17514 |[Colasanti Construction Servi ces Inc. [ E-mail || [ |
COMMERCE CONSTRUCTION & .
18492 Il ANDSCAPING, ING. " E-mail IP
[ 22592 [[ConsoerTownsend Envirodyne Engineers_" E-mail |[ 112972005 |
[ 13815 ||Corby Energy Services, Inc E-mail | |
[ 16505 [[D. Olsen Inc. er mail ||
| 17560 [[D1 Services | Free 12/7/2005
| 22795 |IDelaney Construction | E-mail I
| 14551 |IDETROIT NIPPLE WORKS, INC. E-mail || 12/16/2005 | |
| 20675 |iDiversified Concepts and Services, Inc. E-mail
[ 16393 |IDoetsch Industrial Services [ E-mail
|_20372_|Douglas N. Higgins, Inc. E-mail 1 |
[ 17888 |[E.T. MacKenzie Company | E-mail || [ I
" I 12428 ||East Jordan Iron Works, Inc. E-mail 12/2/2005 #1 1211912005 ',
| 12164 j|[Edw. C. Levy Co. E-mail 12/16/2005
12080 ||Etna Supply Company I E-mail 12/5/2005 #112/15/2005
[ 22538 ][Euridium Solutions, LLG | E-mail ] [ ]
22220 ||Fed Brothers Construction I E-mail | Il ]]
16719 |[Ferguson Enterprise | E-mail ||
13651 |[Flow Control Systems, LLC | E-mail ||
20365 ||G.H. Ross Contractors {{ E-mail |l It ]
| 20082 |lGeocon Inc. | E-mail || I |
| 19516 [[Grant Tower, Inc N E-mait || [ |
| 22437 ||Great Lakes Carbon Treatment, inc. | E-mail ||  11/29/2005 |
20323 |lGunners Meters & Parts Free 12/12/2005 #1 1212112005
| 17850 |[GZA GeoEnvironmental, Inc. E-mail |
[ 22693 |[Hamlett Engineering Sales DBA HESCO Free 12/16/2005 ||
T [ 0 i i . L
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21711 [[Haskell Service Company ! Fax #1 1211512005 |
| 15913 |[HAYES EXCAVATING CO INC. E-mail f ]
| 20479 |[HAYES EXCAVATING CO. INC. [[ E-mail | |
20051_|[Hy-Lines Utility Services, Inc. E-mail || | II
[ 20157 |[HYDRO METER SYSTEMS, INC E-mail 12/21/2005 ||
21275 |[Impact , inc. | E-mait |
[ 21233 [[tmprovement Technologies Company E-mail || I ]
[ 22908 lInfrasource Underground Construction || E-mail || I ]
[ 20247 {[insituform Technologies USA, Inc. Free || 12522005 ] ]
|

[ 17522 |[Jack B. Anglin Company, Inc E-mail ||

{ 18533 {lJames P Contracting, Inc. E-mail | i i

[ 12021 [lJOHN CARLO, INC. | E-mail I

[ "1asa5_|[John Deere Landscapes [ E-mail 12/23/2005 ||

| 17938 |Jones & Henry Engineers, Ltd. || Free | 113072005 | [

[ 21358 [Kasco, Inc. [l E-malil B

[ 22017 |[Kokosing Construction Company, Inc. || E-mail I |

| 12254 |{L.-D-J CONSTRUCTION, INC. |l E-mail || I |
19813 ||Labor Ready, Inc | E-mail I
12251 |[Lanier Worldwide | Free 12/20/2005 ||

[ 16500 [lgl construction co., inc. [ E-mail || |

[[ 22143 ][Lighting Technologies | E-mail || |

| 18159 |[Mago Construction || E-mail I H

[ 19566 |[Major Cement Co [ E-mail 12/2/2005 |
11269 |[Man Con Michigan, Inc. || E-mail || |
13303 |[Maryland Electric Company [ E-mait [ | ]
22473 |[Metro Eviromental Controls E-mail || [ |
22119 |[Mint City Excavating, Inc. | E-mail || i |
18052 [[Motor City Pipe and Supply Co. Inc Free 12/2/2005 ||

| 15910 [Mueller Company Free 12/13/2005

| 10155 |[National Waterworks Inc. | E-mail ||  12/6/2005 |

[ 10604 |Inationwide fence & Supply | E-mail 1
13310 1 gg;tlrilnztar Refrigeration, Heating and " E-mail E i

| 12761 |[Northwest Consultants, Inc. [ E-mail || I ]

| 12101 |INTH Consultants, Ltd. | Email || 12/6/2005 | i

| 17310 ||O'Laughlin Construction Company | E-mail |i

[ 21899 |[Ozark Tubular Products E-mail {

| 11059 [[Pamar Enterprises, Inc. E-mail |l

| 12916 ]|Piping Components, Inc. _ | E-mail || 127172005 |

| 22411 |[Pittsburg Tank and Tower Inc/Sales | E-mail || [

| 16388 |[Pro-Seal | Free | 12/5/2005 ||
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![ 18073 |iProject Control Systems, Inc. [ E-mail | | |
[ 20315 |[Proline Technologies/ Inland Waters | E-mail |[  11/29/2005 || ]
| 15064 ||Protech Diamond Tools [ E-mail || [
[ 23104 |[Pumps & Systems I E-mail || 12/21/2005 ||
13691 |IR & E Trucking Inc. " Fax #112/15/2005 1
19782 ||RMC HOLDINGS | E-mail | I |
15568 _||Rotondo Construgtion Corp. E-mail ]
12078 |[S.L.C. Meter Service, Inc E-mail 12/6/2005 #112/20/2005
| 21102 ||SCM Construction Services Fax #112/15/2005
| 12265 [[scodeller construction, inc. E-mail | ]
| 20116 |[Seal-All Waterproofing Company, Inc. E-mail [ |
21568 ||Sierra Consultants || E-mail | f |
12583 }[Sigma Associates, Inc. E-mail [
‘I 13684 |isoil and materials engineers, inc E-mail |
[ 13832 |[Spalding DeDecker Associates, Inc. || E-mail |- | I
12535 |[The Stansley Group I E-mail || |
12044 | Thompson Pump Midwest | Email ]| 12/6/2005
| 18499 |ITOEBE CONSTRUCTION CO. [ E-mail | |
19915 _[[Tommy D's I E-mail || I H
20311 [[Tony Angelo Cement Construction Co. E-mail | ]
[ 11814 |[Tony Anthony Inc E-mail | R
[11904 |[TTL Associates | Email || 12/16/2005 | ]
[ 13532 _|[Underground Lines, Inc. || _E-mail ]
| 12391 ||Utilities Instrumentation Service, Inc. | _E-mail 12/20/2005 | [
| 13207 |Walbridge Aldinger Company [ E-mail || _ B |
| 14707 [[water Services, Inc. )l Free || 12/572005 || |






