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March 20, 2006 
 
TO:  John M. Lamerato, Acting City Manager 
 
FROM: Brian P. Murphy, Assistant City Manager/Services 

Jeanette Bennett, Purchasing Director 
  Carol K. Anderson, Parks and Recreation Director 
 
SUBJECT: Agenda Item – Standard Purchasing Resolution 1: Award to Low 

Bidders - Pump Maintenance, Repair and Replacement of City Pools 
 
RECOMMENDATION 
On March 6, 2006, bid proposals were opened to furnish all labor, tools, 
equipment including cranes etc., and transportation services to provide two-year 
requirements of pump maintenance, repair and replacement on the City of Troy 
(outdoor and indoor) pools with two one-year options to renew.   
 
After reviewing the bid proposals, City management recommends that contracts 
be awarded to the following low bidders, at unit prices contained on the attached 
bid tabulation.   
Kerr Pump and Supply Inc of Oak Park, MI, exclusive representative in the 
lower peninsula for the Aurora Pumps at the Community Center be awarded both 
Proposal A and B, Pump Maintenance, Repair and Replacement of Aurora 
Pumps.  Kennedy Industries Inc of Milford, MI, the direct representative of the 
Floway Pumps at the Aquatic Center be awarded Proposal A, Pump 
Maintenance and Repair for Floway Pumps.  Evergreen Water Controls of 
Burton, MI, be awarded Proposal B, Pump Replacement for Floway Pumps. 
 
The awards are contingent upon contractors’ submission of properly executed 
bid documents, including insurance certificates and all specified requirements. 
 
BACKGROUND 
Building Operations oversees the general maintenance on the pumps at both 
facilities.  Due to additional repair work and the aging pumps at the Aquatic 
Center, the City decided to contract for specific pump services.  Below are the 
three companies City management recommends based on the bid process. 
 

• Kennedy Industries Inc. has been involved with the repair of the Troy 
Family Aquatic Center Floway Vertical Pumps since 1992.  They have 
been reliable and trustworthy.   

 
• Evergreen Water Controls has a three-year warranty on replacement 

pumps.  They have seven years of experience. 
 

• Kerr Pump and Supply Inc. has 102 years of experience with the supply 
and service of the Aurora Pumps.    
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March 20, 2006 
 
To: John M. Lamerato, Acting City Manager 
Re: Bid Award – Pump Maintenance, Repair and Replacement  
 
 
BUDGET 
These services are to be charged to the Contractual Equipment Maintenance 
Account #755.7802.150 and #787.7802.150; and the Troy Family Aquatic Center 
Contractual Service Account, #787.7802.070.  
 
 
51 Vendors Notified via MITN System 
  3 Bid Responses Rec’d 
  1 No Bid: - Company cannot be competitive 
 
 
 
 
Prepared by: Ann Blizzard, Recreation Supervisor  



CITY OF TROY              ITB-COT 06-02
Opening Date -- 3/6/06 BID TABULATION Pg. 1 of 2
Date Prepared -- 3/13/06 PUMP MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR

VENDOR NAME: Kerr Pump & Supply Kennedy Industries Inc Evergreen Water Controls
Inc

PROPOSAL: Furnish all labor, tools, & equipment including cranes to provide Two-year requirements of Pump Maintenance,
   Repair, and Replacement on the City of Troy Pools with an option to renew for two one-year periods

PROPOSAL A:  PUMP MAINTENANCE & REPAIR
ITEM        DESCRIPTION

1 Pump Maintenance Service/Tune-up

2 Repair Service EST. HRS COST EST. HRS COST EST. HRS COST
a.   Pump Service ON-SITE $ 80.00 / hr $ 90.00 / hr $ 90.00 / hr

b.   Pump Repair OFF-SITE 60 Hrs $ 75.00 / hr 60 Hrs $ 90.00 / hr 60 Hrs $ 90.00 / hr

c.  Cost to remove the pumps from their
     housing & replacement after work
     completion including Labor & Equip $ N/A $ 90.00 / hr $ 305.00 / hr

d.  RESPONSE TIME:                Within 3 / hr 4 / hr 4 / hr

3 Emergency Repairs - Labor Rates EST. HRS COST EST. HRS COST EST. HRS COST
Regular Time 20 Hrs $ 80.00 / hr 20 Hrs $ 90.00 / hr 20 Hrs $ 90.00 / hr
Overtime Time 115.00 / hr 135.00 / hr 135.00 / hr
Holiday Time 140.00 / hr 180.00 / hr 270.00 / hr

4 Floway Repair Parts
Discount-- No Bid % Blank % - 20 %
Parts List No Bid Blank Blank
Dated No Bid Blank Blank
Parts Price List Attached No Bid Blank Blank
Mark up or down No Bid +    20 % - 20 %
Impeller Replacement No Bid 1,800.00 N/A
Pump Shaft Replacement No Bid 1,000.00 N/A

5 Aurora Repair Parts
Discount-- 10 % Blank %      Blank %
Parts List Master Blank Blank
Dated 1/1/2006 Blank Blank
Parts Price List Attached N/A Blank Blank
Mark up or down N/A +    20 % Blank
Impeller Replacement 1,254.00 1,900.00 2,799.20
Pump Shaft Replacement 1,058.00 2,300.00 Blank

6 Travel Time: $ 40.00 $ 270.00

PROPOSAL B:  PUMP REPLACEMENT
ITEM        DESCRIPTION

FLOWAY PUMPS
1 Vertical Turbine Pump 25 HP w/8" disch.
2 Vertical Turbine Pump 10 HP w/6" disch.
3 Vertical Turbine Pump 5 HP w/6" disch.
4 Vertical Turbine Pump 8 HP w/8" disch.
5 Vertical Turbine Pump 30 HP w/12" disch.

Quoting on Blank 2-21-06 above
Manufactured by: Blank Floway Floway

$480/yr $1500/yr $3600/yr

17,994.00$                     
8,906.60$                       

10,094.60$                     
10,424.60$                     
18,887.00$                     20,000.00$                    

No Bid

COMPLETE FOR THE SUM OF:

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

18,000.00$                    
16,000.00$                    
16,000.00$                    

American Electric

COST COST COST

See exceptions
Attached to Bid

(Pump & Motor)

18,000.00$                    



CITY OF TROY
Opening Date -- 3/6/06 BID TABULATION ITB-COT 06-02
Date Prepared -- 3/13/06 PUMP MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR Pg. 2 of 2

VENDOR NAME: Kerr Pump & Supply Kennedy Industries Inc Evergreen Water Controls
Inc

PROPOSAL B:  PUMP REPLACEMENT
ITEM        DESCRIPTION

AURORA PUMPS #02-406411 Type #342ABF
1 Pentair Pumps 20 HP, 4" inlet- 3" Outlet
2 Pentair Pumps 15 HP, 6" inlet- 6" Outlet
3 Pentair Pumps 20 HP, 6" inlet- 5" Outlet
4 Pentair Pumps 7.5 HP, 3" inlet- 2" Outlet

Quoting on Aurora Pump 2-21-06 above
Manufactured by: Pentair Pumps Aurora Aurora

DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE:     Y or N          Yes     Yes            Yes

INSURANCE: Can Meet XX XX XX
Cannot Meet

YEARS OF EXPERIENCE 101 yrs 30 + yrs 7 yrs

CONTACT INFORMATION:
Hours of Operation - 8-5pm 7-5pm M-F 7:30-4pm
24Hr Phone Number - (248)279-2402 (248)684-1200 (810)742-1900

SITE INSPECTION: Visited the site XX XX
Did not visit XX
Date 2/15/2006 2/15/2006

TERMS: Net 30 days Net 30 days Net 30
1 yr - Comm. Ctr.

WARRANTY: Attached to Bid 3 yrs - Aquatic Ctr. 3 years

EXCEPTIONS: Attached to Bid Listed in Bid Blank
Equip & Warranty Warranty & Travel Time

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:         Y or N Yes     Yes Yes

Addendum 1 & 2 Y or N No Yes, Addendum 1 Yes, Addendum 1

NO BIDS:
 Professional Pool Tech LLC

___________________________
ATTEST: Jeanette Bennett
Ann Blizzard Purchasing Director
Charlene McComb
David LaPine BOLDFACE TYPE DENOTES LOW BIDDERS AND PROPOSED AWARDS
Brian Goul
Linda Bockstanz

G/ITB-COT 06-02 Pump Maint/Repair - Comm. Ctr.

5,814.25$                       3,685.00$                   
5,049.50$                       
5,814.25$                       
3,790.25$                       

5,500.00$                      
5,100.00$                      
5,900.00$                      
4,200.00$                      

3,459.00$                   
4,111.00$                   
2,386.00$                   

COMPLETE FOR THE SUM OF:

American Electric










