
September 7, 2006 
 
To:  Phillip L. Nelson, City Manager 
 
From:  Brian P. Murphy, Assistant City Manager/Services 
  Jeanette Bennett, Purchasing Director 
  Steven Pallotta, Building Operations Director  
 
Subject: Agenda Item – Rescind Partial Bid Award / Re-Award Contract –  

Janitorial Services 
 
RECOMMENDATION 
City management recommends that City Council rescind the award with prejudice to Elite 
Maintenance of Elk Grove Village, Illinois for Janitorial Services, Group 2 and 4, (Resolution 
#2005-08-375-E-4a) due to their exodus from the state of Michigan.   
 
Staff also recommends re-awarding the contract to the next lowest acceptable bidders, American 
Cleaning and Road Runr Maintenance.  Both vendors currently hold janitorial contracts with the 
City.  Subsequent letters received from American Cleaning and Road Runr Maintenance indicate 
an interest in expanding the scope of their work at prices originally bid in 2003.  Approval is 
needed to amend their contracts to include the public works facilities and fire halls beginning 
October 1, 2006 and expiring October 30, 2007, at an estimated additional cost of $20,299.37 
and $29,544.84 respectively.  Unit prices and square footages of the areas to be serviced are as 
follows –  
 
Location Square Footage $ per SqFt Cost per Month 
Group 2:   
American Cleaning 

   

  DPW Facility 9,500 $.110 $1,045.00
  P&R Garage 1,781 $.290 $   516.49
Group 4:   
Road Runr Maintenance 

  

  #1 Fire Halls 2,175 $.12 $   261.00
  #2 2,320 $.12 $   278.40
  #3 3,000 $.12 $   360.00
  #4 1,914 $.12 $   229.68
  #5 3,000 $.12 $   360.00
  #6 1,920 $.12 $   230.40
Fire/Police Training 
Center 

 
6,915 

 
$.08 $   553.20

 
BACKGROUND 
On August 1, 2005, Troy City Council exercised and approved the option to renew the janitorial 
services contract for two (2) additional years with Road Runr Maintenance, American Cleaning, 
Elite Maintenance, and This is It! Quality Cleaning under the same contract terms and conditions to 
expire October 30, 2007 (Resolution #2005-08-375-E-4a).  On August 31, 2006, the City of Troy 
received a letter from Elite Maintenance indicating their intent to terminate the janitorial 
maintenance contract effective September 30, 2006 at midnight. 
 
Staff recommends rescinding the award with prejudice that will suspend Elite Maintenance from 
being awarded City contracts for three (3) years.  If they request to be readmitted after this time, 
Administrative Memorandum guides the process for re-entry.   
 
BUDGET 
Funds for janitorial services are available in the various facilities’ operating accounts for custodial 
contractors. 
 
Prepared by: Susan Leirstein, CPPB, Purchasing Systems Administrator 
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CITY OF TROY    ITB-COT 03-06
Opening Date -- 9-23-03 BID TABULATION Pg 1 of 10
Date Prepared -- 10/14/03 JANITORIAL SERVICES

VENDOR NAME:      Road Runr Mtnce Inc
CHECK # 100870289 469896 197864054

CHECK AMOUNT 15,150.00$        15,150.00$          15,150.00$     
SQUARE COST / $ PER COST / $ PER COST / $ PER 
FOOTAGE MONTH SQUARE FT. MONTH SQUARE MONTH SQUARE FT.

Group 1:  Civic Center Sites
CITY HALL & POLICE 86,388 4,751.34$        0.055$                6,582.77$          0.0762     12,094.32$    0.140$              

52-4 DISTRICT COURT 29,000 2,030.00$        0.070$                2,891.30$          0.0997     3,190.00$      0.110$              

COMMUNITY CENTER 97,835 8,071.39$            0.0825$              12,043.49$        0.1231     24,458.75$    0.25$               

LIBRARY 44,500 2,447.50$        0.055$                4,556.80$          0.1024     4,895.00$      0.11$               

 Monthly TOTAL of GROUP  $     17,300.23  $       26,074.35  $   44,638.07 
Yearly Total of Group 1:  $   207,602.73  $     312,892.25  $ 535,656.84 
CASUAL-  22,724 Hrs x Regular Time; 272,688.00$         307,455.72$           244,283.00$      
CASUAL - Holiday Time  x 96 HRS 1,728.00$            2,598.72$               2,064.00$          
GRAND TOTAL -W/CASUAL - GROUP 1: 482,018.73$      * 622,946.69$       782,003.84$   
Group 2:  Garage Facilities

DPW FACILITY 9,500 1,140.00$        0.12$                 1,107.70$          0.1166     1,045.00$      0.110$              

P&R GARAGE 1,781 623.35$           0.35$                 340.35$             0.1911     516.49$         0.290$              

Monthly TOTAL of GROUP  $       1,763.35 1,448.05$          1,561.49$      
Yearly Total of Group 2:  $     21,160.20  $       17,376.60 **  $   18,737.88 <=Re-Award

Group 3:  
Enrichment Facilities
MUSEUM 5X / Week 704.99$           0.065$                1,713.67$          0.1580     867.68$         0.080$              

10,846
LLOYD STAGE 3X / Week 736.56$           0.09$                 848.68$             0.1037     654.72$         0.080$              

NATURE CENTER 8,184
Monthly TOTAL of GROUP  $       1,441.55  $         2,562.35  $     1,522.40 
Yearly Total of Group 3  $     17,298.60  $       30,748.19  $   18,268.80 
Nature Center - 1,040 Hrs x Regular Time; 12,480.00$          14,071.20$             11,180.00$        
GRAND TOTAL -W/CASUAL - GROUP 3: 29,778.60$        44,819.39$          29,448.80$     *
Group 4:  Fire Sites
FIRE HALLS:
1 (Tuesday and Friday) 2,175 261.00$           0.12$                 228.59$             0.1051$   261.00$         0.120$              

2 (Monday and Thursday) 2,320 278.40$           0.12$                 271.21$             0.1169$   278.40$         0.120$              

3 (Tuesday and Friday) 3,000 360.00$           0.12$                 315.30$             0.1051$   360.00$         0.120$              

4 (Tuesday and Friday) 1,914 229.68$           0.12$                 201.16$             0.1051$   229.68$         0.120$              

5 (Monday and Thursday) 3,000 360.00$           0.12$                 350.70$             0.1169$   360.00$         0.120$              

6 (Monday and Thursday) 1,920 230.40$           0.12$                 224.45$             0.1169$   230.40$         0.120$              

FIRE/ POLICE TRAINING 6,915 553.20$           0.08$                 577.40$             0.0835$   1,037.25$      0.150$              

Monthly TOTAL of GROUP 2,272.68$        2,168.81$          2,756.73$      
Yearly Total of Group 4: 27,272.16$      <= Re-Award 26,025.75$        * 33,080.76$    
Group 5: Other Sites WITHDREW FROM GROUP 5 - 

SYLVAN GLEN: 2X /  112.50$           0.15$                 259.20$             0.3456$   INCORRECT SQFT 0.040$              

Maintenance Bldg. - All Year 750 AMOUNTS

SYLVAN GLEN GC: 5X / 255.00$           0.15$                 631.55$             0.3715$   0.030$              

Pro Shop (9 mos./yr) 1,700
SANCTUARY LAKE GC: 2X /  107.85$           0.15$                 244.24$             0.3397$   0.040$              

Maintenance Bldg. - All Year 719
SANCTUARY LAKE GC: 5X / 150.00$           0.15$                 660.50$             0.6605$   0.050$              

Pro Shop (9 mos./yr) 1,000
ENGINEERING FIELD 2X / Week 353.55$           0.15$                 135.53$             0.0575$   0.040$              

OFFICE: All Year 2,357
Monthly TOTAL of GROUP 978.90$           1,931.02$          -$               
Yearly Total of Group 5: 11,746.80$      23,172.26$        -$               

23,756.71$          34,184.59$             N/A
Yearly Grand Totals - Groups 1 - 5 285,080.49$      410,215.05$           N/A
GRAND TOTAL - Groups 1-5 w/Causal 571,976.49$      734,340.69$       N/A

American Cleaning

LOCATION

Monthly GRAND TOTAL GROUPS 1 - 5

Elite Maintenance



CITY OF TROY    ITB-COT 03-06
Opening Date -- 9-23-03 BID TABULATION Pg 2 of 10
Date Prepared -- 10/14/03 JANITORIAL SERVICES

VENDOR NAME:     Road Runr Mtnce Inc

CASUAL LABOR:
 City Hall, Courts, Comm.Ctr, Library 
   22,724 Hrs x Regular Time; 272,688.00$     307,455.72$        10.75              244,283.00$   
Holiday Time   96 Hrs 1,728.00$         2,598.72$            21.50              2,064.00$       
Nature Center - 1,040 Hrs X Regular Time; 12,480.00$       14,071.20$          10.75              11,180.00$     

NOTE: HOURLY RATES NORMALIZED

Regular Time: 12.00$             13.53$   9.00 to 12.50
Employee Pay Range: 7.75  to  9.00 13.53  to 19.55 9.00  to 12.50
Holiday Time: 18.00$             27.07$   18.00 to 25.00

TOTAL OF CASUAL LABOR: 286,896.00$     324,125.64$        257,527.00$   

GRAND TOTAL:

RETURN OF BID DEPOSIT Pick Up X
Mail X X

INSURANCE: Can Meet X X X
Cannot Meet

SITE INSPECTIONS: Y or N Yes Yes Yes
DATE 9/17/2003 9/21 & 22/03 9/17/2003

VENDOR QUESTIONNAIRE Y or N Yes Yes (Part of) Yes

TERMS: 30 days Blank Blank

WARRANTY: Per Contract Blank Blank

EXCEPTIONS: Blank None Blank

PROPOSAL:  Two(2) Year Requirements of Janitorial Services for Various City Locations with an Option
to Renew for Two(2) Additional Years

* DENOTES LOW TOTAL BIDDERS

** DENOTES LOWEST ACCEPTABLE BIDDERS

ATTEST:
Steve Pallotta
Mary Ann Hayes ______________________________
Linda Bockstanz Jeanette Bennett

Purchasing Director
G: Janitiorial Services ITB-COT 03-06

   Elite Maintenance American Cleaning



CITY OF TROY    ITB-COT 03-06
Opening Date -- 9-23-03 BID TABULATION Pg 3 of 10
Date Prepared -- 10/14/03 JANITORIAL SERVICES

VENDOR NAME: THIS IS IT  OMNI Facility     Giant Janitorial
CHECK # 329724225 650318445 698816125

CHECK AMOUNT 15,150.00$       15,150.00$     15,150.00$     
SQUARE COST / $ PER COST / $ PER COST / $ PER 
FOOTAGE MONTH SQUARE FT. MONTH SQUARE FT. MONTH SQUARE FT.

Group 1:  Civic Center Sites
CITY HALL & POLICE 86,388 4,751.34$        0.055$            6,435.91$      0.0745$           5,174.64$      0.0599$          

52-4 DISTRICT COURT 29,000 2,610.00$        0.090$            2,001.00$      0.0690$           2,523.00$      0.0870$          

COMMUNITY CENTER 97,835 10,761.85$      0.110$            9,587.83$          0.0980$           10,517.26$    0.1075$          

LIBRARY 44,500 2,670.00$        0.060$            3,115.00$      0.0700$           3,110.55$      0.0699$          

 Monthly TOTAL of GROUP  $     20,793.19  $   21,139.74  $   21,325.45 
Yearly Total of Group 1:  $   249,518.28  $ 253,676.88  $ 255,905.44 
CASUAL-  22,724 Hrs x Regular Time; 289,731.00$        255,645.00$      272,688.00$      
CASUAL - Holiday Time  x 96 HRS 1,224.00$            1,632.00$          1,248.00$          
GRAND TOTAL -W/CASUAL - GROUP 1: 540,473.28$     510,953.88$  ###########
Group 2:  Garage Facilities

DPW FACILITY 9,500 1,330.00$        0.14$              1,140.00$      0.1200$           1,805.00$      0.19$              

P&R GARAGE 1,781 552.11$           0.31$              498.68$         0.2800$           614.45$         0.345$            

Monthly TOTAL of GROUP  $       1,882.11  $     1,638.68  $     2,419.45 
Yearly Total of Group 2:  $     22,585.32  $   19,664.16  $   29,033.40 
Group 3:  
Enrichment Facilities
MUSEUM 5X / Week 759.22$           0.07$              845.99$         0.0780$           1,084.60$      0.10$              

10,846
LLOYD STAGE 3X / Week 654.72$           0.08$              

NATURE CENTER 8,184 793.85$         0.0970$           638.35$         0.078$            

Monthly TOTAL of GROUP  $       1,413.94  $     1,639.84  $     1,722.95 
Yearly Total of Group 3  $     16,967.28  $   19,678.08  $   20,675.40 
Nature Center - 1,040 Hrs x Regular Time; 13,260.00$          11,700.00$        12,480.00$        
GRAND TOTAL -W/CASUAL - GROUP 3: 30,227.28$       31,378.08$     33,155.40$     
Group 4:  Fire Sites
FIRE HALLS:
1 (Tuesday and Friday) 2,175 261.00$           0.12$              289.28$         0.1330$           369.75$         0.17$              

2 (Monday and Thursday) 2,320 278.40$           0.12$              308.56$         0.1330$           394.40$         0.17$              

3 (Tuesday and Friday) 3,000 360.00$           0.12$              399.00$         0.1330$           510.00$         0.17$              

4 (Tuesday and Friday) 1,914 229.68$           0.12$              254.56$         0.1330$           325.38$         0.17$              

5 (Monday and Thursday) 3,000 360.00$           0.12$              399.00$         0.1330$           510.00$         0.17$              

6 (Monday and Thursday) 1,920 230.40$           0.12$              255.36$         0.1330$           326.40$         0.17$              

FIRE/ POLICE TRAINING 6,915 1,728.75$        0.25$              1,058.00$      0.1530$           1,521.30$      0.22$              

Monthly TOTAL of GROUP 3,448.23$        2,963.75$      3,957.23$      
Yearly Total of Group 4: 41,378.76$      35,565.00$    47,486.76$    
Group 5:  Other Sites
SYLVAN GLEN: 2X /  75.00$             0.10$              86.25$           0.1150$           202.50$         0.27$              

Maintenance Bldg. - All Year 750
SYLVAN GLEN GC: 5X / 272.00$           0.16$              241.40$         0.1420$           391.00$         0.23$              

Pro Shop (9 mos./yr) 1,700
SANCTUARY LAKE GC: 2X /  71.90$             0.10$              81.97$           0.1140$           201.32$         0.28$              

Maintenance Bldg. - All Year 719
SANCTUARY LAKE GC: 5X / 160.00$           0.16$              142.00$         0.1420$           420.00$         0.42$              

Pro Shop (9 mos./yr) 1,000
ENGINEERING FIELD 2X / Week 235.70$           0.10$              223.92$         0.0950$           259.27$         0.11$              

OFFICE: All Year 2,357
Monthly TOTAL of GROUP 814.60$           775.53$         1,474.09$      
Yearly Total of Group 5: 9,775.20$        ** 9,306.36$       +25% Service Fee 17,689.08$    

28,352.07$          28,157.54$        $2,326.59 30,899.17$     
Yearly Grand Totals - Groups 1 - 5 340,224.84$     337,890.48$      370,790.08$   
GRAND TOTAL - Groups 1-5 w/Causal 644,439.84$     606,867.48$   657,206.08$   

LOCATION

Monthly GRAND TOTAL GROUPS 1 - 5



CITY OF TROY    ITB-COT 03-06
Opening Date -- 9-23-03 BID TABULATION Pg 4 of 10
Date Prepared -- 10/14/03 JANITORIAL SERVICES

VENDOR NAME:   THIS IS IT  OMNI Facility    Giant Janitorial

CASUAL LABOR:
 City Hall, Courts, Comm.Ctr, Library 
   22,724 Hrs x Regular Time; 289,731.00$  255,645.00$  272,688.00$ 
Holiday Time   96 Hrs 1,224.00$     1,632.00$     1,248.00$     
Nature Center - 1,040 Hrs X Regular Time; 13,260.00$   11,700.00$   12,480.00$   

Regular Time: 12.75$          11.25$          12.00$          
Employee Pay Range: 10.50  to 12.75 8.00  to  8.15 6.50  to  11.00
Holiday Time: 12.75$          17.00$          13.00$          

TOTAL OF CASUAL LABOR: 304,215.00$  268,977.00$  286,416.00$ 

GRAND TOTAL:

RETURN OF BID DEPOSIT Pick Up X X
Mail X

INSURANCE: Can Meet X X X
Cannot Meet

SITE INSPECTIONS: Y or N Yes Yes   Yes
DATE 9/16/2003 9/11/2003 9/10 & 9/16

VENDOR QUESTIONNAIRE Y or N Yes Yes Yes

TERMS: Net 15 Days Net 30 Days Net 10

WARRANTY: Blank N/A /

EXCEPTIONS: Blank 25% Service Fee for Group 5 Blank
Listed in Bid

ATTEST:
Steve Pallotta
Mary Ann Hayes
Linda Bockstanz

G: Janitiorial Services ITB-COT 03-06



CITY OF TROY    ITB-COT 03-06
Opening Date -- 9-23-03 BID TABULATION Pg 5 of 10
Date Prepared -- 10/14/03 JANITORIAL SERVICES

VENDOR NAME:    HI -Tech      Clean Care     Kristel Cleaning
CHECK # 961911146 840811902-3 10118551

CHECK AMOUNT 15,150.00$       14,700.00$      15,150.00$     
SQUARE COST / $ PER COST / $ PER COST / $ PER 
FOOTAGE MONTH SQUARE FT. MONTH SQUARE FT. MONTH SQUARE FT.

Group 1:  Civic Center Sites
CITY HALL & POLICE 86,388 7,774.92$       0.09$              5,183.28$      0.06$              6,911.04$      0.08$              

52-4 DISTRICT COURT 29,000 2,900.00$       0.10$              2,900.00$      0.10$              2,320.00$      0.08$              

COMMUNITY CENTER 97,835 8,805.15$       0.09$              9,783.50$      0.10$              11,740.20$    0.12$              

LIBRARY 44,500 3,560.00$       0.08$              3,560.00$      0.08$              3,337.50$      0.075$            

 Monthly TOTAL of GROUP  $    23,040.07  $    21,426.78 WAS CLARIFIED BY  $   24,308.74 
Yearly Total of Group 1:  $  276,480.84  $  257,121.36 AUDREA ON 9/26/03  $ 291,704.88 
CASUAL-  22,724 Hrs x Regular Time; 270,415.60$       306,774.00$      272,688.00$      
CASUAL - Holiday Time  x 96 HRS 1,713.60$           768.00$             1,152.00$          
GRAND TOTAL -W/CASUAL - GROUP 1: 548,610.04$     564,663.36$   565,544.88$   
Group 2:  Garage Facilities

DPW FACILITY 9,500 1,235.00$       0.13$              1,472.50$      0.155$            1,330.00$      0.140$            

P&R GARAGE 1,781 231.53$          0.13$              1,424.80$      0.80$              302.77$         0.17$              

Monthly TOTAL of GROUP 1,466.53$       2,897.30$      1,632.77$      
Yearly Total of Group 2:  $    17,598.36  $    34,767.60  $   19,593.24 
Group 3:  
Enrichment Facilities
MUSEUM 5X / Week 759.22$          0.07$              1,301.52$      0.12$              1,518.44$      0.14$              

10,846
LLOYD STAGE 3X / Week
NATURE CENTER 8,184 982.08$          0.12$              982.08$         0.12$              613.80$         0.075$            

Monthly TOTAL of GROUP  $      1,741.30  $     2,283.60  $     2,132.24 
Yearly Total of Group 3  $    20,895.60  $    27,403.20  $   25,586.88 
Nature Center - 1,040 Hrs x Regular Time; 12,376.00$         14,040.00$        12,480.00$        
GRAND TOTAL -W/CASUAL - GROUP 3: 33,271.60$       41,443.20$      38,066.88$     
Group 4:  Fire Sites
FIRE HALLS:
1 (Tuesday and Friday) 2,175 282.75$          0.13$              435.00$         0.20$              326.25$         0.15$              

2 (Monday and Thursday) 2,320 301.60$          0.13$              464.00$         0.20$              348.00$         0.15$              

3 (Tuesday and Friday) 3,000 390.00$          0.13$              600.00$         0.20$              450.00$         0.15$              

4 (Tuesday and Friday) 1,914 248.82$          0.13$              382.00$         0.20$              287.10$         0.15$              

5 (Monday and Thursday) 3,000 390.00$          0.13$              600.00$         0.20$              450.00$         0.15$              

6 (Monday and Thursday) 1,920 249.60$          0.13$              384.00$         0.20$              288.00$         0.15$              

FIRE/ POLICE TRAINING 6,915 1,521.30$       0.22$              1,452.15$      0.21$              1,037.25$      0.15$              

Monthly TOTAL of GROUP 3,384.07$       4,317.15$      3,186.60$      
Yearly Total of Group 4: 40,608.84$     51,805.80$     38,239.20$    
Group 5:  Other Sites
SYLVAN GLEN: 2X /  112.50$          0.15$              No Bid $                 127.50$         0.17$              

Maintenance Bldg. - All Year 750
SYLVAN GLEN GC: 5X / 289.00$          0.17$              No Bid $                 459.00$         0.27$              

Pro Shop (9 mos./yr) 1,700
SANCTUARY LAKE GC: 2X /  115.04$          0.16$              No Bid $                 122.23$         0.17$              

Maintenance Bldg. - All Year 719
SANCTUARY LAKE GC: 5X / 290.00$          0.29$              No Bid $                 450.00$         0.45$              

Pro Shop (9 mos./yr) 1,000
ENGINEERING FIELD 2X / Week 235.70$          0.10$              No Bid $                 235.70$         0.10$              

OFFICE: All Year 2,357
Monthly TOTAL of GROUP 1,042.24$       No Bid 1,394.43$      
Yearly Total of Group 5: 12,506.88$     0 16,733.16$     

30,674.21$         N/A 32,654.78$        
Yearly Grand Totals - Groups 1 - 5 368,090.52$       N/A 391,857.36$      
GRAND TOTAL - Groups 1-5 w/Causal 652,595.72$     N/A 678,177.36$   

LOCATION

Monthly GRAND TOTAL GROUPS 1 - 5



CITY OF TROY    ITB-COT 03-06
Opening Date -- 9-23-03 BID TABULATION Pg 6 of 10
Date Prepared -- 10/14/03 JANITORIAL SERVICES

VENDOR NAME:    HI -Tech    Clean Care  Kristel Cleaning

CASUAL LABOR:
 City Hall, Courts, Comm.Ctr, Library 
   22,724 Hrs x Regular Time; 270,415.60$  306,774.00$  272,688.00$ 
Holiday Time   96 Hrs 1,713.60$     768.00$        1,152.00$     
Nature Center - 1,040 Hrs X Regular Time; 12,376.00$   14,040.00$   12,480.00$   

Regular Time: 11.90$          13.50$          12.00$          
Employee Pay Range: 8.00  to 9.00 7.00  to 11.00 8.00  to 12.00
Holiday Time: 17.85$          8.00$            12.00$          

TOTAL OF CASUAL LABOR: 284,505.20$  321,582.00$  286,320.00$ 

GRAND TOTAL:

RETURN OF BID DEPOSIT Pick Up Blank X
Mail X Blank

INSURANCE: Can Meet X X X
Cannot Meet

SITE INSPECTIONS: Y or N Yes No Yes
DATE 9/11/2003 9/11/2003

VENDOR QUESTIONNAIRE Y or N Yes Yes Yes

TERMS: Net 30 Days 30 Days/Net Blank

WARRANTY: Yes Blank Blank

EXCEPTIONS: All or None award Blank N/A

ATTEST:
Steve Pallotta
Mary Ann Hayes
Linda Bockstanz

G: Janitiorial Services ITB-COT 03-06

Current Contractor



CITY OF TROY    ITB-COT 03-06
Opening Date -- 9-23-03 BID TABULATION Pg 7 of 10
Date Prepared -- 10/14/03 JANITORIAL SERVICES

VENDOR NAME:     SABER      ABM Jantorial   At Your Service Cleaning
CHECK # 698787165 875227425-3

CHECK AMOUNT 12,000.00$       15,150.00$      15,150.00$      
SQUARE COST / $ PER COST / $ PER COST / $ PER 
FOOTAGE MONTH SQUARE FT. MONTH SQUARE FT. MONTH SQUARE FT.

Group 1:  Civic Center Sites
CITY HALL & POLICE 86,388 6,219.94$       0.0720$           7,170.20$      0.083$            10,107.40$     0.1170$          

52-4 DISTRICT COURT 29,000 2,436.00$       0.0840$           3,596.00$      0.124$            3,161.00$       0.1090$          

COMMUNITY CENTER 97,835 8,707.32$       0.0890$           9,783.50$      0.10$              9,587.83$       0.0980$          

LIBRARY 44,500 3,871.50$       0.0870$           4,450.00$      0.10$              5,918.50$       0.1330$          

 Monthly TOTAL of GROUP  $     21,234.75  $    24,999.70  $    28,774.73 
Yearly Total of Group 1:  $   254,817.01  $  299,996.40  $  345,296.71 
CASUAL-  22,724 Hrs x Regular Time; 318,136.00$        274,278.68$      295,184.76$       
CASUAL - Holiday Time  x 96 HRS 1,728.00$            1,728.00$          1,775.04$           
GRAND TOTAL -W/CASUAL - GROUP 1: 574,681.01$     576,003.08$   642,256.51$    
Group 2:  Garage Facilities

DPW FACILITY 9,500 No Bid -$                2,194.50$      0.231$            2,736.00$       0.288$            

P&R GARAGE 1,781  No Bid -$                1,259.17$      0.707$            537.86$          0.302$            

Monthly TOTAL of GROUP  No Bid 3,453.67$       $      3,273.86 
Yearly Total of Group 2: 0  $    41,444.04  $    39,286.34 
Group 3:  
Enrichment Facilities
MUSEUM 5X / Week No Bid -$                770.07$         0.071$            1,052.06$       0.097              

10,846
LLOYD STAGE 3X / Week No Bid -$              491.04$         0.06$              

NATURE CENTER 8,184 867.50$          0.106              

Monthly TOTAL of GROUP  No Bid  $     1,261.11  $      1,919.57 
Yearly Total of Group 3 0  $    15,133.27  $    23,034.79 
Nature Center - 1,040 Hrs x Regular Time; 14,560.00$          12,552.80$        13,509.60$         
GRAND TOTAL -W/CASUAL - GROUP 3: 14,560.00$       27,686.07$      36,544.39$      
Group 4:  Fire Sites
FIRE HALLS: -$                

1 (Tuesday and Friday) 2,175 No Bid -$                152.25$         0.07$              289.28$          0.133$            

2 (Monday and Thursday) 2,320 No Bid -$                178.64$         0.077$            285.36$          0.123$            

3 (Tuesday and Friday) 3,000 No Bid -$                231.00$         0.077$            354.00$          0.118$            

4 (Tuesday and Friday) 1,914 No Bid -$                153.12$         0.08$              273.70$          0.143$            

5 (Monday and Thursday) 3,000 No Bid -$                204.00$         0.068$            354.00$          0.118$            

6 (Monday and Thursday) 1,920 No Bid -$                153.60$         0.08$              268.80$          0.140$            

FIRE/ POLICE TRAINING 6,915 No Bid 1,535.13$      0.222$            1,002.68$       0.145$            

Monthly TOTAL of GROUP No Bid 2,607.74$      2,827.81$       
Yearly Total of Group 4: 0 31,292.88$     33,933.74$     
Group 5:  Other Sites -$                

SYLVAN GLEN: 2X /  No Bid 54.75$           0.073$            219.00$          0.292$            

Maintenance Bldg. - All Year 750 -$                

SYLVAN GLEN GC: 5X / No Bid 384.20$         0.226$            402.90$          0.237$            

Pro Shop (9 mos./yr) 1,700 -$                

SANCTUARY LAKE GC: 2X /  No Bid 51.05$           0.071$            212.82$          0.296$            

Maintenance Bldg. - All Year 719 -$                

SANCTUARY LAKE GC: 5X / No Bid 256.00$         0.256$            378.00$          0.378$            

Pro Shop (9 mos./yr) 1,000 -$                

ENGINEERING FIELD 2X / Week No Bid 153.21$         0.065$            263.98$          0.112$            

OFFICE: All Year 2,357
Monthly TOTAL of GROUP No Bid 899.20$         1,476.71$       
Yearly Total of Group 5: 0 10,790.45$     17,720.50$     

 N/A 33,221.42$        38,272.67$         
Yearly Grand Totals - Groups 1 - 5 N/A 398,657.04$      459,272.09$       
GRAND TOTAL - Groups 1-5 w/Causal N/A 687,216.52$    769,741.49$    

LOCATION

Monthly GRAND TOTAL GROUPS 1 - 5

NO CHECK/See Letter 



CITY OF TROY    ITB-COT 03-06
Opening Date -- 9-23-03 BID TABULATION Pg 8 of 10
Date Prepared -- 10/14/03 JANITORIAL SERVICES

VENDOR NAME:
SABER ABM Janitorial   At Your Service Cleaning

CASUAL LABOR:
 City Hall, Courts, Comm.Ctr, Library 
   22,724 Hrs x Regular Time; 318,136.00$  274,278.68$  295,184.76$ 
Holiday Time   96 Hrs 1,728.00$     1,728.00$     1,775.04$     
Nature Center - 1,040 Hrs X Regular Time; 14,560.00$   12,552.80$   13,509.60$   

Regular Time: 14.00$          12.07$          12.99$          
Employee Pay Range: 8.00  to  11.00 7.00  to  12.00 9.00  to  10.00
Holiday Time: 18.00$          18.00$          18.49$          

TOTAL OF CASUAL LABOR: 334,424.00$  288,559.48$  310,469.40$ 

GRAND TOTAL:

RETURN OF BID DEPOSIT Pick Up X
Mail X X

INSURANCE: Can Meet X X X
Cannot Meet

SITE INSPECTIONS: Y or N   Yes Yes   Yes
DATE 9/11/2003 9/11/2003 9/11/2003

VENDOR QUESTIONNAIRE Y or N Yes Yes Yes

TERMS: Option #1 Blank Net 15 Days

WARRANTY: Blank Blank Blank

EXCEPTIONS: Blank ABM based its proposal on All or None Award
being awarded all locations

ATTEST:
Steve Pallotta
Mary Ann Hayes
Linda Bockstanz

G: Janitiorial Services ITB-COT 03-06



CITY OF TROY    ITB-COT 03-06
Opening Date -- 9-23-03 BID TABULATION Pg 9 of 10
Date Prepared -- 10/14/03 JANITORIAL SERVICES

VENDOR NAME:    24/7  365 Inc Corporate Cleaning
CHECK # 840811903-2 5733124716/5733124727 Five(5) Int'l Money Orders

CHECK AMOUNT 14,700.00$       900.00$          450.00$        2,250.00$       
SQUARE COST / $ PER COST / $ PER COST / $ PER 
FOOTAGE MONTH SQUARE FT. MONTH SQUARE FT. MONTH SQUARE FT.

Group 1:  Civic Center Sites
CITY HALL & POLICE 86,388 14,685.96$     0.17$              No Bid -$              No Bid -$            

52-4 DISTRICT COURT 29,000 2,610.00$       0.09$              No Bid -$              No Bid -$            

COMMUNITY CENTER 97,835 12,229.38$         0.125$            No Bid -$            No Bid -$            

LIBRARY 44,500 5,562.50$       0.125$            No Bid -$              No Bid -$            

 Monthly TOTAL of GROUP  $    35,087.84 WAS CLARIFIED BY  No Bid  No Bid 
Yearly Total of Group 1:  $  421,054.08 AUDREA ON 9/26/03 0 0
CASUAL-  22,724 Hrs x Regular Time; 294,048.56$       -$                  -$                   
CASUAL - Holiday Time  x 96 HRS 936.00$              -$                  -$                   
GRAND TOTAL -W/CASUAL - GROUP 1:  $716,038.64 -$               -$               
Group 2:  Garage Facilities

DPW FACILITY 9,500 1,330.00$       0.14$              No Bid -$                1,045.00$      0.11$              

P&R GARAGE 1,781 516.49$          0.29$              No Bid -$                356.20$         0.20$              

Monthly TOTAL of GROUP  $      1,846.49  No Bid  $     1,401.20 
Yearly Total of Group 2:  $    22,157.88 0  $   16,814.40 => DMS

Group 3:  
Enrichment Facilities
MUSEUM 5X / Week 1,193.06$       0.11$              867.68$         0.080$            No Bid -$                

10,846
LLOYD STAGE 3X / Week
NATURE CENTER 8,184 900.24$          0.11$              1,145.76$      0.14$              No Bid -$              

Monthly TOTAL of GROUP  $      2,093.30  $     2,013.44  No Bid 
Yearly Total of Group 3  $    25,119.60  $   24,161.28 0
Nature Center - 1,040 Hrs x Regular Time; 13,457.60$         14,040.00$        -$                   
GRAND TOTAL -W/CASUAL - GROUP 3: 38,577.20$       38,201.28$     -$                
Group 4:  Fire Sites
FIRE HALLS:
1 (Tuesday and Friday) 2,175 304.50$          0.14$              No Bid -$                217.50$         0.10$              

2 (Monday and Thursday) 2,320 324.80$          0.14$              No Bid -$                232.00$         0.10$              

3 (Tuesday and Friday) 3,000 420.00$          0.14$              No Bid -$                300.00$         0.10$              

4 (Tuesday and Friday) 1,914 267.96$          0.14$              No Bid -$                191.40$         0.10$              

5 (Monday and Thursday) 3,000 420.00$          0.14$              No Bid -$                300.00$         0.10$              

6 (Monday and Thursday) 1,920 268.80$          0.14$              No Bid -$                192.00$         0.10$              

FIRE/ POLICE TRAINING 6,915 1,037.25$       0.15$              No Bid -$                760.65$         0.11$              

Monthly TOTAL of GROUP 3,043.31$       No Bid 2,193.55$      
Yearly Total of Group 4: 36,519.72$     0 26,322.60$    
Group 5:  Other Sites
SYLVAN GLEN: 2X /  No Bid $                 97.50$           0.13$              90.00$           0.12$              

Maintenance Bldg. - All Year 750 0
SYLVAN GLEN GC: 5X / No Bid $                 289.00$         0.17$              204.00$         0.12$              

Pro Shop (9 mos./yr) 1,700 0
SANCTUARY LAKE GC: 2X /  No Bid $                 100.66$         0.14$              71.90$           0.10$              

Maintenance Bldg. - All Year 719 0
SANCTUARY LAKE GC: 5X / No Bid $                 150.00$         0.15$              110.00$         0.11$              

Pro Shop (9 mos./yr) 1,000 0
ENGINEERING FIELD 2X / Week No Bid $                 259.27$         0.11$              235.70$         0.10$              

OFFICE: All Year 2,357 0
Monthly TOTAL of GROUP No Bid 896.43$         711.60$         
Yearly Total of Group 5: 0 10,757.16$         $     8,539.20 => DMS

N/A N/A N/A
Yearly Grand Totals - Groups 1 - 5 N/A N/A N/A
GRAND TOTAL - Groups 1-5 w/Causal N/A N/A N/A

CITY OF TROY    ITB-COT 03-06

LOCATION

Monthly GRAND TOTAL GROUPS 1 - 5

Group 2 - DMS

Group 5 - DMS

European Best Cleaning



Opening Date -- 9-23-03 BID TABULATION Pg 10 of 10
Date Prepared -- 10/14/03 JANITORIAL SERVICES

VENDOR NAME:      24/7  365 Inc.    Corporate Cleaning

CASUAL LABOR:
 City Hall, Courts, Comm.Ctr, Library 
   22,724 Hrs x Regular Time; 294,048.56$  -$              -$              
Holiday Time   96 Hrs 936.00$        -$              0
Nature Center - 1,040 Hrs X Regular Time; 13,457.60$   14,040.00$   -$              

Regular Time: 12.94$          13.50$          Blank
Employee Pay Range: 6.50  to  8.50 Blank Blank
Holiday Time: 9.75$            20.25$          Blank

TOTAL OF CASUAL LABOR: 308,442.16$  14,040.00$   -$              

GRAND TOTAL:

RETURN OF BID DEPOSIT Pick Up X Blank Blank
Mail Blank Blank

INSURANCE: Can Meet X X X
Cannot Meet

SITE INSPECTIONS: Y or N Yes Yes   Yes
DATE 9/18/2003 9/17/2003

VENDOR QUESTIONNAIRE Y or N Yes Yes Yes

TERMS: 30 Days Net Blank Blank

WARRANTY: Blank Blank

EXCEPTIONS: Blank Blank Blank

DMS:
 European Best Cleaning - Group 2 ($16,814.40); Group 5 ($8,539.20)
    Reason: Lack of Equipment, failure to pass site visit inspection, inaccurate reference information

NO BIDS:
  Commercial Building Mtnce
  Speed Clean Service
  Right Way Janitorial

ATTEST:
Steve Pallotta
Mary Ann Hays
Linda Bockstanz

G: Janitiorial Services ITB-COT 03-06

Many Occasions

Attached to Bid

European Best Cleaning




