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)]

November 3, 2006

TO: Phillip L. Nelson, City Manager

FROM: Brian P. Murphy, Assistant City Manager/Economic Development Services
Jeanette Bennett, Purchasing Director
Timothy L. Richnak, Public Works Director

SUBJECT: Standard Purchasing Resolution 1: — Award To Low Bidders —
Traffic Control Signs And Posts

Background
= On October 17, 2006, bid proposals were received for one-year requirements of Traffic Control Signs and

Posts with an option to renew for one additional year.
= |tems bid were separated into ten proposal categories, A - J, and shall be awarded per complete proposal.

= Signs and posts are required for new installations, repairs and replacement, and ordered on an as needed
basis.
= 106 vendors were notified via the MITN system with eleven bid responses received; as well as one late bid.

= Low bidders are as follows: 1) Vulcan Signs for finished signs — 2) Rocal Inc. for finished signs with
diamond grade sheeting — 3) Garden State Highway Products, Inc. for traffic sign faces — 4) Allied
Municipal Supply for tubular and U-channel posts — and 5) Custom Products Corporation for round steel
posts.

Financial Considerations
= Funds are available in the 2006/07 Operating Budget of the Public Works Streets Division.

Legal Considerations
= |TB-COT 06-51, Traffic Control Signs and Posts was competitively bid and opened with eleven bidders
responding.

Policy Considerations
= Proper sign placement and legibility are required to warn, regulate and maintain the safety of motorists and
pedestrians. (Goal 11l & VI)

Options

e City management recommends awarding contracts on a proposal by proposal basis to the five low bidders,
Vulcan Signs of Foley, AL, Proposals A, C, D, F & G; Rocal Inc. of Frankfort, OH, Proposals B & G; Garden
State Highway Products, Inc. of Vineland, NJ, Proposals E & G; Allied Municipal Supply of Taylorville, IL,
Proposals H & J; and Custom Products Corporation of Jackson, MS, Proposal | for an estimated total cost
of $28,694.40, at unit prices contained in the bid tabulation.
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CITY OF TROY
Opening Date -- 10/17/06 BID TABULATION

Date Prepared -- 11/3/06

TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS

ITB-COT 06-51
Pg.10f6

VENDOR NAME: Vulcan Rocal Inc. | Garden State Allied
Signs Highway Municipal
Products Supply
EST UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
PROPOSAL A: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE 3M HIGH INTENSITY ON ALUMINUM -
1. 50 36" YIELD $ 1822 | $ 23.96 | $ 26.02 No bid
2. 50 30" STOP $ 25.72 | $ 2471 | $ 34.04 No bid
3. 10 36" STOP $ 37.05| $ 35.58 | $ 49.02 No bid
4. 10 18" x 6" All Way $ 349 | $ 4941 % 4.72 No bid
PROPOSAL A: ESTIMATED TOTAL -- $ 260240|% 2,838.70|$% 3,540.40 No bid
PROPOSAL B: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE 3M Diamond Grade, VIP Sheeting, Fluorescent yellow green on Aluminum
1. 10 36" S1-1 School Advance $ 70.32 | $ 60.57 | $ 77.63 No bid
2. 10 36" S2-1 School Crossing $ 7032 | $ 60.57 | $ 77.63 No bid
3. 10 12 x 24 -W 16-7 Left School Arrow $ 16.70 | $ 1453 | $ 18.75 No bid
PROPOSAL B: ESTIMATED TOTAL -- $ 157340|% 1,356.70|$% 1,740.10 No bid
PROPOSAL C: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - ONE COLOK
1. 10 12" X 18" One Color $ 590 | $ 1010 | $ 7.12 No bid
2. 20 12" X 36" One Color $ 1071 | $ 20.19 | $ 13.91 No bid
3. 30 18" X 18" One Color $ 8353 1514 | $ 10.43 No bid
4. 20 24" X 24" One Color $ 1428 | $ 26.92 | $ 18.54 No bid
5. 50 24" X 30" One Color $ 1785 % 33.65| % 23.18 No bid
6. 50 30" X 30" One Color $ 2231 $ 4206 | $ 28.98 No bid
7. 10 30" X 36" One Color $ 3213 | $ 60.57 | $ 41.73 No bid
8. 10 48" X 48" One Color $ 5712 | $ 107.68 | $ 74.19 No bid
9. 50 12" X 30 Hi Int W/Round Corners $ 11.23 | $ 1683 | $ 14.78 No bid
10. 50 12" X 36 Hi Int W/Round Corners $ 13.47 | $ 2019 | $ 17.73 No bid
11. 20 12" X 42 Hi Int W/Round Corners $ 1572 | $ 23.56 | $ 20.69 No bid
12. 50 12" X 48 Hi Int W/Round Corners $ 17.96 | $ 2692 | $ 23.64 No bid
13. 10 12" X 60 Hi Int W/Round Corners $ 2245 | $ 33.65| $ 29.55 No bid
PROPOSAL C:. ESTIMATED TOTAL -- $ 6,381.70 | $ 10,970.10|$ 8,317.10 No bid
PROPOSAL D: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE, TWO OR MORE COLORS
1. 200 12" X 12" Two Color $ 4251 % 7.06 | $ 5.62 No bid
2. 50 12" X 18" Two Color $ 6.03 (% 1059 | $ 7.47 No bid
PROPOSAL D: ESTIMATED TOTAL -- $ 1,15150|% 1,94150|% 1,497.50 No bid
PROPOSAL E: 3M STANDARD PRE-PRINTED TRAFFIC SIGN FACES
1. 500 12" X 12" No Parking Symbol R8-3A $ 1.46 | $ 213 | $ 1.14 No bid
2. 20 30" Stop Faces High Intensity $ 1240 | $ 11.03 | $ 13.61 No bid
3. 20 36" Yield Faces High Intensity $ 748 | $ 831 (% 9.79 No bid
PROPOSAL E: ESTIMATED TOTAL -- $ 112760]|% 1,451.80|% 1,038.00 No bid
PROPOSAL F: DOUBLE FACED, TWO SIDED ON WHITE
1. 40 9" X 30" Extruded High Intensity White $ 16.31 | $ 23.00 | $ 23.41 No bid
2. 40 9" X 36" Extruded High Intensity White $ 1956 | $ 27.60 | $ 28.09 No bid
3. 40 9" X 42" Extruded High Intensity White $ 22.85 [ % 3220 | $ 32.77 No bid
4, 40 6" X 24" Extruded High Intensity White $ 9.07 [ $ 1840 | $ 12.94 No bid
5. 50 6" X 30" Extruded High Intensity White $ 11.35| $ 23.00 | $ 16.17 No bid
6. 50 6" X 36" Extruded High Intensity White $ 1361 | $ 27.60 | $ 19.41 No bid
7. 50 6" X 42" Extruded High Intensity White [ $ 15.86 | $ 3220 | $ 22.64 No bid
PROPOSAL F: ESTIMATED TOTAL -- $ 4,75260]|% 8,188.00|% 6,799.40 No bid
PROPOSAL G: SET UP FEES CALL $ 150.00 | $ 25.00 No Bid
CALL $ 150.00 | $ 25.00 No bid




CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 06-51

Opening Date -- 10-17-06 BID TABULATION Pg. 2 of 6
Date Prepared -- 11/3/06 TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS
VENDOR NAME: Vulcan Rocal Inc. | Garden State Allied
Signs Highway Municipal
Products Supply
PROPOSAL H; Square Tubular Sign Posts - Perforated - Galvanized Steel - FHWA Approved
1. 100 12 Ftx 1-3/4 " - 14 Gauge No bid No bid $ 39.18 | $ 19.75
2. 100 9 Ft x 1-1/2" - 14 Gauge No bid No bid $ 2938 | $ 15.07
3. 100 3 Ftx2"Base-12 Gauge No bid No bid $ 1980 | $ 9.15
4 100 3 Ftx 1-3/4" Base - 12 Gauge No bid No bid $ 1782 | $ 8.14
PROPOSAL H: ESTIMATED TOTAL -- No bid No bid $ 10,618.00|$ 5,211.00
PROPOSAL I: Round Galvanized Steel Post, 2" Nominal Size, 2 1/8" ID 2-3/8" OD.,125 Wall Thickness, 3lbs LF
1. 100 12 Ft Galvanized Steel Round Post No bid No bid $ 76.25 1 $ 21.36
PROPOSAL |: ESTIMATED TOTAL -- No bid No bid $ 7,62500(|% 2,136.00
PROPOSAL J: U-Channel Sign Posts
1. 50 12 Ft - 3 Ibs Galvanized Steel $ 31.02 No bid $ 40.12 | $ 25.95
2. 100 12 Ft - 3 Ibs Green Painted Steel $ 24.01 No bid $ 2947 | $ 18.95
3. 100 10 Ft - 2 Ibs Green Painted Steel $ 12.90 No bid $ 19.70 | $ 11.57
PROPOSAL J: ESTIMATED TOTAL $ 5,242.00 No bid $ 6,923.00|% 4,349.50
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS: |$ 1488820]% 1,356.70[$ 1,038.00 9,560.50
DELIVERY:
Minimum Shipment $ 50.00 $1,000.00 ([ $ 1,000.00 25 pc
# of Days 3-5 days - stock 45 30 30
30 days nonstock
CONTACT: Hrs of Operation 7:00 to 4:00 8:00 to 4:30 7:00 to 5:00 7:00 to 5:00
Phone # N/A 704-998-2122 609-774-1116 800-824-0783
TERMS: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Days 30 Days
WARRANTY: Standard 3M 10 Years 10 Years
3-5 days - stock
DELIVERY: 30 days nonstock 45 30 30
EXCEPTIONS: Blank Listed in Blank N/A
Bid
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT: Y orN Yes Yes Yes Yes
ATTEST: BOLDFACE TYPE DENOTES LOW BIDDER BY PROPOSAL
Tom Rosewarne
Emily Frontera
Charlene McComb Jeanette Bennett
Linda Bockstanz Purchasing Director
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CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 06-51

Opening Date -- 10/17/06 BID TABULATION Pg.30f 6
Date Prepared -- 11/3/06 TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS
VENDOR NAME: Custom Unistrut Dornbos Hall Signs
Products Detriot Sign Inc
Corporation
EST UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
PROPOSAL A: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE 3M HIGH INTENSITY ON ALUMINUM -
1. 50 36" YIELD $ 18.85 No bid No bid $ 22.91
2. 50 30" STOP $ 27.86 No bid No bid $ 29.20
3. 10 36" STOP $ 40.13 No bid No bid $ 41.76
4, 10 18" x 6" All Way $ 4.73 No bid No bid $ 4.02
PROPOSAL A: ESTIMATED TOTAL -- $ 2,784.10 No bid No bid $ 3,063.30
PROPOSAL B: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE 3M Diamond Grade, VIP Sheeting, Fluorescent yellow green on Aluminum
1. 10 36" S1-1 School Advance $ 68.16 No bid No bid $ 74.31
2. 10 36" S2-1 School Crossing $ 68.16 No bid No bid $ 74.31
3. 10 12 x 24 -W 16-7 Left School Arrow $ 15.97 No bid No bid $ 17.39
PROPOSAL B: ESTIMATED TOTAL -- $ 1,522.90 No bid No bid $ 1,660.10
PROPOSAL C: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - ONE COLOFR
1. 10 12" X 18" One Color $ 5.83 No bid No bid $ 5.82
2. 20 12" X 36" One Color $ 10.79 No bid No bid $ 11.11
3. 30 18" X 18" One Color $ 8.72 No bid No bid $ 8.58
4, 20 24" X 24" One Color $ 14.39 No bid No bid $ 14.71
5. 50 24" X 30" One Color $ 17.92 No bid No bid $ 18.23
6. 50 30" X 30" One Color $ 21.70 No bid No bid $ 22.71
7. 10 30" X 36" One Color $ 31.00 No bid No bid $ 32.45
8. 10 48" X 48" One Color $ 54.67 No bid No bid $ 59.96
9. 50 12" X 30 Hi Int W/Round Corners $ 12.43 No bid No bid $ 12.37
10. 50 12" X 36 Hi Int W/Round Corners $ 14.08 No bid No bid $ 14.84
11. 20 12" X 42 Hi Int W/Round Corners $ 17.45 No bid No bid $ 17.31
12. 50 12" X 48 Hi Int W/Round Corners $ 19.78 No bid No bid $ 19.79
13. 10 12" X 60 Hi Int W/Round Corners $ 24.40 No bid No bid $ 24.73
PROPOSAL C: ESTIMATED TOTAL -- $ 6,568.70 No bid No bid $ 6,746.60
PROPOSAL D: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE, TWO OR MORE COLORS
1. 200 12" X 12" Two Color $ 5.46 No bid No bid $ 4.54
2. 50 12" X 18" Two Color $ 6.35 No bid No bid $ 6.47
PROPOSAL D: ESTIMATED TOTAL -- $ 1,409.50 No bid No bid $ 1,231.50
PROPOSAL E: 3M STANDARD PRE-PRINTED TRAFFIC SIGN FA(|3ES
1. 500 12" X 12" No Parking Symbol R8-3A $ 2.41 No bid No bid $ 1.38
2. 20 30" Stop Faces High Intensity $ 12.46 No bid No bid $ 13.18
3. 20 36" Yield Faces High Intensity $ 8.56 No bid No bid $ 9.85
PROPOSAL E: ESTIMATED TOTAL -- $ 1,625.40 No bid No bid $ 1,150.60
PROPOSAL F: DOUBLE FACED, TWO SIDED ON WHITE
1. 40 9" X 30" Extruded High Intensity White $ 21.04 No bid No bid $ 29.40
2. 40 9" X 36" Extruded High Intensity White $ 25.25 No bid No bid $ 35.16
3. 40 9" X 42" Extruded High Intensity White $ 29.46 No bid No bid $ 40.94
4, 40 6" X 24" Extruded High Intensity White $ 11.22 No bid No bid $ 16.57
5. 50 6" X 30" Extruded High Intensity White $ 14.03 No bid No bid $ 20.54
6. 50 6" X 36" Extruded High Intensity White $ 16.83 No bid No bid $ 24.49
7. 50 6" X 42" Extruded High Intensity White $ 19.64 No bid No bid $ 28.46
PROPOSAL F. ESTIMATED TOTAL -- $ 6,003.80 No bid No bid $ 8,557.30
PROPOSAL G: SET UP FEES l $ 75.00 No Bid No Bid $ 69.26
$ 75.00 No bid No bid $ 69.26




CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 06-51
Opening Date -- 10-17-06 BID TABULATION Pg. 4 of 6
Date Prepared -- 11/3/06 TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS
VENDOR NAME: Custom Unistrut Dornbos Hall Signs
Products Detriot Sign Inc
Corporation
PROPOSAL H; Square Tubular Sign Posts - Perforated - Galvanized Steel - FHWA Approved
1. 100 12 Ftx 1-3/4 " - 14 Gauge $ 2458 | $ 19.80 No bid $ 24.08
2. 100 9 Ft x 1-1/2" - 14 Gauge $ 16.82 | $ 16.65 No bid $ 18.07
3. 100 3 Ftx2"Base - 12 Gauge $ 11.00 | $ 9.13 No bid $ 8.42
4 100 3 Ft x 1-3/4" Base - 12 Gauge $ 929 $ 7.44 No bid $ 9.88
PROPOSAL H: ESTIMATED TOTAL -- $ 6,169.00 | $ 5,302.00 No bid $ 6,045.00
PROPOSAL I: Round Galvanized Steel Post, 2" Nominal Size, 2 1/8" ID 2-3/8" OD.,125 Wall Thickness, 3Ibs LF
1. 100 12 Ft Galvanized Steel Round Post $ 18.51 No bid Blank No bid
PROPOSAL I: ESTIMATED TOTAL -- $ 1,851.00 No bid Blank No bid
PROPOSAL J: U-Channel Sign Posts
1. 50 12 Ft - 3 Ibs Galvanized Steel $ 30.23 No bid $ 3012 | $ 30.76
2. 100 12 Ft - 3 Ibs Green Painted Steel $ 22.18 No bid $ 1969 | $ 22.03
3. 100 10 Ft - 2 Ibs Green Painted Steel $ 12.86 No bid $ 1093 | $ 12.31
PROPOSAL J: ESTIMATED TOTAL -- $ 5,015.50 No bid $ 4568.00$ 4,972.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS: [$ 1,851.00
DELIVERY:
Minimum Shipment $1,000.00 $50.00 Blank $1,000.00
# of Days 7 -45 5 Blank 30-45 signs
45-75 posts
CONTACT: Hrs of Operation 7:30 to 5:00 7:30 to 5:00 7:30 to 5:00 8:00 to 5:00
Phone # 800-367-1492 | 734-778-9452 | 517-719-2417 800-284-7446
TERMS: Net 30 Days Blank N-30 0% Net 30
WARRANTY: Standard 3M Blank Blank Attached to Bid
30-45 signs
DELIVERY: 7 -45 Blank 30 45-75 posts
EXCEPTIONS: Listed in Blank Blank Listed in
Bid Bid
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT: Y orN Yes Yes Yes Yes
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CITY OF TROY
Opening Date -- 10/17/06 BID TABULATION

Date Prepared -- 11/3/06

TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS

ITB-COT 06-51
Pg.50f 6

VENDOR NAME: Subcon Michigan State | Electromark
International Industries Company
LLC
EST UNIT UNIT UNIT
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE
PROPOSAL A: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE 3M HIGH INTENSITY ON ALUMINUM -
1. 50 36" YIELD $ 2471 | $ 87.75| % 118.19
2. 50 30" STOP $ 3432 | $ 87.75| $ 90.31
3. 10 36"STOP $ 4941 [ $ 87.75| % 163.15
4, 10 18"x 6" All Way $ 412 | $ 7.80 | % 34.04
PROPOSAL A: ESTIMATED TOTAL -- $ 3486.80|$% 9,73050| % 12,396.90
PROPOSAL B: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE 3M Diamond Grade, VIP Sheeting, Fluorescent yellow green on Aluminum
1. 10 36" S1-1 School Advance $ 82711 % 105.75 | $ 264.97
2. 10 36" S2-1 School Crossing $ 82.71 | $ 105.75 | $ 264.97
3. 10 12 x 24 -W 16-7 Left School Arrow $ 1838 | $ 2350 | $ 76.56
PROPOSAL B: ESTIMATED TOTAL -- $ 1838.00|$% 2,350.00|$ 6,065.00

PROPOSAL C: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - ONE COLOF

1. 10 12"X 18" One Color $ 1287 | $ 2350 | $ 39.25
2. 20 12" X 36" One Color $ 25.74 | $ 3525 | $ 41.76
3. 30 18" X 18" One Color $ 1931 | $ 47.00 [ $ 47.51
4, 20 24" X 24" One Color $ 3432 | $ 47.00 [ $ 125.42
5. 50 24" X 30" One Color $ 4290 [ $ 7050 | $ 77.79
6. 50 30" X 30" One Color $ 53.63 | $ 105.75 [ $ 91.56
7. 10 30" X 36" One Color $ 7722 | $ 105.75 | $ 121.84
8. 10 48"X 48" One Color $ 13728 $ 187.20 [ $ 218.38
9. 50 12" X 30 Hi Int W/Round Corners $ 13.73 | $ 29.25| $ 36.95
10. 50 12" X 36 Hi Int W/Round Corners $ 1647 | $ 29.25 | $ 43.20
11. 20 12" X 42 Hi Int W/Round Corners $ 19.22 | $ 34.00 | $ 59.40
12. 50 12" X 48 Hi Int W/Round Corners $ 2196 | $ 39.00 | $ 55.70
13. 10 12" X 60 Hi Int W/Round Corners $ 2745 | $ 4875 | $ 110.41
PROPOSAL C: ESTIMATED TOTAL -- $ 12,147.60 | $ 21,07450| $ 26,115.70
PROPOSAL D: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE, TWO OR MORE COLORS
1. 200 12" X 12" Two Color $ 8.86 | $ 11.75 | $ 11.58
2. 50 12" X 18" Two Color $ 1329 | $ 2350 | $ 20.91
PROPOSAL D: ESTIMATED TOTAL -- $ 2,43650]|$% 3525.00|% 3,361.50
PROPOSAL E: 3M STANDARD PRE-PRINTED TRAFFIC SIGN F,lACES
1. 500 12" X 12" No Parking Symbol R8-3A $ 279 $ 6.15| $ 3.13
2. 20 30" Stop Faces High Intensity $ 19.50 | $ 87.75 | % 49.72
3. 20 36" Yield Faces High Intensity $ 28.08 | $ 87.75| % 65.36
PROPOSAL E: ESTIMATED TOTAL -- $ 2,346.60|$% 6,585.00|$ 3,866.60
PROPOSAL F: DOUBLE FACED, TWO SIDED ON WHITE
1. 40 9" X 30" Extruded High Intensity White $ 29.06 N/A No bid
2. 40 9" X 36" Extruded High Intensity White $ 34.87 N/A No bid
3. 40 9" X 42" Extruded High Intensity White $ 40.68 N/A No bid
4. 40 6" X 24" Extruded High Intensity White $ 17.91 N/A No bid
5. 50 6" X 30" Extruded High Intensity White $ 22.09 N/A No bid
6. 50 6" X 36" Extruded High Intensity White $ 26.87 N/A No bid
7. 50 6" X 42" Extruded High Intensity White $ 31.34 N/A No bid
PROPOSAL F: ESTIMATED TOTAL -- $ 8,915.80 N/A No bid
PROPOSAL G: SET UP FEES $ 90.00 Blank $ -
$ 90.00 Blank $ -




Opening Date -- 10-17-06
Date Prepared -- 11/3/06

CITY OF TROY

BID TABULATION
TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS

ITB-COT 06-51
Pg. 6 of 6

VENDOR NAME: Subcon Michigan State | Electromark
International Industries Company
LLC
PROPOSAL H; Square Tubular Sign Posts - Perforated - Galvanized Steel - FHWA Approved

1. 100 12 Ftx1-3/4"- 14 Gauge No bid N/A No bid

2. 100 9 Ftx1-1/2"- 14 Gauge No bid N/A No bid

3. 100 3 Ftx2"Base - 12 Gauge No bid N/A No bid

4. 100 3 Ftx 1-3/4" Base - 12 Gauge No bid N/A No bid
PROPOSAL H: ESTIMATED TOTAL -- No bid N/A No bid

PROPOSAL I: Round Galvanized Steel Post, 2" Nominal Size, 2 1/8" ID 2-3/8"

OD.,125 Wall Thickness, 3Ibs LF

1. 100
PROPOSAL I:

PROPOSAL J: U-Channel Sign Posts

1. 50
2. 100
3. 100

ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS: [

DELIVERY:
Minimum Shipment
# of Days

CONTACT:
Phone #

TERMS:
WARRANTY:
DELIVERY:

EXCEPTIONS:

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:

G:\ITB-COT 06-51 Traffic Control Signs & Posts

12 Ft Galvanized Steel Round Post
ESTIMATED TOTAL --

12 Ft - 3 Ibs Galvanized Steel
12 Ft - 3 Ibs Green Painted Steel
10 Ft - 2 Ibs Green Painted Steel
PROPOSAL J: ESTIMATED TOTAL --

Hrs of Operation

YorN

No bid Blank No bid
No bid Blank No bid
No bid N/A No bid
No bid N/A No bid
No bid N/A $ 14.99
No bid N/A $ 1,499.00
None Blank $1,000.00
45 45 - 60 30
9:00 to 5:00 7:00 to 3:30 8:00 to 5:00

616-304-2208

517-780-6217

315-594-8085

Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Days
Blank Blank Yes
Blank 45 - 60 30 Days
Blank Blank Blank
Yes Yes Yes
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