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February 12, 2007 
 
 
TO:     Phillip L. Nelson, City Manager 
 
FROM:   John M. Lamerato, Assistant City Manager/Finance & Administration 
    Susan A. Leirstein, Purchasing Director 
    Carol K. Anderson, Parks and Recreation Director    
 
SUBJECT: Standard Purchasing Resolution 2: Bid Award - Lowest Bidders Meeting 

Specifications - Turfgrass Chemical Products for Sylvan Glen and 
Sanctuary Lake Golf Courses  

 
Background 
� On January 9, 2007, bids were received and opened for IBT-COT 06-56 to provide turfgrass 

chemicals and fertilizers for Sylvan Glen and Sanctuary Lake Golf Courses. 
� Eighty (80) vendors were notified via the MITN system with seven (7) bidders responding and one 

statement of no bid received. 
� Serious consideration was given to all vendors on all items due to the fact that some of the 

chemicals are now coming off patent.  
� Lesco Inc. bid an alternate on Item #6 Insignia, which did not meet specifications. Insignia is a 

different chemistry class and mode of action. The City has tried this product in the past with poor 
results. 

� Tri-Turf, Lesco Inc., Turfgrass and UAP Professional Products bid prices were all the same for 
Item #9 Emerald 70WG. Tri-Turf was awarded the bid item based upon their payment terms of 2% 
discount, net 30 days.   

� Lesco Inc. bid an alternate on Items #8 and #10 that does not contain the micronutrient package 
and patented plant extracts essential for quality plant growth. 

� Turfgrass and UAP Professional Products bid prices were all the same for Item #21 Primo.  
Turfgrass was awarded the bid item based upon their payment terms of net 60 days opposed to 
UAP’s terms of net 30 days.   

� Lesco Inc. bid an alternate on Item #23 that does not have the patented green pigmentation that 
aids in plant photosynthesis. 

� Tri-Turf Inc. and Lesco Inc. bid alternatives for item #28 that does not contain the proprietary 
blend of surfactants specified.   

� Tri-Turf Inc. bid an alternate on Item #32 which does not contain the Contec Technology. This 
allows the fertilizer to dissolve quickly into the turf canopy after application and irrigation, reducing 
the potential of turf damage to the golf course greens. 

� Turfgrass Inc. and Lesco Inc. bid alternates on Item #34, these products contain less phosphites 
and do not have the proprietary organic acids that improve nutrient uptake and translocation.  

� Lesco Inc. bid an alternate on Item # 37 that did not meet packaging requirements.  
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To:  Phillip L. Nelson, City Manager 
Re:  Bid Award – Lowest Bidders Meeting Specifications – Turfgrass Chemical Products 
 
Financial Considerations 
 
� The department has funds budgeted in the Sylvan Glen Seed/Planting Supplies account 

#785.7740.100 and the Sanctuary Lake Seed/Planting Supplies account #885.7740.100.  
 
Legal Considerations 
 
� ITB-COT 06-56 to furnish seasonal requirements of chemicals for the Sylvan Glen and Sanctuary 

Lake Golf Courses was competitively bid and vendors were given the opportunity to respond with 
their level of interest in supplying turf chemicals and fertilizers to the City’s Golf Facilities. 

 
Policy Considerations 
 
� Vendors were required to submit product information on all alternates in order to assist in the 

recommendation process.  Based on this the City was able to accept nine generic products at a 
cost savings. (Goal II) 

� Communicate with educators and vendors on newer cost effective chemistries and products for 
the future. (Goals II and IV) 

 
Options 
 
� City management recommends awarding the seasonal requirements of chemicals for the Sylvan 

Glen and Sanctuary Lake Golf Courses to the following low bidders meeting specifications for an 
estimated total cost of $178,277.95 at unit prices contained in the bid tabulation. 

 
Tri-Turf Inc., Farmington Hills, Michigan 
 
Item 
No. 

Product Description Estimated Quantity Case Price Estimated Cost 

1. Chipco 26GT or Iprodione Pro 
SE            

60 Gallons- 12 
Cases 

$360.00 $4,320.00

6. Disarm (Alternate) 48lbs – 2 Cases $6,216.00 $12,432.00
7.  Imidacloprid(Alternate) 153.6 oz- 6 Cases $299.00 $1,794.00
9. Emerald 70WG 98Lbs-20 Cases $1,323.00 

 
$26,460.00

22. Propiconazole (Alternate) 125 Gallons-50 
Cases 

$387.50 $19,375.00

29.  Ethephon (Alternate) 20 Gallons-4 Cases $160.00 $640.00
37. T-Methyl 50 (Alternate) 144Lbs-12 Cases $189.00 $2,268.00
    $67,289.00
 
 
 
February 12, 2007 
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To:  Phillip L. Nelson, City Manager 
Re:  Bid Award – Lowest Bidders Meeting Specifications – Turfgrass Chemical Products 
 
IKEX LLC., Tecumseh, Michigan 
 
Item 
No. 

Product Description Estimated Quantity Case Price Estimated Cost 

2. Echo 720 150 Gallons-30 
Cases 

$144.70 $4,341.00

20. Mefanoxam 2 (Alternate ) 34 Gallons-17 
Cases 

$618.88 $10,520.96

    $14,861.96
 
Turfgrass Inc., South Lyon, Michigan  
 
Item 
No. 

Product Description Estimated Quantity Case Price Estimated Cost 

3. Banol 12 Gallons- 6 Cases $639.00 $3,834.00
4. Aqua-Aid 60 Gallons-2 Drums $585.00 $1,170.00
10. Gary’s Green  18-3-4+Iron 75 Gallons-15 

Cases 
$150.00 $2,250.00

11. Sili-Kal B 75 Gallons-15 
Cases 

$203.85 $3,057.75

12. Ultraplex 75 Gallons- 15 
Cases 

$200.00 $3,000.00

16.  Bayleton  50 WSP 171.85 Lbs-5 Drums $2,558.00 $12,790.00

17. PK Plus 100 Gallons-20 
Cases             

$223.08 $4,461.60

19. Kelly’s High Calcium Lime 
Greens Grade 

34,000 Lbs - 17 
Bags 

$237.60 $4,039.20

21. Primo Maxx 10 Gallons – 1 pk $3,860.00 $3,860.00
23.  Alliette/Signature 110 Lbs-5 Cases $403.90 $2,019.50
24. Glacier 4F (Alternate) 300 Gallons-60 

Cases 
$103.50 $6,210.00

28.  Cascade Plus 20 Gallons-1 Drum $1,377.00 $1,377.00
32. Anderson’s 18-9-18 Contec 

DG Pro 
6800 Lbs-170 Bags $34.67 $5,893.90

    $53,962.95
 
 
 
 
 
 
February 12, 2007 
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To:  Phillip L. Nelson, City Manager 
Re:  Bid Award – Lowest Bidders Meeting Specifications – Turfgrass Chemical Products 
 
Lesco Inc., Cleveland, Ohio  
 
Item 
No. 

Product Description Estimated Quantity Case Price Estimated Cost 

5. Gallery Herbicide 24Lbs-6 Cases $465.52 $2,793.12
25. Tartan 10 Gallons-2 Cases $2,000.00 $4,000.00
    $6,793.12
 
Great Lakes Turf LLC, Grand Rapids, Michigan 
 
Item 
No. 

Product Description Estimated Quantity Case Price Estimated Cost 

8. Astron 45 Gallons-9 Cases $410.00 $3,690.00
13. Carbon N 20-0-4 155 Gallons- 31 

Cases 
$104.00 $3,224.00

14.  CalpHlex  100 Gallons- 20 
Cases 

$190.00 $3,800.00

15. ProteSyn 50 Gallons-10 
Cases 

$215.00 $2,150.00

18. White Gold Regular 0-0-24 
Grade 

2,000 Lbs – 40 Bags $34.00 $1,360.00

31. Carbon K 3-0-15 75 Gallons- 15 
Cases 

$116.00 $1,740.00

34. PK Fight 0-0-28 30 Gallons- 6 Cases $212.00 $1,272.00
35. White Gold Greens Grade  

0-0-24 
5,000 Lbs – 100 
Bags 

$38.00 $3,800.00

    $21,036.00
 
UAP Professional Products, Linden, Michigan 
 
Item 
No. 

Product Description Estimated Quantity Case Price Estimated Cost 

26. Allectus 25 Gallons-5 Cases $1,030.00 $5,150.00
27. Prostar 100 Lbs-10 Cases $420.00 $4,200.00
30. Allectus Granular 500 Lbs-10 Bags $67.50 $675.00
33. Trimmit 8 Gallons-2 Cases $1,450.00 $2,900.00
36. Velocity 16 ounces- 2 Pak $704.96 $1,409.92
    $14,334.92

 
ESTIMATED TOTAL COST:   $178,277.95 

 
dtm  G:\Bid Award 06-07 NewFormat/Award Standard Purchasing Resolution 2 – Chemicals 01.07.doc  

 



 CITY OF TROY            ITB-COT 06-56
Opening Date -- 1-09-07 BID TABULATION Pg 1 of 12
Date Prepared - 2/12/2007 CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

VENDOR NAME: IKEX

 EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1. 60 GALS CHIPCO 26 GT FLOWABLE or Alt:Chipco 2 X 2.5 GALS 76.90$             384.50$             
(12 CASES)  IPRODIONE PRO 2 SE 5 GALS/CASE 109.00$     545.00$      94.91$        474.55

Alt: Mainsail
2. 150 GALS DACONIL WEATHERSTIK 2 X 2.5 GALS 45.00$             225.00$             

(30 CASES) or ECHO 720 5 GALS/CASE 72.00$       360.00$      28.94$        144.70$    

3. 12 GALS BANOL 2 X 1 GAL

(6 CASES) 2 GALS/CASE 319.50$    639.00$     414.54$      829.08$     

4.  60 GALS AQUA-AID 30 GALS

(2 DRUMS) WETTING AGENT PER DRUM 19.50$      585.00$     No Bid No Bid

5. 24 lbs GALLERY 4 x 1 lb

(6 CASES) HERBICIDE 4 1lbs/Case 139.50$     558.00$      122.58$      490.32

6. 48 LBS HERITAGE W.G. 4 X 6 LBS

(2 CASES) BULK PACK 24 LBS/CASE 330.00$     7,920.00$   No Bid No Bid
Alt: Zenith75  48 x 1.6 oz

7. 153.6 oz MERIT 75 W.S.P. 4 X 4 X 1.6 OZ. 13.32$             1,002.73$          Alternate: Imidicloprid
(6 CASES) 25.6 OZ./CASE 20.06$       513.57$      13.62$        348.67$     

8. 45 GALS ASTRON 2 X 2.5 GALS

(9 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9. 98 lbs. EMERALD 70 WG 10 X 0.49 lbs

(20 CASES)  4.90 lbs/CASE 270.00$     1,323.00$   No Bid No Bid

10. 75 GALS GARY'S GREEN 18-3-4+Iron 2 X 2.5 GALS

(15 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 30.00$      150.00$     No Bid No Bid

11. 75 GALS SILI-KAL B 2 X 2.5 GALS

(15 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 40.77$      203.85$     No Bid No Bid

12. 75 GALS ULTRAPLEX 2 X 2.5 GALS

(15 CASES) 5 GALS./CASE 40.00$      200.00$     No Bid No Bid

13. 155 GALS 20-0-4 CARBON N 2 X 2.5 GALS

(31 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

14. 100 GALS CALPHLEX 2 X 2.5 GALS

(20 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

15. 50 GALS PROTESYN 2 X 2.5 GALS

(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

16. 171.85 lbs BAYLETON 50WSP 34.37 lbs per

(5 Drums) Drum 74.42$      2,558.00$  No Bid No Bid

Turfgrass Inc.



CITY OF TROY               ITB-COT 06-56
Opening Date -- 1/09/07 BID TABULATION Pg. 2 of 12
Date Prepared -- 2/12/07 CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

VENDOR NAME: IKEX

 EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
17. 100 gals PK PLUS 2 X 2.5 GALS

(20 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE 44.62$      223.08$     No Bid No Bid

18. 2,000 lbs WHITE GOLD 0-0-24
(40 BAGS) REG-GRADE 50 LBS/BAG No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

19. 34,000 lbs KELLY'S HIGH
(17 BAGS) CALCIUM LIME GREENS GRADE 1 Ton/Bag 0.1188$    237.60$     No Bid No Bid

Alt:Subdue 2 x 16 x 5oz
20. 34 GALS SUBDUE MAXX 2 X 1 GALS 501.33$           1,106.38$          Alternate:  Mefanoxam 2

(17 Cases) LINK PAK 2 GALS/CASE 604.50$     1,209.00$   309.44$      618.88$    

21. 10 GALS PRIMO MAXX 1 X 10 GALS

(1 PAK) LINK PAK 10 GALS/PAK 386.00$    3,860.00$  No Bid No Bid
Alt: Fathom 2x2.5gal 

179.50$           897.50$             
Alt: Linkpak

22. 124 Gals BANNER MAXX 2 X 1 GALS 300.00$           3,000.00$          Alternate: Propiconizole Pro

(62 Cases) LINK PAK 2 GALS/CASE 300.00$     600.00$      247.09$      494.18$     

23. 110 lbs Alliette/Signature 2 x 11 lbs 18.359$    403.90$     No Bid No Bid
(5 Cases) 22 lbs/CASE

Alt: Glacier 4F
24. 300 Gals PAR-FLOW 4F 2 X 2.5 GALS 20.70$      103.50$     No Bid No Bid

(60 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE

25. 10 Gals TARTAN 2 X 2.5 GALS

(2 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 416.00$     2,080.00$   No Bid No Bid

26. 25 Gals ALLECTUS 2 X 2.5 GALS 4x1 gal; 4 gal/case
(5 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE 235.78$     943.12$      No Bid No Bid

27. 100 lbs PROSTAR 10 x 1 lb

(10 Cases) 10 lbs/CASE 42.55$       425.50$      No Bid No Bid

28. 20 Gals CASCADE PLUS 20 gal. DRUM 68.85$      1,377.00$  No Bid No Bid
(1 Drum)

29. 20 Gals PROXY 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate: Ethephon 2 SL
(4 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE 37.30$       186.50$      32.33$        161.65$     

30. 500 lbs ALLECTUS GRANULAR 50 lbs/ BAG

(10 Bags) 1.47$         73.50$        No Bid No Bid

31. 75 Gals CARBON K 3-0-15 2 X 2.5 GALS

(15 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

32. 6800 lbs ANDERSON'S 18-9-18 40 LBS/BAG

(170 Bags) CONTEC DG PRO 0.866$      34.67$       No Bid No Bid
33. 8 Gals TRIMMIT 4 X 1 GAL

(2 Cases) 4 GALS/CASE 408.00$     1,632.00$   No Bid No Bid

Turfgrass Inc.



CITY OF TROY               ITB-COT 06-56
Opening Date -- 01/09/07 BID TABULATION Pg. 3 of 12
Date Prepared -- 2/12/07 CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

VENDOR NAME: IKEX

 EST UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
34. 30 Gals PK FIGHT 0-0-28 2 X 2.5 Gals Alternate:  FairPhyt

(6 Cases) 5 Gal/Case DMS No Bid No Bid

35. 5000 lbs WHITE GOLD GREENS 50 LBS/BAG

(100 Bags) GRADE  0-0-24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

36. 16 oz VELOCITY 4 x 2 oz

(2 Packs) 8oz/PACK 110.51$     884.08$      No Bid No Bid

37. 144 LBS CLEARY's 3336 6 X 2 lbs/Case

(12 CASES) 12 lbs/Case 21.85$       262.20$      20.59$        247.08$     

ESTIMATED TOTAL OF AWARDED ITEMS --

MINIMUM SHIPMENT:        One Bag or Case                 N/A

CONTACT INFORMATION:  Hrs of Oper:   8:00 AM to 5:00 PM   8:00 AM to 5:00 PM
    Phone #         248-866-6081        517-403-3778

TERMS          Net 60 Days            Net 30 Days

WARRANTY         Manufacturers             Blank

EXCEPTIONS Alternates offered may provide              Blank
more cost effective
Alternates provided #1,#2,#7,
#20,#22,#24 & #34

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:     Y or N               YES              YES

NO BIDS: 
ADAPCO Inc. BOLDFACE TYPE DENOTES LOWEST ACCEPTABLE BIDDERS

ATTEST:
Jake Pilat
Debra Painter Susan Leirstein
Linda Bockstanz Purchasing Director

G:ITB-COT 06-56 Chemicals-Golf Courses

53,962.95$                      14,861.96$                      

Turfgrass, Inc.



CITY OF TROY            ITB-COT 06-56
Opening Date -- 1-09-07 BID TABULATION Pg 4 of 12
Date Prepared - 2/12/07 CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

VENDOR NAME: UAP

 EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1. 60 GALS CHIPCO 26 GT FLOWABLE or 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate: 18Plus
(12 CASES)  IPRODIONE PRO 2 SE 5 GALS/CASE 79.00$       395.00$      72.00$       360.00$       

2. 150 GALS DACONIL WEATHERSTIK 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate:  Manicure 6 FL
(30 CASES) or ECHO 720 5 GALS/CASE 36.48$       182.40$      72.00$       360.00$       

3. 12 GALS BANOL 2 X 1 GAL

(6 CASES) 2 GALS/CASE 334.03$     668.06$      338.55$     677.10$       

4.  60 GALS AQUA-AID 30 GALS

(2 DRUMS) WETTING AGENT PER DRUM No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5. 24 lbs GALLERY 4 x 1 lb

(6 CASES) HERBICIDE 4 1lbs/Case 116.395$  465.52$     117.53$     470.12$       

6. 48 LBS HERITAGE W.G. 4 X 6 LBS Alternate: Insignia 7.2 x 3/case
(2 CASES) BULK PACK 24 LBS/CASE DMS 330.00$     7,920.00$    

7. 153.6 oz MERIT 75 W.S.P. 4 X 4 X 1.6 OZ.

(6 CASES) 25.6 OZ./CASE 18.55$       475.00$      16.25$       416.00$       

8. 45 GALS ASTRON 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate:  Bolster
(9 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE DMS No Bid No Bid

9. 98 lbs. EMERALD 70 WG 10 X 0.49 lbs

(20 CASES)  4.90 lbs/CASE 270.00$     1,323.00$   270.00$     1,323.00$    

10. 75 GALS GARY'S GREEN 18-3-4+Iron 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate:  Green Flo 052448
(15 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE DMS No Bid No Bid

11. 75 GALS SILI-KAL B 2 X 2.5 GALS

(15 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12. 75 GALS ULTRAPLEX 2 X 2.5 GALS

(15 CASES) 5 GALS./CASE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

13. 155 GALS 20-0-4 CARBON N 2 X 2.5 GALS

(31 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

14. 100 GALS CALPHLEX 2 X 2.5 GALS

(20 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

15. 50 GALS PROTESYN 2 X 2.5 GALS

(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

16. 2000 LBS BAYLETON 50WSP 34.37 lbs per

(5 Drums) DRUM 77.04$       2,648.00$   77.04393 2,648.00$    

Lesco, Inc.



CITY OF TROY
Opening Date -- 1/09/07 BID TABULATION               ITB-COT 06-56
Date Prepared -- 2/12/07 CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES Pg 5 of 12

VENDOR NAME: UAP

 EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
17. 100 gals PK PLUS 2 X 2.5 GALS

(20 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

18. 2,000 lbs WHITE GOLD 0-0-24
(40 BAGS) REG-GRADE 50 LBS/BAG No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

19. 34,000 lbs KELLY'S HIGH
(17 BAGS) CALCIUM LIME GREENS GRADE 1 Ton/Bag No Bid No Bid 0.1395$     279.00$       

20. 34 GALS SUBDUE MAXX 2 X 1 GALS Alternate: Mefenoxam
(17 Cases) LINK PAK 2 GALS/CASE 406.41$     812.82$      518.40$     1,036.80$    

21. 10 GALS PRIMO MAXX 1 X 10 GALS

(1 PAK) LINK PAK 10 GALS/PAK No Bid No Bid 386.00$     3,860.00$    

22. 124 Gals BANNER MAXX 2 X 1 GALS Alternate: Spectator Ultra
(62 Cases) LINK PAK 2 GALS/CASE 196.23$     392.46$      285.00$     570.00$       

Alt: Prodigy Signature 5.5x4/cs
23. 110 lbs Alliette/Signature 2 x 11 lbs DMS 22.50$       495.00$      

(5 Cases) 22 lbs/CASE

Alternate:  Revere
24. 300 Gals PAR-FLOW 4F 2 X 2.5 GALS 25.01$       125.05$      22.00$       110.00$       

(60 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE

25. 10 Gals TARTAN 2 X 2.5 GALS

(2 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 400.00$    2,000.00$  416.00$     832.00$       

26. 25 Gals ALLECTUS 2 X 2.5 GALS 4 x 1 gal 4x1 gal -  bid as 5 gal cs
(5 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE 220.24$     880.96$      206.00$     1,030.00$   

27. 100 lbs PROSTAR 10 x 1 lb

(10 Cases) 10 lbs/CASE 47.77$       477.70$      42.00$       420.00$      
Alternate: Lesco Flo 2.5gal x 2

28. 20 Gals CASCADE PLUS 20 gal. DRUM DMS No Bid No Bid
(1 Drum)

29. 20 Gals PROXY 2 X 2.5 GALS

(4 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid 32.90$       164.50$       

30. 500 lbs ALLECTUS GRANULAR 50 lbs/ BAG

(10 Bags) 1.51$         75.50$        1.35$         67.50$        

31. 75 Gals CARBON K 3-0-15 2 X 2.5 GALS

(15 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

32. 6800 lbs ANDERSON'S 18-9-18 40 LBS/BAG

(170 Bags) CONTEC DG PRO No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

(2 Cases) 4 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid 362.50$     1,450.00$   

Lesco, Inc.



CITY OF TROY               ITB-COT 06-56
Opening Date -- 01/09/07 BID TABULATION Pg 6 of 12
Date Prepared --  2/12/07 CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

VENDOR NAME: UAP

 EST UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
34. 30 Gals PK FIGHT 0-0-28 2 X 2.5 Gals Alternate:  Green Flo Phyte

(6 Cases) 5 Gal/Case DMS No Bid No Bid

35. 5000 lbs WHITE GOLD GREENS 50 LBS/BAG

(100 Bags) GRADE  0-0-24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

36. 16 oz VELOCITY 4 x 2 oz

(2 Packs) 8oz/PACK No Bid No Bid 88.12$       704.96$      
8 oz x 4 x 10

37. 144 LBS CLEARY's 3336 6 X 2 lbs/Case Alternate: T-Storm 
(12 CASES) 12 lbs/Case DMS 16.98$       203.76$       

ESTIMATED TOTAL OF AWARDED ITEMS -- 6,793.12$ 

MINIMUM SHIPMENT: No limit               NONE

CONTACT INFORMATION:  Hrs of Oper:   8:00 AM to 5:00 PM   8:00 AM to 5:00 PM
    Phone #          586-839-8930

TERMS Net 30

WARRANTY                 None           Manufacturer

EXCEPTIONS Substitutions to bid specs have                 O
been noted along with original
specifications

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:     Y or N               YES              YES

G:ITB-COT 06-56 Chemicals-Golf Courses

800-321-5325

N30

14,334.92$                       

Lesco, Inc.



CITY OF TROY            ITB-COT 06-56
Opening Date -- 1-09-07 BID TABULATION Pg 7 of 12
Date Prepared -  2/12/07 CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

VENDOR NAME: Great Lakes Turf

 EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1. 60 GALS CHIPCO 26 GT FLOWABLE or 2 X 2.5 GALS

(12 CASES)  IPRODIONE PRO 2 SE 5 GALS/CASE 72.00$      360.00$     No Bid No Bid

2. 150 GALS DACONIL WEATHERSTIK 2 X 2.5 GALS

(30 CASES) or ECHO 720 5 GALS/CASE 41.00$       205.00$      40.00$       200.00$         

3. 12 GALS BANOL 2 X 1 GAL

(6 CASES) 2 GALS/CASE 385.00$     770.00$      No Bid No Bid

4.  60 GALS AQUA-AID 30 GALS Alternate:Aquadult
(2 DRUMS) WETTING AGENT PER DRUM 37.30$       1,119.00$   No Bid No Bid

5. 24 lbs GALLERY 4 x 1 lb

(6 CASES) HERBICIDE 4 1lbs/Case 132.00$     528.00$      No Bid No Bid
16oz

6. 48 LBS HERITAGE W.G. 4 X 6 LBS Alternate:Sub Disarm (24 lbs)
(2 CASES) BULK PACK 24 LBS/CASE 259.00$    6,216.00$  No Bid No Bid

7. 153.6 oz MERIT 75 W.S.P. 4 X 4 X 1.6 OZ. Alternate: Imidacloprid
(6 CASES) 25.6 OZ./CASE 11.68$      299.00$     No Bid No Bid

8. 45 GALS ASTRON 2 X 2.5 GALS

(9 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid 82.00$       410.00$        

9. 98 lbs. EMERALD 70 WG 10 X 0.49 lbs (10 Units x $132.30)
(20 CASES)  4.90 lbs/CASE 270.00$    1,323.00$  No Bid No Bid

10. 75 GALS GARY'S GREEN 18-3-4+Iron 2 X 2.5 GALS

(15 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11. 75 GALS SILI-KAL B 2 X 2.5 GALS

(15 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12. 75 GALS ULTRAPLEX 2 X 2.5 GALS

(15 CASES) 5 GALS./CASE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

13. 155 GALS 20-0-4 CARBON N 2 X 2.5 GALS

(31 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid 20.80$       104.00$        

14. 100 GALS CALPHLEX 2 X 2.5 GALS

(20 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid 38.00$       190.00$        

15. 50 GALS PROTESYN 2 X 2.5 GALS

(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid 43.00$       215.00$        

16. 2000 LBS BAYLETON 50WSP 34.37 lbs per

(5 Drums) DRUMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Tri-Turf



CITY OF TROY
Opening Date -- 1/09/07 BID TABULATION               ITB-COT 06-56
Date Prepared -- 2/12/07 CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES Pg 8 of 12

VENDOR NAME: Great Lakes Turf

 EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
17. 100 gals PK PLUS 2 X 2.5 GALS

(20 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

18. 2,000 lbs WHITE GOLD 0-0-24
(40 BAGS) REG-GRADE 50 LBS/BAG No Bid No Bid 0.68$         34.00$          

19. 34,000 lbs KELLY'S HIGH
(17 BAGS) CALCIUM LIME GREENS GRADE 1 Ton/Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

20. 34 GALS SUBDUE MAXX 2 X 1 GALS Alternate: Mefenoxam
(17 Cases) LINK PAK 2 GALS/CASE 445.00$     890.00$      No Bid No Bid

21. 10 GALS PRIMO MAXX 1 X 10 GALS

(1 PAK) LINK PAK 10 GALS/PAK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2.5 Gal

22. 124 Gals BANNER MAXX 2 X 1 GALS Alternate: Propiconazole Alternate:  Propensity 1.3ME

(62 Cases) LINK PAK 2 GALS/CASE 155.00$    387.50$     190.00$     950.00$         
Alternate: Magellan   2.5 Gal

23. 110 lbs Alliette/Signature 2 x 11 lbs 98.00$       245.00$      No Bid No Bid
(5 Cases) 22 lbs/CASE

24. 300 Gals PAR-FLOW 4F 2 X 2.5 GALS 24.50$       122.50$      No Bid No Bid
(60 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE

25. 10 Gals TARTAN 2 X 2.5 GALS

(2 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

26. 25 Gals ALLECTUS 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate: Arena  40 oz
(5 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE 599.00$     599.00$      No Bid No Bid

27. 100 lbs PROSTAR 10 x 1 lb

(10 Cases) 10 lbs/CASE 48.50$       485.00$      No Bid No Bid
Alternate: 16-90    5 Gal

28. 20 Gals CASCADE PLUS 20 gal. DRUM DMS No Bid No Bid
(1 Drum)

29. 20 Gals PROXY 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate: Ethephon
(4 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE 32.00$      160.00$     No Bid No Bid

30. 500 lbs ALLECTUS GRANULAR 50 lbs/ BAG Alternate:  Arena (25lb)
(10 Bags) 1.50$         37.50$        No Bid No Bid

31. 75 Gals CARBON K 3-0-15 2 X 2.5 GALS

(15 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid 23.20$       116.00$        
Alternate: LEB 18-3-18

32. 6800 lbs ANDERSON'S 18-9-18 40 LBS/BAG (50 Lbs)
(170 Bags) CONTEC DG PRO DMS No Bid No Bid

33. 8 Gals TRIMMIT 4 X 1 GAL

(2 Cases) 4 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Tri-Turf, Inc.



CITY OF TROY               ITB-COT 06-56
Opening Date -- 01/09/07 BID TABULATION Pg 9 of 12
Date Prepared -- 2/12/07 CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

VENDOR NAME: Great Lakes Turf

 EST UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
34. 30 Gals PK FIGHT 0-0-28 2 X 2.5 Gals

(6 Cases) 5 Gal/Case No Bid No Bid 42.40$       212.00$        

35. 5000 lbs WHITE GOLD GREENS 50 LBS/BAG

(100 Bags) GRADE  0-0-24 No Bid No Bid 0.76$         38.00$          

36. 16 oz VELOCITY 4 x 2 oz

(2 Packs) 8oz/PACK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

37. 144 LBS CLEARY's 3336 6 X 2 lbs/Case Alternate: T-Methyl 50
(12 CASES) 12 lbs/Case 15.75$      189.00$     No Bid No Bid

ESTIMATED TOTAL OF AWARDED ITEMS --

MINIMUM SHIPMENT:                  No             One Case

CONTACT INFORMATION:  Hrs of Oper:   8:00 AM to 5:00 PM   8:00 AM to 5:00 PM
    Phone #          248-640-4439          586-915-9281

TERMS  2% 10 -   Net 30            Net 30 Days

WARRANTY           Manufacturer           Manufacturer

EXCEPTIONS Attached to Bid Item #22: Substitue Propensity
1.3ME(Generic) for Banner Maxx

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:     Y or N               YES              YES

G:ITB-COT 06-56 Chemicals-Golf Courses

67,289.00$                      21,036.00$                        

Tri-Turf, Inc.



CITY OF TROY            ITB-COT 06-56
Opening Date -- 1-09-07 BID TABULATION Pg 10 of 12
Date Prepared - 2/12/07 CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

VENDOR NAME:

 EST PKG UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE

1. 60 GALS CHIPCO 26 GT FLOWABLE or 2 X 2.5 GALS

(12 CASES)  IPRODIONE PRO 2 SE 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid

2. 150 GALS DACONIL WEATHERSTIK 2 X 2.5 GALS

(30 CASES) or ECHO 720 5 GALS/CASE 32.00$            160.00$         

3. 12 GALS BANOL 2 X 1 GAL

(6 CASES) 2 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid

4.  60 GALS AQUA-AID 30 GALS

(2 DRUMS) WETTING AGENT PER DRUM No Bid No Bid

5. 24 lbs GALLERY 4 x 1 lb

(6 CASES) HERBICIDE 4 1lbs/Case No Bid No Bid

6. 48 LBS HERITAGE W.G. 4 X 6 LBS

(2 CASES) BULK PACK 24 LBS/CASE No Bid No Bid

7. 153.6 oz MERIT 75 W.S.P. 4 X 4 X 1.6 OZ.

(6 CASES) 25.6 OZ./CASE No Bid No Bid

8. 45 GALS ASTRON 2 X 2.5 GALS

(9 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid

9. 98 lbs. EMERALD 70 WG 10 X 0.49 lbs

(20 CASES)  4.90 lbs/CASE No Bid No Bid

10. 75 GALS GARY'S GREEN 18-3-4+Iron 2 X 2.5 GALS

(15 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid

11. 75 GALS SILI-KAL B 2 X 2.5 GALS

(15 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid

12. 75 GALS ULTRAPLEX 2 X 2.5 GALS

(15 CASES) 5 GALS./CASE No Bid No Bid

13. 155 GALS 20-0-4 CARBON N 2 X 2.5 GALS

(31 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid

14. 100 GALS CALPHLEX 2 X 2.5 GALS

(20 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid

15. 50 GALS PROTESYN 2 X 2.5 GALS

(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid

16. 2000 LBS BAYLETON 50WSP 34.37 lbs per

(5 Drums) DRUMS No Bid No Bid

Carso, Inc.



CITY OF TROY
Opening Date -- 1/09/07 BID TABULATION               ITB-COT 06-56
Date Prepared --  2/12/07 CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES Pg 11 of 12

VENDOR NAME:

 EST PKG UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE
17. 100 gals PK PLUS 2 X 2.5 GALS

(20 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid

18. 2,000 lbs WHITE GOLD 0-0-24
(40 BAGS) REG-GRADE 50 LBS/BAG No Bid No Bid

19. 34,000 lbs KELLY'S HIGH
(17 BAGS) CALCIUM LIME GREENS GRADE 1 Ton/Bag No Bid No Bid

20. 34 GALS SUBDUE MAXX 2 X 1 GALS

(17 Cases) LINK PAK 2 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid

21. 10 GALS PRIMO MAXX 1 X 10 GALS

(1 PAK) LINK PAK 10 GALS/PAK No Bid No Bid

22. 124 Gals BANNER MAXX 2 X 1 GALS Alternate:  Heritage Pro
(62 Cases) LINK PAK 2 GALS/CASE 178.00$          356.00$         

23. 110 lbs Alliette/Signature 2 x 11 lbs No Bid No Bid
(5 Cases) 22 lbs/CASE

24. 300 Gals PAR-FLOW 4F 2 X 2.5 GALS No Bid No Bid
(60 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE

25. 10 Gals TARTAN 2 X 2.5 GALS

(2 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid

26. 25 Gals ALLECTUS 2 X 2.5 GALS

(5 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid

27. 100 lbs PROSTAR 10 x 1 lb

(10 Cases) 10 lbs/CASE No Bid No Bid

28. 20 Gals CASCADE PLUS 20 gal. DRUM No Bid No Bid
(1 Drum)

29. 20 Gals PROXY 2 X 2.5 GALS

(4 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid

30. 500 lbs ALLECTUS GRANULAR 50 lbs/ BAG

(10 Bags) No Bid No Bid

31. 75 Gals CARBON K 3-0-15 2 X 2.5 GALS

(15 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE No Bid No Bid

32. 6800 lbs ANDERSON'S 18-9-18 40 LBS/BAG

(170 Bags) CONTEC DG PRO No Bid No Bid

33. 8 Gals TRIMMIT 4 X 1 GAL

Carso, Inc.



CITY OF TROY               ITB-COT 06-56
Opening Date -- 01/09/07 BID TABULATION Pg 12 of 12
Date Prepared -- 2/12/07 CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

VENDOR NAME:

 EST UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE
34. 30 Gals PK FIGHT 0-0-28 2 X 2.5 Gals

(6 Cases) 5 Gal/Case No Bid No Bid

35. 5000 lbs WHITE GOLD GREENS 50 LBS/BAG

(100 Bags) GRADE  0-0-24 No Bid No Bid

36. 16 oz VELOCITY 4 x 2 oz

(2 Packs) 8oz/PACK No Bid No Bid

37. 144 LBS CLEARY's 3336 6 X 2 lbs/Case

(12 CASES) 12 lbs/Case No Bid No Bid

ESTIMATED TOTAL OF AWARDED ITEMS -- -$               

MINIMUM SHIPMENT:              Blank

CONTACT INFORMATION:  Hrs of Oper:              Blank
    Phone #              Blank

TERMS          Net 30 Days

WARRANTY              Blank

EXCEPTIONS              Blank

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:     Y or N               YES

G:ITB-COT 06-56 Chemicals-Golf Courses

Carso, Inc.




