
 

 

CITY  COUNCIL  ACTION  REPORTC C A RITY OUNCIL CTION EPORT  
 

 
April 27, 2007 
 
 
TO:    Phillip L. Nelson, City Manager 
 
FROM:  Susan A. Leirstein, Purchasing Director 

William S. Nelson, Fire Chief   
      
SUBJECT: Standard Purchasing Resolution 1:  Award To Low Bidder – Purchase of 

Self-contained Breathing Apparatus Equipment  
 
Background 
 On April 11, 2007, bids were received to replacement and update Survivair self-contained 

breathing apparatus utilizing grant monies received under the US Fire Administration FIRE 
ACT, plus a 20% local match requirement. 

 Sixty-six (66) vendors were notified via the MITN system with two (2) bid responses and 
one statement of no bid received. 

 Most of the 260 SCBA cylinders in use will require replacement within the next three years 
due to federal regulations.  

 The new and updated units are certified for protection from chemical, biological, and 
radiological hazards (CBRNE) and meet the current standards for performance. While it is 
possible to upgrade existing units, the grant requires that new units be purchased.   

 All new and upgraded units will include the Survivair Pathfinder system, which assists in 
locating personnel who have activated their distress alarm.   

 The fire department proposes to purchase 70 new SCBA, 150 additional facemasks, and 6 
pathfinder tracker kits in FY 2006/07; and 50 upgrades for existing units in FY 2007/08.  

 In addition, staff recommends the rejection of Item #1 as the difference between Item #1 
and alternate Item #1a is the inclusion of a second air cylinder with each unit.  Purchasing 
an extra cylinder with each new unit now, represents a 50% cost savings over purchasing 
extra cylinders alone. 

 
Financial Considerations 
 Funds are available in the 2006/07 Fire Operating budget for this purchase, Account 

#338.7740.115. 
 Funds are included in the proposed 2007/08 budget for the upgrades. 

 
Legal Considerations 
 ITB-COT 07-11 to furnish self-contained breathing apparatus equipment for the Troy Fire 

Department was competitively bid, as required under Chapter 7 of the City Code. 
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April 27, 2007 
 
To: Phillip L. Nelson, City Manager 
Re: Bid Award – Self-contained Breathing Apparatus Equipment 
 
 
Legal Considerations - continued 
 All bidders were given the opportunity to respond with their level of interest in supplying 

self-contained breathing apparatus equipment for the City of Troy. 
 
Policy Considerations 
 This project will enhance both the safety of the community and the firefighters who service 

them.  (Goal I) 
 Utilizing the federal grant and upgrading existing units achieve the maximum cost effectiveness. 

(Goal II) 
 
Options 
 City management and the fire department recommend the purchase of Item #1A) Survivair 

Panther SCBA units with two air cylinders each, Item #2) additional equipment and Item #3) 
Survivair SCBA CBRNE upgrade kits from the low bidder, Southeast Equipment Company 
of Troy, MI, at unit prices as contained on the bid tabulation opened April 11, 2007, with a 
contract expiration of November 1, 2007. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
G:/Bid Award 06-07 new format/Award Standard Purchasing Resolution 1 – Breathing Apparatus 04.07.doc 
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CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 07-11
Opening Date -- 04/11/07 BID TABULATION Pg 1 of 1
Date Prepared -- 04/12/07 BREATHING APPARATUS 

VENDOR NAME:
ITEM #1
PROPOSAL:  TO PURCHASE SELF CONTAINED BREATHING APPARATUS EQUIPMENT FOR THE CITY OF TROY FIRE DEPARTMENT
EST QTY   DESCRIPTION Price/per Each Price/per Each Price/per Each Price/per Each

Units Before 9/1/07 After 9/1/07 Before 9/1/07 After 9/1/07

60 Survivair Panther Units in accordance with specs
No Exceptions 3,104.00$           No Bid 5,948.00$          No Bid

Quoting on Style: CBRN Panther CBRN Panther
Manufactured by: Survivair Survivair

COMPLETE FOR THE SUM OF: 186,240.00$    No Bid 356,880.00$   No Bid
ITEM #1A
ALTERNATE
EST QTY   DESCRIPTION Price/per Each Price/per Each Price/per Each Price/per Each

Units Before 9/1/07 After 9/1/07 Before 9/1/07 After 9/1/07

60 Survivair Panther Units in with exact specifications
as item #1 on the base bid with two 917426
45 minute carbon cylinder with lock
No Exceptions 3,653.00$           No Bid 7,085.00$          No Bid

Quoting on Style: CBRN Panther CBRN Panther
Manufactured by: Survivair Survivair

COMPLETE FOR THE SUM OF: 219,180.00$    No Bid 425,100.00$   No Bid
ITEM #2
ADDITIONAL EQUIPMENT
EST QTY   DESCRIPTION Price/per Each Price/per Each Price/per Each Price/per Each

Units Before 9/1/07 After 9/1/07 Before 9/1/07 After 9/1/07

150 CBRN 2020 - Plus Face pieces with silicone
Harness 130.00$             130.00$                  280.00$             No Bid

Units
6 961999 - Tracker Kits 1,181.00$           1,181.00$               1,350.00$          No Bid

COMPLETE FOR THE SUM OF: 26,586.00$      26,586.00$         50,100.00$     No Bid

ITEM #3
ADDITIONAL EQUIPMENT UPDATES
EST QTY   DESCRIPTION Price/per Each Price/per Each Price/per Each Price/per Each
Updates Before 9/1/07 After 9/1/07 Before 9/1/07 After 9/1/07

50 CBRN Update Kits for Survivair SCBA 1,768.00$           No Bid 2,320.00$          No Bid

COMPLETE FOR THE SUM OF: 88,400.00$      No Bid 116,000.00$   

AUTHORIZED DEALER Yes or No Yes Yes

CONTACT INFORMATION:
Hours of Operation:
Phone Number:

OPTIONAL
EXTENSION OF AWARD TO OTHER FIRE DEPARTMENTS:

Yes or No         Yes NO
Minimum Order Requirements   None Blank

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT FORM:  Y or N Yes Yes

TERMS:
                          Lifetime-1st stage, 3 yrs-pass,2yrs-HUD

WARRANTY: 12 yrs - Panther, 15 yrs - Cylinder  Blank

DELIVERY DATE(S)

EXCEPTIONS: None - No bid after 9/1/07 due Pricing for post 9/1/07 is not
to NFPA Changes submitted due to this airpack will no

longer be NFPA compliant & will no 
longer be in production

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT Y or N Yes Yes

NO BIDS: 
West Shore Fire, Inc. BOLDFACE TYPE DENOTES LOW BIDDER

ATTEST: _____________________________
Debra Painter Susan Leirstein CPPB
Don Mouch Purchasing Director
Linda Bockstanz G:ITB-COT 07-11 Breathing Apparatus Equipment

Southeast Equipment Inc. Douglass Safety Systems

RECOMMEND REJECTION ITEM #1

8:00AM to 5:00 PM
248-895-7531

 8:00AM to 5:00 PM
 989-687-7600

Net 30 Net 30 Days

 60 days 6 to 8 weeks
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