
 

 
June 26, 2007 
 
 
TO:    Phillip L. Nelson, City Manager 
 
FROM:  Brian P. Murphy, Assistant City Manager/Economic Development Services  
   Susan A. Leirstein, Purchasing Director 
   Timothy L. Richnak, Public Works Director 
 
SUBJECT: Standard Purchasing Resolution 1: Award to Low Bidders – Water System 

Materials  
Background 
 On June 5, 2007, bid proposals were received to furnish one-year requirements of water system 

materials. 
 135 vendors were notified via the MITN system with three (3) bidders responding. 
 All items recommended represent the lowest bidder for each item. 
 Estimated quantities of materials shall be purchased at quoted unit prices, and ordered on an as 

needed basis. 
 Informal quotes will be taken for Item #9 Mueller Fire Hydrants Parts, as no discounts were offered. 

 
Financial Considerations 
 Funds are available in the Water Division Operating Budget. 

 
Legal Considerations 
 ITB-COT 07-23, Water System Materials was competitively bid in accordance with Chapter 7 of the 

City Code, and opened with three bidders responding. 
 
Policy Considerations 
 All bidders were given the opportunity to respond with their level of interest in supplying goods to the 

City of Troy.  (Goal II) 
 
Options 
 City management recommends awarding contracts to the following low bidders:  Etna Supply 

Company of Grand Rapids, MI; Gunners Meters & Parts of Pontiac, MI; and SLC Meter Service, Inc of 
Davisburg, MI for an estimated total cost of $55,182.00, $79,760.00 and $4,096.00 respectively at unit 
prices contained in the bid tabulation opened June 5, 2007. 

 
 
S:/Murphy’s Review/Agenda 07.09.07 SR1 – WaterSystemMatls ITB-COT 07-23  

CCIITTYY  CCOOUUNNCCIILL  AACCTTIIOONN  RREEPPOORRTT  
 

campbellld
Text Box
E-04a



CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 07-23
Opening Date -- 6/5/07 BID TABULATION Pg. 1 of 4
Date Prepared --  6/26/07 WATER SYSTEM MATERIALS

VENDOR NAME:

EST UNIT UNIT
ITEM # QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
ITEM #1 CURB BOX ITEMS

1 200 2 X 1 1/2" BLACK BUSHING 1.85$         370.00$          2.15$          430.00$          
2 500 2" MINNEAPOLIS CURB BOX W/STEMS 51.10$       25,550.00$     26.50$        13,250.00$     
3 50 2" Curb Box (Mueller #H10300-9902) 29.40$       1,470.00$       32.50$        1,625.00$       

MANUFACTURER AY McDonald/Mueller McDonald
MODEL 5613 - 5611

ITEM #2 CORPORATION STOPS
1 350 1" CORPORATION STOPS w/nuts 21.03$       7,360.50$       20.00$        7,000.00$       
2 100 1 1/2" CORPORATION STOPS w/nuts 56.72$       5,672.00$       53.85$        5,385.00$       
3 100 2" CORPORATION STOPS w/nuts 99.08$       9,908.00$       95.00$        9,500.00$       

MANUFACTURER McDonald
MODEL 4701

ITEM #3 CURB STOPS (Ball Valve Type)
1 350 1" CURB STOPS w/nuts 42.01$       14,703.50$     41.50$        14,525.00$     
2 100 1 1/2" CURB STOPS w/nuts 92.30$       9,230.00$       88.50$        8,850.00$       
3 100 2" CURB STOPS w/nuts 149.34$     14,934.00$     144.50$      14,450.00$     

MANUFACTURER McDonald
MODEL 6104

ITEM #4 FULL CIRCLE REPAIR CLAMPS
1 2 3" X 7 1/2" Range 3.73-4.00 -Single Band 30.05$       60.10$            -$            -$               
2 10 6" x 15" Range 6.84-7.64 112.83$     1,128.30$       -$            -$               
3 10 8" x 12" FS2 Tapped OD 8.99-9.79 99.11$       991.10$          -$            -$               
4 6 12" x 12 1/2" FS2 Tapped 13.20 - 14.00 189.88$     1,139.28$       -$            -$               
5 6 12" x 15" FS2 Tapped 13.65-14.45 219.09$     1,314.54$       -$                 -$               

MANUFACTURER Smith Blair
MODEL

ITEM #5 BRASS FITTINGS
1 100 1" Copper to Copper Union w/nuts 12.82$       1,282.00$       12.40$        1,240.00$       
2 100 1 - 1 1/2" Copper to Copper Union w/nuts 35.21$       3,521.00$       34.50$        3,450.00$       
3 100 2" Copper to Copper Union w/nuts 57.45$       5,745.00$       55.60$        5,560.00$       
4 100 1" x 90 Degree bend non-swivel less nuts 11.34$       1,134.00$       23.80$        2,380.00$       
5 100 2" x 90 Degree bend non-swivel less nuts 62.07$       6,207.00$       102.50$      10,250.00$     

MANUFACTURER Ford McDonald
MODEL 4758

ITEM #6 BRONZE TAPPING SADDLES w/cc THREADS
AC/Ductilie Iron Pipe

1 40 1" x 8" Tap Saddle 71.59$       2,863.60$       77.50$        3,100.00$       
2 20 2" x 8" Tap Saddle 82.05$       1,641.00$       88.50$        1,770.00$       
3 40 1 1/2" x 12" Tap Saddle 117.08$     4,683.20$       133.80$      5,352.00$       
4 40 2" x 12" Tap Saddle 119.20$     4,768.00$       136.50$      5,460.00$       

Ductilie Iron Pipe
5 20 1" x 16" DI Tap Saddle 254.21$     5,084.20$       291.90$      5,838.00$       
6 40 1 1/2 x 16" DI Tap Saddle 269.73$     10,789.20$     310.40$      12,416.00$     
7 30 2" x 16" DI Tap Saddle 298.07$     8,942.10$       340.10$      10,203.00$     

Concrete Steel Pipe
8 10 2" x 16" Service Saddle 125.05$     1,250.50$       285.50$      2,855.00$       

MANUFACTURER McDonald-JCM
MODEL 3825

NO BID

Ford/Smith Blair

GUNNERS METERS & PARTS

Ford

ETNA SUPPLY COMPANY

Ford



CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 07-23
Opening Date -- 06/5/07 BID TABULATION Pg. 2 of 4
Date Prepared -- 6/26/07 WATER SYSTEM MATERIALS

VENDOR NAME:

EST UNIT UNIT
ITEM # QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
ITEM #7 VALVE BOX PARTS

1 2 18" D-BOX BOTTOM SECTION 24.05$       48.10$            -$            -$               
2 20 24" D-BOX BOTTOM SECTION 28.04$       560.80$          -$            -$               
3 12 D-BOX RISER - SCREW IN TYPE 12" 27.89$      334.68$         -$           -$              
4 20 D-BOX TOP - SECTION 16" 22.45$       449.00$          -$            -$               
5 20 D-BOX TOP - SECTION 26" 36.08$       721.60$          -$            -$               

MANUFACTURER
MODEL

ITEM #8 WATER MAIN FITTINGS
1 12 6" x 7 1/2 MJ DI Solid Sleeve 37.35$       448.20$          -$            -$               
2 4 12" MJ Split Rings 13.75$       55.00$            -$            -$               
3 6 12" MJ Rings 11.84$       71.04$            -$            -$               
4 1 length 24" Clas 54 Ductile Iron Pipe $    74.05 ft 1,481.00$       -$            -$               

MANUFACTURER
MODEL

ITEM #9
DISCOUNT 0% 0%
Parts Price List Blank Blank
Dated Blank Blank

ESTIMATED TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS: 55,181.72$    79,760.00$    

CONTACT INFORMATION:
Hrs of Operation 7 - 5  M-F 8 - 5   M - F
24 Hr Phone No. 616-257-8038 248-545-6304

TERMS: Net 30 Net 30 Days

WARRANTY: Manufacturer 1 year

DELIVERY DATE: 1 - 21 Days 2 - 3 wks

EXCEPTIONS: Blank AY McDonald Brass as an 
alternate - We have provided
AY McDonald in past bid 
awards

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT: Completed - Y or N Yes Yes

ATTEST:
Debra Painter HIGHLIGHTED AREAS DENOTE LOW BIDDER(S)
Emily Frontera
Richard Shepler
Linda Bockstanz
G:/WaterSystemMaterial ITB-COT 07-23

Union/American Cast

PARTS FOR MUELLER IMPROVED FIRE HYDRANTS

NO BID

NO BID

Bibby

GUNNERS METERS & PARTSETNA SUPPLY COMPANY



CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 07-23
Opening Date -- 6/5/07 BID TABULATION Pg. 3 of 4
Date Prepared -- 6/26/07 WATER SYSTEM MATERIALS

VENDOR NAME:

EST UNIT
ITEM # QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL
ITEM #1 CURB BOX ITEMS

1 200 2 X 1 1/2" BLACK BUSHING 1.50$         300.00$           
2 500 2" MINNEAPOLIS CURB BOX W/STEMS 30.00$       15,000.00$      
3 50 2" Curb Box (Mueller #H10300-9902)

MANUFACTURER A.Y. McDonald
MODEL 5613 LR

ITEM #2 CORPORATION STOPS
1 350 1" CORPORATION STOPS w/nuts 21.40$      7,490.00$       
2 100 1 1/2" CORPORATION STOPS w/nuts 58.64$       5,864.00$        
3 100 2" CORPORATION STOPS w/nuts 102.44$     10,244.00$      

MANUFACTURER
MODEL

ITEM #3 CURB STOPS (Ball Valve Type)
1 350 1" CURB STOPS w/nuts 44.43$       15,550.50$      
2 100 1 1/2" CURB STOPS w/nuts 95.43$      9,543.00$       
3 100 2" CURB STOPS w/nuts 154.35$     15,435.00$      

MANUFACTURER
MODEL

ITEM #4 FULL CIRCLE REPAIR CLAMPS
1 2 3" X 7 1/2" Range 3.73-4.00 -Single Band 35.10$       70.20$             
2 10 6" x 15" Range 6.84-7.64 138.75$     1,387.50$        
3 10 8" x 12" FS2 Tapped OD 8.99-9.79 119.22$     1,192.20$        
4 6 12" x 12 1/2" FS2 Tapped 13.20 - 14.00 160.00$     960.00$           
5 6 12" x 15" FS2 Tapped 13.65-14.45 169.30$     1,015.80$        

MANUFACTURER Ford
MODEL

ITEM #5 BRASS FITTINGS
1 100 1" Copper to Copper Union w/nuts 13.26$       1,326.00$        
2 100 1 - 1 1/2" Copper to Copper Union w/nuts 18.20$       1,820.00$        
3 100 2" Copper to Copper Union w/nuts 59.40$       5,940.00$        
4 100 1" x 90 Degree bend non-swivel less nuts 11.73$       1,173.00$        
5 100 2" x 90 Degree bend non-swivel less nuts 64.17$       6,417.00$        

MANUFACTURER Ford
MODEL

ITEM #6 BRONZE TAPPING SADDLES w/cc THREADS
AC/Ductilie Iron Pipe

1 40 1" x 8" Tap Saddle 73.77$       2,950.80$        
2 20 2" x 8" Tap Saddle 84.54$       1,690.80$        
3 40 1 1/2" x 12" Tap Saddle 120.64$     4,825.60$        
4 40 2" x 12" Tap Saddle 122.81$    4,912.40$       

Ductilie Iron Pipe
5 20 1" x 16" DI Tap Saddle 261.91$     5,238.20$        
6 40 1 1/2 x 16" DI Tap Saddle 277.90$     11,116.00$      
7 30 2" x 16" DI Tap Saddle 307.09$     9,212.70$        

Concrete Steel Pipe
8 10 2" x 16" Service Saddle

MANUFACTURER
MODEL

SLC METER SERVICE INC

No Bid

No Bid

Ford

Ford

Ford



CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 07-23
Opening Date -- 06/5/07 BID TABULATION Pg. 4 of 4
Date Prepared -- 6/26/07 WATER SYSTEM MATERIALS

VENDOR NAME:

EST UNIT
ITEM # QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL
ITEM #7 VALVE BOX PARTS

1 2 18" D-BOX BOTTOM SECTION -$           -$                
2 20 24" D-BOX BOTTOM SECTION -$          -$                
3 12 D-BOX RISER - SCREW IN TYPE -$           -$                
4 20 D-BOX RISER - SCREW IN TYPE 12" -$           -$                
5 20 D-BOX TOP - SECTION 26" -$           -$                

MANUFACTURER
MODEL

ITEM #8 WATER MAIN FITTINGS
1 12 6" x 7 1/2 MJ DI Solid Sleeve -$          -$                
2 4 12" MJ Split Rings -$          -$                
3 6 12" MJ Rings -$          -$                
4 1 length 24" Clas 54 Ductile Iron Pipe -$           -$                

MANUFACTURER
MODEL

ITEM #9
DISCOUNT N/A
Parts Price List Blank
Dated Blank

ESTIMATED TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS: 4,095.80$       

CONTACT INFORMATION:
Hrs of Operation 7:30 - 5:00   M-F
24 Hr Phone No. Blank

TERMS: Net 30 Days

WARRANTY: Standard Mfg.

DELIVERY DATE: Stock to 2 weeks

EXCEPTIONS: Blank

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT: Completed - Y or N Yes

Susan Leirstein CPPB
Purchasing Director

G:/WaterSystemMaterial ITB-COT 07-23

SLC METER SERVICE INC

NO BID

PARTS FOR MUELLER IMPROVED FIRE HYDRANTS

NO BID




