
 
 

July 30, 2007 
 
 
TO:  Phillip L. Nelson, City Manager 
 
FROM: Susan A. Leirstein, Purchasing Director 

Charles T. Craft, Chief of Police 
 
SUBJECT:  Standard Purchasing Resolution 1:  Award To Low Bidder – Patrol Rifles & Accessories 
 

Background 

 On June 20, 2007, bid proposals were received to purchase new rifles and accessories for 
the Troy Police Department  

 52 Vendors were notified via the MITN system with five bidders responding and eight bids 
received.  One vendor submitted a statement of no bid due to territorial restrictions. 

 
Financial Considerations 

 Funds for Patrol Rifles are available in the 2007/2008 Police Administration Drug Enforcement 
Account # 401305.7978.065. 

 Due to budget limitations, Proposals B and C for Accessories are being rejected at this time.  
  

Legal Considerations 

 ITB-COT07-24 was competitively bid and opened with five bidders responding. 

 All bidders were given the opportunity to respond with their level of interest in supplying patrol 
rifles to the City of Troy.  

 

Policy Considerations 

 The acquisition of these patrol rifles will enhance the Police Department’s ability to protect its 
citizens against attacks from criminal/terrorist elements.   (Goal #I) 

 A well-trained and prepared Police Department will enhance the safety and livability of the 
community. (Goal #I) 

 

Options 

 City management and the Police Department recommend awarding the contract for the 
purchase of (50) Smith & Wesson M&P 15 Patrol Rifles as specified under Proposal A, to 
Michigan Police Equipment of Charlotte, MI, for an estimated total cost of $43,650.00.  

 

 In addition, staff recommends the rejection of Proposals B and C due to budgetary limitations. 
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CITY OF TROY            ITB-COT 07-24
Opening Date -- 6/20/07 BID TABULATION Page 1 of 3
Date Prepared-- 7/30/07 RIFLES & ACCESSORIES

BID # 1 BID # 2 BID #3
VENDOR NAME:

EST QTY        DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
Proposal A:

50 Rifles - Semi Auto .223 873.00$   43,650.00$ 979.00$    48,950.00$ 1,019.00$  50,950.00$
Manufacturer Smith & Wesson M&P 15 Rock River Tactical CARA4 Colt AR 6721

Proposal B: Accessories
50 Setina Manufacturing Double

Vertical Weapon Mount System No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Proposal C: Accessories

50 Magazine Thigh Rig Holster No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
50 Streamlight LED Foregrip Lights 85.00$    4,250.00$   85.00$      4,250.00$    85.00$       4,250.00$  

100 3 Volt Lithium Batteries 1.20$      120.00$      1.20$        120.00$       1.20$         120.00$     
50 Streamlight TLR-1 Weapon Light 20.75$    1,037.50$   20.75$      1,037.50$    20.75$       1,037.50$  

Forearm
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTALS: 49,057.50$  54,357.50$  56,357.50$ 

CONTACT INFORMATION:
Hrs of Operation: M - F   8:30 to 5:00 M - F   8:30 to 5:00 M - F   8:30 to 5:00
24 Hr. Phone #:     313-600-7484     313-600-7484     313-600-7484

TIME PERIOD - Additional Orders 12/15/2007 12/15/2007 12/15/2007

TERMS: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 

WARRANTY:   Full Manufacturers   Full Manufacturers   Full Manufacturers 

DELIVERY DATE: 60 Days 60 Days 60 Days

EXCEPTIONS: None None None

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:  Y or N Yes Yes Yes

NO BIDS:
Ray O'Herron Co. Inc. 

BOLD FACE TYPE DENOTES LOW BIDDER
ATTEST:
Sgt.Scott McWilliams
Yvonne Ranzinger
Antonio Cascioli
Linda Bockstanz _______________________

Susan Leirstein CPPB
Purchasing Director
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Bid #1 Bid #2
VENDOR NAME:

Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc.

EST QTY        DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
Proposal A:

50 Rifles - Semi Auto .223 885.00$    44,250.00$ 1,160.97$ 58,048.50$  1,076.24$  53,812.00$ 
Manufacturer Smith & Wesson M&P 15 Colt AR 6721 Rock River AR1221

Proposal B: Accessories
50 Setina Manufacturing Double

Vertical Weapon Mount System No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Proposal C: Accessories

50 Magazine Thigh Rig Holster No Bid No Bid 41.11$     2,055.50$   No Bid No Bid
50 Streamlight LED Foregrip Lights 94.49$     4,724.50$  88.22$     4,411.00$   88.22$      4,411.00$  
100 3 Volt Lithium Batteries 1.75$       175.00$     1.35$       135.00$       1.35$        135.00$     
50 Streamlight TLR-1 Weapon Light 19.49$     974.50$     21.57$     1,078.50$   21.57$      1,078.50$  

Forearm
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTALS: 50,124.00$ 65,728.50$  59,436.50$ 

CONTACT INFORMATION:
Hrs of Operation: M-F   8:30 to 5:00 M-F   8:00 to 5:00 M-F   8:00 to 5:00
24 Hr. Phone #:  517-974-4276 772-538-2528 772-538-2528

TIME PERIOD - Additional Orders Prior to 12/31/07   90 days  - ARO   90 days  - ARO

TERMS: Net 30

WARRANTY: Blank     Limited Lifetime     Limited Lifetime

DELIVERY DATE:   30-60 Days  - ARO   30-60 Days - ARO   30-60 Days - ARO

EXCEPTIONS: Blank Substituted Blackhawk Substituted Blackhawk
#561602BK for S.O. #561602BK for S.O.
Tech item Tech item - 

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:  Y or N Yes Yes Yes

G:ITB-COT 07-24 Rifles & Accessories

Net 10

CMP Distributors, Inc. Lawsmen & Shooters Lawsmen & Shooters

Net 10
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VENDOR NAME:
dba Vance's Law Enforcement

EST QTY        DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
Proposal A:

50 Rifles - Semi Auto .223 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer

Proposal B: Accessories
50 Setina Manufacturing Double

Vertical Weapon Mount System 547.90$    27,395.00$  No Bid No Bid
Proposal C: Accessories

50 Magazine Thigh Rig Holster No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
50 Streamlight LED Foregrip Lights 116.05$    5,802.50$    87.50$     4,375.00$      
100 3 Volt Lithium Batteries 3.46$        346.00$       1.25$       125.00$        
50 Streamlight TLR-1 Weapon Light No Bid No Bid 23.50$     1,175.00$      

Forearm
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTALS: 33,543.50$   5,675.00$      

CONTACT INFORMATION: Tues - F   10 am to 8 pm
Hrs of Operation: M - F     8 to 5 SAT 10 am to 6 pm
24 Hr. Phone #: 517-647-5365 614-471-7000

TIME PERIOD - Additional Orders Pricing Good thru 12/31/07 90 Days

TERMS: Net 30 Days

WARRANTY: 1 yr - Parts & Labor Lifetime (Except Batteries)

DELIVERY DATE: 15 - 21 Busness Days     30 days  - ARO

EXCEPTIONS: No bid on weapons. Alert Blank
does not have  FFL 
License. Bid lighting only

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:  Y or N Yes Yes

G:ITB-COT 07-24 Rifles & Accessories

Alert Emergency 
Equipment Group

Vance Outdoors Inc.

Net 30

RECOMMEND REJECTION

RECOMMEND REJECTION




