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Date: July 16, 2015
To: Brian Kischnick, City Manager
From: MaryBeth Murz, Purchasing Manager

Timothy L. Richnak, Public Works Director
Kurt Bovensiep, Public Works Manager

Subject: Standard Purchasing Resolution 2: Award To Lowest Bidders Meeting Specifications —

Traffic Control Signs and Posts

History

e The Streets Division is responsible for the maintenance of all city posted traffic control signs and

posts.

e These signs and posts require new installations, as well as repairs and replacements to be in
compliance with the most current standards as specified in the Michigan Manual on Uniform Traffic

Control Devices.

Purchasing

e OnJuly 9, 2015, a bid opening was conducted as required by City Charter and Code for one (1) year

requirements of traffic control signs and posts.

e The bid was posted on the Michigan
www.mitn.info and the bid was sent to the Troy Chamber of Commerce.
o (9) bid responses were received. Below is a detailed summary of potential vendors:

Inter-governmental Trade Network (MITN) website;

Companies notified via MITN 88
Troy Companies notified via MITN 1
Troy Companies - Active email Notification

Troy Companies - Active Free 0
Companies that viewed the bid 29
Troy Companies that viewed the bid 0

MITN provides a resourceful online platform to streamline the
procurement process, reduce costs, and make it easier and more
transparent for vendors to do business with the City of Troy.

Active MITN members with a current membership and paying annual
dues receive automatic electronic notification which allows instant
access to Bids, RFPS and Quote opportunities with the City.

Active MITN non-paying members are responsible to monitor and
check the MITN website for opportunities to do business with the City.
Inactive MITN member status can occur when a company does not
renew their account upon expiration. Inactive members cannot be
notified of solicitations or access any bid information.

e The following vendors responded to the Bid solicitation:
Garden State Highway Products, Inc.

Dornbos Sign & Safety, Inc.
Osburn Associates, Inc.

Lightle Enterprises of Ohio, LLC
Vulcan, Inc, dba Vulcan Signs

Rocal, Inc.

Custom Products Corporation

Rathco Safety Supply, Inc.

MD Solutions
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¢ Quantities are estimated and shall be purchased at quoted unit prices, on an as needed basis.
All items bid were separated into 11 proposal categories, A — K.

¢ Due to minimum shipment requirements, contracts are to be awarded on a proposal by proposal
basis.

e Proposal H is a set-up fee to fabricate non-standard signs for all sizes listed in the contract.
Therefore, all vendors awarded sign material contracts shall also be awarded Proposal H.

Financial
Funds are available in the Operating Budgets of the Public Works Streets Division.

Recommendation

City management recommends awarding one (1) year contracts on a proposal by proposal basis to the
following five (5) low bidders meeting specifications as detailed below for an estimated total cost of
$73,941.35 at unit prices contained in the bid tabulation opened July 9, 2015.

Estimated
Bidder Proposal Total
Custom Products Corp A $3,391.75
Garden State Highway
Products B,C,D $2,932.80
Vulcan Signs E,F,G K $54,290.80
Lightle Enterprises of
Ohio LLC I $2,016.00
Dornbos Sign & Safety J $11,310.00
Estimated Grand Total $73,941.35

G:\Bid Award 15-16 SPR 2 Traffic Signs ITB-COT 15-21.doc



Opening Date -- 7/9/15
Date Reviewed -- 7/15/2015

CITY OF TROY
BID TABULATION

TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS

Garden State
Highway Products,

Dornbos Sign &

ITB-COT 15-21
Pg.10of 6

Osburn Associates,

VENDOR NAME: Inc. Safety Inc. Inc.
Vineland, NJ Chalotte, Ml Logan, OH
ITEM EST QTY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
PROPOSAL A: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE 3M HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC ON ALUMINUM
1. 25 36" YIELD (R1-2) $ 16.98 | $ 17.00 | $ 19.13
2. 30 30" STOP (R1-1) $ 2454 | $ 25.00 | $ 26.00
3. 10 36" STOP (R1-1) $ 34.66 | $ 3335 % 38.25
4. 10 18" x 6" All Way (R1-4) $ 4071 $ 3.10 [ $ 3.19
5. 500 12" x 12" No Parking (R8-3A) 3 463 (% 455 $ 4.25
PROPOSAL A: EST TOTAL -- $ 3,863.00 | $ 381450 | $ 3,797.65
|PROPOSAL B: 3M STANDARD PRE-PRINTED TRAFFIC SIGN FACES HIGH INTENSITY
1. 500 12" X 12" No parking Symbol $ 1691 3% 250 | $ 1.80
2. 10 30" Stop Faces $ 9.74 | $ 11.75 | $ 9.98
3. 10 36" Yield Faces $ 546 | $ 9.00 | $ 14.40
PROPOSAL B: EST TOTAL -- $ 997.00 | $ 1,457.50 | $ 1,143.80
PROPOSAL C: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE. 3M DIAMOND GRADE, VIP SHEETING, FLUORESCENT YELLOW GREEN
ON ALUMINUM
1. 10 30" School Sign FYG $ 19.32 | $ 36.08 | $ 34.38
2. 10 36" School Sign FYG $ 2781 | % 5181 (% 49.50
3. 10 24" x 12" Directional Arrow FYG (W16-7p)| $ 6.18 | $ 13.87 | $ 10.98
4, 10 24" x 24" Directional Arrow FYG (W16-7p)| $ 12.36 | $ 2537 1% 10.98
PROPOSAL C: EST TOTAL -- $ 656.70 | $ 1,271.30 | $ 1,058.40
|PROPOSAL D: MDO SINGLE FACED, RECTANGLE PLYWOOD SIGN
1. 5 96" X 48" HIP Orange $ 12791 | $ 175.00 | $ 136.00
2. 5 96" x 48" HIP White $ 12791 | $ 189.00 | $ 136.00
PROPOSAL D: EST TOTAL -- $ 1,279.10 | $ 1,820.00 | $ 1,360.00
PROPOSAL E: COMPLETE SIGNS, STANDARD WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - ONE COLOR HIGH
INTENSITY PRISMATIC ON ALUMINUM, ROUNDED OR SQUARE CORNERS
1. 10 9" X 24" $ 838 |%$ 6.18 | $ 6.38
2. 10 9" X 30’ $ 10.48 | $ 7811 $ 7.97
3. 10 9" X 36" $ 1257 | $ 9341 $ 9.56
4. 10 9" X 48" $ 16.75 | $ 1245 | $ 12.75
5. 10 12" X 12" $ 449 1% 410 | $ 4.25
6. 100 12"X 18" $ 6.11 ] $ 6.14 | $ 6.38
7. 10 12" X 24" $ 799 | $ 8.18|$ 8.50
8. 10 12" X 30" $ 9.98 | $ 10.38 | $ 10.63
9. 150 12" X 36" $ 11.98 | $ 12.36 | $ 12.75
10. 25 12" X 42" $ 13.97 | $ 1453 | $ 14.88
11. 50 12" X 48" $ 1598 | $ 16.60 | $ 17.00
12. 25 12" X 54 $ 17.96 | $ 18.68 | $ 19.13
13. 25 18" X 18" $ 8.99|%$ 9341 $ 9.56
14. 20 18" X 24 $ 11.98 | $ 12.36 | $ 12.77
15. 20 18" X 48" $ 1598 | $ 35.28 | $ 25.50
16. 20 18" X 60" $ 19.98 | $ 4410 | $ 31.88
17. 10 24" X 24" $ 1598 | $ 16.60 | $ 17.00
18. 200 24" X 30" $ 19.98 | $ 2045 | $ 21.25
19. 10 24" X 36" $ 23.98 | $ 2490 | $ 25.50
20. 10 24" X 48 $ 3197 | $ 33.20 | $ 34.00
21. 200 30" X 30" $ 2498 | $ 2594 | $ 26.56
22. 10 36" X 36" $ 35.96 | $ 37.35| $ 38.25
PROPOSAL E: EST TOTAL -- $ 15,966.10 | $ 17,179.45 | $ 17,202.65
PROPOSAL F: COMPLETE SIGNS, STANDARD, WARNING SIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - TWO OR MORE
COLORS HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC ON ALUMINUM
1. 10 12" X 12" Two Color $ 463 |9 415 | $ 4.35
2. 50 12" X 18" Two Color $ 6.29 | $ 6.02|$ 6.53
3. 10 24" x 24" Two Color $ 16.46 | $ 16.05 | $ 17.40
4. 10 30" X 30" Three Color $ 2782 | $ 2845 | $ 28.13
PROPOSAL F: EST TOTAL -- $ 803.60 | $ 78750 | $ 825.30
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TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS

. Garden State Dornbos Sign & Osburn Associates,
Highway Products, Safety Inc Inc
VENDOR NAME: Inc. ] )
Vineland, NJ Chalotte, Ml Logan, OH
ITEM EST QTY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
PROPOSAL G: COMPLETE SIGNS, DOUBLE FACED, HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC TWO SIDED ON WHITE ON
EXTRUDED ALUMINUM
1. 25 9" X 24" Extruded BLANK (No Film) $ 10.26 | $ 558 | $ 10.62
2. 25 9" X 30" Extruded BLANK (No Film) $ 12.83 | $ 895 % 13.28
3. 25 9" X 36" Extruded BLANK (no film) $ 1539 | $ 1112 | $ 15.93
4, 25 9" X 42" Extruded BLANK (no film) $ 1796 | $ 13.28 | $ 18.55
5. 25 9" X 48" Extruded BLANK (No Film) $ 2053 % 14.49 | $ 21.24
PROPOSAL G: EST TOTAL -- $ 1,924.25| $ 1,335.50 | $ 1,990.50
|PROPOSAL H: SET UP FEES 2500  25.00[9% -
PROPOSAL |I: ROUND GALVANIZED STEEL POST, 2" NOMINAL SIZE, 2-1/8" ID,2-3/8" OD, .125 WALL THICKNESS, 3 LBS.
PER LINEAL FOOT.
1. 100 12 Ft. Galvanized steel round post $ 41.38 | $ 51.10 [ $ 43.38
PROPOSAL I: EST TOTAL -- $ 4,138.00 | $ 5,110.00 | $ 4,338.00
|PROPOSAL J: U-CHANNEL SIGN POSTS
1. 200 10 FT - 2Ibs Galvanized Steel $ 2024 | $ 1450 | $ 19.20
2. 200 12 FT - 3lbs Galvanized Steel $ 29.49 | $ 26.05 | $ 34.75
3. 100 15 FT - 3lbs Galvanized Steel $ 36.86 | $ 3200 | $ 43.43
PROPOSAL J: EST TOTAL -- $ 13,632.00 | $ 11,310.00 | $ 15,133.00
PROPOSAL K: SQUARE TUBULAR SIGN POSTS -- PERFORATED-- GALVANIZED STEEL-- FHWA APPROVED
1. 100 14 FT x 1-3/4"-14 Gauge $ 26.48 | $ 28.40 | $ 28.56
2. 300 12 FT x2"-12 Gauge $ 32.16 | $ 39.14 | $ 37.98
3. 300 10FT X 2"-12 Gauge $ 26.81 | % 32.66 | $ 31.65
4, 300 9FT X2"-12 Gauge $ 24.60 | $ 2940 | $ 28.49
5. 100 3 FT X2" Anchor Base - 12 Gauge $ 8.61|9% 956 | $ 9.50
6. 1000 3 FT X 2-1/4" Anchor Base - 12 Gauge $ 10.27 |1 $ 1183 | $ 10.17
PROPOSAL K: EST TOTAL -- $ 38,850.00 | $ 45,986.00 | $ 43,412.00
| ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS: $ 82,109.75| % 90,071.75| % 90,261.30
$1,000.00 *Posts: 6-8
DELIVERY: Minimum Shipment $500.00 Blank weeks delivery time
# of Days 21-30 30 30
CONTACT INFO: Hrs of Operation: Mon-Fri 7am-5pm 7:30am-5:00pm 8am-5pm
24 Hr Phone Number: 609-774-1116 517-543-4000 800-523-8917
DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE: Marked N N specs
PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 days
WARRANTY: Blank 3M Warranty 10 years
EXCEPTIONS: Blank Blank Blank
FORMS INCLUDED: Legal Status Bidder Y Y Y
Non-Collusion Affadavit Y Y Y
Debarment Certification Y Y Y
Iran-Linked Business Y Y Y
ALL OR NONE AWARD: YorN N N N
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT SIGNED: Y orN Y Y Y
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Lightle Enterprises of| Vulcan, Inc. (DBA Rocal. Inc
VENDOR NAME: Ohio, LLC Vulcan Signs) ' )
Frankfort, OH Foley, AL Frankfort, OH
ITEM EST QTY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
PROPOSAL A: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE 3M HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC ON ALUMINUM
1. 25 36" YIELD (R1-2) $21.42| $ 16.11 | $ 20.06
2. 30 30" STOP (R1-1) $26.60| $ 2198 [ $ 28.94
3. 10 36" STOP (R1-1) $42.60| $ 3185( % 41.67
4. 10 18" x 6" All Way (R1-4) $3.60] $ 3443 5.47
5. 500 12" x 12" No Parking (R8-3A) $4.80] $ 444 $ 6.63
PROPOSAL A: EST TOTAL -- $ 4,195.50 [ $ 3,635.05 | $ 5,156.10
|PROPOSAL B: 3M STANDARD PRE-PRINTED TRAFFIC SIGN FACES HIGH INTENSITY
1. 500 12" X 12" No parking Symbol $ 210 | $ 211 | $ 1.99
2. 10 30" Stop Faces $ 12.38 | $ 10.19 | $ 12.44
3. 10 36" Yield Faces $ 892 1% 6.64 % 9.76
PROPOSAL B: EST TOTAL -- $ 1,263.00 | $ 1,223.30 | $ 1,217.00
PROPOSAL C: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE. 3M DIAMOND GRADE, VIP SHEETING, FLUORESCENT YELLOW GREEN
ON ALUMINUM
1. 10 30" School Sign FYG $ 23.88 | $ 34.01| % 40.50
2. 10 36" School Sign FYG $ 34.38 | $ 49.20 | $ 58.32
3. 10 24" x 12" Directional Arrow FYG (W16-7p)| $ 7641 % 11.61 | $ 12.96
4, 10 24" x 24" Directional Arrow FYG (W16-7p)| $ 1428 | $ 2542 1% 25.92
PROPOSAL C: EST TOTAL -- $ 801.80 | $ 1,202.40 | $ 1,377.00
PROPOSAL D: MDO SINGLE FACED, RECTANGLE PLYWOOD SIGN
1. 5 96" X 48" HIP Orange $ 208.00 NO BID $ 255.04
2. 5 96" x 48" HIP White $ 208.00 $ 255.04
PROPOSAL D: EST TOTAL -- $ 2,080.00 $ 2,550.40
PROPOSAL E: COMPLETE SIGNS, STANDARD WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - ONE COLOR HIGH
INTENSITY PRISMATIC ON ALUMINUM, ROUNDED OR SQUARE CORNERS
1. 10 9" X 24" $ 7141 $ 577 | $ 6.95
2. 10 9" X 30' $ 8931|% 710 | $ 8.68
3. 10 9" X 36" $ 10.71 | $ 850 | % 10.42
4. 10 9" X 48" $ 14.28 | $ 11.33 | $ 13.89
5. 10 12" X 12" $ 476 | $ 391 1% 6.63
6. 100 12" X 18" $ 7141 % 578 | $ 6.95
7. 10 12" X 24" $ 952 1% 754 1% 9.26
8. 10 12" X 30" $ 11.90 | $ 9.39 | % 11.58
9. 150 12" X 36" $ 14.28 | $ 10.83 | $ 13.89
10. 25 12" X 42" $ 16.66 | $ 12.64 | $ 16.21
11. 50 12" X 48" $ 19.04 | $ 14.44 1 $ 18.52
12. 25 12" X 54 $ 2142 |1 $ 16.25 | $ 20.84
13. 25 18" X 18" $ 10.71 | $ 845 | % 10.42
14. 20 18" X 24 $ 14.28 | $ 10.83 | $ 13.89
15. 20 18" X 48" $ 28.56 | $ 21.66 | $ 27.78
16. 20 18" X 60" $ 35.70 | $ 27.08 | $ 34.73
17. 10 24" X 24" $ 19.04 | $ 14.44 1 $ 18.52
18. 200 24" X 30" $ 23.80 | $ 18.05 | $ 23.15
19. 10 24" X 36" $ 28.56 | $ 21.66 | $ 27.78
20. 10 24" X 48 $ 38.08 | $ 28.88 | $ 37.04
21. 200 30" X 30" $ 29.75 | $ 2256 | $ 28.94
22. 10 36" X 36" $ 4284 1% 3249 1% 41.67
PROPOSAL E: EST TOTAL -- $ 19,266.15 | $ 14,681.50 | $ 18,761.45
PROPOSAL F: COMPLETE SIGNS, STANDARD, WARNING SIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - TWO OR MORE
COLORS HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC ON ALUMINUM
1. 10 12" X 12" Two Color $ 488 | $ 434 | $ 6.94
2. 50 12" X 18" Two Color $ 732 % 6.21 | $ 7.41
3. 10 24" x 24" Two Color $ 1952 | $ 1483 | $ 19.76
4. 10 30" X 30" Three Color $ 3050 | $ 23.36 | $ 36.69
PROPOSAL F: EST TOTAL -- $ 915.00 [ $ 735.80 | $ 1,004.40
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Lightle Enterprises of| Vulcan, Inc. (DBA Rocal. Inc
VENDOR NAME: Ohio, LLC Vulcan Signs) ' )
Frankfort, OH Foley, AL Frankfort, OH
ITEM EST QTY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
PROPOSAL G: COMPLETE SIGNS, DOUBLE FACED, HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC TWO SIDED ON WHITE ON
EXTRUDED ALUMINUM
1. 25 9" X 24" Extruded BLANK (No Film) $ 25431 % 570 | $ 28.90
2. 25 9" X 30" Extruded BLANK (No Film) $ 31.78 | $ 710 $ 36.12
3. 25 9" X 36" Extruded BLANK (no film) $ 38.14 | $ 8.50 | $ 38.50
4. 25 9" X 42" Extruded BLANK (no film) $ 4449 | $ 9.98 | % 4491
5. 25 9" X 48" Extruded BLANK (No Film) $ 50.85 | $ 11.30 | $ 51.33
PROPOSAL G: EST TOTAL -- $ 476725 [ $ 1,064.50 | $ 4,994.00
|PROPOSAL H: SET UP FEES 40000[$  25.00[$  100.00|

PROPOSAL I: ROUND GALVANIZED STEEL POST, 2" NOMINAL SIZE, 2-1/8" ID,

2-3/8" OD, .125 WALL THICKNESS, 3 LBS.

PER LINEAL FOOT.

1. 100 12 Ft. Galvanized steel round post $ 20.16 NO BID NO BID
PROPOSAL I: EST TOTAL -- $ 2,016.00
|PROPOSAL J: U-CHANNEL SIGN POSTS
1. 200 10 FT - 2Ibs Galvanized Steel $ 19.60 | $ 18.34
2. 200 12 FT - 3lbs Galvanized Steel $ 33.60 | $ 32.60 NO BID
3. 100 15 FT - 3lbs Galvanized Steel $ 4200 [ % 41.57
PROPOSAL J: EST TOTAL -- $ 14,840.00 | $ 14,345.00
|PROPOSAL K: SWUARE TUBULAR SIGN POSTS -- PERFORATED-- GALVANIZED STEEL-- FHWA APPROVED

1. 100 14 FT x 1-3/4"-14 Gauge $ 31.12 | $ 26.26
2. 300 12FT x2"-12 Gauge $ 36.48 | $ 31.42
3. 300 10FT X 2"-12 Gauge $ 30.40 | $ 26.18 NO BID
4, 300 9FT X2"-12 Gauge $ 27.36 | $ 23.57
5. 100 3 FT X2" Anchor Base - 12 Gauge $ 9.20 | $ 8.92
6. 1000 3 FT X 2-1/4" Anchor Base - 12 Gauge $ 10.63 | $ 9.94
PROPOSAL K: EST TOTAL -- $ 42,934.00 | $ 37,809.00
| ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS: $ 93,078.70 | $ 74,696.55 | $ 35,060.35
DELIVERY: Minimum Shipment $2,000.00 $500.00 $500.00
Stock items 3-5 days.
See bid for more
# of Days 30-45 ARO details. 30-45
CONTACT INFO: Hrs of Operation: 8am-5pm 7am-4pm Central Time 7am-4:30pm
24 Hr Phone Number: 740-703-6740 800-633-6845 800-992-8633
DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE: Marked Blank Blank A, B
PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Per reflective sheeting | Standard warranty Labor - 1 year
WARRANTY: manufacturer standard applies Materials - 10 years
We are bidding Avery
Dennison series 6500
HIP for Proposals A, B,
D, E, and F. We are
bidding Avery
Dennison series 9500
Proposal G - We are OmniView for
quoting bare metal (no| Proposals C and G.
sheeting) extruded Product Bulletins are
EXCEPTIONS: Blank blanks. attached.
FORMS INCLUDED: Legal Status Bidder Y Y Y
Non-Collusion Affadavit Y Y Y
Debarment Certification Y Y Y
Iran-Linked Business Y Y Y
ALL OR NONE AWARD: Y orN N N N
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT SIGNED: Y orN Y Y Y
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Custom Products |Rathco Safety Supply, .
VENDOR NAME: Corporation Inc. MD Solutions
Jackson, MS Portage, Ml Plain City, OH
ITEM EST QTY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
PROPOSAL A: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE 3M HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC ON ALUMINUM
1. 25 36" YIELD (R1-2) $ 16.87 | $ 17.51
2. 30 30" STOP (R1-1) $ 2335 % 24.66
3. 10 36" STOP (R1-1) $ 33.65 | % 34.16 NO BID
4. 10 18" x 6" All Way (R1-4) $ 3.30 [ $ 3.40
5. 500 12" x 12" No Parking (R8-3A) $ 3.80 % 4.49
PROPOSAL A: EST TOTAL -- $ 3,391.75 [ $ 3,798.15
|PROPOSAL B: 3M STANDARD PRE-PRINTED TRAFFIC SIGN FACES HIGH INTENSITY
1. 500 12" X 12" No parking Symbol $ 2351 % 2.45
2. 10 30" Stop Faces $ 11.63 | $ 11.25 NO BID
3. 10 36" Yield Faces $ 750 % 7.85
PROPOSAL B: EST TOTAL -- $ 1,366.30 | $ 1,416.00
PROPOSAL C: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE. 3M DIAMOND GRADE, VIP SHEETING, FLUORESCENT YELLOW GREEN
ON ALUMINUM
1. 10 30" School Sign FYG $ 48.53 | $ 36.50
2. 10 36" School Sign FYG $ 7481 | $ 49.59 NO BID
3. 10 24" x 12" Directional Arrow FYG (W16-7p)| $ 16.17 | $ 11.10
4, 10 24" x 24" Directional Arrow FYG (W16-7p)| $ 36.00 | $ 22.20
PROPOSAL C: EST TOTAL -- $ 1,755.10 | $ 1,193.90
|PROPOSAL D: MDO SINGLE FACED, RECTANGLE PLYWOOD SIGN
1. 5 96" X 48" HIP Orange $ 199.75
2. 5 96"x 48" HIP White NO BID $ 226.85 NO BID
PROPOSAL D: EST TOTAL -- $ 2,133.00

PROPOSAL E: COMPLETE SIGNS, STANDARD WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - O

NE COLOR HIGH

21.
22.

10
10
10
10
10
100
10
10
150
25
50
25
25
20
20
20
10
200
10
10
200
10

9" X 24"

9" X 30

9" X 36"

9" X 48"

12" X 12"
12" X 18"
12" X 24"
12" X 30"
12" X 36"
12" X 42"
12" X 48"
12" X 54
18" X 18"
18" X 24
18" X 48"
18" X 60"
24" X 24"
24" X 30"
24" X 36"
24" X 48
30" X 30"
36" X 36"

PROPOSAL E: EST TOTAL --

INTENSITY PRISMATIC ON ALUMINUM, ROUNDED OR SQUARE CORNERS

$ 6.02 % 6.45
$ 7521% 8.06
$ 9.02 1% 9.64
$ 12.03 [ $ 12.90
$ 4.20 [ $ 4.24
$ 6.03]|% 6.53
$ 8.02|% 8.20
$ 10.03 [ $ 9.88
$ 12.03 [ $ 12.30
$ 14.04 [ $ 14.35
$ 16.04 [ $ 16.40
$ 18.18 [ $ 18.45 NO BID
$ 9.03|% 9.23
$ 12.03 [ $ 12.30
$ 24.06 | $ 24.60
$ 29.63 | $ 30.75
$ 16.04 [ $ 16.40
$ 1955 (% 20.50
$ 2346 | $ 24.26
$ 31.28 | $ 32.80
$ 24.44 | $ 25.63
$ 36.00 | $ 36.90
$ 15,989.35 | $ 16,645.05

PROPOSAL F: COMPLETE SIGNS, STANDARD, WARNING SIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - TWO OR MORE

1.

2.
3.
4.

10
50
10
10

COLORS HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC ON ALUMINUM

12" X 12" Two Color
12" X 18" Two Color
24" x 24" Two Color
30" X 30" Three Color

PROPOSAL F: EST TOTAL --

$ 1150 [ $ 4.54
$ 1284 [ $ 6.74
$ 32.00| $ 13.86 NO BID
$ 53.00 | $ 29.74
$ 1,607.00 | $ 818.40
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Custom Products |Rathco Safety Supply, :
VENDOR NAME: Corporation Inc. MD Solutions
Jackson, MS Portage, Ml Plain City, OH
ITEM EST QTY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
PROPOSAL G: COMPLETE SIGNS, DOUBLE FACED, HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC TWO SIDED ON WHITE ON
EXTRUDED ALUMINUM
1. 25 9" X 24" Extruded BLANK (No Film) $ 11.50
2. 25 9" X 30" Extruded BLANK (No Film) $ 14.37
3. 25 9" X 36" Extruded BLANK (no film) NO BID $ 17.24 NO BID
4. 25 9" X 42" Extruded BLANK (no film) $ 20.11
5. 25 9" X 48" Extruded BLANK (No Film) $ 22.99
PROPOSAL G: EST TOTAL -- $ 2,155.25
35.00 NO BID NO BID

|PROPOSAL H: SET UP FEES

PROPOSAL I: ROUND GALVANIZED STEEL POST, 2" NOMINAL SIZE, 2-1/8" ID,

2-3/8" OD, .125 WALL THICKNESS, 3 LBS.

PER LINEAL FOOT.

1. 100 12 Ft. Galvanized steel round post NO BID NO BID NO BID
PROPOSAL |: EST TOTAL --
|PROPOSAL J: U-CHANNEL SIGN POSTS
1. 200 10 FT - 2lbs Galvanized Steel $ 1796 | $ 1520 | $ 16.32
2. 200 12 FT - 3lbs Galvanized Steel $ 3415 | $ 26.28 | $ 27.40
3. 100 15 FT - 3lbs Galvanized Steel $ 56.88 | $ 3285 | % 32.90
PROPOSAL J: EST TOTAL -- $ 16,110.00 | $ 11,581.00 | $ 12,034.00
|PROPOSAL K: SWUARE TUBULAR SIGN POSTS -- PERFORATED-- GALVANIZED STEEL-- FHWA APPROVED
1. 100 14 FT x 1-3/4"-14 Gauge $ 27.05
2. 300 12FT x2"-12 Gauge $ 33.60
3. 300 10FT X 2"-12 Gauge $ 28.00
4, 300 9FT X2"-12 Gauge NO BID NO BID $ 25.20
5. 100 3 FT X2" Anchor Base - 12 Gauge $ 9.50
6. 1000 3 FT X 2-1/4" Anchor Base - 12 Gauge $ 10.28
PROPOSAL K: EST TOTAL -- $ 39,975.00
| ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS: $ 40,219.50 | $ 39,740.75| % 52,009.00
$500 & post must be
ordered in full bundles
DELIVERY: Minimum Shipment of (50) $500.00 $2,500.00
# of Days 35; post up to 65 30 30
CONTACT INFO: Hrs of Operation: 7am-5pm 8am-4pm 8:30am-5pm
None / 7am-5pm: 888-
24 Hr Phone Number: 905-5665 n/a Blank
DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE: Marked #8 Catalog Blank Blank
PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
WARRANTY: 3m Warranty applies 3M Sheeting Standard
1) Post must be
ordered in full bundles.
EXCEPTIONS: See bid for more. Blank Blank
FORMS INCLUDED: Legal Status Bidder Y Y Y
Non-Collusion Affadavit Y Y Y
Debarment Certification Y Y Y
Iran-Linked Business Y Y Y
ALL OR NONE AWARD: YorN N N N
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT SIGNED: YorN Y Y Y
ATTEST:

Enna Bachelor

Saraa Teets
Susan Riesterer
G:\ITB-COT 15-21 Traffic Control Signs & Posts

MaryBeth Murz

Purchasing Manager






