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CCIITTYY  CCOOUUNNCCIILL  AAGGEENNDDAA  IITTEEMM  
 

Date: July 12, 2016 

To: Brian Kischnick, City Manager 

From: MaryBeth Murz, Purchasing Manager 
Kurt Bovensiep, Public Works Director 

Subject: Standard Purchasing Resolution 2: Award To Lowest Bidders Meeting Specifications – 
Traffic Control Signs and Posts 

History 
• The Streets Division is responsible for the maintenance of all city posted traffic control signs and posts.
• These signs and posts require new installations, as well as repairs and replacements to be in compliance

with the most current standards as specified in the Michigan Manual on Uniform Traffic Control Devices.

Purchasing 
• On July 7, 2016, a bid opening was conducted as required by City Charter and Code for one (1) year

requirements of traffic control signs and posts.
• The bid was posted on the Michigan Inter-governmental Trade Network (MITN) website; www.mitn.info.
• (1) Vendor; MD Solutions, did not meet specifications (DMS) on sign items and was not considered for

award because their minimum shipment requirement of $3,500.00 greatly exceeded the $500.00
minimum as specified in the bid documents.

• (6) bid responses were received.  Below is a detailed summary of potential vendors:

• Quantities are estimated and shall be purchased at quoted unit prices, on an as needed basis.
• All items bid were separated into 11 proposal categories, A – K.
• Due to minimum shipment requirements, contracts are to be awarded on a proposal by proposal

basis.
• Proposal H is a set-up fee to fabricate non-standard signs for all sizes listed in the contract.

Therefore, all vendors awarded sign material contracts shall also be awarded Proposal H.

Financial 
Funds are available in the Operating Budgets of the Public Works Streets Division. 

Companies notified via MITN 259 
Troy Companies notified via MITN 4 
Troy Companies - Active email Notification 4 
Troy Companies - Active Free 0 
Companies that viewed the bid 22 
Troy Companies that viewed the bid 0 

MITN provides a resourceful online platform to streamline the 
procurement process, reduce costs, and make it easier and more 
transparent for vendors to do business with the City of Troy. 
Active MITN members with a current membership and paying annual 
dues receive automatic electronic notification which allows instant 
access to Bids, RFPS and Quote opportunities with the City.   
Active MITN non-paying members are responsible to monitor and 
check the MITN website for opportunities to do business with the City.
Inactive MITN member status can occur when a company does not 
renew their account upon expiration.  Inactive members cannot be 
notified of solicitations or access any bid information. 
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CCIITTYY  CCOOUUNNCCIILL  AAGGEENNDDAA  IITTEEMM  
 

Recommendation 
City management recommends awarding one (1) year contracts on a proposal by proposal basis to the 
following three (3) low bidders meeting specifications as detailed below for an estimated total cost of 
$61,136.58 at unit prices contained in the bid tabulation opened July 7, 2016. 
 

Bidder Proposal 
Estimated 

Total 
Vulcan Signs B, C, F, G, K $29,274.05 
Lightle Enterprises of 
Ohio LLC I $2,930.00 
Dornbos Sign & Safety A, D, E, J $28,932.53 
Estimated Grand Total   $61,136.58  
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Opening Date -- 7/7/2016 CITY OF TROY    ITB-COT 16-27
Date Reviewed -- 7/7/2016 BID TABULATION Pg. 1 of 5

TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS

VENDOR NAME:

Lightle Enterprises of 
Ohio, LLC Unistrut Midwest Vulcan, Inc.

Frankfort, OH Cincinatti, OH Foley, AL
ITEM EST QTY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
PROPOSAL A: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE 3M HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC ON ALUMINUM

1. 10 36" YIELD (R1-2) 20.75$                        15.09$                        
2. 30 30" STOP (R1-1) 26.10$                        21.65$                        
3. 10 36" STOP (R1-1) 41.10$                        29.89$                        
4. 10 18" x 6" All Way        (R1-4) 3.46$                          2.92$                          
5. 500 12" x 12" No Parking (R8-3A) 4.61$                          3.97$                          

PROPOSAL A:  EST TOTAL : 3,741.10$                   No Bid 3,113.50$                   

PROPOSAL B: 3M STANDARD PRE-PRINTED TRAFFIC SIGN FACES HIGH INTENSITY
1. 500 12" X 12" 2.02$                          1.61$                          
2. 10 30" Stop Faces 12.31$                        9.03$                          
3. 10 36" Yield Faces 8.87$                          5.81$                          

PROPOSAL B:  EST TOTAL: 1,221.80$                   No Bid 953.40$                      

PROPOSAL C: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE. 3M DIAMOND GRADE, VIP SHEETING, FLUORESCENT YELLOW GREEN 
ON ALUMINUM

1. 10 30" School Sign FYG 47.60$                        28.19$                        
2. 10 36" School Sign FYG 68.58$                        40.35$                        
3. 10 24" x 12" Directional Arrow FYG (W16-7p) 15.24$                        9.36$                          
4. 10 24" x 24" Directional Arrow FYG (W16-7p) 30.48$                        20.98$                        
5. 10 30" x 15" 'AHEAD' Sign FYG (W16-9P) 23.80$                        14.60$                        

PROPOSAL C:  EST TOTAL: 1,857.00$                   No Bid 1,134.80$                   

PROPOSAL D: MDO SINGLE FACED, RECTANGLE PLYWOOD SIGN
1. 3 96" X 48" HIP Orange 216.00$                      
2. 3 96" x 48" HIP White 216.00$                      

PROPOSAL D:  EST TOTAL: 1,296.00$                   No Bid No Bid

PROPOSAL E: COMPLETE SIGNS, STANDARD WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - ONE COLOR HIGH
INTENSITY PRISMATIC ON ALUMINUM, ROUNDED OR SQUARE CORNERS

1. 10 9" X 24" 6.92$                          5.24$                          
2. 10 9" X 30' 8.64$                          6.54$                          
3. 10 9" X 36" 10.37$                        7.84$                          
4. 10 9" X 48" 13.83$                        10.48$                        
5. 10 12" X 12" 4.61$                          3.82$                          
6. 100 12" X 18" 6.92$                          5.24$                          
7. 10 12" X 24" 9.22$                          7.01$                          
8. 10 12" X 30" 11.53$                        8.71$                          
9. 150 12" X 36" 13.83$                        10.36$                        

10. 25 12" X 42" 16.14$                        12.18$                        
11. 50 12" X 48" 18.44$                        13.92$                        
12. 25 12" X 54 20.75$                        15.66$                        
13. 25 18" X 18" 10.37$                        7.76$                          
14. 20 18" X 24 13.83$                        10.44$                        
15. 20 18" X 48" 27.66$                        20.88$                        
16. 20 18" X 60" 34.58$                        26.10$                        
17. 10 24" X 24" 18.44$                        13.92$                        
18. 200 24" X 30" 23.05$                        17.27$                        
19. 10 24" X 36" 27.66$                        20.88$                        
20. 10 24" X 48 36.88$                        27.84$                        
21. 200 30" X 30" 28.81$                        21.57$                        
22. 10 36" X 36" 41.49$                        31.32$                        
23. 10 36" X 48" 55.32$                        41.76$                        
24. 10 48" X 48" 73.76$                        55.68$                        

PROPOSAL E:  EST TOTAL: 19,950.10$                 No Bid 14,990.80$                 

No parking Symbol         



CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 16-27
BID TABULATION Pg. 2 of 5
TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS

VENDOR NAME:

Lightle Enterprises of 
Ohio, LLC Unistrut Midwest Vulcan Inc.

Frankfort, Ohio Detroit, Michigan Foley, Alabama
ITEM EST QTY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

1. 10 12" X 12" Two Color 4.70$                          4.30$                          
2. 50 12" X 18" Two Color 7.05$                          5.81$                          
3. 10 24" x 24" Two Color 18.60$                        14.73$                        
4. 10 30" X 30" Three Color 32.20$                        23.19$                        

PROPOSAL F:  EST TOTAL: 907.50$                      No Bid 712.70$                      

1. 25 9" X 24" Extruded BLANK (No Film) 25.43$                        4.92$                          
2. 25 9" X 30" Extruded BLANK (No Film) 31.78$                        6.15$                          
3. 25 9" X 36" Extruded BLANK  (No Film) 38.14$                        7.36$                          
4. 25 9" X 42" Extruded BLANK  (No Film) 44.49$                        8.67$                          
5. 25 9" X 48" Extruded BLANK  (No Film) 50.85$                        9.81$                          
6. 5 9" X 54" Extruded BLANK  (No Film) 57.21$                        11.08$                        

PROPOSAL G:  EST TOTAL: 5,053.30$                   No Bid 978.15$                      

PROPOSAL H: SET UP FEES 45.00$                        No Bid 25.00$                        

PROPOSAL I: ROUND GALVANIZED STEEL POST, 2" NOMINAL SIZE, 2-1/8" ID,2-3/8" OD, .125 WALL THICKNESS, 3 LBS.
PER LINEAL FOOT.

1. 100 12 Ft. Galvanized steel round post 29.30$                        
PROPOSAL I:  EST TOTAL: 2,930.00$                   No Bid No Bid

PROPOSAL J: U-CHANNEL SIGN POSTS
1. 200 10 FT - 2lbs Galvanized Steel 17.90$                        19.89$                        
2. 200 12 FT - 3lbs Galvanized Steel 31.20$                        35.00$                        
3. 100 15 FT - 3lbs Galvanized Steel 42.00$                        44.26$                        

PROPOSAL J:  EST TOTAL: 14,020.00$                 No Bid 15,404.00$                 

PROPOSAL K: SQUARE TUBULAR SIGN POSTS -- PERFORATED-- GALVANIZED STEEL-- FHWA APPROVED
1. 100 14 FT x 1-3/4"-14 Gauge 29.54$                        48.86$                        27.26$                        
2. 100 12 FT x 2" - 12 Gauge 25.32$                        41.88$                        23.36$                        
3. 200 10 FT X 2" - 12 Gauge 31.20$                        42.96$                        32.30$                        
4. 200 9 FT X 2" - 12 Gauge 26.00$                        35.80$                        26.92$                        
5. 200 9 FT X 2" - 12 Gauge 25.40$                        35.80$                        24.22$                        
6. 100 3 FT X 2" Anchor Base - 12 Gauge 9.15$                          12.00$                        8.68$                          
7. 300 3 FT X 2-1/4" Anchor Base - 12 Gauge 10.10$                        12.91$                        9.59$                          

PROPOSAL K:  EST TOTAL: 25,951.00$                 37,059.00$                 25,495.00$                 

ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS: 76,927.80$                 37,059.00$                 62,782.35$                 

DELIVERY: Minimum Shipment: Signs $1500.00             
Posts $5000.00 None $500.00 

# of Days 30-60 days 3 days 30-45 days ARO
CONTACT INFO: Hrs of Operation: 8:00am-4:30pm 8:00am-5:00pm 7:00am-4:00pm CST

24 Hr Phone Number: 740 703 6740 800 586 4787 800-633-6845
DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE: Marked None None
PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 days Net 30 days Net 30 days
WARRANTY: Blank 1 Year Standard
EXCEPTIONS: None None None

Y/N Yes Yes Y
ALL OR NONE AWARD: Y or N No No N

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT SIGNED:   Y or N Yes Yes Y

PROPOSAL G: Extruded Aluminum 

FORMS INCLUDED:  

PROPOSAL F: COMPLETE SIGNS, STANDARD, WARNING SIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - TWO OR MORE 
COLORS HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC ON ALUMINUM



CITY OF TROY    ITB-COT 16-27
BID TABULATION Pg. 3 of 5
TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS

VENDOR NAME:

Dornbos Sign & 
Safety, Inc.

GardenState Highway 
Products, Inc. MD Solutions

Charlotte, Michigan Vineland, NJ Plain City, OH
ITEM EST QTY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
PROPOSAL A: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE 3M HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC ON ALUMINUM

1. 10 36" YIELD (R1-2) 15.25$                        17.87$                        
2. 30 30" STOP (R1-1) 20.38$                        26.59$                        
3. 10 36" STOP (R1-1) 29.33$                        36.56$                        
4. 10 18" x 6" All Way        (R1-4) 2.73$                          3.63$                          
5. 500 12" x 12" No Parking (R8-3A) 3.73$                          4.73$                          

PROPOSAL A:  EST TOTAL: 2,949.50$                   3,743.30$                   No Bid

PROPOSAL B: 3M STANDARD PRE-PRINTED TRAFFIC SIGN FACES HIGH INTENSITY
1. 500 12" X 12" 1.54$                          1.92$                          
2. 10 30" Stop Faces 8.71$                          10.46$                        
3. 10 36" Yield Faces 12.53$                        5.96$                          

PROPOSAL B:  EST TOTAL: 982.40$                      1,124.20$                   No Bid

PROPOSAL C: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE. 3M DIAMOND GRADE, VIP SHEETING, FLUORESCENT YELLOW GREEN 
ON ALUMINUM

1. 10 30" School Sign FYG 29.13$                        40.96$                        
2. 10 36" School Sign FYG 41.94$                        57.37$                        
3. 10 24" x 12" Directional Arrow FYG (W16-7p) 9.32$                          13.41$                        
4. 10 24" x 24" Directional Arrow FYG (W16-7p) 18.64$                        26.81$                        
5. 10 30" x 15" 'AHEAD' Sign FYG (W16-9P) 14.62$                        20.94$                        

PROPOSAL C:  EST TOTAL: 1,136.50$                   1,594.90$                   No Bid

PROPOSAL D: MDO SINGLE FACED, RECTANGLE PLYWOOD SIGN
1. 3 96" X 48" HIP Orange 139.28$                      150.29$                      
2. 3 96" x 48" HIP White 139.28$                      150.29$                      

PROPOSAL D:  EST TOTAL: 835.68$                      901.74$                      No Bid

PROPOSAL E: COMPLETE SIGNS, STANDARD WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - ONE COLOR HIGH
INTENSITY PRISMATIC ON ALUMINUM, ROUNDED OR SQUARE CORNERS

1. 10 9" X 24" 5.19$                          7.64$                          
2. 10 9" X 30' 6.51$                          9.56$                          
3. 10 9" X 36" 7.79$                          13.11$                        
4. 10 9" X 48" 10.38$                        15.29$                        
5. 10 12" X 12" 3.46$                          4.73$                          
6. 100 12" X 18" 5.19$                          6.52$                          
7. 10 12" X 24" 6.92$                          8.69$                          
8. 10 12" X 30" 8.65$                          10.87$                        
9. 150 12" X 36" 10.38$                        13.04$                        

10. 25 12" X 42" 12.11$                        15.22$                        
11. 50 12" X 48" 13.84$                        17.39$                        
12. 25 12" X 54 15.57$                        19.56$                        
13. 25 18" X 18" 7.79$                          9.78$                          
14. 20 18" X 24 10.38$                        13.04$                        
15. 20 18" X 48" 20.76$                        26.09$                        
16. 20 18" X 60" 25.95$                        32.61$                        
17. 10 24" X 24" 13.84$                        17.39$                        
18. 200 24" X 30" 16.94$                        21.74$                        
19. 10 24" X 36" 20.34$                        26.09$                        
20. 10 24" X 48 27.68$                        34.79$                        
21. 200 30" X 30" 21.63$                        27.18$                        
22. 10 36" X 36" 31.14$                        39.15$                        
23. 10 36" X 48" 41.52$                        52.20$                        
24. 10 48" X 48" 55.36$                        69.60$                        

PROPOSAL E:  EST TOTAL: 14,898.35$                 18,901.40$                 No Bid

No parking Symbol         



ITB-COT 16-27
BID TABULATION Pg. 4 of 5
TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS

Dornbos Sign & 
Safety, Inc.

GardenState Highway 
Products MD Solutions

VENDOR NAME: Charlotte, MI Vineland, NJ Plain City, OH

ITEM EST QTY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

1. 10 12" X 12" Two Color 3.73$                          4.73$                          
2. 50 12" X 18" Two Color 5.71$                          6.84$                          
3. 10 24" x 24" Two Color 15.23$                        18.26$                        
4. 10 30" X 30" Three Color 24.05$                        29.63$                        

PROPOSAL F:  EST TOTAL: 715.60$                      868.20$                      No Bid

1. 25 9" X 24" Extruded BLANK (No Film) 8.28$                          6.21$                          
2. 25 9" X 30" Extruded BLANK (No Film) 9.54$                          7.76$                          
3. 25 9" X 36" Extruded BLANK  (No Film) 11.68$                        9.31$                          
4. 25 9" X 42" Extruded BLANK  (No Film) 12.80$                        10.86$                        
5. 25 9" X 48" Extruded BLANK  (No Film) 14.63$                        12.41$                        
6. 5 9" X 54" Extruded BLANK  (No Film) 19.26$                        13.97$                        

PROPOSAL G:  EST TOTAL: 1,519.55$                   1,233.60$                   No Bid

PROPOSAL H: SET UP FEES 20.00$                        40.00$                        No Bid

PROPOSAL I: ROUND GALVANIZED STEEL POST, 2" NOMINAL SIZE, 2-1/8" ID,2-3/8" OD, .125 WALL THICKNESS, 3 LBS.
PER LINEAL FOOT.

1. 100 12 Ft. Galvanized steel round post 49.10$                        46.92$                        57.00$                        
PROPOSAL I:  EST TOTAL: 4,910.00$                   4,692.00$                   5,700.00$                   

PROPOSAL J: U-CHANNEL SIGN POSTS
1. 200 10 FT - 2lbs Galvanized Steel 14.90$                        19.92$                        15.50$                        
2. 200 12 FT - 3lbs Galvanized Steel 22.52$                        34.21$                        27.40$                        
3. 100 15 FT - 3lbs Galvanized Steel 27.65$                        42.76$                        35.25$                        

PROPOSAL J:  EST TOTAL: 10,249.00$                 15,102.00$                 12,105.00$                 

PROPOSAL K: SQUARE TUBULAR SIGN POSTS -- PERFORATED-- GALVANIZED STEEL-- FHWA APPROVED
1. 100 14 FT x 1-3/4"-14 Gauge 26.80$                        30.76$                        23.23$                        
2. 100 12 FT x 2" - 12 Gauge 22.87$                        26.36$                        20.07$                        
3. 200 10 FT X 2" - 12 Gauge 37.63$                        33.43$                        27.06$                        
4. 200 9 FT X 2" - 12 Gauge 27.28$                        27.86$                        22.55$                        
5. 200 9 FT X 2" - 12 Gauge 24.32$                        25.07$                        20.25$                        
6. 100 3 FT X 2" Anchor Base - 12 Gauge 9.50$                          8.36$                          8.55$                          
7. 300 3 FT X 2-1/4" Anchor Base - 12 Gauge 9.94$                          10.24$                        8.85$                          

PROPOSAL K:  EST TOTAL : 26,745.00$                 26,892.00$                 21,812.00$                 

ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS: 64,961.58$                 75,093.34$                 39,617.00$                 
DELIVERY: Minimum Shipment None $2,500.00 $3,500.00 

# of Days ASAP upon request 30 days of request 45 days of request
CONTACT INFO: Hrs of Operation: 7:30am-5:00pm 7:00am-5:00pm 8:30am-5:00pm

24 Hr Phone Number: None 609 774 1116 None
DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE: Marked None None None
PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
WARRANTY: 3M Blank Standard
EXCEPTIONS: None None None

Y/N Yes Yes Yes
ALL OR NONE AWARD: Y or N No No No
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT SIGNED:   Y or N Yes Yes Yes

PROPOSAL G: Extruded Aluminum 

FORMS INCLUDED:  

PROPOSAL F: COMPLETE SIGNS, STANDARD, WARNING SIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - TWO OR MORE 
COLORS HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC ON ALUMINUM

CITY OF TROY



CITY OF TROY    ITB-COT 16-27
BID TABULATION Pg. 5 of 5
TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS

ATTEST:
Enna Bachelor
Arinze Okafor
Emily Frontera
Susan Riesterer

MaryBeth Murz
Purchasing Manager
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