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CITY COUNCIL AGENDA ITEM 
 Date:  November 30, 2016 

 
To:   Brian Kischnick, City Manager     
  
From:  MaryBeth Murz, Purchasing Manager 

Mark Miller, Director of Economic and Community Development 
Elaine S. Bo, Recreation Director 
Scott Mercer, Recreation Supervisor 
Kurt Bovensiep, Public Works Director 
Chief David Roberts, Fire Department 

   
 
Subject: Standard Purchasing Resolution 1: Award To Low Bidder – Tee Shirts – Various City 

Departments 
 
History 
The Recreation Department routinely purchases Tee Shirts for staff and the youth and adult recreational 
programs throughout the year on an as needed basis.  Tee shirts are used by the Recreation Center, Aquatic 
Center and the Community Center.  Tee Shirts provide uniformed attire and make staff easily identifiable.  Tee 
shirts are also furnished for league play, day camps, and league awards. The current Tee shirt contract has 
expired. 
 
Other departments such as Fire and Public Works also purchase tee shirts to maintain a uniformed appearance 
for their employees working out in the field. The requirements for these departments have been added to the tee 
shirt bid so that quantities can be combined leveraging savings to City Departments. 
 
Purchasing 
On November 10, 2016, a bid opening was conducted as required by City Charter/Code and bid proposals were 
received at the City’s request from firms interested in providing two (2) year requirements of 50/50 and 100% 
Cotton Tee Shirts and Sweatshirts for the City of Troy with an option to renew for one (1) additional year.  Ninety-
three (93) companies were notified via the Michigan Intergovernmental Trade Network (MITN) website with seven 
(7) proposals received.  Also of the ninety-three (93) companies notified via MITN; fifty-five (55) companies were 
Michigan based companies.   

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

A detailed pricing list for each option was requested and received from six responsible, responsive bidders.  The 
bid tabulation was analyzed and a reference check was conducted.   
 
Financial 
Funding for the purchase of Tee Shirts is available in the operating accounts of the Fire, Public Works, 
Recreation Departments respectively. The cost of Tee Shirts for the Recreation Department is built into 
registration and membership fees paid by participants. 
 

Companies notified via MITN 93 
Troy Companies notified via MITN 1 
Troy Companies notified Active email 
Notification 1 
Troy Companies notified Active Free 0 
Companies that viewed the bid  33 
Troy Companies that viewed the bid 0 
 
 

MITN provides a resourceful online platform to streamline the 
procurement process, reduce costs, and make it easier and more 
transparent for vendors to do business with the City of Troy. 
Active MITN members with a current membership and paying 
annual dues receive automatic electronic notification which allows 
instant access to Bids, RFPS and Quote opportunities with the City.   
Active MITN non-paying members are responsible to monitor and 
check the MITN website for opportunities to do business with the 
City. 
Inactive MITN member status can occur when a company does not 
renew their account upon expiration.  Inactive members cannot be 
notified of solicitations or access any bid information. 
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CITY COUNCIL AGENDA ITEM 
  

Recommendation 
City management recommends awarding a two (2) year contract with an option to renew for one (1) additional year 
to provide Tee Shirts for the City Troy on an as needed basis to the low total bidder, Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, 
Inc., of Houston Texas, for an estimated total annual cost of $46,203.30 at unit prices contained in the bid tabulation 
opened November 10, 2016; with all expenses not to exceed budgetary limitations. 
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Opening Date - 11.10.2016 CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 16-34
Date Reviewed - 11.14.2016 BID TABULATION Page 1 of 9

TEE SHIRTS

Vendor

Check #

Check Amt

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

2000 2.72$            5,440.00$      2.59$           5,180.00$     3.47$            6,940.00$        

2000 2.72$            5,440.00$      2.45$           4,900.00$     3.07$            6,140.00$        

60 4.72$            283.20$         4.18$           250.80$        3.65$            219.00$            

100 1.00$            100.00$         0.67$           67.00$          0.60$            60.00$              

500 1.00$            500.00$         0.97$           485.00$        0.60$            300.00$            

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

400 2.72$            1,088.00$      2.59$           1,036.00$     3.07$            1,228.00$        

100 4.72$            472.00$         3.97$           397.00$        3.95$            395.00$            

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

350 2.15$            752.50$         1.99$           696.50$        2.40$            840.00$            

50 4.15$            207.50$         3.87$           193.50$        3.25$            162.50$            

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

2800 3.60$            10,080.00$   2.89$           8,092.00$     3.67$            10,276.00$      

1600 3.60$            5,760.00$      2.79$           4,464.00$     3.50$            5,600.00$        

No Bid Deposit Ck 40701765 (NOT CERTIFIED CK) 17847
N/A  $                             2,000.00  $                                  2,000.00 

Express Press Ad-Wear Specialty All American Embroidery

Springfield, MO Houston, TX Livonia, MI

Cost Per Digit - Double

Quoting On Style:

Manufactured By:

Number of Colors Available:

Blank

Gildan 8000/8000B

See Attached

ITEM #1 -- 50/50 Plyester w/One Color Imprint on Front

Description
Youth - Small, Med, Large

Adult - Small, Med, Large, X-Large

Adult - XX-Large, XXX-Large

Cost Per Digit - Single

Estimated Total Item #1
ITEM #2 -- Shirts, 100% Cotton - Short Sleeve 1 Color Impront on Front

Description
Adult - Medium Large, X-Large

Adult - XX-Large

11,763.20$                        

8000B & 8000

Gildan

33

PC55

Port & Company

30

10,882.80$                      13,659.00$                          

Manufactured By: Gildan 2000 Gildan Port & Company

Number of Colors Available: See Attached 68 55

Quoting On Style: Blank 2000 PC61

Adult - Medium, Large, X-Large

Adult - XX-Large

Quoting On Style: Blank 2000 PC61

Estimated Total Item #2 1,560.00$                          1,433.00$                        1,623.00$                            
ITEM #3 -- Shirts, 100% Cotton - Short Sleeve (No Printing or Silk Screening)

Description

Estimated Total Item #3 960.00$                             890.00$                           1,002.50$                            
ITEM #4 -- Shirts, Tee Shirts(50% Cotton 50% Polyester Blend) 2 Color Imprint/Front and 1 Color Imprint on Back

Description

Manufactured By: Gildan 2000 Gildan Port & Company

Number of Colors Available: See Attached 68 55

Manufactured By: Gildan 8000/8000B Gildan Port & Company

Number of Colors Available: See Attached 33 30

Youth - Small, Medium Large

Adult - Medium, Large, X-Large

Quoting On Style: Blank 8000 PC61

Estimated Total Item #4 15,840.00$                        12,556.00$                      15,876.00$                          



CITY OF TROY BID TABULATION ITB-COT 16-34  Page 2 0f 9

Vendor

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

3200 3.92$            12,544.00$   2.89$           9,248.00$     3.67$            11,744.00$      

400 5.92$            2,368.00$      4.27$           1,708.00$     4.97$            1,988.00$        

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

400 3.81$            1,524.00$      2.69$           1,076.00$     4.95$            1,980.00$        

24 3.81$            91.44$           2.57$           61.68$          4.35$            104.40$            

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

800 2.99$            2,392.00$      2.59$           2,072.00$     3.67$            2,936.00$        

300 4.99$            1,497.00$      4.27$           1,281.00$     4.97$            1,491.00$        

100 5.99$            599.00$         5.07$           507.00$        6.97$            697.00$            

50 6.56$            328.00$         5.77$           288.50$        6.97$            348.50$            

50 7.01$            350.50$         6.03$           301.50$        6.97$            348.50$            

50 7.15$            357.50$         6.21$           310.50$        6.97$            348.50$            

50 8.65$            432.50$         6.27$           313.50$        6.97$            348.50$            

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
40 5.40$            216.00$         5.89$           235.60$        9.00$            360.00$            
20 7.40$            148.00$         7.19$           143.80$        11.50$          230.00$            

20 9.40$            188.00$         7.99$           159.80$        11.50$          230.00$            

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
266 3.24$            861.84$         2.97$           790.02$        3.50$            931.00$            

12 5.24$            62.88$           2.79$           33.48$          4.75$            57.00$              
12 6.24$            74.88$           4.49$           53.88$          4.75$            57.00$              

ITEM #5 -- Shirts, 100% Cotton -  2 Color Imprint/Front and Back

Description
Youth - Small, Medium Large

Express Press Ad-Wear Specialty All American Embroidery

Adult - Medium, Large, X-Large

Quoting On Style: Blank 2000 PC61

Manufactured By: Gildan 2000 Gildan Port & Company

ITEM #6 -- 50/50 Tee Shirts (50% Cotton/50% Polyester Blend) 4 Color Imprint/Front
Description

Youth - Small, Medium Large

Adult - Medium, Large, X-Large

Quoting On Style: Blank 8000B & 8000 PC55

Number of Colors Available: See Attached 68 55

Estimated Total Item #5 14,912.00$                        10,956.00$                      13,732.00$                          

Estimated Total Item #6 1,615.44$                          1,137.68$                        2,084.40$                            
ITEM #7 -- Shirts, 100% Cotton - Two Color Imprint/Front, Screen Print with City Logo Placed on Uppler Left Chest Area

Description

Manufactured By: Gildan 8000/8000B Gildan Port & Company

Number of Colors Available: See Attached 33 30

Adult - Small, Med, Large, X-Large

Adult - 2XL, 3XL, 4XL, 5XL

Quoting On Style: 4XLT Hanes 518T 2000 & 2000T PC61/PC61T

Adult Tall 2XL

Adult Tall 3XL

Adult Tall 4XL

Adult 3XL, 4XL, 5XL

Estimated Total Item #7 5,956.50$                          5,074.00$                        5,472.50$                            

Adult Tall - XL

Manufactured By: Gildan 2000/2000T Gildan Port & Company

Number of Colors Available: See Attached 68 55

ITEM #8 --Shirts, 100% Cotton - 2 Color Imprint/Front, Screen Print with City Logo Placed on Upper Left Chest Area Above Pocket

Number of Colors Available: See Attached 68 17

Adult  - 3XL-5XL

Quoting On Style: Blank 2300 PC61P
Manufactured By: Gildan 2300 Gildan Port & Company

Description
Adult - Small, Med, Large, X-Large
Adult - 2XL

Adult - Small, Med, Large, X-Large
Adult - 2XL

Quoting On Style: Blank 8000 PC55
Adult - 3XL-5XL

Estimated Total Item #8 552.00$                             539.20$                           820.00$                                
ITEM #9 --Shirts, 50/50 Blend, Tagless Dry Blend, Left chest logo in White, Rear of Shirt Logo in White

Description

Estimated Total Item #9 999.60$                             877.38$                           1,045.00$                            

Manufactured By: Gildan 8000 Gildan Port & Company
Number of Colors Available: See Attached 33 30



Opening Date - 11.10.2016 CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 16-34
Date Reviewed BID TABULATION Page 3 of 9

TEE SHIRTS

Vendor

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
290 7.57$            2,195.30$      6.29$           1,824.10$     7.37$            2,137.30$        

2 9.57$            19.14$           7.87$           15.74$          9.26$            18.52$              

2 10.57$          21.14$           8.70$           17.40$          9.26$            18.52$              

Express Press Ad-Wear Specialty All American Embroidery

Manufactured By: Gildan 18000 Gildan Port & Company
Number of Colors Available: See Attached 38 27

ITEM #10 --Sweatshirts, 50/50 Blend, Tagless, Left Chest Logo in white on Front, Rear of Shirt Logo in White, Crew Neck Style
Description

Adult - Small, Med, Large, X-Large
Adult - 2XL

Quoting On Style: Blank 1800 PC78

Adult - 3XL, 4XL, 5XL

Acknowledgements

Estimated Total Item #10 2,235.58$                          1,857.24$                        2,174.34$                            

GRAND TOTAL ALL ITEMS 56,394.32$               46,203.30$              57,488.74$                  

Hours of Operation

24 Hour Contact Phone Number

Warranty

Exceptions

All or None Award Y/N

References

8AM-6PM CT

713-703-3070

As Per Manufacturer

No Exceptions

YES

YES

YES

8:30AM-5:00PM

205-503-2480

Blank

Blank

NO

YES

YES



CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 16-34
BID TABULATION Page 4 of 9 
TEE SHIRTS

Vendor

Check #

Check Amt

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

2000 2.84$            5,680.00$      3.50$           7,000.00$     3.58$            7,160.00$        

2000 2.84$            5,680.00$      3.50$           7,000.00$     3.33$            6,660.00$        

60 3.94$            236.40$         5.50$           330.00$        5.70$            342.00$            

100 0.26$            26.00$           1.00$           100.00$        0.90$            90.00$              

500 0.52$            260.00$         1.00$           500.00$        1.80$            900.00$            

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

400 2.72$            1,088.00$      3.75$           1,500.00$     3.47$            1,388.00$        

100 3.82$            382.00$         5.75$           575.00$        5.94$            594.00$            

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

350 2.21$            773.50$         3.50$           1,225.00$     2.49$            871.50$            

50 3.31$            165.50$         5.50$           275.00$        4.45$            222.50$            

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

2800 3.06$            8,568.00$      4.00$           11,200.00$   4.90$            13,720.00$      

1600 4.06$            6,496.00$      4.00$           6,400.00$     4.79$            7,664.00$        

SP Designs Mfg Inc Impressive Promo Prod BSN Sports

Cape Coral, FL Clawson, MI Dallas, TX

ITEM #1 -- 50/50 Plyester w/One Color Imprint on Front

Description
Youth - Small, Med, Large

Adult - Small, Med, Large, X-Large

Adult - XX-Large, XXX-Large

Cost Per Digit - Single

Not Certified Ck #1195  513904461-3 No Bid Deposit Submitted
2000  $                             2,000.00  N/A 

Cost Per Digit - Double

Quoting On Style: Gildan 8000 G800B & G800 8000/8000B

Manufactured By: Gildan Gildan Gilden

ITEM #2 -- Shirts, 100% Cotton - Short Sleeve 1 Color Impront on Front

Description
Adult - Medium Large, X-Large

Adult - XX-Large

Quoting On Style: G5000 G200 2000

Number of Colors Available: Multiple 29 30

Estimated Total Item #1 11,882.40$                        14,930.00$                      15,152.00$                          

Estimated Total Item #2 1,470.00$                          2,075.00$                        1,982.00$                            
ITEM #3 -- Shirts, 100% Cotton - Short Sleeve (No Printing or Silk Screening)

Description

Manufactured By: Gildan Gildan Gilden

Number of Colors Available: Multiple 63 30

Manufactured By: Gildan Gildan Gilden

Number of Colors Available: Various 63 30

Adult - Medium, Large, X-Large

Adult - XX-Large

Quoting On Style: G5000 G200 2000

Youth - Small, Medium Large

Adult - Medium, Large, X-Large

Quoting On Style: G8000/8000b G800B & G800 8000/8000B

Estimated Total Item #3 939.00$                             1,500.00$                        1,094.00$                            
ITEM #4 -- Shirts, Tee Shirts(50% Cotton 50% Polyester Blend) 2 Color Imprint/Front and 1 Color Imprint on Back

Description

Estimated Total Item #4 15,064.00$                        17,600.00$                      21,384.00$                          

Manufactured By: Gildan Gildan Gilden

Number of Colors Available: Various 29 30



CITY OF TROY BID TABULATION ITB-COT 16-34 Page 5 of 9
Vendor

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
3200 2.90$               9,280.00$         4.50$              14,400.00$      5.10$               16,320.00$          

400 3.90$               1,560.00$         6.50$              2,600.00$        7.57$               3,028.00$            

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
400 3.30$               1,320.00$         4.00$              1,600.00$        5.20$               2,080.00$            

24 3.30$               79.20$               4.00$              96.00$              5.20$               124.80$                

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
800 3.00$               2,400.00$         4.95$              3,960.00$        4.05$               3,240.00$            
300 4.00$               1,200.00$         6.95$              2,085.00$        7.95$               2,385.00$            

50 5.50$               275.00$            8.95$              447.50$            7.95$               397.50$                
50 Adult 4XL 6.75$               337.50$            8.95$              447.50$            7.95$               397.50$                
50 Adult 5XL 8.00$               400.00$            8.95$              447.50$            7.95$               397.50$                
50 4.09$               204.50$            8.95$              447.50$            7.95$               397.50$                
50 7.19$               359.50$            8.95$              447.50$            7.95$               397.50$                
50 7.47$               373.50$            8.95$              447.50$            7.95$               397.50$                
50 7.78$               389.00$            8.95$              447.50$            7.95$               397.50$                

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
40 5.88$               235.20$            8.95$              358.00$            4.15$               166.00$                
10 7.46$               74.60$               10.95$            109.50$            7.75$               77.50$                  
10 8.81$               88.10$               10.95$            109.50$            7.75$               77.50$                  
10 8.90$               89.00$               10.95$            109.50$            7.75$               77.50$                  
10 9.00$               90.00$               10.95$            109.50$            7.75$               77.50$                  

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
266 -$                   3.75$              997.50$            -$                      

12 -$                   5.75$              69.00$              -$                      
12 -$                   5.75$              69.00$              -$                      

SP Designs & Mfg Inc Impressive Promo Prod BSN Sports

Manufactured By: Gildan Gildan Gilden
Number of Colors Available: Various 29 30

ITEM #5 -- Shirts, 100% Cotton -  2 Color Imprint/Front and Back
Description

Youth - Small, Medium Large
Adult - Medium, Large, X-Large

Quoting On Style: G5000 G200 2000

Youth - Small, Medium Large
Adult - Medium, Large, X-Large

Quoting On Style: G8000 G800B & G800 2000/2000B

Estimated Total Item #5 10,840.00$                                    17,000.00$                                 19,348.00$                                       
ITEM #6 -- 50/50 Tee Shirts (50% Cotton/50% Polyester Blend) 4 Color Imprint/Front

Description

2,204.80$                                         
ITEM #7 -- Shirts, 100% Cotton - Two Color Imprint/Front, Screen Print with City Logo Placed on Uppler Left Chest Area

Description

Manufactured By: Gildan Gildan Gilden
Number of Colors Available: Various 29 30

Adult - Small, Med, Large, X-Large
Adult - 2XL
Adult 3XL

Adult Tall - XL
Adult Tall 2XL
Adult Tall 3XL

Estimated Total Item #6 1,399.20$                                      1,696.00$                                    

Number of Colors Available: Various 63 30

Estimated Total Item #7 5,939.00$                                      9,177.50$                                    8,407.50$                                         

Adult Tall 4XL
Quoting On Style: G5000 & PC55T G200 & G200T 5000

Manufactured By: Gildan/Port & Company Gildan Gilden

ITEM #8 --Shirts, 100% Cotton - 2 Color Imprint/Front, Screen Print with City Logo Placed on Upper Left Chest Area Above Pocket
Description

Adult - Small, Med, Large, X-Large
Adult - 2XL
Adult  - 3XL

Quoting On Style: Gildan 2300 Pocket G230 5000

Adult - 4XL
Adult - 5XL

476.00$                                            
ITEM #9 --Shirts, 50/50 Blend, Tagless Dry Blend, Left chest logo in White, Rear of Shirt Logo in White

Description

Manufactured By: Gildan Gildan Gilden
Number of Colors Available: Various 17 30

Adult - Small, Med, Large, X-Large
Adult - 2XL
Adult - 3XL-5XL

Quoting On Style: NO BID G800

Estimated Total Item #8 576.90$                                         796.00$                                       

Estimated Total Item #9 -$                                                1,135.50$                                    -$                                                   

NO BID
Manufactured By: Gildan

Number of Colors Available: 29



Opening Date - 11.10.2016 CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 16-34
Date Reviewed BID TABULATION Page 6 of 9 

TEE SHIRTS
Vendor

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
290 -$                   10.95$            3,175.50$        -$                      

2 -$                   12.95$            25.90$              -$                      
2 -$                   12.95$            25.90$              -$                      

SP Designs Mfg Inc Impressive Promo Prod BSN Sports
ITEM #10 --Sweatshirts, 50/50 Blend, Tagless, Left Chest Logo in white on Front, Rear of Shirt Logo in White, Crew Neck Style

Description
Adult - Small, Med, Large, X-Large
Adult - 2XL
Adult - 3XL, 4XL, 5XL

Quoting On Style: NO BID G180 NO BID

Estimated Total Item #10 -$                                                3,227.30$                                    -$                                                   

GRAND TOTAL ALL ITEMS 48,110.50$                                    69,137.30$                                 70,048.30$                                       

Manufactured By: Gildan
Number of Colors Available: 31 Colors

Yes

Hours of Operation 8:00AM-5:00PM 8:00AM-5:30PM 7:00AM-5:00PM
24 Hour Contact Phone Number 239-424-8060 X132 248-390-8028 800-527-7510

Warranty 90 days against mfg Manufacturer 1 Year Std Mfg
Exceptions Blank Request surety decrease Blank

Acknowledgements Yes Yes Yes

All or None Award Y/N No No No
References Yes Yes



CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 16-34
BID TABULATION Page 7 of 9 
TEE SHIRTS

Vendor

Check #
Check Amt

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
2000 -$                   -$                  -$                      
2000 -$                   -$                  -$                      

60 -$                   -$                  -$                      
100 -$                   -$                  -$                      
500 -$                   -$                  -$                      

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
400 -$                   -$                  -$                      
100 -$                   -$                  -$                      

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
350 -$                   -$                  -$                      

50 -$                   -$                  -$                      

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
2800 -$                   -$                  -$                      
1600 -$                   -$                  -$                      

Redline Specialty Inc
Troy MI

ITEM #1 -- 50/50 Plyester w/One Color Imprint on Front
Description

Youth - Small, Med, Large
Adult - Small, Med, Large, X-Large
Adult - XX-Large, XXX-Large
Cost Per Digit - Single

No Bid Deposit Submitted
N/A

Cost Per Digit - Double
Quoting On Style: NO BID
Manufactured By:

ITEM #2 -- Shirts, 100% Cotton - Short Sleeve 1 Color Impront on Front
Description

Adult - Medium Large, X-Large
Adult - XX-Large

Quoting On Style: NO BID

Number of Colors Available:

Estimated Total Item #1 -$                                                -$                                              -$                                                   

Estimated Total Item #2 -$                                                -$                                              -$                                                   
ITEM #3 -- Shirts, 100% Cotton - Short Sleeve (No Printing or Silk Screening)

Description

Manufactured By:
Number of Colors Available:

Manufactured By:
Number of Colors Available:

Adult - Medium, Large, X-Large
Adult - XX-Large

Quoting On Style: NO BID

Youth - Small, Medium Large
Adult - Medium, Large, X-Large

Quoting On Style: NO BID

Estimated Total Item #3 -$                                                -$                                              -$                                                   
ITEM #4 -- Shirts, Tee Shirts(50% Cotton 50% Polyester Blend) 2 Color Imprint/Front and 1 Color Imprint on Back

Description

Estimated Total Item #4 -$                                                -$                                              -$                                                   

Manufactured By:
Number of Colors Available:
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Vendor

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
3200 -$                   -$                  -$                      

400 -$                   -$                  -$                      

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
400 -$                   -$                  -$                      

24 -$                   -$                  -$                      

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
800 -$                   -$                  -$                      
300 -$                   -$                  -$                      

50 -$                   -$                  -$                      
50 Adult 4XL -$                   -$                  -$                      
50 Adult 5XL -$                   -$                  -$                      
50 -$                   -$                  -$                      
50 -$                   -$                  -$                      
50 -$                   -$                  -$                      
50 -$                   -$                  -$                      

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
40 -$                   -$                  -$                      
10 -$                   -$                  -$                      
10 -$                   -$                  -$                      
10 -$                   -$                  -$                      
10 -$                   -$                  -$                      

Redline Specialty

Manufactured By:
Number of Colors Available:

ITEM #5 -- Shirts, 100% Cotton -  2 Color Imprint/Front and Back
Description

Youth - Small, Medium Large
Adult - Medium, Large, X-Large

Quoting On Style: NO BID

Youth - Small, Medium Large
Adult - Medium, Large, X-Large

Quoting On Style: NO BID

Estimated Total Item #5 -$                                                -$                                              -$                                                   
ITEM #6 -- 50/50 Tee Shirts (50% Cotton/50% Polyester Blend) 4 Color Imprint/Front

Description

-$                                                   
ITEM #7 -- Shirts, 100% Cotton - Two Color Imprint/Front, Screen Print with City Logo Placed on Uppler Left Chest Area

Description

Manufactured By:
Number of Colors Available:

Adult - Small, Med, Large, X-Large
Adult - 2XL
Adult 3XL

Adult Tall - XL
Adult Tall 2XL
Adult Tall 3XL

Estimated Total Item #6 -$                                                -$                                              

Adult Tall 4XL
Quoting On Style: NO BID
Manufactured By:

ITEM #8 --Shirts, 100% Cotton - 2 Color Imprint/Front, Screen Print with City Logo Placed on Upper Left Chest Area Above Pocket
Description

Adult - Small, Med, Large, X-Large
Adult - 2XL
Adult  - 3XL
Adult - 4XL

Number of Colors Available:

Estimated Total Item #7 -$                                                -$                                              -$                                                   

Number of Colors Available:

Estimated Total Item #8 -$                                                -$                                              -$                                                   

Adult - 5XL
Quoting On Style: NO BID
Manufactured By:
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Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
266 3.96$               1,053.36$         -$                  -$                      

4 7.35$               29.40$               -$                  -$                      
4 7.96$               31.84$               
8 8.50$               68.00$               

Vendor

Est Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
290 9.50$               2,755.00$         -$                  -$                      

1 11.96$             11.96$               -$                  -$                      
1 12.50$             12.50$               -$                  -$                      
1 Adult - 4XL 12.75$             12.75$               
1 Adult - 5XL 13.96$             12.50$               

ATTEST:

Mary Beth Murz, Purchasing Manager

G/Purchasing/Bid Tabs/ITB-COT 16-34 Tee ShirtS

Description
Adult - Small, Med, Large, X-Large
Adult - 2XL

Quoting On Style: 8000

Adult - 3XL

Estimated Total Item #9 1,182.60$                                      -$                                              -$                                                   
Redline Specialty

Manufactured By: Gildan
Number of Colors Available: 31

-$                                                   

GRAND TOTAL ALL ITEMS 3,987.31$                                      -$                                              -$                                                   

Manufactured By: Gildan
Number of Colors Available: 31

Exceptions Not submitted

Hours of Operation Not submitted
24 Hour Contact Phone Number Not Submitted

Enna A. Bachelor

All or None Award Y/N Not submitted
References Not submitted

Kurt Bovensiep
Susan Reisterer

Adult - 4XL & 5XL

Acknowledgements No

Warranty Not submitted

Estimated Total Item #10 2,804.71$                                      -$                                              

ITEM #10 --Sweatshirts, 50/50 Blend, Tagless, Left Chest Logo in white on Front, Rear of Shirt Logo in White, Crew Neck Style
Description

Adult - Small, Med, Large, X-Large
Adult - 2XL
Adult - 3XL

Quoting On Style: 18000
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