
 

 
 
April 21, 2008 
 
TO:    Phillip L. Nelson, City Manager 
 
FROM:   John M. Lamerato, Assistant City Manager/Finance and Administration 
   Susan A. Leirstein, Purchasing Director 
   Carol K. Anderson, Parks and Recreation Director  
   
SUBJECT:  Contract Extension – OEM Replacement Parts for Golf and Turf  
   Maintenance Equipment    
 
Background 
 On July 11, 2005, Troy City Council approved a three (3) year contract to furnish original equipment 

manufacturers replacement parts for golf course, lawn and turf maintenance equipment with an option to 
renew for one additional year to WF Miller Company of Novi, Michigan.  In addition, separate contracts 
were approved with Weingartz and Spartan Distributors, exclusive distributors for John Deere and Toro 
replacement parts respectively. {CC Res #2005-07-332a & 332b (F2)} 

 Since the contract was approved, WF Miller Company has merged and is now doing business as Midwest 
Golf and Turf Company of Cincinnati, Ohio. 

 All three suppliers have agreed to all terms and conditions set forth in the original contracts and would like 
to extend their contracts for one (1) additional year. 

 A market survey was not conducted by the Purchasing Department, as it was determined the City would 
not benefit from soliciting additional formal bids. 
 

Financial Considerations 
 Funds are available in Sylvan Glen Operating Supplies Account #785.7740.010 and Sanctuary Lake 

Operating Supplies Account #885.7740.010, and used by various departments within the City for an 
estimated total cost of $45,000.00 per year. 

 
Legal Considerations 
 ITB-COT 05-07, OEM Replacements Parts was competitively bid and vendors were given the opportunity 

to respond with their level of interest in 2005. 
 
Policy Considerations 
 Extending the contracts minimizes costs and increases the efficiency of maintenance operations. (Goal II & 

V) 
 
Options 
 City management and the Parks and Recreation-Golf Division request approval to extend the contracts for 

one (1) additional year to Midwest Golf and Turf of Cincinnati, Ohio, Weingartz of Farmington Hills, and 
Spartan Distributors of Sparta, MI, under the same pricing structure, terms and conditions as their original 
contracts to expire June 30, 2009. 
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June 9, 2005 
 
TO:  John Szerlag, City Manager 
 
FROM: Brian P. Murphy, Assistant City Manager/Services 
  Jeanette Bennett, Purchasing Director 
  Carol K. Anderson, Director of Parks and Recreation 
 
SUBJECT: Agenda Item:  Standard Purchasing Resolution 1:  Award To Sole 

Bidder – Miscellaneous Golf and Turf Maintenance Replacement 
Parts  
 

RECOMMENDATION 
Bid proposals were opened April 27, 2005, to furnish three (3) year requirements 
of original equipment manufacturers replacement parts for golf course, lawn and 
turf maintenance equipment with an option to renew for one (1) additional year.  
The estimated total cost for these replacement parts is $30,000.00 per year.  City 
management recommends purchases be made from the sole bidder, WF Miller 
Company of Novi, Michigan at list prices dated 4/4/05 for the following items— 
 
WF MILLER COMPANY 
Section A 
Item    Catalog & Price Sheet  Discount  
Cushman Turf Equipment  P400000    0% 
Jacobsen Turf Equipment  2811657    0% 
Ryan Turf Equipment  P400000    0% 
Ransomes Turf Equipment  P400000    0% 
 
Section B 
Kohler Engine Parts   TP-453-P              10% 
Briggs & Stratton Engine Parts MS-7299-7100   0% 
 
SUMMARY 
Even though WF Miller was the sole bidder, they are the authorized 
dealer/distributor in Michigan for the items awarded in Section A. (see above)  
Spartan Distributors and Weingartz have participated in past bids and awarded 
contracts for OEM replacement parts with exclusive distributorships.  The 
reasons given for their lack of participation in this recent solicitation are as 
follows: 
Spartan Distributors – Even though the company was mailed a notice, failure in 
the company’s internal processing meant the proper division was not notified that 
the bid document was available for pick-up at the City or download from the 
MITN system. 
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June 9, 2005 
 
TO:  John Szerlag 
RE:  Bid Award – Golf and Turf Maintenance Equipment Replacement Parts 
 
 
SUMMARY (continued) 
Weingartz – The bid opened at 10AM on April 27, 2005.  A new runner for the 
company did not arrive at the Office of the City Clerk until after the specified time.  
Therefore, the bid was considered late and returned to the runner unopened. 
 
BUDGET 
Funds are available to complete these purchases in Sylvan Glen Operating 
Supplies Account #785.7740.010 and Sanctuary Lake Operating Supplies 
Account #885.7740.010. 
 
 
 
31 Vendors Notified via the MITN System  
39 Vendors Mailed Notices from JDE System 
  1 Bid Response Rec’d 
  1 Late Bid 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Prepared by: Danny T. McDonald, Superintendent of Greens 
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CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 05-07
Opening Date -- 4/27/05 BID TABULATION Pg 1 of 2
Date Prepared -- 6/8/05 GOLF AND TURF MAINTENANCE REPLACEMENT PARTS

VENDOR NAME: *

SECTION A: (Note -- Copies of Price List Pages must be included w/bid for verification purposes.)
Approved Alternate Catalog Net Approved Alternate Catalog Net

CUSHMAN TURF EQUIPMENT Make/Part# Price Price Make/Part# Price Price
  Universal Joint Part#826284 12.05$    12.05$    
  Alternator Belt Part#816864 6.33$      6.33$      
  Solenoid Part#889673 Cushman 2701465 33.49$    33.49$    
  Breaker Point Set Part#580394 12.81$    12.81$    

Complete line discounted at -- 0% 0%
dated: 4/4/2005

JACOBSEN TURF EQUIPMENT
  Bedknife Part#503460 30.48$    30.48$    
  Reel Coupling Part#337370 3.98$      3.98$      
  Bearing Set Part#500534 7.60$      7.60$      
  Reel Nut Part#364900 6.31$      6.31$      

Complete line discounted at -- 0% 0%
dated: 4/4/2005

RYAN TURF EQUIPMENT
  Drive Belt Part#522887 37.03$    37.03$    
  Slide Assembly Part#540094 250.71$  250.71$  
  Hydraulic Oil Filter Part#522972 Cushman 108046 15.64$    15.64$    
  Tine 5/8" Part#523028 1.75$      1.75$      

Complete line discounted at -- 0% 0%
dated: 4/4/2005

JOHN DEERE TURF EQUIPMENT
  Hydraulic Filter Part #RE45864
  Oil Filter Part #M801209
  Air Filter Part #M131802
  Mower Blade Part #M77178

Complete line discounted at --
dated:

RANSOMES TURF EQUIPMENT
  Bedknife Part #503478 28.31$    28.31$    
  Reel Part #839031 318.57$  318.57$  
  Bearing Set Part #500534 7.60$      7.60$      
  Reel Seal Part #839064 3.47$      3.47$      

Complete line discounted at -- 0% 0%
dated: 4/4/2005

WF MILLER COMPANY

NO BID



CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 05-07
Opening Date -- 04/27/05 BID TABULATION Pg 2 of 2
Date Prepared -- 6/8/05 GOLF AND TURF MAINTENANCE REPLACEMENT PARTS

VENDOR NAME: *

SECTION A: (Cont'd) Approved Alternate Catalog Net Approved Alternate Catalog Net
Make/Part# Price Price Make/Part# Price Price

TORO TURF/IRRIGATION EQUIPMENT
  Bearing Cone Part #254-94
  Bearing Cup Part #254-72
  Oil Seal Part #253-96
  Reel Part #12-3599

Complete line discounted at --
dated:

SECTION B:  (Note -- After award, a Published Price List MUST be supplied unless previously furnished.)

DEALER & SPECIALTY PARTS/ CURRENT PUBLISHED PRICE LIST OF MINUS % CURRENT PUBLISHED PRICE LIST OF MINUS %
SUPPLY ITEMS MANUFACTURER'S RETAIL PRICE DISCOUNT MANUFACTURER'S RETAIL PRICE DISCOUNT

   Honda Engine Parts
   Kohler Engine Parts -10%
   Briggs & Stratton Engine Parts 0%
   Progressive Rotary Mower Parts
   Ty-Crop Equipment Parts

DELIVERY ALL ORDERS SHIPPED SAME DAY UPS
PROCESSED W/I 10 HOURS AFTER PHONE RELEASE

MINIMUM ORDER PER SHIPMENT  NONE

CONTACT INFORMATION:
Hours of Operation 7-4pm
Phone Number (248) 649-4100

TERMS BLANK

WARRANTY BLANK

EXCEPTIONS BLANK

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT: YES

ATTEST: * DENOTES SOLE BIDDER
 Pat Rubino ___________________________
 Danny McDonald
 Linda Bockstanz Jeanette Bennett
G:ITB-COT 05-07Golf Turf Parts.xls Purchasing Director

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

WF MILLER COMPANY

NO BID











June 29, 2005 
 
TO:  John Szerlag, City Manager 
 
FROM: Brian P. Murphy, Assistant City Manager/Services 
  Jeanette Bennett, Purchasing Director 
  Carol K. Anderson, Parks and Recreation Director 
 
SUBJECT: Agenda Item:  Sole Source – OEM Replacement Parts For 
  Golf and Turf Maintenance Equipment 
 
 
RECOMMENDATION 
The Parks and Recreation Department recommends approval of a three-year 
contract to purchase original equipment manufactured replacement parts for 
John Deere equipment from Weingartz in Farmington Hills and Toro parts from 
Spartan Distributors of Sparta, Michigan, the exclusive distributors in southeast 
Michigan at varied discounts up to 55%.  The companies agree to their individual 
contracts, which will expire June 30, 2008. 
 
 
BACKGROUND 
Contracts for manufactured equipment replacement parts with Weingartz and 
Spartan Distributors expired in the spring of 2005, and have been used by 
various City departments to purchase repair parts and supplies for routine 
maintenance of turf equipment throughout the City.  All of the Torro and John 
Deere brand maintenance equipment used by the various City departments 
requires replacement parts that are sold exclusively through Weingartz and 
Spartan Distributors.  By having contracts in place for replacement parts for Torro 
and John Deere brand pieces of equipment, the City will be able to utilize the 
support and expertise of the parts and service departments to assist us quickly 
and efficiently to adjust and/or repair our equipment.  
 
 
BUDGET 
Funds are available to complete these purchases in Sylvan Glen Operating 
Supplies Account #785.7740.010 and Sanctuary Lake Operating Supplies 
Account #885.7740.010. 
 
 
Prepared by: Danny T. McDonald, Superintendent of Greens 
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