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CCIITTYY  CCOOUUNNCCIILL  AAGGEENNDDAA  IITTEEMM  
 

 
Date:  February 5, 2013 
 
To:   Brian Kischnick, City Manager 
  
From: Susan A. Leirstein, Purchasing Director 
 MaryBeth Murz, Purchasing Manager 
  Timothy L. Richnak, Public Works Director 
  Kurt Bovensiep, Superintendent Parks, Streets, and Drains 
 
Subject: Standard Purchasing Resolution 1: Award To Low Bidders – Asphalt Paving Materials - Hot Patch 
 
History 
The Streets and Drains Division uses hot patch asphalt paving materials to replaced distressed areas in city local, 
industrial, and major roads. The material provides better adhesion properties than cold patch asphalt patching 
materials and has a longer projected life expectancy. Asphalt paving materials - hot patch are purchased on an as 
needed basis throughout the year. 
 
Purchasing 
On January 24, 2013, bids were electronically received as required by City Charter and Code for one-year 
requirements of Asphalt Paving Materials- Hot Patch with an option to renew for one additional year.  52 vendors 
were notified of the bid opportunity via the MITN website with four (4) bid responses received.  A secondary supplier 
is being recommended for award in the event that the primary supplier is unable to supply materials as needed.   
 
After reviewing these proposals, Barrett Paving Material Inc of Troy, MI is being recommended for items 1-5, Cadillac 
Asphalt LLC is being recommended for item 6 (Bulk Tack Coat) and Surface Coatings Co is being recommended for 
item 7 (Tack Coat – 5 gal). Barrett Paving Material Inc based in Troy, Michigan was not the lowest bidder. However; 
as per bid specifications; Terms and Conditions; Section - Local Preference which states that “The City of Troy 
reserves the right to award a contract to a local business, one which pays City of Troy taxes (real and/or personal), if 
the bid of a local vendor is within 5% of the lowest responsive and responsible non-local bidder, the local vendor is 
given one chance to match the low bid.”; the bid tabulation was further analyzed.  
 
Barrett Paving Material Inc, being a Troy based vendor was within 5% of the lowest non-local bidder; Cadillac 
Asphalt LLC.  Barrett Paving Material Inc will meet the lowest non-local bid pricing for items 1-5. See the attached 
bid tabulation for bid pricing as per each bidders response and note the Estimated Total Awarded Items line 
summarizing Barrett Paving Materials willingness to meet low bid pricing. 
 
Financial 
Funds for these materials are available through the Public Works operating budgets. 
 
Recommendation 
City management recommends awarding contracts to the following low bidders: Barrett Paving Materials Inc for 
items 1- 5 at an estimated total cost of $92,800.00, Cadillac Asphalt LLC for item 6 (Bulk Tack Coat) at estimated 
total cost of $2,125.00 and Surface Coatings for item 7 (Tack Coat – 5 gal) at an estimated total cost of $3,300.00, 
as per unit prices listed in the attached bid tabulation.  Additionally, the City requests authorization to use reciprocity 
between Barrett Paving Materials Inc and Cadillac Asphalt LLC for items 1-5 in the event of a plant closing, or the 
inability to supply material as needed and specified. Awards are contingent upon contractors’ submission of properly 
executed bid documents. 
 
Prepared by: Marina Basta Farouk, Project Construction Manager 
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CITY OF TROY ITB-COT  12-19
Opening Date -- 1/24/13 BID TABULATION Page 1 of 2
Date REVIEWED - 2/4/2013 ASPHALT PAVING MATERIALS - HOT PATCH

VENDOR NAME: **Cadillac Asphalt LLC **Surface Coatings Co.
 

Secondary

ITEM EST QTY
# (TONS) DESCRIPTION Unit Price Unit Price

Bid Pricing *Local Preference

1 100 1100T  36A Wearing 52.00$                        54.00$                          52.00$                  No bid
2 300 1100T 20AA Wearing 48.00$                        49.25$                          48.00$                  No bid
3 200 1100L 20AA Leveling 48.00$                        49.25$                          48.00$                  No bid
4 1200 Commercial Top 48.00$                        49.25$                          48.00$                  No bid
5 125 Commercial Base 48.00$                        49.25$                          48.00$                  No bid
6 500 gal Bulk Tack Coat 4.25$                          No bid No bid No bid
7 100 pails Tack Coat - 5 gal 50.00$                        50.00$                          33.00$                       

99,925.00$                 100,281.25$                 3,300.00$                   
ESTIMATED TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS: 2,125.00$                   92,800.00$           3,300.00$                   

HRS OF OPERATION: Hrs of Operation 8:00 - 4:00 7:00 - 4:00 7:30 - 4:00
Days of Operation M-F M-F Everyday
Notice of Pick up M-F 24 hrs 12 hrs
Saturday 24 hrs w/prior approval Apr-Nov 7:30 - Noon
Sunday 7:30 - 10:00am

PROMIXITY: Location 23 Mile, Shelby Twp
2280 Auburn Rd,      

Shelby Twp

TERMS: Net 30 Net 30

EXCEPTIONS: None None

ATTACHMENT: Attachment Attachment No attachment

ALL OR NONE AWARD: Y or N No No

PROPOSAL:  One-Year Requirements of Asphalt Paving Materials - Hot Patch; with an option to renew
for one (1) additional year.
*Local preference; 5% rule applies - Barrett Paving Materials, Inc. agrees 

to match lowest prices of non-Troy based business as allowed as per

bid specifications.

ATTEST:
Susan Leirstein; CPPO, CPPB
Susan K. Riesterer
Marina Basta-Farouk

___________________________
MaryBeth Murz
Purchasing Manager
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**BOLDFACE TYPE DENOTES LOW BIDDERS

ESTIMATED TOTAL COST:

**Barrett Paving 
Materials Inc.

Barrett Dr., Troy

Net 30

Unit Price

No

Primary



CITY OF TROY ITB-COT  12-19
Opening Date -- 1/24/13 BID TABULATION Page 2 of 2
Date REVIEWED - 2/4/2013 ASPHALT PAVING MATERIALS - HOT PATCH

VENDOR NAME: Ajax Material
 Corp.

ITEM EST QTY
# (TONS) DESCRIPTION Unit Price Unit Price

1 100 1100T  36A Wearing 55.00$                           
2 300 1100T 20AA Wearing 50.00$                           
3 200 1100L 20AA Leveling 49.25$                           
4 1200 Commercial Top 50.00$                           
5 125 Commercial Base 48.00$                           
6 500 gal Bulk Tack Coat 6.00$                             
7 100 pails Tack Coat - 5 gal 60.00$                           

105,350.00$                  

ESTIMATED TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS:

HRS OF OPERATION: Hrs of Operation 7:30 - 4:00
Days of Operation M-F
Notice of Pick up M-F 24 hrs
Saturday call for availability
Sunday

PROMIXITY: Location Kirks Blvd., Troy

TERMS: Net 30

EXCEPTIONS: None

ATTACHMENT: Attachment

ALL OR NONE AWARD: Y or N No

PROPOSAL:  One-Year Requirements of Asphalt Paving Materials - Hot Patch

*Local preference; 5% rule applies - Barrett Paving Materials, Inc. agrees 

to match lowest prices of non-Troy based business as allowed as per

bid specifications.
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ESTIMATED TOTAL COST:
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