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February 4, 2009

TO: Phillip L. Nelson, City Manager

FROM: Brian P. Murphy, Assistant City Manager/Economic Development Services
Susan A. Leirstein, Purchasing Director
Timothy L. Richnak, Public Works Director

SUBJECT: Standard Purchasing Resolution 1: — Award To Low Bidders —
Traffic Control Signs and Posts

Background

= OnJanuary 13, 2009, bid proposals were received for one-year requirements of Traffic Control Signs and
Posts.

= |tems bid were separated into eleven proposal categories, A-K; and due to minimum shipment
requirements, staff recommends contracts be awarded on a proposal by proposal basis.

= Signs and posts are required for new installations, repairs and replacement, and ordered on an as needed
basis.

= 91 vendors were notified via the MITN system with twelve bid responses received.

= Low total bidders are as follows: 1) Osburn Associate, Inc for Proposals A-G and J; 2) Allied Municipal
Supply for Proposals H and I; 3) Dornbos Sign, Inc, Proposal K and secondary supplier for Proposal | —
Round steel posts and 4) Vulcan Signs as secondary supplier for Proposal H — Tubular sign posts.

= |n the event the primary vendor is unable to supply as specified, the secondary supplier will be used.

Financial Considerations
= Funds will be available from the 2009 and 2010 Operating Budgets of the Public Works Division.

Legal Considerations
= |TB-COT 08-41, Traffic Control Signs and Posts was competitively bid as required by City Charter and
Code.

Policy Considerations
= Proper sign placement and legibility are required to warn, regulate and maintain the safety of motorists and
pedestrians. (Outcome Statement I)

Options

= City management recommends awarding contracts on a proposal by proposal basis to the four low total
bidders as follows: Osburn Associates, Inc of Logan, OH, Proposals A-G, and J; Allied Municipal Supply of
Taylorville, IL Proposals H & I; Dornbos Sign, Inc of Charlotte, Ml, Proposal K, and secondary supplier on
Proposal I; and Vulcan Signs of Foley, AL, secondary supplier on Proposal H at unit prices contained on
the bid tabulation, which opened January 13, 2009.
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CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 08-41
Opening Date -- 1/13/09 BID TABULATION Pg.1of 6
Date Prepared -- 1/14/09 jmh /sl TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS
VENDOR NAME: Osburn Allied Municipal | Dornbos Sign Vulcan
Associates, Inc Supply Inc Signs
ITEM EST QTY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
PROPOSAL A: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE 3M HIGH INTENSITY ON ALUMINUM
1. 50 36" YIELD (R1-2) $ 17.00 | $ 19.45 | $ 2207 | $ 16.55
2. 50 30" STOP (R1-1) $ 2200 | $ 26.10 | $ 2749 | $ 24.67
3. 10 36" STOP (R1-1) $ 33.00 | % 3206 | $ 44111 $ 35.47
4 10 18" x 6" All Way (R1-4) $ 2811 $% 349 | $ 369 | % 3.57
PROPOSAL A: EST TOTAL -- $ 230810 9% 2,633.00 | $ 2,956.00 | $ 2,451.40
3M #3930
PROPOSAL B: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE, 3M Diamond Grade, VIP Sheeting, Fluorescent Yellow Green
1. 10 36" S2-1 School Crossing $ 50.85 | $ 76.20 | $ 78.40 | $ 62.60
2. 10 24" X 12" W 16-7 Left School Arrow $ 11.30 | $ 16.95 | $ 17.43 | $ 14.71
3. 10 36" S1-1 Cross Walk $ 50.85| % 76.20 | $ 78401 $ 62.60
PROPOSAL B: EST TOTAL -- $ 1,130.00 | $ 1,693.50 | $ 1,74230 | $ 1,399.10
3V #4083
PROPOSAL C: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - ONE COLOR - SIGN
1. 10 12" X 18" One Color $ 563|9% 71713 4911 % 6.47
2. 20 12" X 36" One Color $ 11.25 | $ 14.34 | $ 1471 | $ 12.48
3. 30 18" X 18" One Color $ 844 1% 10.76 | $ 11.05 | $ 9.35
4, 20 24" X 24" One Color $ 15.00 | $ 19.12 | $ 19.64 | $ 16.64
5. 50 24" X 30" One Color $ 18.75 | $ 2390 | $ 2455 | $ 20.80
6. 50 30" X 30" One Color $ 2344 | $ 29.88 | $ 30.69 | $ 26.00
7. 10 36" X 36" One Color $ 33.75 | $ 43.02 | $ 4419 | $ 37.44
8. 10 48" X 48" One Color $ 60.00 | $ 76.48 | $ 78.56 | $ 66.56
9. 50 12" X 30" High Intensity $ 9.38 1| 9% 11.81 | $ 12.28 | $ 10.70
10. 50 12" X 36" High Intensity $ 11.25 | $ 14.18 | $ 1473 | $ 12.48
11 50 12" X 48" High Intensity $ 15.00 | $ 18.92 | $ 19.64 | $ 16.64
12 20 12" X 54" High Intensity $ 16.87 | $ 2191 | $ 2210 | $ 18.72
13 10 12" X 60" High Intensity $ 18.75 | $ 2510 | $ 2455 | % 20.80
PROPOSAL C: EST TOTAL -- $ 6,18790( $ 7,882.40 | $ 8,077.10 | $ 6,881.00
3M #3930
PROPOSAL D: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SOQUARE, TWO OR MORE COLORS- SIGN
1. 200 12" X 12" Two Color $ 385|9% 4841 % 5401 % 4.81
2. 50 12" X 18" Two Color $ 578 | $ 726 | $ 8.10 | % 6.97
PROPOSAL D: EST TOTAL -- $ 1,059.00 | % 1,331.00 | $ 1,485.00 | $ 1,310.50
3M #3930
PROPOSAL E: 3M STANDARD PRE-PRINTED TRAFFIC SIGN FACES
1. 500 12" X 12" No Parking Symbol R8-3A Face $ 167 ($ - $ 216 | $ 2.25
2 20 30" Stop Faces $ 10.44 | $ - $ 12.19 | $ 11.56
3 20 36" Yield Faces $ 7501 % - $ 8.78 | % 7.06
4 20 24" x 24" No Parking R8-3A Faces $ 6.68 | $ - $ 858 |9% 7.60
PROPOSAL E: EST TOTAL -- $ 1,327.40 No Bid $ 1,671.00 | $ 1,649.40
3M #3930
PROPOSAL F: DOUBLE FACED, TWO SIDED ON WHITE - SIGN
1. 40 9" X 30" Extruded High Intensity White $ 10.00 | $ - $ 19.02 | $ 14.98
2. 40 9" X 36" Extruded High Intensity White $ 12.00 | $ - $ 2452 |3 18.04
3. 40 9" X 42" Extruded High Intensity White $ 14.00 | $ - $ 2642 | $ 21.04
4, 40 6" X 24" Extruded High Intensity White $ 6.34 | $ - $ 9.02 9% 8.35
5. 50 6" X 30" Extruded High Intensity White $ 792193 - $ 13.63 | $ 10.60
6. 50 6" X 36" Extruded High Intensity White $ 9511|9% - $ 2160 | $ 12.53
7. 50 6" X 42" Extruded High Intensity White $ 11.00 | $ - $ 2297 | $ 14.62
PROPOSAL F: EST TOTAL -- $ 3,115.10 No Bid $ 6,069.20 | $ 4,383.90




CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 08-41
Opening Date -- 1/13/09 BID TABULATION Pg. 2 of 6
Date Prepared -- 1/14/09 TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS
VENDOR NAME: Osburn Allied Municipal | Dornbos Sign Vulcan
Associates, Inc Supply Inc Signs
PROPOSAL G: SET UP FEES $ 15.00 Blank $ 20.00 | callfor pricing

PROPOSAL H: SQUARE TUBULAR SIGN POSTS - PERFORATED - GALVANIZED STEEL - FHWA APPROVED

1. 100 12 Ft X 1 3/4" - 14 Gauge $ - $ 2158 | $ - $ 24.81
2. 100 9FtX11/2"- 14 Gauge $ - $ 1431 | $ - $ 19.78
3. 100 3 Ft X 2" Base - 12 Gauge $ - $ 864 | % - $ 9.23
4, 100 3 Ft X 13/4"Base - 12 Gauge $ - $ 748 | $ - $ 8.00
PROPOSAL H: EST TOTAL -- No Bid $ 5,201.00 No Bid $ 6,182.00
#2 & #4 25/Bundle
PROPOSAL I: ROUND GALVANIZED STEEL POST, 2" NOMINAL SIZE .125 WALL THICKNESS
1. 100 12 FT Galvanized steel round post $ - $ 2687 | $ 4370 | $ -
PROPOSAL I: EST TOTAL -- No Bid $ 2,687.00 | $ 4,370.00 No Bid
PROPOSAL J: U-CHANNEL SIGN POSTS
1. 50 12 FT - 3lbs Silver Galvanized Steel $ 2448 | $ 31.05| $ 2951 1| $ 32.48
2. 100 12 FT - 3lbs Green Painted Steel $ 17.64 | $ 23.85| $ 23.75 | $ 27.43
3. 100 10 FT - 2lbs Green Painted Steel $ 10.00 | $ 1325 | $ 13.20 | $ 14.43
PROPOSAL J: EST TOTAL -- $ 3,9838.00| % 5,26250 | $ 5,170.50 | $ 5,810.00
OPTIONAL:
PROPOSAL K: Complete Signs, Single Face 3M Diamond Grade DG3 Reflective Sheeting Series 4000
1. 50 36" Yield (R1-2) $ 2858 | $ 73.72 | $ 2545 | $ 28.24
2. 50 30" Stop (R1-1) $ 39.69 | $ 46.37 | $ 3533 | $ 43.43
3. 10 36" Stop (R1-1) $ 5767 | $ 73.72 | $ 50.87 | $ 62.46
4, 10 18" x 6" All Way (R1-4) $ 476 | $ 6.45| $ 500 1| $ 5.82
PROPOSAL K: EST TOTAL -- $ 403780 1|9% 6,806.20 | $ 3,597.70 | $ 4,266.30
$ 4,370.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS: | $ 19,11550 | $ 7,888.00 | $ 3,597.70 | $ 6,182.00
DELIVERY: Minimum Shipment $100.00 $1,300 or less | $1,000.00 $50.00
Non-Stock - 30 days
# of Days 30 Days 30-45 Days 30 - 45 Days | Stock Items 3-5 days
M-F 7AM to 4 PM
CONTACT INFO: Hrs of Operation: 7AMt05PMM-F | 7 AMt04:30 PM | M-F 7:30AM to 5PM CST
24 Hr Phone Number: 740-603-3011 | 217-825-9369 517-712-2467 N/A
DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE: Marked Blank Blank Blank Blank
PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 30 Days N-30 Net 30
WARRANTY: Manufacturers| 3M's Warranty | 3M Warranty | Standard 3M
Non-Stock - 30 days
DELIVERY: 30 - 45 Days ARO| 30-45 Days ARO 30-45 Days | stock Items 3-5 days
EXCEPTIONS: Blank Square Post purchase Blank Blank
in increments of 25
U-Channel purchase in
increments of 50
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT: Y orN Yes Yes Yes Yes

YELLOW DENOTES LOW TOTAL BIDDER BY PROPOSAL - PRIMARY
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CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 08-41
Opening Date -- 1/13/09 BID TABULATION Pg.30of 6
Date Prepared -- 1/14/09 TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS
VENDOR NAME: MD Solutions, Unistrut Rocal, Inc. Custom
Inc. Detroit Service Products
Company Corporation
ITEM EST QTY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
PROPOSAL A: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE 3M HIGH INTENSITY ON ALUMINUM
1. 50 36" YIELD (R1-2) $ - $ - $ 18.67 | $ 16.54
2. 50 30" STOP (R1-1) $ - $ - $ 2401 1% 23.91
3. 10 36" STOP (R1-1) $ - $ - $ 3471 1% 33.97
4 10 18" x 6" All Way (R1-4) $ - $ - $ 3511|$% 4.20
PROPOSAL A: EST TOTAL -- No Bid No Bid $ 2,516.20|$ 2,404.20
Avery T-6500
PROPOSAL B: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE, 3M Diamond Grade, VIP Sheeting, Fluorescent Yellow Green
1. 10 36" S2-1 School Crossing $ - $ - $ 61.29 | $ 77.20
2. 10 24" X 12" W 16-7 Left School Arrow $ - $ - $ 14.62 | $ 18.01
3. 10 36" S1-1 Cross Walk $ - $ - $ 61.29 | $ 77.20
PROPOSAL B: EST TOTAL -- No Bid No Bid $ 1,372.00 | $ 1,724.10
Avery T-9500
PROPOSAL C: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - ONE COLOR - SIGN
1. 10 12" X 18" One Color $ - $ - $ 6.59 | $ 6.57
2. 20 12" X 36" One Color $ - $ - $ 11.67 | $ 12.29
3. 30 18" X 18" One Color $ - $ - $ 9.83|9% 9.85
4, 20 24" X 24" One Color $ - $ - $ 15.56 | $ 16.39
5. 50 24" X 30" One Color $ - $ - $ 19.45 | $ 20.44
6. 50 30" X 30" One Color $ - $ - $ 2431 1% 25.11
7. 10 36" X 36" One Color $ - $ - $ 3501 1|9% 35.89
8. 10 48" X 48" One Color $ - $ - $ 62.24 | $ 63.49
9. 50 12" X 30" High Intensity $ - $ - $ 10.98 | $ 10.95
10. 50 12" X 36" High Intensity $ - $ - $ 11.67 | $ 12.29
11 50 12" X 48" High Intensity $ - $ - $ 15.56 | $ 16.39
12 20 12" X 54" High Intensity $ - $ - $ 1751 | $ 18.36
13 10 12" X 60" High Intensity $ - $ - $ 1945 $ 20.44
PROPOSAL C: EST TOTAL -- No Bid No Bid $ 6,522.60| 3% 6,759.20
Avery T-6500
PROPOSAL D: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE, TWO OR MORE COLORS-SIGN
1. 200 12" X 12" Two Color $ - $ - $ 539 9% 5.75
2. 50 12" X 18" Two Color $ - $ - $ 729 1% 7.00
PROPOSAL D: EST TOTAL -- No Bid No Bid $ 1,44250|$% 1,500.00
Avery T-6500
PROPOSAL E: 3M STANDARD PRE-PRINTED TRAFFIC SIGN FACES
1. 500 12" X 12" No Parking Symbol R8-3A Fac| $ - $ - $ 199 $ 3.32
2 20 30" Stop Faces $ - $ - $ 1050 | $ 12.49
3 20 36" Yield Faces $ - $ - $ 75119% 8.57
4 20 24" x 24" No Parking R8-3A Faces $ - $ - $ 336 | $ 9.02
PROPOSAL E: EST TOTAL -- No Bid No Bid $ 1,42240|% 2,261.60
Avery T-6500
PROPOSAL F: DOUBLE FACED, TWO SIDED ON WHITE - SIGN
1. 40 9" X 30" Extruded High Intensity White | $ 1752 | $ - $ 31.80 | $ 18.42
2. 40 9" X 36" Extruded High Intensity White | $ 2061 | % - $ 3456 | $ 22.10
3. 40 9" X 42" Extruded High Intensity White | $ 2411 | $ - $ 37.32 | $ 25.78
4, 40 6" X 24" Extruded High Intensity White | $ 11.14 | $ - $ 2760 | $ 9.87
5. 50 6" X 30" Extruded High Intensity White | $ 1342 | $ - $ 30.00 | $ 12.34
6. 50 6" X 36" Extruded High Intensity White | $ 11.96 | $ - $ 3240 | $ 14.66
7. 50 6" X 42" Extruded High Intensity White | $ 1792 | $ - $ 3480 | $ 17.11
Avery T-6500
PROPOSAL F: EST TOTAL -- $ 5,100.20 No Bid $10,111.20 | $ 5,252.30




CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 08-41
Opening Date -- 1/13/09 BID TABULATION Pg. 4 of 6
Date Prepared -- 1/14/09 TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS
VENDOR NAME: MD Solutions Unistrut Rocal, Inc. Custom
Detroit Service Products Corp
PROPOSAL G: SET UP FEES Blank No Bid $ 50.00 | $ 75.00
PROPOSAL H: SOUARE TUBULAR SIGN POSTS - PERFORATED - GALVANIZED STEEL - FHWA APPROVED
1. 100 12 Ft X 1 3/4" - 14 Gauge $ - $ 30.00 | $ - $ 26.53
2. 100 9FtX11/2"-14 Gauge $ - $ 2200 | $ - $ 22.75
3. 100 3 Ft X 2" Base - 12 Gauge $ - $ 1140 $ - $ 9.91
4, 100 3 Ft X 13/4"Base - 12 Gauge $ - $ 10.60 | $ - $ 9.89
PROPOSAL H: EST TOTAL -- No Bid $ 7,400.00 No Bid $ 6,908.00
PROPOSAL I: ROUND GALVANIZED STEEL POST, 2" NOMINAL SIZE .125 WALL THICKNESS
1. 100 12 FT Galvanized steel round post $ - $ - $ - $ -
PROPOSAL I: EST TOTAL -- No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
PROPOSAL J: U-CHANNEL SIGN POSTS
1. 50 12 FT - 3lbs Silver Galvanized Steel $ - $ - $ - $ 32.52
2. 100 12 FT - 3lbs Green Painted Steel $ - $ - $ - $ 27.72
3. 100 10 FT - 2lbs Green Painted Steel $ - $ - $ - $ 16.00
PROPOSAL J: EST TOTAL -- No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 5,998.00
OPTIONAL:
PROPOSAL K: Complete Signs, Single Face 3M Diamond Grade DG3 Reflective Sheeting Series 4000
1. 50 36" Yield (R1-2) $ - $ - $ 28.16 | $ 29.89
2. 50 30" Stop (R1-1) $ - $ - $ 3943 | $ 43.33
3. 10 36" Stop (R1-1) $ - $ - $ 56.79 | $ 64.12
4, 10 18" x 6" All Way (R1-4) $ - $ - $ 4731 $ 6.64
PROPOSAL K: EST TOTAL -- No Bid No Bid $ 3,99470 % 4,368.60
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS: N/A N/A N/A N/A
DELIVERY: Minimum Shipment Blank $1,000 or Less $700.00 $300.00
Posts - 35-45 days
# of Days 30 Days Three 30 - 45 Days| 30days Nonstock
0:8AMto 5 PM M-Thurs
CONTACT INFO: Hrs of Operation: 8:30 AMto5PM | w:7:30AMto4PM| 8 AMto5PM | 7 AMto5:30 PM
24 Hr Phone Number: Blank 734-756-9773 N/A 800-367-1492
DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE:  Marked Blank Blank w/Letter Catalog
Net 30
PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 1/2 of 1% 10 day Net 30 Net 30
WARRANTY: Blank Firm 10 years |3M's Warranty
Posts-35-45 days
DELIVERY: 30 Days As Requested | 30 - 45 Days | 30days Nonstock
EXCEPTIONS: Blank Blank Avery Dennison |Proposal H: quoted
Sheeting 12 Gauge & Purchased
in bundles of 25
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT: YorN Yes Yes Yes Yes
ATTEST:
Tom Rosewarne
Deanna Theobald Susan Leirstein CPPB

Diane Fisher
Linda Bockstanz

Purchasing Director
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CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 08-41
Opening Date -- 1/13/09 BID TABULATION Pg. 50f 6
Date Prepared -- 1/14/09 TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS
VENDOR NAME: Hall Signs Inc. | Rathco Safety Michigan Madalyn's |
Supply, Inc. | State Industries |Contracting LLC
ITEM EST QTY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
PROPOSAL A: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE 3M HIGH INTENSITY ON ALUMINUM
1. 50 36" YIELD (R1-2) $ 2401 [ $ 1759 | $ 76.15 [ $ 100.00
2. 50 30" STOP (R1-1) $ 30.23 [ $ 28.65 [ $ 5145 $ 100.00
3. 10 36" STOP (R1-1) $ 4319 | $ 4125 | $ 76.15 [ $ 100.00
4 10 18" x 6" All Way (R1-4) $ 424 1% 352 1% 15.00 | $ 50.00
PROPOSAL A: EST TOTAL -- $ 3,186.30 | $ 2,759.70 | $ 7,291.50 | $ 11,500.00
PROPOSAL B: COMPLETE SIGNS, SINGLE FACE, 3M Diamond Grade, VIP Sheeting, Fluorescent Yellow Green
1. 10 36" S2-1 School Crossing $ 70.89 | $ 68.85 [ $ 10045 [ $ 120.00
2. 10 24" X 12" W 16-7 Left School Arrow $ 16.74 | $ 15.30 | $ 3445 [ $ 75.00
3. 10 36" S1-1 Cross Walk $ 70.89 [ $ 68.85 [ $ 10045 $ 100.00
PROPOSAL B: EST TOTAL -- $ 1,585.20 [$ 1,530.00 | $ 2,35350 |$  2,950.00
PROPOSAL C: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE - ONE COLOR - SIGN
1. 10 12" X 18" One Color $ 8.04 1% 7.04 1% 24.30 | $ 60.00
2. 20 12" X 36" One Color $ 1544 | $ 14.07 | $ 37.00 [ $ 100.00
3. 30 18" X 18" One Color $ 11.87 | $ 10.55 | $ 36.00 [ $ 75.00
4. 20 24" X 24" One Color $ 20.46 | $ 18.76 | $ 40.80 | $ 75.00
5. 50 24" X 30" One Color $ 25.39 | $ 2345 | $ 4535 | $ 75.00
6. 50 30" X 30" One Color $ 3165 % 2931 $ 5145 $ 100.00
7. 10 36" X 36" One Color $ 4527 | $ 4221 | $ 76.15 [ $ 100.00
8. 10 48" X 48" One Color $ 83.30 [ $ 75.04 | $ 175.00 | $ 120.00
9. 50 12" X 30" High Intensity $ 1287 | $ 11.73 | $ 34.00 [ $ 50.00
10. 50 12" X 36" High Intensity $ 15.44 | $ 14.07 | $ 37.00 [ $ 75.00
11 50 12" X 48" High Intensity $ 2059 [ $ 18.76 | $ 40.80 | $ 75.00
12 20 12" X 54" High Intensity $ 23.16 [ $ 2111 [ $ 45.00 | $ 100.00
13 10 12" X 60" High Intensity $ 2573 | $ 2345 | $ 50.00 | $ 75.00
PROPOSAL C: EST TOTAL -- $ 8457.70|$ 7,738.70|$ 17,220.50 | $ 30,050.00
PROPOSAL D: STANDARD, WARNING DIAMOND, RECTANGULAR OR SQUARE, TWO OR MORE COLORS-SIGN
1. 200 12" X 12" Two Color $ 6.23 | $ 4931 % 16.60 | $ 100.00
2. 50 12" X 18" Two Color $ 8.931% 7391 % 24.30 [ $ 100.00
PROPOSAL D: EST TOTAL -- $ 169250 ($ 1,355.50 | $ 4,535.00 | $ 25,000.00
PROPOSAL E: 3M STANDARD PRE-PRINTED TRAFFIC SIGN FACES
1. 500 12" X 12" No Parking Symbol R8-3A Faceq $ 253 1% 2331 % 1540 | $ 50.00
2 20 30" Stop Faces $ 12.02 | $ 13.38 | $ 5145 $ 75.00
3 20 36" Yield Faces $ 9.10 | $ 8.021% 76.15 [ $ 75.00
4 20 24" x 24" No Parking R8-3A Faces $ 8331|% 8.56 | $ 40.80 | $ 75.00
PROPOSAL E: EST TOTAL -- $ 185400 (% 1,76420($ 11,068.00 ($ 29,500.00
PROPOSAL F: DOUBLE FACED, TWO SIDED ON WHITE - SIGN
1. 40 9" X 30" Extruded High Intensity White $ 29.63 [ $ 17.02 | $ - $ 80.00
2. 40 9" X 36" Extruded High Intensity White $ 3542 | $ 20.64 | $ - $ 80.00
3. 40 9" X 42" Extruded High Intensity White $ 4123 | $ 2383 [ $ - $ 80.00
4. 40 6" X 24" Extruded High Intensity White $ 16.77 | $ 9.08 | % - $ 80.00
5. 50 6" X 30" Extruded High Intensity White $ 20.79 [ $ 11.35| $ - $ 50.00
6. 50 6" X 36" Extruded High Intensity White $ 24.78 | $ 13.62 | $ - $ 50.00
7. 50 6" X 42" Extruded High Intensity White $ 28.79 | $ 1589 | $ - $ 80.00
PROPOSAL F: EST TOTAL -- $ 8,640.00 | $  4,865.80 Blank $ 21,800.00




CITY OF TROY

Opening Date -- 1/13/09 BID TABULATION ITB-COT 08-41
Date Prepared -- 1/14/09 TRAFFIC CONTROL SIGNS & POSTS Pg. 6 of 6
VENDOR NAME: Hall Signs, Inc. | Rathco Safety Michigan Madalyn's |
Supply, Inc. | State Industries |Contracting LLC
PROPOSAL G: SET UP FEES $ 80.00 Blank Blank $ 200.00
PROPOSAL H: SQUARE TUBULAR SIGN POSTS - PERFORATED - GALVANIZED STEEL - FHWA APPROVED
1. 100 12 Ft X 1 3/4" - 14 Gauge $ - $ 4725 | $ - $ 40.00
2. 100 9Ft X11/2"- 14 Gauge $ - $ 38.75 | $ - $ 40.00
3. 100 3 Ft X2 " Base - 12 Gauge $ - $ 16.65| $ - $ 10.00
4 100 3 Ft X13/4 " Base - 12 Gauge $ - $ 1590 | $ - $ 10.00
PROPOSAL H: EST TOTAL -- No Bid $ 11,855.00 Blank $ 10,000.00
PROPOSAL I: ROUND GALVANIZED STEEL POST, 2" NOMINAL SIZE .125 WALL THICKNESS
1. 100 12 FT Galvanized steel round post $ - $ - $ - $ 70.00
PROPOSAL I: EST TOTAL -- No Bid No Bid Blank $ 7,000.00
PROPOSAL J: U-CHANNEL SIGN POSTS
1. 50 12 FT - 3lbs Silver Galvanized Steel $ 41421 $ 25.03 | $ - $ 45.00
2. 100 12 FT - 3lbs Green Painted Steel $ 3460 | $ 1995 $ - $ 48.00
3. 100 10 FT - 2lbs Green Painted Steel $ 19.21( $ 13.20 | $ - $ 25.00
PROPOSAL J: EST TOTAL -- $ 7,452.00 | $ 4,566.50 Blank $ 9,550.00
OPTIONAL:
PROPOSAL K: Complete Signs, Single Face 3M Diamond Grade DG3 Reflective Sheeting Series 4000
1. 50 36" Yield (R1-2) $ 36.76 | $ 2831 % 10045 | $ 100.00
2. 50 30" Stop (R1-1) $ 4793 | $ 4719 | $ 68.35 | $ 100.00
3. 10 36" Stop (R1-1) $ 68.69 | $ 67.95 | $ 10045 $ 100.00
4 10 18" x 6" All Way (R1-4) $ 6.36 | $ 5671 % 20.00 | $ 50.00
PROPOSAL K: EST TOTAL -- $ 4985.00|$ 451120 | % 9,64450 | $ 11,500.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS: N/A N/A N/A N/A
$500 Signs
DELIVERY: Minimum Shipment $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000 or less | $1,000 Posts
Non-Stock-60-75 Days
# of Days 30-45 Days 30 Days 45 - 60 Days 10 Days
CONTACT INFO: Hrs of Operation: 7AM to 5:30PM M-F| 7:30 AM to 5 PM 8 AMto 5 PM 9 AM to 5 PM M-F

24 Hr Phone Number:

800-284-7446

269-323-0153

517-373-4277

248-414-9438

DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE:  Marked Catalog Blank Blank N/A
PAYMENT TERMS: 0%, Net 30 Net 30 Days Net 30 Net 30
WARRANTY: Attached To Bid | Manufacturers Blank Manufacturers
DELIVERY: POStSsgnEg):;/Z Z’;Z‘;Ck 30 Days 45 - 60 Days FOB to DPW
EXCEPTIONS: Attached To Bid Attached To Bid Blank N/A
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT: YorN Yes Yes Yes Yes
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