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February 23, 2009 
 
 
TO:     Phillip L. Nelson, City Manager 
 
FROM:   John M. Lamerato, Assistant City Manager/Finance & Administration 
    Susan A. Leirstein, Purchasing Director 
    Carol K. Anderson, Parks and Recreation Director 
 
SUBJECT:   Standard Purchasing Resolution 2: Bid Award – Lowest Bidders Meeting  
    Specifications – Turfgrass Chemical Products – City Golf Courses 
 
Background 

 On February 4, 2009, bids were received and opened for IBT-COT 09-01 to provide turfgrass 
chemicals and fertilizers for Sylvan Glen and Sanctuary Lake Golf Courses. 

 56 vendors were notified via the MITN system with seven (7) bidders responding and one 
statement of no bid received. 

 Serious consideration was given to all vendors on all items, due to the fact that some 
chemicals are now coming off patent. 

  Lesco Inc. bid an alternate on Item #3, and Turfgrass Inc bid alternates on Items #3 and #8, 
which do not contain the micro-nutrient package and patented plant extracts essential for 
plant growth.  

 On Item #6, bids received for Triton 70WDG were quoted in units of measure (UOM) other 
than those specified; and therefore not considered for award. 

 Great Lakes Turf LLC bid an alternate on Item #7 that deviated from the UOM specified, and 
therefore not considered for award. 

 All bids received for Items #6, #9 and #26 had identical agency pricing.  Tri-Turf Inc. was 
awarded Items #6 and #9; Helena Chemical Co. was awarded Item #26. Both awards are 
based on minimum shipments and payment terms. 

 Lesco Inc., Tri-Turf Inc. and Helena Chemical Co. bid alternates on Item #10, which do not 
contain chelated micro-nutrients as specified. 

 Lesco Inc. bid an alternate on Item #12, which does not have a complete micro-nutrient 
package. 

 Turfgrass Inc. bid an alternate on Item #13 that does not contain the proprietary nitrogen 
source specified. 

 Helena Chemical Co. and Turfgrass Inc. bid alternates on Item #15, which do not contain 
complex carbohydrates and proteins necessary for plant digestion and photosynthesis. 
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February 23, 2009 
 
To: Phillip L. Nelson, City Manager 
Re: Bid Award – Lowest Bidders Meeting Specifications – Turfgrass Chemical Products 
 
Background - continued 
 Lesco Inc and CPS (formerly UAP) withdrew bids on Items #16 and #21; CPS also withdrew 

on Item #23; Harrell’s withdrew bids on Items #6, #16, #21 and #26, all due to incorrect 
pricing.  

 Tri-Turf Inc., Lesco Inc. and Helena Chemical Co. bid alternates on Item #17. Tri-Turf Inc. and 
Lesco Inc. bids did not contain the micro-nutrient package as specified. Helena Chemical 
Company’s product is only labeled for use in New Mexico and Texas. 

 Lesco Inc. bid an alternate on Item #18; this product must be watered in immediately after 
application and cannot be applied if heat and humidity exceed thresholds.  Product specified 
requires no water and can be applied at any time. 

 Turfgrass Inc. and Helena Chemical Co. had identical agency pricing on Items #16 and #21. 
Items were awarded to Helena Chemical Co. based on minimum shipment and payment 
terms. 

 Lesco Inc. bid an alternate on Item #22, which has a totally different chemistry and higher 
application rates than specified. This product even though cheaper in price is more expensive 
in cost per acre and is therefore not the lowest priced or the best buy.  

 Tri-Turf Inc. and Turfgrass Inc. bid alternates on Item #23, which do not contain the patented 
pigment and Turf Shield Technology that positively affect turf physiology. 

 Tri-Turf Inc. bid an alternate on Item #25, which requires four times more product and three 
times as many applications compared to the product specified. 

 Lesco Inc. bid an alternate on Item #29, which does not contain Contec Technology. This 
allows the fertilizer to dissolve quickly into the turf canopy after application and irrigation, 
reducing the potential of turf damage to the golf course greens. 

 Harrell’s, Tri-Turf Inc, Turfgrass Inc., Lesco Inc. and Helena Chemical Co. all bid alternates on 
Item #30, which do not contain the proprietary Carbon Power Technology as specified.   

 Helena Chemical Co. and Harrell’s bid an alternate on Item #32, which does not have a 
labeled one time season long application rate. 

 All bids for Item #34, Disarm are being recommended for rejection, as the product is not 
available in the packaging specified. 

 
 
Financial Considerations 
 

 The department has funds budgeted in the Sylvan Glen Seed/Planting Supplies account 
#584.785.7740.100 and the Sanctuary Lake Seed/Planting Supplies account 
#583.765.7740.100. 

 Vendors were required to submit product information on all alternates in order to assist in the 
recommendation process. Based on this, the City was able to accept nine generic products 
and eleven low bids out of thirty six items at a considerable cost savings of $30,194.46 over 
last season’s estimated costs.  
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February 23, 2009 
 
To: Phillip L. Nelson, City Manager 
Re: Bid Award – Lowest Bidders Meeting Specifications – Turfgrass Chemical Products 

 
Legal Considerations 
 

 ITB-COT 09-01 to furnish seasonal requirements of chemicals for Sylvan Glen and Sanctuary 
Lake Golf Courses was competitively bid and vendors were given the opportunity to respond 
with their level of interest in supplying turf chemicals and fertilizers to the City’s golf facilities. 

 
 
Policy Considerations 
 

 Troy golf personnel communicate with educators and vendors on newer cost effective 
chemistries and products for the future. (Outcome Statement II) 

 
Options 
 

 City management recommends awarding the seasonal requirements of chemicals for Sylvan 
Glen and Sanctuary Lake Golf Courses to the following low bidders meeting specifications: 
Lesco Inc., Cleveland, Ohio; Helena Chemical Company, Zeeland, Michigan; Great Lakes 
Turf, LLC, Grand Rapids, Michigan; Tri-Turf Inc. Farmington Hills, Michigan; Crop Production 
Services (CPS) Inc., Sunfield, Michigan; Turfgrass Inc., Novi, Michigan; and Harrell’s, 
Lakeland, Florida for products highlighted and at unit prices detailed on the attached bid 
tabulation, which opened 2/4/2009. 

 In addition, staff recommends rejecting Item #34, Disarm, as the product is not available in the 
packaging specified. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Information provided by: Danny McDonald, Superintendent of Greens 
 
G:/Bid Award 08-09 New Format/Award Standard Purchasing Resolution 2 – Chemicals 02-09.doc 

 
 
 



 CITY OF TROY            ITB-COT 09-01
Opening Date -- 02/04/09 BID TABULATION Page 1 of 12
Date Prepared - 02/04/09 jh/sl TURFGRASS CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

VENDOR NAME: Tri-Turf

 EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1. 100 GALS CHIPCO 26 GT FLOWABLE or 2 X 2.5 GALS Alt: Chipco 26019 Alt: Armor Tech AT IP233
(20 CASES)  IPRODIONE PRO 2 SE 5 GALS/CASE 60.95$        304.75$       59.50$        297.50$     

2. 150 GALS DACONIL WEATHERSTIK 2 X 2.5 GALS Alt: Mainsail 6F Alt: Armor Tech AT CLT 720
(30 CASES) or ECHO 720/CONCORDE SST 5 GALS/CASE 43.40$        217.00$       40.60$        203.00$     

3. 30 GALS KNIFE PLUS 2 X 2.5 GALS Alt: Amino Iron 12-0-0 NO BID
(6 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE DMS

4.  20 GALS BANNER MAX 2 X 2.5 GALS Alt: Propiconazole  14.3 Alt: Armor Tech AT PPZ143
(4 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 131.58$      657.90$       116.00$      580.00$     

5. 24 lbs GALLERY 4 x 1 lb

(6 CASES) HERBICIDE 4 1lbs/Case 153.81$      615.24$       158.50$      634.00$     
Alt: Triton 70WDG - 6x2#

6. 55 GALS TRINITY or TRITON FLO 2 X 2.5 GALS Alt:  DMS Trinity
(11 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 325.00$      1,625.00$    325.00$      1,625.00$  

Alt: Imidacloprid WSB 75 (88x1.60oz) 48 x 1.6 oz
7. 176 oz MERIT 75 W.S.P./Zenith 75 WSB 110 X 1.6oz Pk 6.77420$           953.81$              Alt: Armor Tech AT IMD 75

(1 Mini Drum) 176 oz/Drum 12.2159$    2,150.00$    9.10$          698.88$     

8. 50 GALS ASTRON 2 X 2.5 GALS Alt: Ultraplex NO BID
(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE DMS

9. 49.0 lbs EMERALD 70 WG 10 X 0.49 lbs 10 Cases - rec 1 case n/c
(10 CASES)  4.90 lbs/CASE 280.00$      1,372.00$    270.816$    1,327.00$  

10. 50 GALS GARY'S GREEN 18-3-4+Iron 2 X 2.5 GALS Alt: Sub Plant Food 18-3-6
(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 37.60$        188.00$       DMS

11. 50 GALS SILI-KAL B 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID
(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 51.80$        259.00$       

12. 30 GALS ULTRAPLEX 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID
(6 CASES) 5 GALS./CASE 51.00$        255.00$       

13. 125 GALS POWER C3 2 X 2.5 GALS Alt: Fluid Fert. 29-2-3 NO BID
(25 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE DMS

14. 125 GALS CALPHLEX 2 X 2.5 GALS Alt: 12% Calcium Complex NO BID
(25 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 37.60$        188.00$       

15. 50 GALS PROTESYN 2 X 2.5 GALS Alt: Amino-plex NO BID
(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE DMS

16. 68.74 LBS BAYLETON 50WSP 34.37 lbs per NO BID
(2 Drums) Drum $83.309 2,863.35$    

Turfgrass, Inc.



CITY OF TROY               ITB-COT 09-01
Opening Date -- 02/04/09 BID TABULATION Pg 2 of 12
Date Prepared - 02/04/09 TURFGRASS CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

VENDOR NAME:  Tri - Turf

EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
17. 45 gals PK PLUS 2 X 2.5 GALS Alt: Sub K-Phite 7LP

(9 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE 58.40$        292.00$       DMS

18. 6,000 lbs HARRELS TRU-PRILL NO BID NO BID
(120 BAGS) 15-2-15 GREENS GRADE FERTILIZER 50 LBS/BAG

19. 21 TONS KELLY'S HIGH 50 LB/Bag NO BID
(840 Bags) CALCIUM LIME REGULAR GRADE 40 bags/Ton 5.92$          236.80$       

40 Lb Bag
20. 2,000 LBS CASCADE GRANULAR 40 Lb Bags Alt: Sub 16-90 Granular 

(40 BAGS) 50 LBS/BAG 1.94$          77.60$         2.32$          92.80$       

21. 15 GALS TARTAN 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID
(3 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE 450.24$      2,251.20$    

22. 40 GALS MILLENNIUM ULTRA 2 2 X 2.5 GALS

(8 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE 53.10$        265.50$       47.75$        238.75$     
Alt: Fosetyl - A1 4 x 6.3lbs (25.2 #case)

23. 220 lbs ALLIETTE/SIGNATURE 2 x 11 lbs DMS Alt: Armor Tech ALT 70
(10 Cases) 22 lbs/CASE 21.47$        472.34$       DMS

Alt: Mefenoxam 2AQ
378.95$             1,894.75$           

24. 20 Gals SUBDUE MAXX 2 X 2.5 GALS (Subdue 2gal) Alt: QualiPro Mefenaxam
(4 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE 620.85$     1,241.70$   475.00$      2,375.00$ 

25. 60 Gals PERVADE 30 gal NO BID Alt: Sub Dispatch 
(2 Drums) Drum DMS

26. 128 oz ACELEPRYN INSECTICIDE 64 oz / Jug NO BID
(2 Jugs) 13.75$        880.00$       

27. 30 lbs PROSTAR 10 x 1 lb

(3 Cases) 10 lbs/CASE 40.76$        407.60$       57.50$        575.00$     

28. 4,000 lbs VERDE-CAL G NO BID NO BID
(80 bags) 50 lbs/ BAG

29. 2,000 LBS ANDERSON's 18-9-18 NO BID
(50 Bags) CONTEC DG PRO 40 lbs/ BAG 1.16$          46.40$         

30. 90 Gallons PK FIGHT 0-0-28 2 X 2.5 GALS Alt: Fairphyte 1-0-26 Alt: Sub K-Phite 7LP
(18 Bags) 5 GALS/CASE DMS DMS

31. 360 lbs P-48 30 lb / Pails NO BID NO BID
(12 Pails)

32. 40 gals LESCO-FLO 2 X 2.5 GALS Alt: Cascade Plus Alt: Sub Aquatrols 16-90
(8 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE 63.45$        317.25$       58.50$        292.50$     

Different Packaging (48 Lbs cs)
33. 60 LBS CLEARY's 3336 6 x 2 lb case 16.676$             800.48$              Alt: T-Methyl E-Pro 50 WSB

(5 Cases) 12 lb/Case 20.43$        245.16$       18.25$        219.00$     

Turfgrass, Inc.



CITY OF TROY               ITB-COT 09-01
Opening Date -- 02/04/09 BID TABULATION Pg. 3 of  12
Date Prepared - 02/04/09 TURFGRASS CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

VENDOR NAME: Tri - Turf

 EST UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

34. 72 lbs DISARM 24 x 1 lb Jug

(3 Cases) 24 lbs / Case

35. 200 gals GLACIER 4F 2 X 2.5 Gals Alt: Turfcide 400
(40 Cases) 5 Gal/Case 28.12$        140.60$       26.20$        131.00$     

36. 55 gals QUICK-WATER WETTING AGENT 55 gals Alt: Sub Aquatrols Primer Select

(1 Drum) Drum 44.64$        2,455.20$    61.10$        3,360.50$  

ESTIMATED TOTAL OF AWARDED ITEMS --

MINIMUM SHIPMENT: 1 Case or Bag No Minimum
Days after call 1 -3 Days 1 Day

CONTACT INFORMATION:  Hrs of Oper: 7 AM to 4:30 PM 8 AM to 5 PM
    Phone # 248-866-6081  (24 hours) 248-640-4439

PAYMENT TERMS Net 45 Days 2% 10 Net 60

WARRANTY Per Manufacturer Per Manufacturer

EXCEPTIONS See Exception Sheet Agency Terms Net 60 Days
Attached To Bid Next Day Delivery

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:     Y or N Yes Yes

NO BIDS: PROPOSAL - - Seasonal Requirements of Turfgrass Chemicals
DeAngelo Brothers, Inc. 

ALL HIGHLIGHTED AREAS DENOTE LOWEST ACCEPTABLE BIDDERS
ATTEST:
Diane Fisher
Danny McDonald Susan Leirstein CPPB
Linda Bockstanz Purchasing Director

G:ITB-COT 09-01 Chemicals-Golf Courses

30,399.81$                        40,615.00$                      

Turfgrass, Inc.

Recommend Rejecting Item 34



 CITY OF TROY            ITB-COT 09-01
Opening Date -- 02/04/09 BID TABULATION Pg 4 of 12
Date Prepared - 02/04/09 TURFGRASS CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

VENDOR NAME: Lesco, Inc.

 EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

Alt: Chipco 26019 2.5 gallons
1. 100 GALS CHIPCO 26 GT FLOWABLE or 2 X 2.5 GALS 63.95$             319.77$           Alt: Lesco 18+

(20 CASES)  IPRODIONE PRO 2 SE 5 GALS/CASE 119.64$     598.21$      52.00$      260.00$     
Alt: Ensign 720

2. 150 GALS DACONIL WEATHERSTIK 2 X 2.5 GALS 37.50$             187.50$           Alt: Lesco Manicure 6PL
(30 CASES) or ECHO 720/CONCORDE SST 5 GALS/CASE 65.28$       326.40$      40.80$      204.00$     

3. 30 GALS KNIFE PLUS 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID Alt: Bolster
(6 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE DMS

Alt: Pro Con Z
134.50$           672.50$           

4.  20 GALS BANNER MAX 2 X 2.5 GALS (Banner10 Gals) Alt: Lesco Spectator
(4 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 275.00$      2,750.00$    140.00$    700.00$      

5. 24 lbs GALLERY 4 x 1 lb

(6 CASES) HERBICIDE 4 1lbs/Case 129.44$      517.76$       145.00$    580.00$      

6. 55 GALS TRINITY or TRITON FLO 2 X 2.5 GALS Trinity
(11 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 325.00$      1,625.00$    325.00$    1,625.00$   

7. 176 oz MERIT 75 W.S.P./Zenith 75 WSB 110 X 1.6oz Pk    Merit 75 W.S.P.
(1 Mini Drum) 176 oz/Drum 12.2159$     2,150.00$    12.2159$  2,150.00$   

8. 50 GALS ASTRON 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID NO BID
(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE

9. 49.0 lbs EMERALD 70 WG 10 X 0.49 lbs

(10 CASES)  4.90 lbs/CASE 280.00$      1,372.00$    280.00$    1,372.00$   

10. 50 GALS GARY'S GREEN 18-3-4+Iron 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID Alt: Lesco Green Flo
(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE DMS

11. 50 GALS SILI-KAL B 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID NO BID
(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE

12. 30 GALS ULTRAPLEX 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID Alt: Lesco Iron + Chelated
(6 CASES) 5 GALS./CASE DMS

13. 125 GALS POWER C3 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID NO BID
(25 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE

14. 125 GALS CALPHLEX 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID Alt: Lesco Green Flo 6-0-0
(25 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 27.80$      139.00$      

15. 50 GALS PROTESYN 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID NO BID
(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE

16. 68.74 LBS BAYLETON 50WSP 34.37 lbs per

(2 Drums) Drum Withdrew Withdrew

CPS Formerly UAP



CITY OF TROY
Opening Date -- 02/04/09 BID TABULATION Pg. 5 of 12
Date Prepared - 02/04/09 TURFGRASS CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

VENDOR NAME: Lesco Inc.

EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

17. 45 gals PK PLUS 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID Alt: Lesco Green Flo Phyte
(9 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE DMS

18. 6,000 lbs HARRELS TRU-PRILL NO BID Alt: Lesco Trivex 20-2-16E
(120 BAGS) 15-2-15 GREENS GRADE FERTILIZE 50 LBS/BAG DMS

19. 21 TONS KELLY'S HIGH 50 LB/Bag NO BID Alt:Lime Pell Hical Fairway
(840 Bags) CALCIUM LIME REGULAR GRADE 40 bags/Ton 6.00$        240.00$      

20. 2,000 LBS CASCADE GRANULAR NO BID Alt: Lesco Flo Gran

(40 BAGS) 50 LBS/BAG 1.50$        75.00$        

21. 15 GALS TARTAN 2 X 2.5 GALS

(3 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE Withdrew Withdrew

22. 40 GALS MILLENNIUM ULTRA 2 2 X 2.5 GALS Alt: Lesco Momentum
(8 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE 48.632$      243.16$       DMS

4x5.5#
23. 220 lbs ALLIETTE/SIGNATURE 2 x 11 lbs Alt: Lesco Prodigy

(10 Cases) 22 lbs/CASE Withdrew 23.41$      515.02$      
Alt: Mefenoxam 2AQ (5gals)

426.78$           2,133.90$        
24. 20 Gals SUBDUE MAXX 2 X 2.5 GALS (subdue 10gal) Alt: Mefenoxam

(4 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE 451.05$      4,510.50$    435.00$    2,175.00$   

25. 60 Gals PERVADE 30 gal NO BID Alt: Lesco Flo (55 Gal)
(2 Drums) Drum 34.54$      1,899.70$   

26. 128 oz ACELEPRYN INSECTICIDE 64 oz / Jug

(2 Jugs) 13.75$        880.00$       13.75$      880.00$      

27. 30 lbs PROSTAR 10 x 1 lb

(3 Cases) 10 lbs/CASE 48.71$        487.10$       60.005$    600.05$      

28. 4,000 lbs VERDE-CAL G NO BID NO BID
(80 bags) 50 lbs/ BAG

29. 2,000 LBS ANDERSON's 18-9-18 NO BID Alt: Lesco Trivex (50 Lb Bag)

(50 Bags) CONTEC DG PRO 40 lbs/ BAG DMS

30. 90 Gallons PK FIGHT 0-0-28 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID Alt: Lesco Green Flo
(18 Bags) 5 GALS/CASE DMS

31. 360 lbs P-48 30 lb / Pails NO BID NO BID
(12 Pails)

32. 40 gals LESCO-FLO 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID
(8 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE 50.00$      250.00$      

8 oz x 4 x 10/case (20lbs)
33. 60 LBS CLEARY's 3336 6 x 2 lb case Alt: Lesco T-Storm WSB

(5 Cases) 12 lb/Case 14.21$        170.53$       11.25$      225.00$      

CPS Formerly UAP



CITY OF TROY               ITB-COT 09-01
Opening Date -- 02/04/09 BID TABULATION Pg. 6 of 12
Date Prepared - 02/04/09 TURFGRASS CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

VENDOR NAME: Lesco, Inc.

 EST UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

34. 72 lbs DISARM 24 x 1 lb Jug

(3 Cases) 24 lbs / Case

35. 200 gals GLACIER 4F 2 X 2.5 Gals Alt: Turficide 40D Alt: Turfcide 2.5 gal
(40 Cases) 5 Gal/Case 27.50$             137.50$           28.00$      140.00$      

30gal/drum
36. 55 gals QUICK-WATER WETTING AGENT 55 gals NO BID Alt: Lesco Wet 

(1 Drum) Drum 20.00$      600.00$      

ESTIMATED TOTAL OF AWARDED ITEMS --

MINIMUM SHIPMENT: No Minimum No Minimum
Days after call 1 - 3 Days 7 - 10  Days

CONTACT INFORMATION:  Hrs of Oper: 8 AM to 5 PM 8 AM to 5 PM   M-F
    Phone # 586-839-8930 734-915-6123

PAYMENT TERMS Net 30 - on Agency Products Net 30 

WARRANTY Per Manufacturer N/A

EXCEPTIONS List of Alternates Attached Exceptions are noted next to

To Bid ea line item where applicable

We are offering substitute

products. Exception to para 7

under instructions to bidders
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:     Y or N Yes Yes

G:ITB-COT 09-01 Chemicals-Golf Courses

CPS Formerly UAP

3,106.56$                          11,350.00$                     

Recommend Rejecting Item 34



 CITY OF TROY            ITB-COT 09-01
Opening Date -- 02/04/09 BID TABULATION Pg 7 of 12
Date Prepared - 02/04/09 TURFGRASS CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

VENDOR NAME: Harrell's

 EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

Alt: Iprodione Pro
1. 100 GALS CHIPCO 26 GT FLOWABLE or 2 X 2.5 GALS 58.00$             290.00$             Alt: Chipco 26019

(20 CASES)  IPRODIONE PRO 2 SE 5 GALS/CASE 113.99$      569.95$        69.80$             349.00$            
Alt: Echo 720

2. 150 GALS DACONIL WEATHERSTIK 2 X 2.5 GALS 36.36$             181.80$             Alt: Mainsail 6F
(30 CASES) or ECHO 720/CONCORDE SST 5 GALS/CASE 67.98$        339.90$        42.80$             214.00$            

3. 30 GALS KNIFE PLUS 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID NO BID
(6 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE

Alt: Propiconizole Pro
4.  20 GALS BANNER MAX 2 X 2.5 GALS 132.00$           660.00$             Alt: Fathom 14.3

(4 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 285.00$      1,425.00$     162.60$           813.00$            

5. 24 lbs GALLERY 4 x 1 lb

(6 CASES) HERBICIDE 4 1lbs/Case 134.8325$   539.33$        131.74$       526.96$        
Alt: Triton 70 WDG (6 x 2lbs) 

6. 55 GALS TRINITY or TRITON FLO 2 X 2.5 GALS DMS
(11 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 325.00$      1,625.00$     Withdrew

Alt: Mallet 75 WSP (48x1.6 oz)
7. 176 oz MERIT 75 W.S.P./Zenith 75 WSB 110 X 1.6oz Pk 9.75$               748.80$             Merit 75 W.S.P.

(1 Mini Drum) 176 oz/Drum 12.2159$     2,150.00$     12.2159$     2,150.00$     

8. 50 GALS ASTRON 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID NO BID
(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE

9. 49.0 lbs EMERALD 70 WG 10 X 0.49 lbs NO BID
(10 CASES)  4.90 lbs/CASE 280.00$      1,372.00$     

10. 50 GALS GARY'S GREEN 18-3-4+Iron 2 X 2.5 GALS Alt: Helena 19-1-16 + Aminos NO BID
(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE DMS

11. 50 GALS SILI-KAL B 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID NO BID
(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE

12. 30 GALS ULTRAPLEX 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID NO BID
(6 CASES) 5 GALS./CASE

13. 125 GALS POWER C3 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID NO BID
(25 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE

14. 125 GALS CALPHLEX 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID NO BID
(25 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE

15. 50 GALS PROTESYN 2 X 2.5 GALS Alt: Renova NO BID
(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE DMS

16. 68.74 LBS BAYLETON 50WSP 34.37 lbs per

(2 Drums) Drum 83.3095$     2,863.35$     Withdrew

Helena Chemical Co



CITY OF TROY               ITB-COT 09-01
Opening Date -- 02/04/09 BID TABULATION Pg. 8 of 12
Date Prepared - 02/04/09 TURFGRASS CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

VENDOR NAME: Harrell's

EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

17. 45 gals PK PLUS 2 X 2.5 GALS Alt: EleMax 4-0-20 Kphite NO BID
(9 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE DMS

18. 6,000 lbs HARRELS TRU-PRILL NO BID
(120 BAGS) 15-2-15 GREENS GRADE FERTILIZ 50 LBS/BAG 0.9974$       49.87$          

19. 21 TONS KELLY'S HIGH 50 LB/Bag NO BID NO BID
(840 Bags) CALCIUM LIME REGULAR GRADE 40 bags/Ton

20. 2,000 LBS CASCADE GRANULAR Alt: Soaker Maxx G Alt: Brilliance G
(40 BAGS) 50 LBS/BAG 1.76$               88.00$               1.28$               64.00$              

21. 15 GALS TARTAN 2 X 2.5 GALS

(3 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE 450.24$      2,251.20$     Withdrew

22. 40 GALS MILLENNIUM ULTRA 2 2 X 2.5 GALS

(8 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE 48.00$       240.00$       53.80$         269.00$       

23. 220 lbs ALLIETTE/SIGNATURE 2 x 11 lbs

(10 Cases) 22 lbs/CASE 22.1477$     487.25$        21.7727$     479.00$        

24. 20 Gals SUBDUE MAXX 2 X 2.5 GALS  (2 x 1 Gal)
(4 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE 588.54$      2,942.70$     649.50$       1,299.00$     

25. 60 Gals PERVADE 30 gal NO BID NO BID
(2 Drums) Drum

26. 128 oz ACELEPRYN INSECTICIDE 64 oz / Jug

(2 Jugs) 13.75$        880.00$        Withdrew

27. 30 lbs PROSTAR 10 x 1 lb 12 lb Case
(3 Cases) 10 lbs/CASE 49.00$        588.00$        49.17$         491.70$        

28. 4,000 lbs VERDE-CAL G NO BID
(80 bags) 50 lbs/ BAG 0.48$           24.00$          

29. 2,000 LBS ANDERSON's 18-9-18 NO BID NO BID
(50 Bags) CONTEC DG PRO 40 lbs/ BAG

30. 90 Gallons PK FIGHT 0-0-28 2 X 2.5 GALS Alt: EleMax 0-0-26 Phite Alt: Stress Phiter 0-0-30
(18 Bags) 5 GALS/CASE DMS DMS

31. 360 lbs P-48 30 lb / Pails Alt: Axilo Mix 5 (8 x 5lbs) NO BID
(12 Pails) 9.00$               360.00$             

32. 40 gals LESCO-FLO 2 X 2.5 GALS Alt: ProMate Soaker Alt: Brilliance
(8 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE DMS DMS

Alt: T-Methyl E Pro Alt:  Cleary Pro Pak 48LB
33. 60 LBS CLEARY's 3336 6 x 2 lb case 11.95$             143.40$             16.9266$         812.48$            

(5 Cases) 12 lb/Case 18.1666$     218.00$        18.72$         224.64$        

Helena Chemical Co



CITY OF TROY               ITB-COT 09-01
Opening Date -- 02/04/09 BID TABULATION Pg. 9 of 12
Date Prepared - 02/04/09 TURFGRASS CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

VENDOR NAME: Harrell's

 EST UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
34. 72 lbs DISARM 24 x 1 lb Jug

(3 Cases) 24 lbs / Case

35. 200 gals GLACIER 4F 2 X 2.5 Gals Alt: Turfcide 400
(40 Cases) 5 Gal/Case 27.00$             135.00$             26.304$       131.52$        

36. 55 gals QUICK-WATER WETTING AGENT 55 gals Alt: ProMate Injector Alt: Aqua Aid
(1 Drum) Drum 14.00$             770.00$             19.8181$         1,090.00$         

ESTIMATED TOTAL OF AWARDED ITEMS --

MINIMUM SHIPMENT: N/A None
Days after call 1 - 2 Days Same Day

CONTACT INFORMATION:      Hrs of Oper 7 AM to 6 PM 24/7
    Phone # 616-340-9557 586-917-3851

PAYMENT TERMS Net 30    2% 10 Days Net 60

WARRANTY Per Manufacturer Manufacturers

EXCEPTIONS Attached To Bid Chipco 26019 for Chipco 26GT
Fathom 14.3 for Banner Max
Mainsail 6f for Danconil . . . . . .
 Brilliance for Cascade & etc.

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:     Y or N Yes Yes

G:ITB-COT 09-01 Chemicals-Golf Courses

Helena Chemical Co

20,464.30$                      10,464.40$                     

Recommend Rejecting Item 34



 CITY OF TROY            ITB-COT 09-01
Opening Date -- 02/04/09 BID TABULATION Pg 10 of 12
Date Prepared - 02/04/09 TURFGRASS CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

VENDOR NAME:

 EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1. 100 GALS CHIPCO 26 GT FLOWABLE or 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID
(20 CASES)  IPRODIONE PRO 2 SE 5 GALS/CASE

2. 150 GALS DACONIL WEATHERSTIK 2 X 2.5 GALS

(30 CASES) or ECHO 720/CONCORDE SST 5 GALS/CASE 40.65$          203.25$        

3. 30 GALS KNIFE PLUS 2 X 2.5 GALS

(6 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 44.00$          220.00$        

4.  20 GALS BANNER MAX 2 X 2.5 GALS Alt: Propensity 1.3 ME
(4 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 148.50$        742.50$        

5. 24 lbs GALLERY 4 x 1 lb NO BID
(6 CASES) HERBICIDE 4 1lbs/Case

6. 55 GALS TRINITY or TRITON FLO 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID
(11 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE

7. 176 oz MERIT 75 W.S.P./Zenith 75 WSB 110 X 1.6oz Pk Alt: Enforce 75 WSB (1.6# cs)
(1 Mini Drum) 176 oz/Drum DMS

8. 50 GALS ASTRON 2 X 2.5 GALS

(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 84.00$          420.00$        

9. 49.0 lbs EMERALD 70 WG 10 X 0.49 lbs NO BID
(10 CASES)  4.90 lbs/CASE

10. 50 GALS GARY'S GREEN 18-3-4+Iron 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID
(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE

11. 50 GALS SILI-KAL B 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID
(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE

12. 30 GALS ULTRAPLEX 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID
(6 CASES) 5 GALS./CASE

13. 125 GALS POWER C3 2 X 2.5 GALS

(25 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 28.00$          140.00$        

14. 125 GALS CALPHLEX 2 X 2.5 GALS

(25 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 39.00$          195.00$        

15. 50 GALS PROTESYN 2 X 2.5 GALS

(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 45.00$          225.00$        

16. 68.74 LBS BAYLETON 50WSP 34.37 lbs per NO BID
(2 Drums) Drum

Great Lakes Turf, LLC



CITY OF TROY               ITB-COT 09-01
Opening Date -- 02/04/09 BID TABULATION Pg. 11 of 12
Date Prepared - 02/04/09 TURFGRASS CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

VENDOR NAME:

EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
17. 45 gals PK PLUS 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID

(9 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE

18. 6,000 lbs HARRELS TRU-PRILL NO BID
(120 BAGS) 15-2-15 GREENS GRADE FERTILIZER 50 LBS/BAG

19. 21 TONS KELLY'S HIGH 50 LB/Bag NO BID
(840 Bags) CALCIUM LIME REGULAR GRADE 40 bags/Ton

20. 2,000 LBS CASCADE GRANULAR NO BID
(40 BAGS) 50 LBS/BAG

21. 15 GALS TARTAN 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID
(3 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE

22. 40 GALS MILLENNIUM ULTRA 2 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID
(8 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE

23. 220 lbs ALLIETTE/SIGNATURE 2 x 11 lbs NO BID
(10 Cases) 22 lbs/CASE

24. 20 Gals SUBDUE MAXX 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID
(4 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE

25. 60 Gals PERVADE 30 gal

(2 Drums) Drum 33.00$          990.00$        

26. 128 oz ACELEPRYN INSECTICIDE 64 oz / Jug NO BID
(2 Jugs)

27. 30 lbs PROSTAR 10 x 1 lb NO BID
(3 Cases) 10 lbs/CASE

28. 4,000 lbs VERDE-CAL G NO BID
(80 bags) 50 lbs/ BAG

29. 2,000 LBS ANDERSON's 18-9-18 NO BID
(50 Bags) CONTEC DG PRO 40 lbs/ BAG

30. 90 Gallons PK FIGHT 0-0-28 2 X 2.5 GALS

(18 Bags) 5 GALS/CASE 45.00$          225.00$        

31. 360 lbs P-48 30 lb / Pails

(12 Pails) 4.833$          145.00$        

32. 40 gals LESCO-FLO 2 X 2.5 GALS NO BID
(8 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE

33. 60 LBS CLEARY's 3336 6 x 2 lb case NO BID
(5 Cases) 12 lb/Case

Great Lakes Turf, LLC



CITY OF TROY               ITB-COT 09-01
Opening Date -- 02/04/09 BID TABULATION Pg. 12 of 12
Date Prepared - 02/04/09 TURFGRASS CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

VENDOR NAME:

 EST UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

34. 72 lbs DISARM 24 x 1 lb Jug

(3 Cases) 24 lbs / Case

35. 200 gals GLACIER 4F 2 X 2.5 Gals NO BID
(40 Cases) 5 Gal/Case

36. 55 gals QUICK-WATER WETTING AGENT 55 gals NO BID
(1 Drum) Drum

ESTIMATED TOTAL OF AWARDED ITEMS --

MINIMUM SHIPMENT: 1 case
Days after call 2 Days

CONTACT INFORMATION:  Hrs of Oper: M-F  8 AM to 5 PM
    Phone # 586-915-9281

PAYMENT TERMS Net 30 Days

WARRANTY Per Manufacturers

EXCEPTIONS #4  Propensity 1.3 ME and #7 Enforce
75WSB 

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:     Y or N Yes

G:ITB-COT 09-01 Chemicals-Golf Courses

Great Lakes Turf, LLC

19,040.00$                          

Recommend Rejecting Item 34




