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Michigan Inter-governmental Irade Network

tal Trade Neiwork

Response Details From Metropolitan Demolition, LLC

The details for this vendors response are shown below with supporting documents.  glick Here to view this vendors account information.

Solicitation Number: ITB-COT 09-18 Aggregates

Title of Solicitation: Aggregates
Main Contact Name: Mr. Jason Zokoe
Response Submitted By: Tom Perkins

Jason Zokoe

(734) 709 - 5039  metropolitandemo@yahoo.com
3/10/2009 @ 3:30 PM ED.T,

Additienal Information

Authorized 8igher's Name:
Main Contact Phone and Email:
Date and Time Received:
Supporting Documentation:

Line item #1 Qty Quoted uom Unit Cost Extended Cost
1500 TON No Bid No Bid
6A Slag
Specifications: Brand Reguirement: Brand Name or Approved Equal
Manufactqrer: See Specifications
Brand Quoted: No Bid
Comment: N/A Need Alternate Spec. Material
Line itein #2 Qty Quoted uom Unit Cost Extended Cost
3500 TON $13.5000 $47,250.00
22A Gravel
Specifications: Brand Requirement: Brand Name or Approved Equal
Manufacturer: See Specifications
Brand Quoted: Quoting Brand Specified
Commaent:
Line ltem #3 Gity Quoted UORM Unit Cost Extended Cost
300 TON $17.5000 $5,260.00
Pea Gravel
Specifications: Brand Requirement: Brand Name or Approved Equal
Manufacturer: See Specifications
Brand Quoted: Quoting Brand Specified
Comment:
Line ltem #4 City Quoted UQm tinit Cost Extended Cost
200 TON $22.0000 $4,400.00
60/49 Gravel
Specifications: Brand Requirement: Brand Name or Approved Equal
Manufacturer: See Specifications
Brand Quoted: Quoting Brand Specified
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Comment:

Line item #5

Specifications:

Hrand Quoted:

Gomment;

Line ltem #6

Specifications:

Brand Quoted:

Comment:

Line tem #7

Specifications:

Brand Quoted:

Comment;

Line ltem #8

Specifications:

Brand Quoted;

Comment:

Linie ifem #9

Specifications:

Brand Quoted:

Comnient;

Line Mtem #10

Specifications:

Brand Quated:

Comment:

Qty Chuoted

2600
Fill Sand

Brand Requirement: Brard Name or Approved Equal
Manufacturer: Sae Specifications

Queting Brand Specified

(Qty Quoted

200
Crushed Concrete, 1" - 3"

Brand Requirement: Brand Name or Approved Equal
Manufacturer: See Specificaiions

Quoting Brand Specified

Qty Quoted

100
Crushed Concrete, 3" - 6"

Brand Requirement: Brand Name or Approved Equal
Manufacturer: See Specifications

Quoting Brand Specified

Gty Quoted

250
Chloride Sand

Brand Requirement: Brand Name or Approved Equal
Manufacturer: See Specifications

Quoting Brand Specified

Gty Quoted

250
2NS Sand

Brand Regquirement: Brand Name or Approved Equal
Manufacturer: See Specifications

Queting Brand Specified

Gty Guoted

250
Mason Sand

Brand Reguirament: Brand Name or Approved Equal
Manufacturer: See Specifications

Quoting Brand Specified

Unit Cost
$11.0000

Unit Cost
$14.5000

Unit Cost
$17.5000

Unit Cost
$22.5000

Linit Cost
$15.0000

Unit Cost
$15.0000
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Extended Cost
$22,000.00

Extended Cost
$2,900.00

Extended Cost
$1,750.00

Extended Cost
$5,625.00

Extended Cost
$3,750.00

Extended Cost
$3,750.00
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Line ltem #11 Gty Quoted UoM Unit Cost Extended Cost
200 TON $18.0600 $3,600.00
Limestone, 1" - 3"
Specifications; Brand Requirement: Brand Name or Approved Egual
Manufacturer: See Specifications
Brand Quoted: Quoting Brand Specified
Comment;
Ling ltem #12 Oty Quoted UOM Unit Cost Extended Cost
100 TCN $25.0000 $2,500.00
Limestone, 3" - 6"
Speclfications: Brand Requirement: Brand Name or Approved Equal
Manufacturer: See Specifications
Brand Quoted: Quoting Brand Specified
Comment:
Line ltem #13 Gy Quoted UOM Unit Cost Extended Cost
100 TON ’ $25.0000 $2,500.00
Limestone, 4" - 8*
Specifications: Brand Requirement: Brand Name or Approved Equal
Manufacturer; See Specifications
Brand Quoted: Quioting Brand Specified

Comment:

Line ltem #14 Qty Guoted uom Unit Cost Extended Cost
1 EACH No Bid No Bid
Provide Percentage Biscount or Dollar Amount Discount if awarded all items
Specifications: Brand Requirement: Brand Name or Approved Equal
Manufacturer: See Specifications
Brand Quoted: No Bid
Comment:
Total Bid: $105,275.00

Additional Information

Pricing Guarantee: 1 Year
Terms / Discount: Net 30 Days
Warranty: NIA
Delivery / Start Date: ASAP
Price Finm Through: 1 yrw/ 1 yr option
Minimum Order Required? Yes, Minimum order quantity of 50 is required.
Comments/Exceptions:
2
Agency Comments:
:j
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ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

BID TITLE: AGGREGATES
BID MUMBER: (TDH-COT 08-18
Page 1 of 2

NOTE: This form must be included with your bid response

1. Download and save this form.
2. Fillin the appropnate information in all text boxes,
3. Upload this complated form with your online bid response where instructed,

DELIVERY:

Delivery will be within | 44 | hours after a verbal request for material,

Delivery will be to various locations within the Clty of Troy.

CONTACT INFORMATION:

Hours of Operation: [ 89644 ~ ]'gopm |

24 Hr, Phone No: | J84-704-50635 |

COMPANY NAME: [ METAOPAATAN  DEnoLilios, (il |




INSURANCE PAGE Page 1 of1

NOTE: This form must be included with your bid respansé

Download and save this farm.

Check the approprigte box(s} that apply. If your company will charge an additional cost to obtain the required
insurance please inclide this cost in the appropriate feid(s) where Indfcatad,

Complete officer and company naime fields.

Upload this completed form with your online bid response where instrucled.

e

Y

INSURANCE: [nsurance Requirements shall be in accordance with the attached SAMPLE INSURANCE
CERTIFICATE. The required Insurance Certificate must be submitted to Mr. Stephen Cooperrider, Risk
Manager, within (5) five days of a verballelectronic request. The bid cannot be completely awarded without
this Insurance Certificate. The Insurance Certificate may be faxed (248) 526-6128 to the City Offices, and is
the anly hid document accepted in this format.

) We can meet the specified insurance requirements.
[ We cannot meet the specified insurance requirements.

(1 We do not carry the specified limits but can obtain the additional insurance coverage of
3 at the costof §
Note: Please note the amendments on a sample insurance cerificate and attach it to your

bid proposal.

[} Curbidis reduced by §_ if we lower the requiremants to §
Note; Please nuts the amendments on g sampie insurance certificate and attach it to your
bid proposal.

IMPORTANT: A Certificate of Insurance on an ACORD Form showing present coverage or a letter from your
insurance agent or carrier that the insurance to be supplied will meet specifications SHOULD be NOTED.

MNOTE: Failure on the part of any bidder to contact his/her insurance carrier to verify that the insurance carried
by the bidder meets City of Troy specifications may resull in this proposal being completed incorrectly. A
bidder shall complete the above portion that details additional costs that may be incurred for specified’
coverage without purchasing the additional coverage prior to bid proposal submission,

OTHER: Sole proprieters must execute a certificate of exemption from Worker's Compensalion reyuirementy
or provide proof of Worker's Compensation Insurance. All coverage shall be with insurance carriers licensed
and admitted to do business in Michigan and acceptabie to the City of Troy.

INSURANCE VERIFICATION:

Letter Submission:

If not already submitted wWith the bid proposal, the recommended bidder wilt be notified to submit a letter or
certificate of insurance from their insurance agent or carrier indicating that the insurance to be supplied meets
specifications. The City must receive this letter or certificate within & husiness days after verbal/electronic
notification has be delivered to the recommendad bidder, or the bidder will be considered non-responsive and
their bid un-awardable. This process will occur before presentation of the award to the Troy Cily Coungil.

Final insurance GCortificate Submissiomn:
Aftar approval by Troy City Council, the City's Risk Manager wili review the insurance certificates to ensure all
acceptable documents have been received, and allow 5 additional days after verbal / electronic notification to
submit final insurance certificate(s) in accordance with specifications. I not so received, the company will be
considered in default of contract and will be barred from daing business with the City of Troy for a minimum aof
three {3) years for failing to meet insurance requirements.
Tom PEQw®  being duly authorized to execute contracts for vigtzofoviad Pemolihigd Lic

(Print Full Name) (Company Namz)
hareby acknowledges that once accepted by the Risk Manager, the specified insurance certificate for ITB-
COT 09-18 shall remain in full force and effect during the life of the contract,

COMPANY NAME: ____SAET80 Potatan Peine bdiod, L




Cliont#: 52

AIECON

Southfield, Ml 480342067

ACORD. CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE e
PRODUGER ] THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION
ZEvom . e R SR TR
;’fgz‘; Fa'zfgg;""“ (248) 3554417 ALTER THE GOVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DELOW.

Ox e T R

INSURERS AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #

INSURED

Alelil Canstruction Company, inc.
36609 Groesbeck Highway

Ciinton Township, M0 48035

e

A

msurer o Natlonal Fire Insurance Co, Hartford
msurer B, Continental Casuaity Company
msurer o Valley Forge Insurance Company
INGURER 0. ) o
INGURER E:

COVERAGES “em _

THE POLIGIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE SEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURER NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD INDICATED. NOTWITHS TANGING
ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDHTION OF ANY CONTRACT QR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT T0O WHICH THIS CRRTIFIGATE MAY 88 I1SSUED QR

MAY PERTAIN. THE INSLIRANCE AFFORDED 8Y TRE POLICIES DESCRIBED BERFIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS, EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH
POLICIES AGGREGATE LIMITE SHOWHN MAY MAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PDAID CLAIMS

LTk ISR TYPE OF INSURANGE POLICY NUMDCR FOALE or e || DATE (MeRoBet Lwrs
A GENFRAL LIARIITY C4013256378 11/02/08 11/02/05 EAGH OCCURRENDT 51,800,000
X COMMERCIAL GENERAL UARILITY E?,M;: ;‘_AgL;ii&E"I,?E—gagw_(ébfim‘_g} +100,000
[ CLAIMS MADE - GGLUH MED EXI” (Any ane purson) | 35, 000
X | Contractual PERSONAL & ADV INKRY | 91,000,800
X | X, CalU - fUENEl AGtbLALL 152,000,600
GENL AGGREGATE 11T APPLIES FER: FRODULTS - CoMMOR A66 | 52,000,000
] POLICY I X85 % ]i.::lr:
A AUTCMOBILE LIASILITY C4013256358 11’32!‘]8 1 1[(’!7{09 COMBINED SINGLE |IMIT 4. 000.000
H [ ANY AUTO {Eu uceulenl) =y 1
ALL OWNED AUTOS SODILY MIURY 5
SGITOLLTE AITCS {Par prene)
HIRER AUTRS RADILY INJURY 3
K} NON.OWNED AUTOS {Per acciders)
e i PROPERTY DAMAGE
(For acsidenl) - 8
GARAGE LIABILIYY AUTO DMLY - BEA ACOIDENT | 8 i
ANY AUTO CTHER THAN EAACC 1S
7 AUTO OMLY AGG |5
B | EXCESSUMBRELLA LIABILITY Cafi1 3266362 11/02/08 11102108 FACH OUCURRENGE 52,000,080
X loccm | ] CLAMS MADE AGGREGATE 52,000,060
f o $
DUPLCTIBLE $
RETENTICH 5 3
C | WORKERS COMPENSATION AND WE2088150860 12/05/08 11/02/09 x| EWE’XSTM'
EMPLOYERS LIARILITY EACH ACCIOE o1, 000,000
ANY FROFRIETORBARTNEREXECUTIVE S EACH ACCIOENT S
OFFICERMEMBER EXCLUREL? L1 DISEASE . €A eneLoviel 31,000,000
it yns, dissribe under
SPECIAL FREVISIONS below Et. DISEASE - POLICYLIMIT |$1,000,008
aTHER

DESCRIFTION OF QRERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES / EXCLUSIONS ADDEDG BY ENDQRSEMENT ! SPECIAL PROVISIONS
Metropolitan Demolition, LLC is additional insured, per written contract,
with respect to general liability for work parformed.

CERTIFICATE HOLOER -~ -, T CANCELLATION
// e BHOULD ANY OF THE AROVE DESCRIBED POLICIES SE CANCELLED BEFORE THE EXPIRATION
e Metropotitan Demaolition, LLC \ DATE THEREOF, THE 15SUING INSLIRER WILL ENDEAVOR TOIAAIL __3)  DAYS WRITTEN
18277 Merrimen Road NOTICE TO THE CERTIFIGATE HOLDER NAMED TQ THE LEFT, BUT FAILURE TO DO 30 SHALL
Romutus, Ml 48174 1% IMPOSE NO OBLIGATION OR LIABILITY OF ANY KIND UPOR THE INSURER, (TS AGENTE OR
£ REPRESENTATIVES
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE
\ a” \Iq);{;"t?z&!..l . iy 'GL_*._...«-
ACORD 25 (2001084 afd—.____#514844070117205 i MHB ® AGORD CORPORATION 1968



