
 
August 14, 2009 
 
TO:  John Szerlag, City Manager 
 
FROM:  Brian P. Murphy, Assistant City Manager/Economic Development Services 

Susan A. Leirstein, Purchasing Director 
Timothy L. Richnak, Public Works Director 

 
SUBJECT:  Standard Purchasing Resolution 1: Award To Low Bidders – Concrete Pavement Repair  
 
Background 

• On July 29, 2009, bids were received for Concrete Pavement Repair under four proposals: A)- Local 
Roads, B)- Industrial Roads C)- Major Roads,  and D)-Tri Party County Roads with an option to renew 
for two (2) additional one- year periods.  

• 197 vendors were notified via the MITN website.  
• Hard Rock Concrete Inc, Dominic Gaglio Construction Inc, Major Cement Company and Dilisio 

Contracting Inc were the four separate low bidders for each proposal category, A-D respectively.  
• Additional locations may be added based on the scope of work up to, but not exceeding amounts 

budgeted.   
 
Financial Considerations 

• Funds for this project are available in the 2009/10 Capital Accounts for Public Works Construction. 
 

Proposal    Account #          Budget Amount Estimated Total Cost 
    A        401.447.499.7989.500 Local Roads  $2,637,000  $2,056,650 
    B        401.447.479.7989.300 Industrial Roads  $2,000,000  $1,516,150 
    C        401.447.479.7989.500 Major Roads  $1,000,000  $   847,450 
    D        401.447.479.7989.091016 Tri-Party Cty Rd $   600,000  $   563,325 

 
Legal Considerations  

• ITB-COT09-07, Concrete Pavement Repair was competitively bid as required by City Charter and 
Code. 

• The awards are contingent upon the recommended bidders’ submission of proper contracts and bid 
documents, including bonds, insurance certificates and all other specified requirements.  

 
Policy Considerations 

• Moving this work forward would improve public safety and also reduce the liability for the City. (Outcome 
Statement I) 

• Troy adds value to properties through maintenance or upgrades of infrastructure. (Outcome Statement II) 
 
Options 

• City management and the Public Works department recommend contract awards to four separate low 
total bidders, Hard Rock Concrete Inc of Westland, for proposal A, Local Roads; Dominic Gaglio 
Construction Inc, of Southgate, for proposal B, Industrial Roads; Major Cement Company of Detroit, 
MI, for proposal C, Major Roads; and Dilisio Contracting Inc of Clinton Township for proposal D; Tri 
Party County Roads at unit prices contained in the bid tabulation based on scope of work and ability to 
add additional locations up to, but not exceeding amounts budgeted.    

 
Prepared by: Marina Basta-Farouk, Project Construction Manager 

CCIITTYY  CCOOUUNNCCIILL  AACCTTIIOONN  RREEPPOORRTT  
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CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 09-07
Opening Date -- 07/29/09 BID TABULATION Page 1 
Date Prepared -- 07/31/09 jh/sl CONCRETE PAVEMENT REPAIR

VENDOR NAME: Hard Rock Dominic Gaglio Major Cement Dilisio Contracting
 Concrete Inc Construction, Inc. Company Inc.

Ck Number 530033281-3 15254580 343805248 15252566
Ck Amount 10,000.00$        10,000.00$        10,000.00$       10,000.00$          

Proposal A:  Local Road Maintenance Section 5,6,8,10,13,15,19,20, 25 & scattered locations
FY2009/2010 FY2009/2010 FY2009/2010 Year 2009/2010

NO. DESCRIPTION EST. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1 Remove & Replace with Concrete NO BID

9" Non-reinforced- 1,000 S.Y. $33.00 $37.85 $0.00 $37.25
2 Remove & Replace with Concrete

8" Non-reinforced- 5,000 S.Y. $32.00 $36.20 $0.00 $34.50
3 Remove & Replace with Concrete

7" Non-reinforced- 59,000 SY $30.00 $34.00 $0.00 $32.50
4 Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/

Driveway 6" Non-reinforced (Locations not ….. 100 S.F. $4.00 $3.90 $0.00 $4.00
5 Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/

4" Non-reinforced (Locations not specified) 100 S.F. $3.50 $3.85 $0.00 $4.00
6 Gatewell Adjustment 2 Each $150.00 $190.00 $0.00 $125.00
7 Gatewell Repair - Per Foot 4 L.F. $175.00 $100.00 $0.00 $200.00
8 Manhole or Catch Basin  Adjustment 40 each $150.00 $170.00 $0.00 $150.00
9 Manhole or Catch Basin - Repair per Foot 20 L.F. $175.00 $100.00 $0.00 $200.00
10 Misc. Base Repair per CY to excavate/replace

with 21AA Gravel, compacted in place 3,600 C.Y. $9.00 $20.00 $0.00 $18.00
11 Installation of 6" edge drain 200 L.F. $12.00 $9.50 $0.00 $7.00
12 Remove and Replace Curb & Gutter 200 L.F. $18.00 $25.00 $0.00 $20.00
13 Sidewalk Ramp, ADA, Modified w/Inserts 6,000 S.F. $7.00 $6.00 $0.00 $8.00
14 Sidewalk Ramp, Detectable Warning, Retrofit, … 100 S.F. $20.00 $22.00 $0.00 $8.00
15 Restoration Included Included Included Included Included15 Restoration Included Included Included Included Included
16 Traffic Maintenance Included Included Included Included Included

Estimated Total Cost – Proposal A $2,056,650.00 $2,352,305.00 $0.00 $2,258,100.00

Proposal B: Industrial Road Maintenance - Lakeview, Golfview, Wilshire, Souter, Investment, Troy Center, Tower, Rankin,

Chicago & Scattered Locations
Year 2009/2010 Year 2009/2010 Year 2009/2010 Year 2009/2010

NO. DESCRIPTION EST. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

1 Remove & Replace with Concrete NO BID
9" Non-reinforced- 38,000 SY $42.50 $38.00 $0.00 $41.50

2 Remove & Replace with Concrete
8" Non-reinforced- 200 S.Y. $42.00 $38.00 $0.00 $44.00

3 Remove & Replace with Concrete
7" Non-reinforced- 200 S.Y. $40.00 $34.00 $0.00 $43.00

4 Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/
Driveway 6" Non-reinforced (Locations not ….. 100 S.F. $4.50 $3.90 $0.00 $4.00

5 Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/
4" Non-reinforced (Locations not specified) 100 S.F. $4.00 $3.80 $0.00 $4.00

6 Gatewell Adjustment 2 Each $150.00 $190.00 $0.00 $125.00
7 Gatewell Repair - Per Foot 4 L.F. $175.00 $100.00 $0.00 $200.00
8 Manhole or Catch Basin  Adjustment 25 each $175.00 $170.00 $0.00 $150.00
9 Manhole or Catch Basin - Repair per Foot 20 L.F. $150.00 $100.00 $0.00 $200.00
10 Misc. Base Repair per CY to excavate/replace

with 21AA Gravel, compacted in place 2,000 C.Y. $9.00 $20.00 $0.00 $18.00
11 Installation of 6" edge drain 100 L.F. $12.00 $9.50 $0.00 $7.00
12 Remove and Replace Curb & Gutter 200 L.F. $18.00 $25.00 $0.00 $20.00
13 Sidewalk Ramp, ADA, Modified w/Inserts 300 S.F. $7.00 $6.00 $0.00 $8.00
14 Sidewalk Ramp, Detectable Warning, Retrofit, … 100 S.F. $20.00 $22.00 $0.00 $8.00
15 Restoration Included Included Included Included Included
16 Traffic Maintenance Included Included Included Included Included

E i d T l C   P l BEstimated Total Cost – Proposal B $1,667,525.00 $1,516,150.00 $0.00 $1,647,900.00



CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 09-07
Opening Date -- 07/29/09 BID TABULATION Page 2 
Date Prepared -- 07/31/09 CONCRETE PAVEMENT REPAIR

VENDOR NAME: Hard Rock Dominic Gaglio Major Cement Dilisio Contracting
Concrete, Inc. Construction, Inc. Company Inc.

 
Proposal C: Major Road Maintenance - Rochester Road, Coolidge, and scattered locations
NO. DESCRIPTION EST. QTY.  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE
1 Remove & Replace with Concrete NO BID NO BID

9" Non-reinforced- 6 Sac 18,600 SY $0.00 $0.00 $43.50 $44.90
2 Remove & Replace with Concrete

8" Non-reinforced- 200 S.Y. $0.00 $0.00 $37.00 $47.90
3 Remove & Replace with Concrete

7" Non-reinforced- 200 S.Y. $0.00 $0.00 $35.00 $46.90
4 Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/

Driveway 6" Non-reinforced (Locations not ….. 200 S.F. $0.00 $0.00 $5.00 $4.00
5 Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/

4" Non-reinforced (Locations not specified) 100 S.F. $0.00 $0.00 $4.00 $4.00
6 Gatewell Adjustment 1 Each $0.00 $0.00 $250.00 $125.00
7 Gatewell Repair - Per Foot 2 L.F. $0.00 $0.00 $125.00 $200.00
8 Manhole or Catch Basin  Adjustment 2 each $0.00 $0.00 $250.00 $150.00
9 Manhole or Catch Basin - Repair per Foot 2 L.F. $0.00 $0.00 $125.00 $200.00
10 Misc. Base Repair per CY to excavate/replace

with 21AA Gravel, compacted in place 1,000 C.Y. $0.00 $0.00 $15.00 $1.00
11 Installation of 6" edge drain 100 L.F. $0.00 $0.00 $8.00 $7.00
12 Remove and Replace Curb & Gutter 100 L.F. $0.00 $0.00 $15.00 $20.00
13 Sidewalk Ramp, ADA, Modified w/Inserts 300 S.F. $0.00 $0.00 $10.00 $8.00
14 Sidewalk Ramp, Detectable Warning, Retrofit, … 100 S.F. $0.00 $0.00 $10.00 $8.00
15 Restoration Included Included Included Included Included
16 Traffic Maintenance Included Included Included Included Included

Estimated Total Cost – Proposal C $0.00 $0.00 $847,450.00 $863,425.00$0.00 $0.00 $847,450.00 $863,425.00

Proposal D: Tri Party Concrete Repair - Big Beaver, Dequindre, John R, Crooks, Long Lake, Livernois & scattered locations
NO. DESCRIPTION EST. QTY.  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE
1 Remove & Replace with Concrete NO BID NO BID

10" Non-reinforced- 10,000 SY $0.00 $0.00 $48.00 $45.90
2 Remove & Replace with Concrete

9" Non-reinforced- 1,000 S.Y. $0.00 $0.00 $43.50 $48.90
3 Remove & Replace with Concrete

8" Non-reinforced- 500 S.Y. $0.00 $0.00 $37.00 $47.90
4 Remove & Replace with Concrete

7" Non-reinforced- 500 S.Y. $0.00 $0.00 $35.00 $46.90
Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/

5 Driveway 6" Non-reinforced (Locations not ….. 50 S.F. $0.00 $0.00 $5.00 $4.00
Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/

6 4" Non-reinforced (Locations not specified) 50 S.F. $0.00 $0.00 $4.00 $4.00
7 Gatewell Adjustment 1 Each $0.00 $0.00 $250.00 $125.00
8 Gatewell Repair - Per Foot 2 L.F. $0.00 $0.00 $125.00 $200.00
9 Manhole or Catch Basin  Adjustment 2 each $0.00 $0.00 $250.00 $150.00
10 Manhole or Catch Basin - Repair per Foot 2 L.F. $0.00 $0.00 $125.00 $200.00

Misc. Base Repair per CY to excavate/replace
11 with 21AA Gravel, compacted in place 500 C.Y. $0.00 $0.00 $15.00 $1.00
12 Installation of 6" edge drain 100 L.F. $0.00 $0.00 $8.00 $7.00
13 Remove and Replace Curb & Gutter 100 L.F. $0.00 $0.00 $25.00 $20.00
14 Sidewalk Ramp, ADA, Modified w/Inserts 300 S.F. $0.00 $0.00 $10.00 $8.00
15 Sidewalk Ramp, Detectable Warning, Retrofit, … 100 S.F. $0.00 $0.00 $9.00 $8.00
16 Restoration Included Included Included Included Included
17 Traffic Maintenance Included Included Included Included Included

Estimated Total Cost – Proposal D $0.00 $0.00 $575,900.00 $563,325.00



CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 09-07
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VENDOR NAME: Hard Rock Dominic Gaglio Major Cement Dilisio Contracting
 Concrete, Inc. Construction, Inc. Company Inc.

Every 2 Weeks
PROGRESS PAYMENTS: Bi-Weekly or once a month Every 2 Weeks Monthly

M-Sat
CONTACT INFORMATION Hrs of Oper. 8 AM to 8 PM 7 AM to 6 PM 7 AM to 5 PM 9 AM to 5 PM

Phone (734) 564-0925 (734) 216-2051 (248) 388-1168 (586) 405-4578

AWARD                       100% of Contract
                                                   Partial Contract: Proposal A X X

Proposal B X X X
Proposal C X X
Proposal D X X

X
COMPLETION SCHEDULE:

INSURANCE:                      Can Meet XX XX XX XX
                                         Cannot Meet

PAYMENT TERMS: Bi-Weekly Once a Month 2 Weeks Monthly

WARRANTY: As in Contract 1 year 1 year 1 year

EXCEPTIONS: Blank N/A Blank N/A

BY JUNE 30th OF ANY CONTRACT YEAR

ACKNOWLEGEMENT: Y or N Yes Yes Yes Yes

VENDOR QUESTIONNAIRE Y or N Yes Yes Yes Yes

FORMS:                 Legal Staus of Bidder Y or N Yes Yes Yes Yes
Non-Collusion Affidavit Y or N Yes Yes Yes Yes

Addenda #1 & #2 Y or N No Yes No Yes

PROPOSAL: City of Troy Concrete Pavement Repair Program for Local,
Major, Industrial Roads with an Option to Renew for Two (2) Additional 
One-Year Periods.

ATTEST:
Marina Basta Farouk HIGHLIGHTED AREAS DENOTES LOW TOTAL BIDDERS BY PROPOSAL
Debra Painter
Tom Rosewarne
Linda Bockstanz

Susan Leirstein CPPB
Purchasing Director

G: ITB-COT 09-07 Concrete Pavement Repair



CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 09-07
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  Lacaria Concrete &
VENDOR NAME: Florence Major Cement Giorgi Concrete   Audia Construction

 Cement Co Paving L.L.C. Companies
#0180543 - $5,000

Ck Number 343813467 343805249 100438 #15247757 - $5,000
Ck Amount 10,000.00$      10,000.00$      10,000.00$       10,000.00$          

Proposal A:  Local Road Maintenance Section 5,6,8,10,13,15,19,20,25 & scattered locations
FY2009/2010 FY2009/2010 FY2009/2010 Year 2009/2010

NO. DESCRIPTION EST. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1 Remove & Replace with Concrete

9" Non-reinforced- 1,000 S.Y. $40.40 $45.00 $44.00 $43.66
2 Remove & Replace with Concrete

8" Non-reinforced- 5,000 S.Y. $36.60 $37.00 $39.00 $41.10
3 Remove & Replace with Concrete

7" Non-reinforced- 59,000 SY $32.95 $33.00 $35.50 $38.20
4 Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/

Driveway 6" Non-reinforced (Locations not …..) 100 S.F. $3.75 $5.00 $4.11 $11.00
5 Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/

4" Non-reinforced (Locations not specified) 100 S.F. $3.45 $4.00 $4.11 $10.00
6 Gatewell Adjustment 2 Each $190.00 $250.00 $250.00 $500.00
7 Gatewell Repair - Per Foot 4 L.F. $220.00 $125.00 $250.00 $250.00
8 Manhole or Catch Basin  Adjustment 40 each $215.00 $200.00 $250.00 $195.00
9 Manhole or Catch Basin - Repair per Foot 20 L.F. $230.00 $125.00 $250.00 $150.00
10 Misc. Base Repair per CY to excavate/replace

with 21AA Gravel, compacted in place 3,600 C.Y. $12.00 $24.00 $20.00 $19.00
11 Installation of 6" edge drain 200 L.F. $12.00 $12.00 $10.00 $18.00
12 Remove and Replace Curb & Gutter 200 L.F. $19.30 $15.00 $20.00 $25.00
13 Sidewalk Ramp, ADA, Modified w/Inserts 6,000 S.F. $6.30 $9.50 $13.00 $7.00
14 Sidewalk Ramp  Detectable Warning  Retrofit  100 S F $16 80 $10 00 $30 00 $20 0014 Sidewalk Ramp, Detectable Warning, Retrofit, … 100 S.F. $16.80 $10.00 $30.00 $20.00
15 Restoration Included Included Included Included Included

16 Traffic Maintenance Included Included Included Included Included
Estimated Total Cost – Proposal A

$2,271,570.00 $2,339,200.00 $2,509,822.00 $2,638,860.00

Proposal B: Industrial Road Maintenance - Lakeview, Golfview, Wilshire, Souter, Investment, Troy Center, Tower, Rankin,
Chicago & Scattered Locations

Year 2009/2010 Year 2009/2010 Year 2009/2010 Year 2009/2010
NO. DESCRIPTION EST. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1 Remove & Replace with Concrete NO BID

9" Non-reinforced- 38,000 SY $41.10 $39.00 $0.00 $45.66
2 Remove & Replace with Concrete

8" Non-reinforced- 200 S.Y. $38.25 $37.00 $0.00 $44.66
3 Remove & Replace with Concrete

7" Non-reinforced- 200 S.Y. $35.65 $35.00 $0.00 $44.41
4 Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/

Driveway 6" Non-reinforced (Locations not …..) 100 S.F. $3.75 $5.00 $0.00 $11.00
5 Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/

4" Non-reinforced (Locations not specified) 100 S.F. $3.45 $4.00 $0.00 $10.00
6 Gatewell Adjustment 2 Each $190.00 $250.00 $0.00 $500.00
7 Gatewell Repair - Per Foot 4 L.F. $220.00 $100.00 $0.00 $250.00
8 Manhole or Catch Basin  Adjustment 25 each $215.00 $175.00 $0.00 $195.00
9 Manhole or Catch Basin - Repair per Foot 20 L.F. $230.00 $100.00 $0.00 $150.00
10 Misc. Base Repair per CY to excavate/replace

with 21AA Gravel, compacted in place 2,000 C.Y. $12.00 $15.00 $0.00 $19.00
11 Installation of 6" edge drain 100 L.F. $12.00 $10.00 $0.00 $18.00
12 Remove and Replace Curb & Gutter 200 L.F. $19.30 $15.00 $0.00 $25.00
13 Sidewalk Ramp, ADA, Modified w/Inserts 300 S.F. $6.30 $10.00 $0.00 $7.50
14 Sidewalk Ramp, Detectable Warning, Retrofit, … 100 S.F. $16.80 $5.00 $0.00 $20.00
15 Restoration Included Included Included Included Included
16 Traffic Maintenance Included Included Included Included Included16 Traffic Maintenance Included Included Included Included Included

Estimated Total Cost – Proposal B $1,621,165.00 $1,542,075.00 $0.00 $1,813,919.00
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VENDOR NAME: Florence Major Cement Giorgi Concrete Lacaria Concrete &
Cement Co Paving L.L.C.   Audia Construction

 Companies

Proposal C: Major Road Maintenance - Rochester Road, Coolidge, and scattered locations
NO. DESCRIPTION EST. QTY.  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE

1 Remove & Replace with Concrete NO BID NO BID
9" Non-reinforced- 18,600 SY $45.95 $0.00 $0.00 $51.50

2 Remove & Replace with Concrete
8" Non-reinforced- 200 S.Y. $38.00 $0.00 $0.00 $49.75

3 Remove & Replace with Concrete
7" Non-reinforced- 200 S.Y. $36.00 $0.00 $0.00 $48.25

4 Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/
Driveway 6" Non-reinforced (Locations not …..) 200 S.F. $3.75 $0.00 $0.00 $11.00

5 Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/

4" Non-reinforced (Locations not specified) 100 S.F. $3.45 $0.00 $0.00 $10.00
6 Gatewell Adjustment 1 Each $190.00 $0.00 $0.00 $500.00
7 Gatewell Repair - Per Foot 2 L.F. $220.00 $0.00 $0.00 $250.00
8 Manhole or Catch Basin  Adjustment 2 each $215.00 $0.00 $0.00 $500.00
9 Manhole or Catch Basin - Repair per Foot 2 L.F. $230.00 $0.00 $0.00 $200.00
10 Misc. Base Repair per CY to excavate/replace

with 21AA Gravel, compacted in place 1,000 C.Y. $12.00 $0.00 $0.00 $19.00
11 Installation of 6" edge drain 100 L.F. $12.00 $0.00 $0.00 $18.00
12 Remove and Replace Curb & Gutter 100 L.F. $19.30 $0.00 $0.00 $25.00
13 Sidewalk Ramp, ADA, Modified w/Inserts 300 S.F. $6.30 $0.00 $0.00 $7.50
14 Sidewalk Ramp, Detectable Warning, Retrofit, … 100 S.F. $16.80 $0.00 $0.00 $20.00
15 Restoration Included Included Included Included Included
16 Traffic Maintenance Included Included Included Included Included

Estimated Total Cost – Proposal C $890,785.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,010,650.00p $890,785.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,010,650.00

Proposal D: Tri Party Concrete Repair - Big Beaver, Dequindre, John R, Crooks, Long Lake, Livernois & scattered locations
NO. DESCRIPTION EST. QTY.  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE
1 Remove & Replace with Concrete NO BID NO BID

10" Non-reinforced- 10,000 SY $52.90 $0.00 $0.00 $57.75
2 Remove & Replace with Concrete

9" Non-reinforced- 1,000 S.Y. $49.05 $0.00 $0.00 $56.00
3 Remove & Replace with Concrete

8" Non-reinforced- 500 S.Y. $38.00 $0.00 $0.00 $54.75
4 Remove & Replace with Concrete

7" Non-reinforced- 500 SY. $36.00 $0.00 $0.00 $52.75
Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/

5 Driveway 6" Non-reinforced (Locations not …..) 50 S.F. $3.75 $0.00 $0.00 $11.00
Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/

6 4" Non-reinforced (Locations not specified) 50 S.F. $3.45 $0.00 $0.00 $10.00
7 Gatewell Adjustment 1 Each $190.00 $0.00 $0.00 $500.00
8 Gatewell Repair - Per Foot 2 L.F. $220.00 $0.00 $0.00 $200.00
9 Manhole or Catch Basin  Adjustment 2 each $215.00 $0.00 $0.00 $500.00
10 Manhole or Catch Basin - Repair per Foot 2 L.F. $230.00 $0.00 $0.00 $200.00

Misc. Base Repair per CY to excavate/replace
11 with 21AA Gravel, compacted in place 500 C.Y. $12.00 $0.00 $0.00 $25.00
12 Installation of 6" edge drain 100 L.F. $12.00 $0.00 $0.00 $20.00
13 Remove and Replace Curb & Gutter 100 L.F. $19.30 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00
14 Sidewalk Ramp, ADA, Modified w/Inserts 300 S.F. $6.30 $0.00 $0.00 $10.00
15 Sidewalk Ramp, Detectable Warning, Retrofit, … 100 S.F. $16.80 $0.00 $0.00 $20.00
16 Restoration Included Included Included Included Included
17 Traffic Maintenance Included Included Included Included Included

Estimated Total Cost – Proposal D $629,630.00 $0.00 $0.00 $713,000.00



CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 09-07
Opening Date -- 07/29/08 BID TABULATION Page 6
Date Prepared -- 07/31/09 CONCRETE PAVEMENT REPAIR

Lacaria Concrete &
VENDOR NAME: Florence Major Cement Giorgi Concrete   Audia Construction

 Cement Co Paving L.L.C. Companies

PROGRESS PAYMENTS: Bi-Weekly Every 2 Weeks Every 30 Days Monthly

CONTACT INFORMATION Hrs of Oper. Per City Ordinance 7 AM to 5 PM 7 AM to 5 PM 7 AM to 7 PM
Phone (810) 560-4141 (248) 207-7819 (313) 300-3599 (313) 218-6834

AWARD                       100% of Contract X X
                                                    Partial Contract: Proposal A X X

Proposal B X
Proposal C
Proposal D

COMPLETION SCHEDULE:

INSURANCE:                      Can Meet XX XX XX XX
                                         Cannot Meet

PAYMENT TERMS: Bi-Weekly 2 Weeks Every 30 Days Monthly
Mtnce Bond

WARRANTY: 1 year 1 year 1 year Blank

EXCEPTIONS: None Blank Blank None

BY JUNE 30th OF ANY CONTRACT YEAR

ACKNOWLEGEMENT: Y or N Yes Yes Yes Yes

VENDOR QUESTIONNAIRE Y or N Yes Yes Yes Yes

FORMS:                  Legal Status of Bidder Y or N Yes Yes Yes Yes
Non-Collusion Affidavit Y or N Yes Yes Yes Yes

Addenda #1 & #2 Y or N No No No Yes

G: ITB-COT 09-07 Concrete Pavement Repair
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VENDOR NAME: Tony Angelo Cement Walter Toebe Hartwell Cement Angelo Iafrate
 Construction Co Construction  Co Co Construction Co

Ck Number 1542500 9244200729 343805333 9227002917
Ck Amount 10,000.00$         10,000.00$         10,000.00$        10,000.00$          

Proposal A:  Local Road Maintenance Section 5,6,8,10,13,15,19,20,25 & scattered locations
Year 2009/2010 Year 2009/2010 Year 2009/2010 Year 2009/2010

NO. DESCRIPTION EST. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

1 Remove & Replace with Concrete
9" Non-reinforced- 1,000 S.Y. $56.00 $47.12 $48.95 $62.80

2 Remove & Replace with Concrete
8" Non-reinforced- 5,000 S.Y. $50.00 $46.37 $47.10 $60.30

3 Remove & Replace with Concrete
7" Non-reinforced- 59,000 SY $41.29 $45.87 $46.25 $50.25

4 Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/
Driveway 6" Non-reinforced (Locations not …..) 100 S.F. $4.90 $5.20 $7.25 $8.80

5 Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/
4" Non-reinforced (Locations not specified) 100 S.F. $4.40 $7.04 $6.25 $8.80

6 Gatewell Adjustment 2 Each $337.00 $176.05 $200.00 $430.00
7 Gatewell Repair - Per Foot 4 L.F. $337.00 $176.05 $200.00 $190.00
8 Manhole or Catch Basin  Adjustment 40 each $337.00 $176.05 $125.00 $320.00
9 Manhole or Catch Basin - Repair per Foot 20 L.F. $337.00 $283.64 $125.00 $143.00
10 Misc. Base Repair per CY to excavate/replace

with 21AA Gravel, compacted in place 3,600 C.Y. $44.00 $15.00 $5.00 $18.00
11 Installation of 6" edge drain 200 L.F. $11.85 $9.34 $12.00 $12.10
12 Remove and Replace Curb & Gutter 200 L.F. $19.00 $21.46 $28.00 $25.20
13 Sidewalk Ramp, ADA, Modified w/Inserts 6,000 S.F. $14.15 $6.27 $16.00 $8.70
14 Sidewalk Ramp  Detectable Warning  Retrofit  100 S F $22 75 $31 58 $30 00 $24 1014 Sidewalk Ramp, Detectable Warning, Retrofit, … 100 S.F. $22.75 $31.58 $30.00 $24.10
15 Restoration Included Included Included Included Included
16 Traffic Maintenance Included Included Included Included Included

Estimated Total Cost – Proposal A $3,017,027.00 $3,101,233.10 $3,148,250.00 $3,474,960.00

Proposal B: Industrial Road Maintenance - Lakeview, Golfview, Wilshire, Souter, Investment, Troy Center, Tower, Rankin,
Chicago & Scattered Locations

Year 2009/2010 Year 2009/2010 Year 2009/2010 Year 2009/2010
NO. DESCRIPTION EST. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1 Remove & Replace with Concrete

9" Non-reinforced- 38,000 SY $53.00 $47.45 $50.95 $55.00
2 Remove & Replace with Concrete

8" Non-reinforced- 200 S.Y. $52.00 $39.13 $47.10 $70.10
3 Remove & Replace with Concrete

7" Non-reinforced- 200 S.Y. $51.55 $37.39 $46.25 $64.40
4 Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/

Driveway 6" Non-reinforced (Locations not …..) 100 S.F. $4.90 $5.27 $7.25 $8.80
5 Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/

4" Non-reinforced (Locations not specified) 100 S.F. $4.40 $4.84 $6.25 $8.80
6 Gatewell Adjustment 2 Each $337.00 $170.80 $200.00 $430.00
7 Gatewell Repair - Per Foot 4 L.F. $337.00 $170.80 $200.00 $190.00
8 Manhole or Catch Basin  Adjustment 25 each $337.00 $170.80 $125.00 $320.00
9 Manhole or Catch Basin - Repair per Foot 20 L.F. $337.00 $273.14 $125.00 $143.00
10 Misc. Base Repair per CY to excavate/replace

with 21AA Gravel, compacted in place 2,000 C.Y. $44.05 $15.00 $5.00 $18.00
11 Installation of 6" edge drain 100 L.F. $11.85 $9.28 $12.00 $12.10
12 Remove and Replace Curb & Gutter 200 L.F. $28.10 $20.44 $28.00 $25.20
13 Sidewalk Ramp, ADA, Modified w/Inserts 300 S.F. $14.20 $6.30 $16.00 $8.20
14 Sidewalk Ramp, Detectable Warning, Retrofit, … 100 S.F. $22.75 $31.69 $30.00 $24.10
15 Restoration Included Included Included Included Included
16 Traffic Maintenance Included Included Included Included Included16 Traffic Maintenance Included Included Included Included Included

Estimated Total Cost – Proposal B $2,154,267.00 $1,870,247.60 $1,987,545.00 $2,178,260.00
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VENDOR NAME: Tony Angelo Cement Walter Toebe Hartwell Cement Angelo Iafrate
Construction Co Construction Company Construction Co

 Co
Proposal C: Major Road Maintenance - Rochester Road, Coolidge, and scattered locations
NO. DESCRIPTION EST. QTY.  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE

1 Remove & Replace with Concrete NO BID
9" Non-reinforced- 18,600 SY $50.40 $51.06 $0.00 $62.20

2 Remove & Replace with Concrete
8" Non-reinforced- 200 S.Y. $47.90 $39.00 $0.00 $69.80

3 Remove & Replace with Concrete
7" Non-reinforced- 200 S.Y. $43.05 $38.82 $0.00 $57.90

4 Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/
Driveway 6" Non-reinforced (Locations not …..) 200 S.F. $4.60 $5.50 $0.00 $8.80

5 Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/

4" Non-reinforced (Locations not specified) 100 S.F. $4.25 $5.11 $0.00 $8.80
6 Gatewell Adjustment 1 Each $271.00 $176.05 $0.00 $430.00
7 Gatewell Repair - Per Foot 2 L.F. $271.00 $176.05 $0.00 $190.00
8 Manhole or Catch Basin  Adjustment 2 each $271.00 $176.05 $0.00 $320.00
9 Manhole or Catch Basin - Repair per Foot 2 L.F. $271.00 $283.64 $0.00 $143.00
10 Misc. Base Repair per CY to excavate/replace

with 21AA Gravel, compacted in place 1,000 C.Y. $31.00 $15.00 $0.00 $18.00
11 Installation of 6" edge drain 100 L.F. $11.85 $9.55 $0.00 $12.10
12 Remove and Replace Curb & Gutter 100 L.F. $18.40 $21.26 $0.00 $25.20
13 Sidewalk Ramp, ADA, Modified w/Inserts 300 S.F. $13.75 $6.46 $0.00 $8.50
14 Sidewalk Ramp, Detectable Warning, Retrofit, … 100 S.F. $21.90 $31.81 $0.00 $24.80
15 Restoration Included Included Included Included Included
16 Traffic Maintenance Included Included Included Included Included

Estimated Total Cost – Proposal C $999,212.00 $991,538.53 $0.00 $1,213,596.00$999,212.00 $991,538.53 $0.00 $1,213,596.00

Proposal D: Tri Party Concrete Repair - Big Beaver, Dequindre, John R, Crooks, Long Lake, Livernois & scattered locations
NO. DESCRIPTION EST. QTY.  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE  UNIT PRICE
1 Remove & Replace with Concrete NO BID

10" Non-reinforced- 10,000 SY $55.20 $58.50 $0.00 $64.90
2 Remove & Replace with Concrete

9" Non-reinforced- 1,000 S.Y. $52.00 $48.95 $0.00 $65.80
3 Remove & Replace with Concrete

8" Non-reinforced- 500 S.Y. $51.00 $44.50 $0.00 $69.30
4 Remove & Replace with Concrete

7" Non-reinforced- 500 S.Y. $50.00 $42.18 $0.00 $58.90
Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/

5 Driveway 6" Non-reinforced (Locations not …..) 50 S.F. $7.95 $5.56 $0.00 $8.80
Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/

6 4" Non-reinforced (Locations not specified) 50 S.F. $4.55 $5.15 $0.00 $8.80
7 Gatewell Adjustment 1 Each $268.40 $179.90 $0.00 $430.00
8 Gatewell Repair - Per Foot 2 L.F. $268.40 $179.91 $0.00 $190.00
9 Manhole or Catch Basin  Adjustment 2 each $268.40 $179.91 $0.00 $320.00
10 Manhole or Catch Basin - Repair per Foot 2 L.F. $288.25 $291.35 $0.00 $143.00

Misc. Base Repair per CY to excavate/replace
11 with 21AA Gravel, compacted in place 500 C.Y. $32.00 $15.00 $0.00 $18.00
12 Installation of 6" edge drain 100 L.F. $11.85 $9.76 $0.00 $12.10
13 Remove and Replace Curb & Gutter 100 L.F. $22.40 $21.52 $0.00 $25.20
14 Sidewalk Ramp, ADA, Modified w/Inserts 300 S.F. $13.70 $6.47 $0.00 $10.10
15 Sidewalk Ramp, Detectable Warning, Retrofit, … 100 S.F. $21.09 $31.84 $0.00 $24.10
16 Restoration Included Included Included Included Included
17 Traffic Maintenance Included Included Included Included Included

Estimated Total Cost – Proposal D $682,687.50 $695,060.74 $0.00 $799,686.00
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VENDOR NAME: Tony Angelo Cement Walter Toebe Hartwell Cement Angelo Iafrate
 Construction Co Construction  Co Co Construction Co

PROGRESS PAYMENTS: Bi-Weekly Bi-Weekly Monthly Payments Per Specification

CONTACT INFORMATION Hrs of Oper. 7 AM to 8 PM Dennady Bilzon 7 AM to 6 PM 7 AM to 6 PM
Phone (248) 756-1168 (248) 640-0018 (248) 789-4156 (586) 756-1070

AWARD                       100% of Contract X X
                                                    Partial Contract: Proposal A X X

Proposal B X X
Proposal C X
Proposal D X

COMPLETION SCHEDULE:

INSURANCE:                      Can Meet XX XX XX XX
                                         Cannot Meet

PAYMENT TERMS: Net 10 Days Blank Monthly Per Specification

WARRANTY: Maintenance Bond Blank 1 year 1 year

EXCEPTIONS: Blank Blank Blank Will accept Proposal 

A & B together/Separately

Will not accept Proposal

C & D Seperately

BY JUNE 30th OF ANY CONTRACT YEAR

p y

ACKNOWLEGEMENT: Y or N Yes Yes Yes Yes

VENDOR QUESTIONNAIRE Y or N Yes Yes Yes Yes

FORMS:                 Legal Status of Bidder Y or N Yes Yes Yes Yes
Non-Collusion Affidavit Y or N Yes Yes Yes Yes

Addenda #1 & #2 Y or N Yes No No No

G: ITB-COT 09-07 Concrete Pavement Repair
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