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March 26, 2010 
 
 
TO:     John Szerlag, City Manager 
 
FROM:   John M. Lamerato, Assistant City Manager/Finance & Administration 
    Susan A. Leirstein, Purchasing Director 
    Carol K. Anderson, Parks and Recreation Director 
 
SUBJECT:   Standard Purchasing Resolution 2: Bid Award – Lowest Bidders Meeting  
    Specifications – Turfgrass Chemical Products for Sylvan Glen and  
    Sanctuary Lake Golf Courses 
 
 
Background 

 On March 4, 2010, bids were received and opened for IBT-COT 10-09 to provide seasonal 
requirements of turfgrass chemicals and fertilizers for Sylvan Glen and Sanctuary Lake Golf 
Courses. 

 56 vendors were notified via the MITN system with eight (8) bid responses received. 
 Serious consideration was given to all vendors on all items due to the fact that some chemicals 

are now coming off patent. 
 All bids received for Items #12, #16 and #20 had identical agency pricing and terms. All items 

are being recommended to Harrell’s LLC on minimum shipment and delivery terms. 
 Tri-Turf Inc. and Turfgrass Inc. bid alternates on Items #3 and #8, which do not contain the 

total micro-nutrient package as specified. 
 Tri-Turf Inc. bid alternates on Items #6 and #17, which do not contain the proprietary Stress 

Guard pigment which positively affects turf physiology. 
 Helena Chemical Co. and Turfgrass Inc. bid alternates on Item #7; and Turfgrass Inc bid an 

alternate on Item #23, both products are not labeled for use on turfgrass. 
 Turfgrass Inc. bid alternates on Items #9 and #27, which do not contain the proprietary Carbon 

Technology essential for nutrient uptake. 
 John Deere Landscapes, Tri-Turf Inc. and Turfgrass Inc. all bid alternates on Item #10, which 

do not contain multiple calcium chelates and contain less actual calcium needed for residual 
and sodium flushing throughout the growing season. 

 Helena Chemical Co. bid an alternate on Item #11, which does not contain all twenty three 
amino acids and carbohydrates needed for healthy plant growth. 

 Tri-Turf Inc., John Deere Landscapes and Turfgrass Inc. bid alternates on Item #13, which do 
not contain the micro-nutrient package and less than half of water soluble nitrogen as 
specified. 
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March 26, 2010 
 
To: John Szerlag, City Manager 
Re: Bid Award – Lowest Bidders Meeting Specifications – Turfgrass Chemical Products 
 
Background 
 Helena Chemical Co., Tri-Turf Inc. and Harrell’s LLC bid alternates on Item #15. Helena 

Chemical Company’s product must be applied monthly which will require three times the 
amount of product at three times the price. Tri-Turf Inc. and Harrell’s LLC products must be 
applied twice per year (double the cost). Product specified in bid is a one time per season 
product. 

 Turfgrass Inc., John Deere Landscapes, Harrell’s LLC and Helena Chemical Company bid 
alternates on Item #19. Turfgrass Inc. and John Deere Landscapes products have an 
opposite mode of action which retains moisture rather than lets the moisture penetrate 
through the soil profile. Harrell’s LLC and Helena Chemical Company’s product contain 50-
60% less active ingredient which would require three to five times the amount of product per 
application. 

 Helena Chemical Company and Agrium Advanced Technologies had identical bids on Item 
#21. The item will be awarded to both vendors. 

 Helena Chemical Co., John Deere Landscapes, Tri-Turf Inc., Harrell’s LLC and Turfgrass Inc. 
bid alternates on Item #22. Helena Chemical Company’s product is not labeled for use in 
Michigan. John Deere Landscape’s product contains only 18% phosphites, considerably less 
than the product specified. Tri-Turf Inc. and Turfgrass Inc. bid products containing potassium 
hydroxide, which must be applied at a much higher spray volume not compatible with foliar 
feeding.  

 Turfgrass Inc. bid an alternate for Item #32. Mutech SOP 1%, which is only a ten-week 
product, not sixteen weeks as specified. 
 

Financial Considerations 
 
 The department has funds budgeted in the Sylvan Glen Seed/Planting Supplies account 

#785.7740.100 and the Sanctuary Lake Seed/Planting Supplies account #885.7740.100. 
 
 
Legal Considerations 
 
 ITB-COT 10-09 to furnish seasonal requirements of chemicals for Sylvan Glen and Sanctuary 

Lake Golf Courses was competitively bid as required by City Charter and Code. 
 

Policy Considerations 
 
 Vendors were required to submit product information on all alternates in order to assist in the 

recommendation process. Based on this, the City was able to accept ten generic products, and 
nine low bids out of thirty two items at a considerable cost savings of $19,074.79 over last 
season’s estimated costs.  

 Communicate with educators and vendors on newer cost effective chemistries and products 
for the future.  
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March 26, 2010 
 
To: John Szerlag, City Manager 
Re: Bid Award – Lowest Bidders Meeting Specifications – Turfgrass Chemical Products 

 
Recommendation 
 
 City management recommends awarding the seasonal requirements of chemicals for Sylvan 

Glen and Sanctuary Lake Golf Courses to the following low bidders meeting specifications for 
an estimated total cost of $144,603.92 at unit prices contained in the bid tabulation. 

 
 
Tri-Turf Inc., Farmington Hills, Michigan 
 
Item 
No. 

Product Description Estimated Quantity Case Price Estimated Cost

1. Iprodione Pro SE 
Alternate: Armor Tech 
IP233 

25 Gallons- 5 Cases $244.00 $1,220.00

4.  Banner Max 
Alternate: Armor Tech 
PPZ 143 

70 Gallons- 14 Cases $467.50  $6,545.00

7. Merit 75 WSP 
Alternate: Armor Tech 
IMD 75 

230.4 oz.- 3 Cases $311.04     $933.12

30. Sol-U-Cal K 
Alternate: pHusion 

5,000 Lbs.- 100 Bags $18.75 $1,875.00

     $10,573.12
 
 
Helena Chemical Company, Zeeland, Michigan 
 
2. Daconil Weather Stik 

Alternate: Dockit WS 
200 Gallons- 40 Cases $159.05 $6,362.00

5. Gallery 24 Lbs.- 6  Cases $507.40 $3,044.40
21. Prostar 36 lbs – 3 Cases $589.80 $1,769.40
24. Cleary’s 3336 

Alternate: T-Methyl E Pro 
60 Lbs.- 5 Cases $114.00     $570.00

26. Glacier 4F 
Alternate: Turfcide 400 

225 Gallons- 45 Cases $145.00 $6,525.00

    $18,270.80
 
 
 
 
 
 



Page 4 of 5 
 

 
March 26, 2010 
 
To: John Szerlag, City Manager 
Re: Bid Award – Lowest Bidders Meeting Specifications – Turfgrass Chemical Products 

 
 
Great Lakes Turf, LLC, Grand Rapids, Michigan 
 
Item 
No. 

Product Description Estimated Quantity Case Price Estimated Cost

3. Knife Plus 60 Gallons- 12 Cases $218.50 $2,622.00
8. Astron 50 Gallons- 10 Cases $422.75 $4,227.50
9. Power C3 160 Gallons- 32 Cases $133.00 $4,256.00
10. Calphlex 125 Gallons- 25 Cases $209.00 $5,225.00
11. Protesyn 80 Gallons- 16 Cases $228.00 $3,648.00
19. Pervade 60 Gallons- 2 Drums $972.00 $1,944.00
22. PK Fight 0-0-28 80 Gallons- 16 Cases $228.00 $3,648.00
23. P-48 300 Lbs.- 10 Pails $137.75 $1,377.50
27. Power 12-6-0 120 Gallons- 24 Cases $118.75 $2,850.00
28.  Defense Mag 172.8 Lbs.- 12 Cases $147.25 $1,767.00
    $31,565.00
 
 
Harrell’s LLC, Lakeland, Florida 
 
Item 
No. 

Product Description Estimated Quantity Case Price Estimated Cost

6. Triton Flo 16 Gallons- 4 Cases $2,500.00 $10,000.00
12. Bayleton Flowable 15 Gallons- 3 Cases $3,238.50 $9,715.50
13. Harrell’s Tru-Prill 15-2-15 

Greens Fertilizer 
4,000 Lbs- 80 Bags $56.88 $4,550.40

16. Tartan 20 Gallons- 4 Cases $2,330.00 $9,320.00
20. Acelepryn Insecticide 256 oz.- 4 Jugs $880.00 $3,520.00
31. Harrell’s 17-3-19 Fertilizer 4,500 Lbs.- 90 Bags $28.00 $2,520.00
32.  24-0-19 Poly-on Fertilizer 8,000 Lbs.- 160 Bags $32.55 $5,208.00
    $44,833.90
 
 
John Deere Landscapes, Cleveland, Ohio 
 

Item 
No. 

Product Description Estimated Quantity Case Price Estimated Cost

14. High Cal Lime 
 Regular Grade 

30,000 Lbs- 600 Bags $5.50 $3,300.00

25. Disarm 384 oz.- 12 Cases $1,200.00 $14,400.00
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    $17,700.00

 
March 26, 2010 
 
To: John Szerlag, City Manager 
Re: Bid Award – Lowest Bidders Meeting Specifications – Turfgrass Chemical Products 
 
 
 
Turfgrass Inc., Novi, Michigan 
 
Item 
No. 

Product Description Estimated Quantity Case Price Estimated Cost

15.  Cascade 2,000 Lbs.50 Bags $69.90 $3,495.00
18.  Subdue Max 

Alternate:Mefenoxam 2AQ 
20 Gallons- 10 Cases $717.10 $7,171.00

29.  Primo PGR 
Alternate: T-Nex 1AQ 

10 Gallons- 2 Cases $902.00 $1,804.00

    $12,470.00
 
 
 
 
Agrium Advanced Technologies, Sunfield, Michigan 
 
Item 
No. 

Product Description Estimated Quantity Case Price Estimated Cost

17. Alliette-Signature 330 Lbs.- 15 Cases $494.78 $7,421.70
21. Prostar 36 Lbs.- 3 Cases $589.80 $1,769.40
    $9,191.10
 
 
                                                                                             ESTIMATED TOTAL COST:  $144,603.92 
 
 

                                        



 CITY OF TROY            ITB-COT 10-09

Opening Date -- 03/04/10 BID TABULATION Page 1 of 12

Date Reviewed - 3/25/10 TURFGRASS CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

VENDOR NAME: jh/sl

By Line Item Alternate Total Only

EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE

Turfgrass, Inc. Turfgrass, Inc.

 EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE

ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1. 25 GALS CHIPCO 26 GT FLOWABLE or 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate - Ipro 2SE

(5 CASES)  IPRODIONE PRO 2 SE 5 GALS/CASE 52.00$       260.00$        

2. 200 GALS DACONIL WEATHERSTIK 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate - Dockit WS

(40 CASES) or ECHO 720/CONCORDE SST 5 GALS/CASE 35.00$       175.00$        

3. 60 GALS KNIFE PLUS 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate - Amino Iron
(12 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE DMS

4 70 GALS BANNER MAX 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate -Propiconazole 14.3
(14 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 99.80$       499.00$        

5 24 LBS GALLERY 4 x 1 lb

(6 CASES) HERBICIDE 4 1lbs/Case 130.735$   522.94$        ( ) $ $

6. 15 GALS TRITON FLO 2 X 2.5 GALS (4 x 1 gal) 

(3 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 625.00$     2,500.00$     

7. 176 OZ MERIT 75 W.S.P./Zenith 75 WSB 110 X 1.6oz Pk Alternate - Imidacloprid 2F (1gal)

(1 Mini Drum) 176 oz/Drum DMS

8. 50 GALS ASTRON 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate - Ultraplexp

(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE DMS

9 160 GALS POWER C3 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate - Fluid Fert 29-2-3

(32 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE DMS

10 125 GALS CALPHLEX 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate - Calcium Complex 12%

(25 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE DMS

11 80 GALS PROTESYN 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate - Aminoplex

(16 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 69.70$       348.50$        

12 15 GALS BAYLETON FLOWABLE 2 X 2.5 GALS

(3 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 647.70$     3,238.50$     
2nd Alter - 18-6-15 Mutech DMS

13 4,000 lbs HARRELS TRU-PRILL Alt - 18-9-18 Contec DG (40lb bag)

(80 BAGS) 15-2-15 GREENS GRADE FERTILIZER 50 LBS/BAG DMS

14 30,000 lbs HIGH CALCIUM LIME

(600 BAGS) REGULAR GRADE 50 LBS/Bag 0.123$       6.15$            

15 2,000 LBS CASCADE GRANULAR

(50 BAGS) 40 LBS/BAG 1.748$       69.90$          

16 20 GALS TARTAN 2 X 2.5 GALS

(4 CASES) 466 00$ 2 330 00$(4 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 466.00$     2,330.00$     

17 330 lbs ALLIETTE/SIGNATURE 2 x 11 lbs

(15 CASES) 22 lbs/CASE 22.955$     505.00$        

18 20 Gals SUBDUE MAXX 2 X 2.5 GALS Alt - Mefenoxam 2AQ (2x1 Gal)
(4 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 358.55$     717.10$        

19 60 Gals PERVADE 30 gal Alt - Aqua Aid (2 x 2.5 Gal)g q ( )
(2 Drums) Drum DMS



Opening Date -- 03/04/10 BID TABULATION            ITB-COT 10-09

Date Reviewed - 3/25/10 TURFGRASS CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES Pg 2 of 12

VENDOR NAME:

Alternate

EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE

ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

Turfgrass, Inc. Turfgrass, Inc.

ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
20 256 oz. ACELEPRYN INSECTICIDE

(4 JUGS) 64 oz / Jug 13.75$       880.00$        

21 30 lbs PROSTAR 10 x 1 lb Alternate - Prostar   4x3 lbs

(3 CASES) 10 lbs/CASE 50.238$     602.85$        

22 80 GALS PK FIGHT 0-0-28 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate - Phiter 2-0-30

(16 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE DMS

23 300 lbs P-48 Alternate - Mullti-ProTek 0-52-36

(10 Pails) 30 lb / Pails DMS

24 60 LBS CLEARY's 3336 6 x 2 lb case Alt - TM85 WDG (6 x 1.2lbs)

(5 Cases) 12 lb/Case 17.885$     128.77$        
16 oz - Jug

25 384 oz DISARM 64 oz -  Jug 4 x 1 pint = 64oz => $/oz

(12 Cases) 2 Jugs / Case 19.313$     1,236.00$     

26 225 GALS GLACIER 4F 2 X 2.5 Gals Alternate - Turfcide 400

(45 Cases) 5 Gal/Case 32.70$       163.50$        

27 120 GALS POWER 12-6-0 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate - Fluid Fert 29-2-3

(24 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE DMS
(2 x 2.5 Gal cs)

28 172.8 LBS DEFENSE MAG 4 x3.6 Lbs Jugs Alternate - Magnesium Chelate 5%

(12 Cases) 14.4 lbs/Case 39.00$       195.00$        
(2 x 2.5 Gal cs)

29 8 GALS PRIMO PGR 2 X 1 GAL Alternate - T-Nex 1AQ

(4 Cases) 2 GALS/CASE 180.40$     902.00$        
2nd Alter: 3Mg Green Grade 0.74$         37.00$          

30 5,000 lbs SOL-U-CAL  K Alternate - 4 Mg K-Cal 0-0-24

(100 B ) 0 82$ 41 00$(100 Bags) 50 lbs / Bag 0.82$         41.00$          

31 4,500 lbs HARRELL's 17-3-19 50 lbs / Bag Alt - 17-0-17 Contec DG (40lb Bg)

(90 Bags) FERTILIZER 1.03$         41.20$          
2nd Alter: Mutech, SOP 1% DMS

32 8,000 Lbs 24-0-19 Poly-On Alternate - SGN 150 TG 22-0-18
(160 Bags) FERTILIZER 50 lbs / Bag 0.77$         38.50$          

ESTIMATED TOTAL OF AWARDED ITEMS 12 470 00$ 150 250 55$ESTIMATED TOTAL OF AWARDED ITEMS --

MINIMUM SHIPMENT:

Days after call

CONTACT INFORMATION:  Hrs of Oper:

    Phone #

1 - 3 Business days

7 AM to 7 PM

248-866-6081

7 AM to 7 PM

248-866-6081

12,470.00$                          150,250.55$                      

1 Case

1 - 3 Business days

1 Case

    Phone #

See Exceptions Exceptions Attached to Bid

PAYMENT TERMS

WARRANTY None None

248 866 6081 248 866 6081

N60 N60



Opening Date -- 03/04/10 BID TABULATION            ITB-COT 10-09

Date Reviewed - 3/25/10 TURFGRASS CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES Pg 3 of 12

VENDOR NAME:

Alternate

EXCEPTIONS:

Turfgrass, Inc.

Bayer terms:  Purchases made 

3/1/10 8/31/10 N t d th 30th

Bayer terms:  Purchases made 

3/1/10 8/31/10 N t d th 30th

Turfgrass, Inc.

of sale- purchases made after of sale- purchases made after

9/1/10; Net Due 1/30/11 9/1/10; Net Due 1/30/11

ALL OR NONE AWARD Y or N No Yes

3/1/10 - 8/31/10; Net due the 30th

of the 2nd month after the month

3/1/10 - 8/31/10; Net due the 30th

of the 2nd month after the month

ALL OR NONE AWARD Y or N

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:   Signed Y or N

PROPOSAL - Seasonal Requirements of Turfgrass Chemicals

Color represents calculation corrected by Purchasing

ATTEST HIGHLIGHTED AREAS DENOTES LOWEST ACCEPTABLE BIDDERS

No Yes

Yes Yes

ATTEST: HIGHLIGHTED AREAS DENOTES LOWEST ACCEPTABLE BIDDERS

Diane Fisher

Danny McDonald

Linda Bockstanz Susan Leirstein CPPO CPPB

Purchasing Director

G:ITB-COT 10-09 Chemicals-Golf CoursesG:ITB-COT 10-09 Chemicals-Golf Courses



 CITY OF TROY            ITB-COT 10-09

Opening Date -- 03/04/10 BID TABULATION Page 4 of 12

Date Reviewed - 3/25/10 TURFGRASS CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

VENDOR NAME:

 EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE

ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1. 25 GALS CHIPCO 26 GT FLOWABLE or 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate - Armor Tech IP 233 Chipco 26019

(5 CASES)  IPRODIONE PRO 2 SE 5 GALS/CASE 48.80$       244.00$         62.00$           310.00$         
Alternate - Docket (Syngenta)

2. 200 GALS DACONIL WEATHERSTIK 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate - Armor Tech CLT 720

(40 CASES) or ECHO 720/CONCORDE SST 5 GALS/CASE 33.98$       169.90$         36.70$           183.52$         

3. 60 GALS KNIFE PLUS 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate - Sub 12 Iron

(12 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE DMS -$               -$               
2 x 2 Gal

4 70 GALS Banner Max 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate -  Armor Tech PPZ143 Alternate - Dorado Propiconazole

(14 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 93.50$       467.50$         117.88$         471.52

5 24 lbs GALLERY 4 x 1 lb

(6 CASES) HERBICIDE 4 1lbs/Case 159.00$     636.00$         149.00$         596.00$         

6. 15 GALS TRITON FLO 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate - Trinity (4 x 1 gal) 

(3 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE DMS 625.00$         2,500.00$      
(48 x 1.6 oz) 4 x 1.6 oz ea 4 x 4 x 1.6 case

7. 176 oz MERIT 75 W.S.P./Zenith 75 WSB 110 X 1.6oz Pk Alternate - Armor Tech IMD 75 Alternate - Criterion Imidacloprid

(1 Mini Drum) 176 oz/Drum 4.05$         311.04$         4.60$             117.84$         
No Bid

8. 50 GALS ASTRON 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate - Micro Mix

(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE DMS -$               -$               
No Bid No Bid

9. 160 GALS POWER C3 2 X 2.5 GALS

(32 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE -$           -$               -$               -$               
No Bid

10 125 GALS CALPHLEX 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate - Sugar Cal

(25 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE DMS -$               -$               
No Bid No Bid

11 80 GALS PROTESYN 2 X 2.5 GALS

(16 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE -$           -$               -$               -$               
No Bid

12 15 GALS BAYLETON FLOWABLE 2 X 2.5 GALS

(3 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE -$           -$               647.70$         3,238.50$      

13 4,000 lbs HARRELS TRU-PRILL Alternate - EC Grow 22-0-22

(80 BAGS) 15-2-15 GREENS GRADE FERTILIZER 50 LBS/BAG DMS 1.14$             56.88$           
No Bid

14 30,000 lbs HIGH CALCIUM LIME Alternate - Verde-Cal

(600 BAGS) REGULAR GRADE 50 LB/Bag -$           -$               0.53$             26.67$           

15 2,000 LBS CASCADE GRANULAR Alternate - 16-90 Granular Alternate - Brilliance G (50lb bag)

(50 BAGS) 40 LBS/BAG DMS DMS
No Bid

16 20 GALS TARTAN 2 X 2.5 GALS

(4 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE -$           -$               466.00$         2,330.00$      
(25.2# case)

17 330 lbs ALLIETTE/SIGNATURE 2 x 11 lbs Alternate - Armor Tech 70 WDG

(15 CASES) 22 lbs/CASE DMS 23.55$           518.00$         
4 x 1 Gal 4 Gal/per Case

18 20 Gals SUBDUE MAXX 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate - QualiPro Mefenaxam

(4 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 392.00$     1,960.00$      499.00$         1,996.00$      
No Bid

19 60 Gals PERVADE 30 gal Alternate - Syringe 55 G

(2 Drums) Drum -$           -$               DMS

Harrell's LLCTri-Turf



Opening Date -- 03/04/10 BID TABULATION            ITB-COT 10-09

Date Reviewed - 3/25/10 TURFGRASS CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES Pg 5 of 12

VENDOR NAME:

EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE

ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
20 256 oz. ACELEPRYN INSECTICIDE No Bid

(4 JUGS) 64 oz / Jug -$           -$               13.75$           880.00$         

21 30 lbs PROSTAR 10 x 1 lb

(3 CASES) 10 lbs/CASE 73.90$       739.00$         -$               -$               

22 80 GALS PK FIGHT 0-0-28 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate - Phosphite 30 Alternate - Title Phyte

(16 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE DMS DMS
No Bid 2 x 2.5  - Gal

23 300 lbs P-48 Alternate - Phos Plus

(10 Pails) 30 lb / Pails -$           -$               33.47$           167.35$         

24 60 LBS CLEARY's 3336 6 x 2 lb case Alternate - T-Methyl E-Pro 50 WSB

(5 Cases) 12 lb/Case 12.09$       145.08$         -$               -$               

25 384 oz DISARM 64 oz -  Jug

(12 Cases) 2 Jugs / Case 18.26$       2,337.28$      -$               -$               

26 225 GALS GLACIER 4F 2 X 2.5 Gals Alternate - ParFLo Alternate - Turfcide 400

(45 Cases) 5 Gal/Case 29.50$       147.50$         31.80$           159.00$         
No Bid

27 120 GALS POWER 12-6-0 2 X 2.5 GALS

(24 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE -$           -$               -$               -$               
No Bid

28 172.8 LBS DEFENSE MAG 4 x3.6 Lbs Jugs

(12 Cases) 14.4 lbs/Case -$           -$               -$               -$               
Trinexapal

29 8 GALS PRIMO PGR 2 X 1 GAL Alternate -Armor Tech PGR 113

(4 Cases) 2 GALS/CASE 221.00$     442.00$         275.00$         550.00$         

30 5,000 lbs SOL-U-CAL  K Alternate - pHusion Calcitic

(100 Bags) 50 lbs / Bag 0.375$       18.75$           -$               -$               

31 4,500 lbs HARRELL's 17-3-19 50 lbs / Bag Alternate - EC Grow 18-4-18

(90 Bags) FERTILIZER 0.58$         29.00$           0.56$             28.00$           
0.79$             39.67$           

32 8,000 Lbs 24-0-19 Poly-On Alternate - Armor Tech 24-0-12 Alternate - 25-0-15 poly-on mini

(160 Bags) FERTILIZER 50 lbs / Bag 0.67$         33.50$           0.65$             32.55$           

ESTIMATED TOTAL OF AWARDED ITEMS --

MINIMUM SHIPMENT:

Days after call

CONTACT INFORMATION:  Hrs of Oper:

    Phone #

(See Exceptions)

PAYMENT TERMS

Full replacement of any product 

WARRANTY

Harrell's LLC

Manufactures w/manufacturer defect/failure

None

0 - 1 Days

24 Hr / 7 Days

586-917-3851

90 Days

Tri-Turf

10,573.12$                           44,833.90$                               

No Minimum

1 Day

8 AM to 5 PM

248-640-4439

2%  10  Net 60



Opening Date -- 03/04/10 BID TABULATION            ITB-COT 10-09

Date Reviewed - 3/25/10 TURFGRASS CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES Pg 6 of 12

VENDOR NAME:

EXCEPTIONS: Agency terms Net 30 Days Line #2  Daconil - Docket

Next day delivery Line #4 - Banner - Dorado

Line #7  Merit - Criterion

Line #14  High Cal - Verde-cal

ALL OR NONE AWARD Y or N

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT: Signed Y or N

G:ITB-COT 10-09 Chemicals-Golf Courses

Harrell's LLC

No

Yes

No

Yes

Tri-Turf



 CITY OF TROY            ITB-COT 10-09

Opening Date -- 03/04/10 BID TABULATION Page 7 of 12

Date Reviewed - 3/25/10 TURFGRASS CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

VENDOR NAME:

 EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE

ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

Alternate - Chipco 26019

1. 25 GALS CHIPCO 26 GT FLOWABLE or 2 X 2.5 GALS 51.00$              255.00$              
(5 CASES)  IPRODIONE PRO 2 SE 5 GALS/CASE 117.00$      585.00$        117.25$        586.25$       

Alternate - Dockit WS
2. 200 GALS DACONIL WEATHERSTIK 2 X 2.5 GALS 31.81 159.05$             

(40 CASES) or ECHO 720/CONCORDE SST 5 GALS/CASE 56.60$        283.00$        56.50$          282.50$       
No Bid No Bid

3. 60 GALS KNIFE PLUS 2 X 2.5 GALS

(12 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE -$            -$             -$              -$             
Alternate - Propiconizole E Pro 2 x 1 Gal.

4 70 GALS Banner Max 2 X 2.5 GALS 103.95$           519.75$             
(14 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE $249 (2x1 Gal) 498.00$        249.00$        498.00$       

5 24 lbs GALLERY 4 x 1 lb

(6 CASES) HERBICIDE 4 1lbs/Case 126.85$      507.40$        129.44$        517.76$       
4 x 1 Gal

6. 15 GALS TRITON FLO 2 X 2.5 GALS

(3 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 625.00$      3,125.00$     625.00$        2,500.00$    
2 Alternates - 4.29$               $109.82  (4x4x1.6oz)

7. 176 oz MERIT 75 W.S.P./Zenith 75 WSB 110 X 1.6oz Pk 1.17$               DMS
(1 Mini Drum) 176 oz/Drum 10.511$      1,850.00$     10.511$        1,850.00$    

No Bid No Bid
8. 50 GALS ASTRON 2 X 2.5 GALS

Technologies

Agrium AdvancedHelena Chemical Company

8. 50 GALS ASTRON 2 X 2.5 GALS

(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE -$            -$             -$              -$             
No Bid No Bid

9. 160 GALS POWER C3 2 X 2.5 GALS

(32 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE -$            -$             -$              -$             
No Bid No Bid

10 125 GALS CALPHLEX 2 X 2.5 GALS

(25 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE -$            -$             -$              -$             
No Bid

11 80 GALS PROTESYN 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate - Renova
(16 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE DMS -$              -$             

12 15 GALS BAYLETON FLOWABLE 2 X 2.5 GALS

(3 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 647.70$      3,238.50$     647.70$        3,238.50$    
No Bid No Bid

13 4,000 lbs HARRELS TRU-PRILL
(80 BAGS) 15-2-15 GREENS GRADE FERTILIZER 50 LBS/BAG -$            -$             -$              -$             

No Bid Kellys Fairway High Calcium
14 30,000 lbs HIGH CALCIUM LIME

(600 BAGS) REGULAR GRADE 50 LB/Bag -$            -$             0.125$          6.25$           
No Bid

15 2,000 LBS CASCADE GRANULAR Alt - Reservior DG (50lb Bag)
(50 BAGS) 40 LBS/BAG DMS -$              -$             

16 20 GALS TARTAN 2 X 2.5 GALS

(4 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 466.00$      2,330.00$     466.00$        2,330.00$    

17 330 lbs ALLIETTE/SIGNATURE 2 x 11 lbs

(15 CASES) 22 lbs/CASE 23.50$        517.00$        22.49$          494.78$       
(2 x 1 Gal) (2 x 1 Gal)

18 20 Gals SUBDUE MAXX 2 X 2.5 GALS

(4 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 499.00$      998.00$        499.00$        998.00$       
No Bid

19 60 Gals PERVADE 30 gal Alternate - Injector (55 Gal)
(2 Drums) Drum DMS -$              -$             
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Date Reviewed - 3/25/10 TURFGRASS CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES Pg 8 of 12

VENDOR NAME:

EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE

ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

20 256 oz. ACELEPRYN INSECTICIDE

(4 JUGS) 64 oz / Jug 13.75$        880.00$        13.75$          880.00$       

21 30 lbs PROSTAR 10 x 1 lb 4 x 3 lbs 4 x 3 Lbs

(3 CASES) 10 lbs/CASE 49.15$        589.80$        49.15$          589.80$       
No Bid

22 80 GALS PK FIGHT 0-0-28 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate - EleMax 0-0-26 phosp

(16 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE DMS -$              -$             
8 x 5 lbs No Bid

23 300 lbs P-48 Alternate - Brexil Multi

(10 Pails) 30 lb / Pails 7.00$          280.00$        -$              -$             
Alternate - T-Methyl E Pro

24 60 LBS CLEARY's 3336 6 x 2 lb case $9.50 114.00$              

(5 Cases) 12 lb/Case 11.32$        135.86$        11.97$          143.64$       
128 oz 4 x 16 oz

25 384 oz DISARM 64 oz -  Jug

(12 Cases) 2 Jugs / Case 13.45$        1,722.44$     16.41$          1,050.60$    
No Bid

26 225 GALS GLACIER 4F 2 X 2.5 Gals Alternate - Turfcide 400

(45 Cases) 5 Gal/Case 29.00$        145.00$        -$              -$             
No Bid No Bid

27 120 GALS POWER 12-6-0 2 X 2.5 GALS

(24 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE -$            -$             -$              -$             
N Bid N Bid

Technologies
Agrium AdvancedHelena Chemical Company

No Bid No Bid
28 172.8 LBS DEFENSE MAG 4 x3.6 Lbs Jugs

(12 Cases) 14.4 lbs/Case -$            -$             -$              -$             
Alternate - Podium

29 8 GALS PRIMO PGR 2 X 1 GAL 209.00$            418.00$              

(4 Cases) 2 GALS/CASE 275.00$      550.00$        275.00$        550.00$       
No Bid No Bid

30 5,000 lbs SOL-U-CAL  K

(100 Bags) 50 lbs / Bag -$            -$             -$              -$             
No Bid No Bid

31 4,500 lbs HARRELL's 17-3-19 50 lbs / Bag

(90 Bags) FERTILIZER -$            -$             -$              -$             
No Bid No Bid

32 8,000 Lbs 24-0-19 Poly-On

(160 Bags) FERTILIZER 50 lbs / Bag -$            -$             -$              -$             

ESTIMATED TOTAL OF AWARDED ITEMS --

MINIMUM SHIPMENT:

Days after call

CONTACT INFORMATION:  Hrs of Oper:

    Phone #

PAYMENT TERMS

WARRANTY

N30

Per Manufacture

0

1- 3 (In Emergency Call)

8 AM to 5 PM

586-839-8930

Per Manufacture

18,270.80$                           9,191.10$                             

None

1 - 3 Days

7 AM to 5 PM

616-340-9557

Net 30 Days
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VENDOR NAME:

EXCEPTIONS:

ALL OR NONE AWARD Y or N

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT: Signed Y or N

G:ITB-COT 10-09 Chemicals-Golf Courses

No

Yes

Agrium Advanced

Technologies

Blank

No

Yes

Sheet Attached To Bid. Products

are either generic or a different

brand

Helena Chemical Company
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Date Reviewed - 3/25/10 TURFGRASS CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

VENDOR NAME:

 EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE

ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1. 25 GALS CHIPCO 26 GT FLOWABLE or 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate - Lesco 18 Plus No Bid
(5 CASES)  IPRODIONE PRO 2 SE 5 GALS/CASE 54.00$         270.00$        -$              -$              

Alternate - Munforse

2. 200 GALS DACONIL WEATHERSTIK 2 X 2.5 GALS 38.00$               190.00$               

(40 CASES) or ECHO 720/CONCORDE SST 5 GALS/CASE 56.50$         282.50$        40.00$           200.00$        
No Bid

3. 60 GALS KNIFE PLUS 2 X 2.5 GALS

(12 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE -$             -$              43.70$           218.50$        
2 X 2.5 GALS Alt-Spectator

4 70 GALS Banner Max 5 GALS/CASE 100.00$             500.00$               Alternate - Propensity 1.3 ME

(14 CASES) 1 Gal x 2 249.00$       498.00$        125.00$         625.00$        
No Bid

5 24 lbs GALLERY 4 x 1 lb

(6 CASES) HERBICIDE 4 1lbs/Case 155.00$       620.00$        -$              -$              
1 Gal x 4 No Bid

6. 15 GALS TRITON FLO 2 X 2.5 GALS

(3 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 625.00$       2,500.00$     -$              -$              
Alternate - Bandit 75 (1.6oz x4x4)

7. 176 oz MERIT 75 W.S.P./Zenith 75 WSB 110 X 1.6oz Pk 4.296$               110.00$               Alternate - Enforce 75 WSB

(1 Mini Drum) 176 oz/Drum 10.511$       1,850.00$     7.00$             1,232.00$     
No Bid

8. 50 GALS ASTRON 2 X 2.5 GALS

(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE -$             -$              84.55$           422.75$        
No Bid

9. 160 GALS POWER C3 2 X 2.5 GALS

(32 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE -$             -$              26.60$           133.00$        

10 125 GALS CALPHLEX 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate - Greenflo 6-0-0

(25 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE DMS 41.80$           209.00$        
No Bid

11 80 GALS PROTESYN 2 X 2.5 GALS

(16 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE -$             -$              45.60$           228.00$        
Agency Pricing No Bid

12 15 GALS BAYLETON FLOWABLE 2 X 2.5 GALS

(3 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 647.70$       3,238.50$     -$              -$              
No Bid

13 4,000 lbs HARRELS TRU-PRILL Alternate - Lebanon 18-3-18 E 65

(80 BAGS) 15-2-15 GREENS GRADE FERTILIZER 50 LBS/BAG DMS -$              -$              
No Bid

14 30,000 lbs HIGH CALCIUM LIME

(600 BAGS) REGULAR GRADE 50 LB/Bag 0.11$           5.50$            -$              -$              
No Bid

15 2,000 LBS CASCADE GRANULAR Alternate - Lesco Flo ultra

(50 BAGS) 40 LBS/BAG 1.875$         75.00$          -$              -$              
No Bid

16 20 GALS TARTAN 2 X 2.5 GALS

(4 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE 466.00$       2,330.00$     -$              -$              
5.5 x 4 No Bid

17 330 lbs ALLIETTE/SIGNATURE 2 x 11 lbs Alternate -  Prodigy Signture

(15 CASES) 22 lbs/CASE 27.27$         599.94$        -$              -$              
2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate - Mefenoxam No Bid

18 20 Gals SUBDUE MAXX 5 GALS/CASE 400.00$             2,000.00$            

(4 CASES) 2 Gals 499.00$       998.00$        -$              -$              
55 Gal Drum

19 60 Gals PERVADE 30 gal Alternate - LescoFlo Ultra

(2 Drums) Drum DMS 32.40$           972.00$        

Great Lake Turf, LLCJohn Deere Landscapes
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VENDOR NAME:

EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE

ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
20 256 oz. ACELEPRYN INSECTICIDE No Bid

(4 JUGS) 64 oz / Jug 13.75$         880.00$        -$              -$              
No Bid

21 30 lbs PROSTAR 10 x 1 lb

(3 CASES) 10 lbs/CASE 65.00$         650.00$        -$              -$              

22 80 GALS PK FIGHT 0-0-28 2 X 2.5 GALS Alternate - Greenflo Phyte

(16 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE DMS 45.60$           228.00$        
No Bid

23 300 lbs P-48

(10 Pails) 30 lb / Pails -$             -$              4.59$             137.75$        
No Bid

24 60 LBS CLEARY's 3336 6 x 2 lb case Alt - T-Storm (8oz x 4x10)

(5 Cases) 12 lb/Case $0.75/oz 240.00$        -$              -$              
No Bid

25 384 oz DISARM 64 oz -  Jug

(12 Cases) 2 Jugs / Case 9.375$         1,200.00$     -$              -$              
No Bid

26 225 GALS GLACIER 4F 2 X 2.5 Gals Alternate - Turfcide

(45 Cases) 5 Gal/Case 38.00$         190.00$        -$              -$              
No Bid

27 120 GALS POWER 12-6-0 2 X 2.5 GALS

(24 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE -$             -$              23.75$           118.75$        
No Bid

28 172.8 LBS DEFENSE MAG 4 x3.6 Lbs Jugs

(12 Cases) 14.4 lbs/Case -$             -$              10.23$           147.25$        
Alternate - Regimax PGR No Bid

29 8 GALS PRIMO PGR 2 X 1 GAL 200.00$             400.00$               

(4 Cases) 2 GALS/CASE 275.00$       550.00$        -$              -$              
No Bid No Bid

30 5,000 lbs SOL-U-CAL  K

(100 Bags) 50 lbs / Bag -$             -$              -$              -$              
No Bid No Bid

31 4,500 lbs HARRELL's 17-3-19 50 lbs / Bag

(90 Bags) FERTILIZER -$             -$              -$              -$              
No Bid

32 8,000 Lbs 24-0-19 Poly-On Alternate - Lescoflo 20-0-20m

(160 Bags) FERTILIZER 50 lbs / Bag 0.74$           37.00$          -$              -$              

ESTIMATED TOTAL OF AWARDED ITEMS --

MINIMUM SHIPMENT:

Days after call

         Sat - 8 AM to Noon

CONTACT INFORMATION:  Hrs of Oper:

    Phone #

PAYMENT TERMS

WARRANTY

   Warranty

Great Lake Turf, LLC

N/A 1 Case

Net 30 Net 30 Days

See label for manufacture Per Manufacturer's Label

John Deere Landscapes

17,700.00$                            31,565.00$                              

2 Days

M-F  7 AM to 4 PM

3 - 10 Days ARO

M-F  8 AM to 5 PM

734-915-6123 586-915-9281
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VENDOR NAME:

EXCEPTIONS: Exceptions are noted w/ a star #4 propensity 1.3 ME  sub

and the corresponding label / #7 Enforce 75WSB Sub

MSDS are enclosed

ALL OR NONE AWARD Y or N

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT: Signed Y or N

G:ITB-COT 10-09 Chemicals-Golf Courses

No

Yes

No

Yes

John Deere Landscapes Great Lake Turf, LLC




