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CiTY COUNCIL ACTION REPORT

April 13, 2010

TO:

John Szerlag, City Manager

FROM: Mark F. Miller, Acting Assistant City Manager/Economic Development Services

Susan A. Leirstein, Purchasing Director
Steven J. Vandette, City Engineer
Timothy L. Richnak, Public Works Director

SUBJECT:  Standard Purchasing Resolution 3: Exercise Renewal Option — Concrete Pavement Repair

Background

On August 17, 2009, Troy City Council approved contracts to complete concrete pavement repair under
four proposals: A) - Local Roads, B) - Industrial Roads C) - Major Roads, and D)-Tri Party County Roads
with an option to renew for two (2) additional one-year periods to the low bidders: Hard Rock Concrete
Inc., Dominic Gaglio Construction Inc., Major Cement Company and Dilisio Contracting Inc. respectively.
CC Resolution #2009-08-250-F-4c.

Hard Rock Concrete Inc., Dominic Gaglio Construction Inc., Major Cement Company and Dilisio
Contracting Inc. have agreed to exercise the first-year renewal option at the same prices, terms, conditions
as the original contract.

The Tri Party County Roads agreement is contingent upon the County’s terms and approval.

All four contractors have been producing a quality product for the City.

The Purchasing Department performed a market survey and based on the results concluded that it is in
the City’s best interest to exercise the option to renew with all four vendors based on current market
conditions. Although the cost of concrete is expected to remain steady, the cost for fuel is projected to rise
over the course of the renewal period which would affect transportation costs.

All four contractors have agreed to pay for overtime incurred by City of Troy inspectors for any inspections
that fall outside the normal eight (8) hour work day at the rate of $50.00 per hour. This rate includes both
the cost of the inspector and the City vehicle.

Concrete pavement repair preserves infrastructure and would improve public safety and also reduce
liability for the City.

Financial Considerations

Funds for this project are budgeted in the 2010/11 Capital Accounts for Public Works Construction.

Proposal Account #
A # 401.447.499.7989.500 Local Roads.
B # 401.447.479.7989.300 Industrial Roads.
C # 401.447.479.7989.500 Major Roads.
D # 401.447.479.7989.091016 Tri Party.

Legal Considerations

ITB-COT 09-07, the Concrete Pavement Repair Program for local, major, and industrial roads with an
option to renew for two (2) additional one-year periods was competitively bid, in accordance with City
Charter and Code.
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April 13, 2010

To: John Szerlag, City Manager
Re: Exercise Renewal Option — Concrete Pavement Repair

Recommendation

¢ City management and the Public Works department recommend exercising the first option to renew for
one (1) additional year with Hard Rock Concrete Inc., of Westland, MI; Dominic Gaglio Construction Inc.,
of Southgate, MI; Major Cement Company, of Detroit, Ml; and Dilisio Contracting Inc. of Clinton Township,
MI; at the same prices, terms, and conditions, not to exceed amounts budgeted, expiring on June 30,
2011. The Tri Party County Road agreement will be contingent upon the County’s term and approval.

G:/Bid Award 10-11 New Format/Award Standard Purchasing Resolution 3 — ConcretePavementRepair 03.10.doc
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January 27, 2010

TO: Susan Leirstein
Purchasing Director

FROM: Linda N. Bockstanz
Associate Buyer

RE: MARKET SURVEY — CONCRETE PAVEMENT REPAIR

FLORENCE CEMENT CO — Angelo Lanni (586) 997-2666
According to Angelo, prices will remain the same. He is planning on keeping his prices level
and only increase them if fuel costs significantly increase.

MAJOR CEMENT PAVING — Dan Scappaticci (313) 532-3212
Per Dan, his prices will remain the same. He is purposely keeping his prices down in order to
compete in the market.

GIORGI CONCRETE LLC — Michelle Solomon (313) 366-2921
Michelle stated that, at this time, their Company is unsure if they plan to increase prices or keep
them the same. The decision is dependent on how business is going and market conditions.
Unfortunately, she could not comment on these conditions at this time.

LACARIA CONCRETE — _Ali Audia (313) 843-1932
He believes that the Company prices will remain the same. If an increase were to happen it
would affect concrete at an increase of $0.25 per square foot, but this small increase would not
affect the product costs.

Based upon the above comments, | respectfully recommend that the City accept the offer to
renew the contract for Concrete Pavement Repair to the current vendors. Although the cost of
concrete repairs is expected to remain steady, there is a possibility of increases based on
market conditions. Additionally, the cost of fuel is expected to rise over the course of the
renewal period which could affect transportation costs. It should be noted that the surveyed
vendors bid prices ranged from 9% to 18% higher than our current vendors’ prices based on
their averaged totals for Proposals A — D.

CC: File



Troy

Date: 12/30/09

ATTN: Mr. Rocco Grimaldi
Hard Rock Congrete Inc.,
38146 Abruzzi Dr.
Westland MI 48185

Dear Mr. Grimaldi

On August 17, 2009, the City of Troy entered into contract #2010-80000004 OB
with Hard Rock Concrete Inc., to provide a one-year contract for local road
concrete pavernent repair program. This contract contained an option to renew
for Two(2) additional one-year periods at the same prices, terms, conditions as
the original contract, and through mutual consent of both parties,.

Please fax this letter back indicating if Hard Rock Concrete Inc. wishes to renew
this contract until June 30, 2011. Our fax number is (248) 524-3520. A reques|
by City staff to determine the successful bidder's interest in renewing the contract
in no way obligates the City. The option sannot be exercised without Troy City
Council approval and a blanket purchase order issued.

If you have'any questions please call me at (248) §24-3595

CHECK ONE:

Hard Rock Concrete Inc., is interested in renewing the contract
under the same prices, terms, and conditions: M

Hard Rock. Concrete Inc., is_not interested in renewing the
contract: ()

ized Company Representative

Thank you,
Marina Basta Farouk
Public Works Department

City of Troy
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Date: 12/30/09

ATTN: Mr. Dominic Gaglio
Dominic Gaglio Construction Inc.
15347 Drysdale

Southgate, Ml 48195

Dear Mr. Gaglio

On August 17, 2008, the City of Troy entered into contract #2010-90000005 OB
Domiinic Gaglio Construction Inc. to provide a one-year contract for Industrial
road concrete pavement repair program. This contract contained an option to
renew for Two(2) additional one-year periods at the same prices, terms,

conditions as the original cantract, and through mutual consent of both parties,.

4

Please fax this letter back indicating if Dominic Gaglio Construction Inc.
Wishes to renew this contract until June 30, 2011. Our fax number is (248) 524-
3520. A request by City staff to determine the successful bidder’s interest in
renewing the contract in no way obligates the City. The option cannot be
exercised without Troy City Council approval and a blanket purchase order

issued.

If you have any questions please call me at (248) 524-3595
CHECK ONE:

Dominic Gaglio Construction Inc. is interested in renewing thF
contract under the same prices, terms, and conditions: L.<)’

Dominic Gaglio Construction Inc. is not interested in renewin
the€ontract: , (
¢ - “/f -
L AL
Signed: Authorized Company Representative
Date: /3~ 3C-<4

\u-r(g

Thank you,

Marina Basta Farouk
Public Works Department
City of Troy
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Date: 12/30/2009

ATTN: Mr. Alfredo Scappaticci
Major Cement Company
15430 Dale

Detroit, Ml 48223

Dear Mr. Scappaticci:

On August 26, 2009, the City of Troy entered into contract #2010-890000006 OB with
Major Cement to provide a one-year contract for Major road concrete pavement repair
program. This contract contained an option to renew for Two(2) additional one-year
pericds at the same prices, terms, conditions as the original contract, and through
mutual consent of both parties,.

Please fax this letter back indicating if Major Cement Company wishes to renew
this contract until June 30, 2011. Our fax number is (248) 524-3520. A request
by City staff to determine the successful bidder’s interest in renewing the contract
in no way obligates the City. The option cannot be exercised without Troy City
Council approval and a blanket purchase order issued.

If you have any questions please call me at (248) 524-35985

CHECK ONE:

Major Cement Company_is_interested in renewing the contract
under the same prices, terms, and conditions:

Major Cement Company is not interested in renewing the
contract: ()

X - .
Signeg: Authorized Cﬁ;tpany Representative

Date: };,/’S-O /7001

Thank you,

Marina Basta Farouk
Public Works Department
City of Troy



ar/13/zele 18:82 5867834858 DILISID CONTRACTING © PAGE Bl/el

‘

Troy

Date: 12/30/09

ATTN: Mr. Giuseppe D. Lia
Dilisio Contracting inc
23525 Lakepointe Drive
Clinton Township, Mt 48036

Dear Mr. Giuseppe D. Lia

On September 2, 2009, the Cnty of Troy entered into contract #2010-90000007
OB with Dilisio Contracting Inc., {0 provide a one-year contract for tri-party road
concrete pavement repair program This contract oontamed an option {o renew
for Two(2) additional one-year periods at the same prices, terms, conditions as
the original contract, and through mutual consent of both parties,.

Please fax this letter back indicating if Dilisio Contracting Inc. wishes to renew
this contract untif June 30, 2011. Our fax number is (248) 524-3520. A request
by City staff to determine the successful bidder’s interest in renewing the contract
in no way obligaies the City. The option cannot be exercised without Troy City
Council approval and a blanket purchase order issued.

if you have any questions please calt me at (248) 524-3595
CHECK ONE:

Dilisio Contracting Inc., is interested in renewing the confract
under the same prices, terms, and conditions:

Dilisio Contracting Inc., is not interested in renewing the
contract: ()

X Gegoen . Pews

Signed:/Kuthorized Company Representative

Date: /"‘ /?- 2[)/0

Thank you,

Marina Basta Farouk
Public Works Department
City of Troy




From?PURCHASTNG 248 519 7608 04/12/2010 04256 #060 P.ODL/00]

Aprll 12, 2010

ATTN: Mr. Roceo Grimaldi
mrd Rock Conerate inc,

38148 Abruzzi Drive

Westland, M1 48185

Dear Mr. Grimaidi:

On August 17, 2009, the City of Troy entered Into contract #2010-900000040B with Hard Reck Cenrele Inc., to
provide a one-year confract for local road concrste pavement repair program with an option to renew for two (2)
sddiional spo-year perlode under the same prices, leans, and congitions s the otiginal toniract,

On Janvary 1, 2010, your company sgreed to extend the confract for one additional year, untll June 30, 2011,
pending Troy City Councll approval.

As part of the renawal coniract, the Clty 5 requesting that your company pay the hourly rata for any overtima incurred
by the Clty of Troy Inspectors for all iInspections that fall cutside the normal eight (8) hour work day as stated below

$50.00 / hour - Inciucias charps for inspectar and vakicle

Normal working hours: Monday — Friday, 7:30 a.m. = 3:30 p.m. (Excluding official City Holldays)

Any inspections that fall outside of thesa hours will b charged at the hourly rale listed above.
Plaase fax this letter back to the City of Troy Purehasing Depariment by 10:00 am, on Tuesday, April 13, 2015,
Indieating if Hard Rock Concrete Inc. agrees to provide concrete pavement repalr 2ervices with the changes indicated,
under the eame prices, terme and conditions of the original contract. The fax number & {248) 812-7608,

If you frava any questions pleass call me at (248) 680-7281.

CHECK ONE: i
Hard Rock Conerate Inc. ngresa {0 incorporate the above chenges to the pavesiant ropalr contract under the
same prices, tenns, and conditions of the orlginal contmel: - V’/

(

Hard ,iOCk C 2 Ine. iz not inter in aceapiing the stated changes {o the contraet: )
Xéq./f%‘ o p g A ‘?@(‘)3/ ;

slmaﬁzﬁd}ompany Reprebentdfive

Dater—7 '/ﬁw/ﬁ . ,

Thank you,

Juliz Hamliton, CPPB -
Purchasing Department
City of Troy |

Gulalters = Memo ~ Optien +Lir - Concrete Pavement Repalr - Inspaction Fess Addition.doa



From: PURCHASING 248 613 7608 0471272010 07:57 #061 P.C01/001

H
~

Agril 12, 2010

i
ATTN: Mr. Daminie Gagllo
Dorminic Gaglio Canstruction, Inc.
183 4?1 Drysdale
Southgam, Mi 48195

Dear Mr (Gaglie:

On August 17, 2008, the Gity of Troy entered into contrast #2010-800000080B with Dominic Gaglio Gmswuctmn, Iné.
te prwiﬁs a ora-year cohtraet for local road concrete pavement repair program with an oplion to renew for fwo (2)

;

addjt] unai one-year periods under the sams prices, terms, and conditiona as the orlginal contract, !

On D@c&mbar 30, 2&09 your company agresd to exisnd the contract for ane add:tronaﬂ yaar, until June 30, 2011
pendmg Troy Cily Council appraval, i g

Ay par‘t of the renowal contract, the Gtty s requesting that your compeany pay the haurly rate for any nwemme incurred
by the City of Troy Inspectors for all mspectivns that fall puteide the nermal elght (8) hour work day as alated helow

{

$50.00 / hour - includes charge for inspecior and vehicle |
Normal working hours: Manday — Friday, 7:30 a.m. i~3:30 . (Excluding official Gity Hnlfdays)
Any inspections that fall outside of these hours will b,le charged a1 the hourly rate listed abo?ve.

H

Please fax this letter back to the City of Troy Purchasing Depariment by 40:00 a.m. on Tussday, fAs:r!l 13, 2010,
indicating if Dominic Gaglio Construction, Inc, agrees {o provide concrele pavement repair serviges with the changes
indicated, under the sams prices, termg and condltions of the original confract. The fax number is (248) 619-7608.

i

i you:have any questions plsase call me at (248) 630-7281.

GHECK ONE: _
Darﬁmar; Gaglio Constructien, inc. agrees to Incarporate the above changes to the pavsmsnt raga/
contract under the same pricaz, tarms, and eorditions of the original eontracl: i (

inlerastey in acoapting the stated smmw to the mntraet {1

X
i

BemtﬁﬁEag i Constroction, ;ﬁ\

X ;{a oo f!f“

Signeo: Autharized Company Rgpresentstive

ES A e .
Dme: 7 f S /0 ‘

Thark you,

Julie Hamilion, CPPB
Purchaaing Departman
City of Tray

O/ etiters ~ Memao = Oplion «»/Lir - Concrets Pavement Rapalr - Inspecfon Foaza Addifon.doc
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From :PURCHAS MG 248 619 /008 04/12/2010 07:57 #062 P.001/001

April 12, 2010

ATTN: Mr. Aifredo Scappaticai
Major Cement Company
15430 Dale

Detroit, M| 48223

Dear Mr. Scappaticol:

On August 17, 2008, the City of Troy entered into confract #2010-900000060B with Major Cemant Company fo
provide & one-yaar contract for looal road concrete pavement rapair program with an pption to renew for two (2)
additionsl one-year periods under the same prices, terms, and conditlong as the orlginal contract.

On December 30, 2008, your company agread to extend the coniract for nne additional year, until June 30, 2011
pending Troy City Councll approval.

As part of the renewal contract, the Chy is requesting that your company pay the hourly rate for any avertime incurred
by the City of Troy inspectors for &l Inspactions that fall ouiside the normal eight (8) hour work day as stated below

$580.00  hour - includes charge Tor inspector and vehicle

Nprmal working hours: Monday - Friday, 7:30 a.m. - 3:30 p.m. {Excluding official City Holldays)

Any inspagtions that fall outgide of these hours will be charged at the hourly rate listed above.
Please fax this lefter back 10 the Clty of Tray Purchasing Department by 1000 aun. on Tuasday, Apcil 18, 2010,
Irdicating if Major Cement Comparly agrees {o provide concrete pavement repalr services with the changes Ind catsd
under the same prices, ferms and conditions of the original contract. The fax number is (248) 519-7608,
if you have any questions please cali me at (248) 880-7291, ’
CHECK aeggg

Major Cement Cumpany agrees fo Incorporate the sbove changes to the uawsmant repair contract
under tha same pricses, termsg, and conditions of thie original contract: %4

Major Cement Company |8 not interested in accepting the stated changes to the confract:  { )

X /‘%,{f"”“\

Signad: geﬁﬁcﬁmd Company Representativa
Date:__ =/ ~ Jd~doIw

Thank you,

Julie Hamitton, CPPB

Purchasing Department

City of Troy

G/l oitors ~ Mame — Ciption -/Lir - Concrete Pavemeni Repalr- Inspection Faes Additon.doe

TOTAL, P.0O1
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From:PURCHASING | 248 613 /608 0471272010 07:58 #063 P.001/001

7

Aprl 12, 2010

ATTN: Mr.-Jo Lla

Dilisio Cortraating e,
23525 | akspoints Drive
Clinton Townahip, ptl 48038

Denr Mr. Lig:

On August 17, 2008 tha City of Troy entered Inlo contract #2010-8000000708 with Diisin Contracting Ing., o provide
& one-yaar comract for local road concrete pavement repair program with an option io renew for two (2) additional
one-year periods undsy the seme prices, termme, and condilions =s the original contract. :

On January 1, 201D, your somparty agresd fo extend the contract for one goditions! yesr, uniil June 30, 2011 pending
“Troy City Councfl approval,

As par of the renewal condract, the Gity fe raquesting that your pompany pay the hourly rete for any overime nourred
by tha Gity of Tray Inspectors for all inepeciions that fall cuiside the normal aight {8) hour work day as stated below

$50.00 { hour - Inciudes charge for inspector and vehicie
Normal working hours: Monday — Friday, 7:30 a.m, — 3:30 p.m. (Excluding official ity Holidays)
Any inspections that fall oulside of these hours will ba charged at the howly rete sfad abovea.

Flease i this leter back m‘ the City of Troy Purchasing Department by 10:08 am. on Tuesday, Agrll 48, 2010,

indicating if Dilisic Contracting Inc. agrees to provide cancrets pavement refial services with the changes indicated,
urder the same prices, terms and conditions of the original cenbast. The fax number is (248) 619-7808.

If you have any questions pleass oall me at (248} 880-7291,

CHEGK ONE:!

Dilisio Confracting Ine. agress v Incorporsta the sbove changes fe the povemesnt repsir cortmet under
the same prices, terma, sind conditions of the origine! contrack: <

¢ In scespiing the stated changes fo the confmet: ()

Dilisio Contracting Ine, Ig not Interesis

Dt Zf~--~/3 /D

Thank you,

Julis Hamitton, CPPB
Pursimsing Depariment

Cify of Troy
SLptiaTs — Ma o ~ Dpion LU - Concrate Favement Repaly - mpection Fres ASMtion goe
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CITY COUNCIL MINUTES - Final August 17, 2009

C) Standard Purchasing Resolution 1: Award to Low Bidders — Concrete Pavement
Repair

Resolution #2009-08-250-F-4¢

RESOLVED, That Troy City Council hereby AWARDS contracts to complete the concrete
pavement repair program for 2009/10 with an option to renew for two (2) additional one-year
periods to the four lowest total bidders: Hard Rock Concrete, Inc. of Westland, for proposal A,
Local Roads; Dominic Gaglio Construction, Inc. of Southgate, for proposal B, Industrial Roads;
Major Cement Company of Detroit, for proposal C, Major Roads; and Dilisio Contracting, Inc. of
Clinton Township for proposal D, Tri-Party County Roads at unit prices contained in the bid
tabulation opened July 29, 2009, a copy of which shall be ATTACHED to the original Minutes
of this meeting based on scope of work and ability to add additional locations up to, but not
exceeding amounts budgeted; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That the awards are CONTINGENT upon submission of
properly executed bid and contract documents, including bonds, insurance certificates and all
other specified requirements.

d) Standard Purchasing Resolution 2: Bid Award — Lowest Bidder Meeting
Specifications — Community Center Treadmills

Resolution #2009-08-250-F-4d

RESOLVED, That Troy City Council hereby AWARDS a contract to furnish and install eight (8)
new commercial treadmills at the Community Center and to purchase the City’s eight (8) Precor
trade-ins to the overall lowest bidder meeting specifications, Fitness Things, Inc. of Plymouth,
MI, at an estimated net total cost of $30,400.00, at prices contained in the bid tabulation
opened July 9, 2009, a copy of which shall be ATTACHED to the original Minutes of this
meeting; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That the award is CONTINGENT upon the submission of
properly executed bid and contract documents, including insurance certificates and all other
specified requirements.

F-5 Nancy Huntley, Legal Guardian of Carolyn Huntley v. City of Troy
Resolution #2009-08-250-F-5

RESOLVED, That Troy City Council hereby AUTHORIZES and DIRECTS the City Attorney to
represent the City of Troy in any and all claims and damages in the matter of Nancy Huntley,
Legal Guardian of Carolyn Huntley, a Protected Person v. City of Troy; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That Troy City Council hereby AUTHORIZES the City Attorney
to pay necessary costs and expenses and to retain any necessary expert witnesses to
adequately represent the City.

-12 -



CITY COUNCIL ACTION REPORT

August 14, 2009
TO: John Szerlag, City Manager

FROM: Brian P. Murphy, Assistant City Manager/Economic Development Services
Susan A. Leirstein, Purchasing Director
Timothy L. Richnak, Public Works Director

SUBJECT:  Standard Purchasing Resolution 1: Award To Low Bidders — Concrete Pavement Repair

Background

e On July 29, 2009, bids were received for Concrete Pavement Repair under four proposals: A)- Local
Roads, B)- Industrial Roads C)- Major Roads, and D)-Tri Party County Roads with an option to renew
for two (2) additional one- year periods.

e 197 vendors were notified via the MITN website.

¢ Hard Rock Concrete Inc, Dominic Gaglio Construction Inc, Major Cement Company and Dilisio
Contracting Inc were the four separate low bidders for each proposal category, A-D respectively.

e Additional locations may be added based on the scope of work up to, but not exceeding amounts
budgeted.

Financial Considerations
¢ Funds for this project are available in the 2009/10 Capital Accounts for Public Works Construction.

Proposal Account # Budget Amount _ Estimated Total Cost
A 401.447.499.7989.500 Local Roads $2,637,000 $2,056,650
B 401.447.479.7989.300 Industrial Roads $2,000,000 $1,516,150
C 401.447.479.7989.500 Major Roads $1,000,000 $ 847,450
D 401.447.479.7989.091016 Tri-Party Cty Rd $ 600,000 $ 563,325

Legal Considerations
e ITB-COTO09-07, Concrete Pavement Repair was competitively bid as required by City Charter and
Code.
e The awards are contingent upon the recommended bidders’ submission of proper contracts and bid
documents, including bonds, insurance certificates and all other specified requirements.

Policy Considerations
e Moving this work forward would improve public safety and also reduce the liability for the City. (Outcome
Statement [)
e Troy adds value to properties through maintenance or upgrades of infrastructure. (Outcome Statement I1)

Options
e City management and the Public Works department recommend contract awards to four separate low
total bidders, Hard Rock Concrete Inc of Westland, for proposal A, Local Roads; Dominic Gaglio
Construction Inc, of Southgate, for proposal B, Industrial Roads; Major Cement Company of Detroit,
MI, for proposal C, Major Roads; and Dilisio Contracting Inc of Clinton Township for proposal D; Tri
Party County Roads at unit prices contained in the bid tabulation based on scope of work and ability to
add additional locations up to, but not exceeding amounts budgeted.

Prepared by: Marina Basta-Farouk, Project Construction Manager



Opening Date -- 07/29/09

CITY OF TROY
BID TABULATION

ITB-COT 09-07
Page 1

Date Prepared -- 07/31/09 jh/sl CONCRETE PAVEMENT REPAIR
VENDOR NAME: Hard Rock Dominic Gaglio Major Cement Dilisio Contracting
Concrete Inc Construction, Inc. Company Inc.
Ck Number 530033281-3 15254580 343805248 15252566
Ck Amount $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
Proposal A: Local Road Maintenance Section 5,6,8,10,13,15,19,20, 25 & scattered locations
FY2009/2010 FY2009/2010 FY2009/2010 Year 2009/2010
NO. DESCRIPTION EST. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1 |Remove & Replace with Concrete NO BID
9" Non-reinforced- 1,000 S.Y. $33.00 $37.85 $0.00 $37.25
2 |Remove & Replace with Concrete
8" Non-reinforced- 5,000 S.Y. $32.00 $36.20 $0.00 $34.50
3 |Remove & Replace with Concrete
7" Non-reinforced- 59,000 SY $30.00 $34.00 $0.00 $32.50
4 |Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/
Driveway 6" Non-reinforced (Locations not ... 100 S.F. $4.00 $3.90 $0.00 $4.00
5 |Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/
4" Non-reinforced (Locations not specified) 100 S.F. $3.50 $3.85 $0.00 $4.00
6 |Gatewell Adjustment 2 Each $150.00 $190.00 $0.00 $125.00
7 |Gatewell Repair - Per Foot 4 L.F. $175.00 $100.00 $0.00 $200.00
8 [Manhole or Catch Basin Adjustment 40 each $150.00 $170.00 $0.00 $150.00
9 [Manhole or Catch Basin - Repair per Foot 20 L.F. $175.00 $100.00 $0.00 $200.00
10 |Misc. Base Repair per CY to excavate/replace
with 21AA Gravel, compacted in place 3,600 C.Y. $9.00 $20.00 $0.00 $18.00
11 [Installation of 6" edge drain 200 L.F. $12.00 $9.50 $0.00 $7.00
12 |Remove and Replace Curb & Gutter 200 L.F. $18.00 $25.00 $0.00 $20.00
13 |[Sidewalk Ramp, ADA, Modified w/Inserts 6,000 S.F. $7.00 $6.00 $0.00 $8.00
14 |Sidewalk Ramp, Detectable Warning, Retrofit,| 100 S.F. $20.00 $22.00 $0.00 $8.00
15 |Restoration Included Included Included Included Included
16 [Traffic Maintenance Included Included Included Included Included
Estimated Total Cost - Proposal A $2,056,650.00 $2,352,305.00 $0.00 $2,258,100.00

Proposal B: Industrial Road Maintenance - Lakeview, Golfview, Wilshire, Souter, Investment, Troy Center, Tower, Rankin,

Chicago & Scattered Locations

Year 2009/2010

Year 2009/2010

Year 2009/2010

Year 2009/2010

NO. DESCRIPTION EST. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1 |Remove & Replace with Concrete NO BID
9" Non-reinforced- 38,000 SY $42.50 $38.00 $0.00 $41.50
2 |Remove & Replace with Concrete
8" Non-reinforced- 200 S.Y. $42.00 $38.00 $0.00 $44.00
3 |Remove & Replace with Concrete
7" Non-reinforced- 200 S.Y. $40.00 $34.00 $0.00 $43.00
4 |Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/
Driveway 6" Non-reinforced (Locations not ...{ 100 S.F. $4.50 $3.90 $0.00 $4.00
5 [Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/
4" Non-reinforced (Locations not specified) 100 S.F. $4.00 $3.80 $0.00 $4.00
6 |Gatewell Adjustment 2 Each $150.00 $190.00 $0.00 $125.00
7 |Gatewell Repair - Per Foot 4 L.F. $175.00 $100.00 $0.00 $200.00
8 [Manhole or Catch Basin Adjustment 25 each $175.00 $170.00 $0.00 $150.00
9 [Manhole or Catch Basin - Repair per Foot 20 L.F. $150.00 $100.00 $0.00 $200.00
10 [Misc. Base Repair per CY to excavate/replace
with 21AA Gravel, compacted in place 2,000 C.Y. $9.00 $20.00 $0.00 $18.00
11 [Installation of 6" edge drain 100 L.F. $12.00 $9.50 $0.00 $7.00
12 [Remove and Replace Curb & Gutter 200 L.F. $18.00 $25.00 $0.00 $20.00
13 |[Sidewalk Ramp, ADA, Modified w/Inserts 300 S.F. $7.00 $6.00 $0.00 $8.00
14 |Sidewalk Ramp, Detectable Warning, Retrofit,| 100 S.F. $20.00 $22.00 $0.00 $8.00
15 [Restoration Included Included Included Included Included
16 |[Traffic Maintenance Included Included Included Included Included
Estimated Total Cost - Proposal B $1,667,525.00 $1,516,150.00 $0.00 $1,647,900.00




Opening Date -- 07/29/09
Date Prepared -- 07/31/09

CITY OF TROY

BID TABULATION

CONCRETE PAVEMENT REPAIR

ITB-COT 09-07
Page 2

VENDOR NAME: Hard Rock Dominic Gaglio Major Cement Dilisio Contracting
Concrete, Inc. Construction, Inc. Company Inc.
Proposal C: Major Road Maintenance - Rochester Road, Coolidge, and scattered locations
NO. |DESCRIPTION EST. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1 |Remove & Replace with Concrete NO BID NO BID
9" Non-reinforced- 6 Sac 18,600 SY $0.00 $0.00 $43.50 $44.90
2 |Remove & Replace with Concrete
8" Non-reinforced- 200 S.Y. $0.00 $0.00 $37.00 $47.90
3 |Remove & Replace with Concrete
7" Non-reinforced- 200 S.Y. $0.00 $0.00 $35.00 $46.90
4 |Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/
Driveway 6" Non-reinforced (Locations not ... 200 S.F. $0.00 $0.00 $5.00 $4.00
5 [Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/
4" Non-reinforced (Locations not specified) 100 S.F. $0.00 $0.00 $4.00 $4.00
6 |Gatewell Adjustment 1 Each $0.00 $0.00 $250.00 $125.00
7 |Gatewell Repair - Per Foot 2 L.F. $0.00 $0.00 $125.00 $200.00
8 |Manhole or Catch Basin Adjustment 2 each $0.00 $0.00 $250.00 $150.00
9 [Manhole or Catch Basin - Repair per Foot 2 L.F. $0.00 $0.00 $125.00 $200.00
10 |Misc. Base Repair per CY to excavate/replace
with 21AA Gravel, compacted in place 1,000 C.Y. $0.00 $0.00 $15.00 $1.00
11 |Installation of 6" edge drain 100 L.F. $0.00 $0.00 $8.00 $7.00
12 |Remove and Replace Curb & Gutter 100 L.F. $0.00 $0.00 $15.00 $20.00
13 |[Sidewalk Ramp, ADA, Modified w/Inserts 300 S.F. $0.00 $0.00 $10.00 $8.00
14 |Sidewalk Ramp, Detectable Warning, Retrofit,| 100 S.F. $0.00 $0.00 $10.00 $8.00
15 |Restoration Included Included Included Included Included
16 [Traffic Maintenance Included Included Included Included Included
Estimated Total Cost - Proposal C $0.00 $0.00 $847,450.00 $863,425.00
Proposal D: Tri Party Concrete Repair - Big Beaver, Dequindre, John R, Crooks, Long Lake, Livernois & scattered locations
NO. |DESCRIPTION EST. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1 |Remove & Replace with Concrete NO BID NO BID
10" Non-reinforced- 10,000 SY $0.00 $0.00 $48.00 $45.90
2 |Remove & Replace with Concrete
9" Non-reinforced- 1,000 S.Y. $0.00 $0.00 $43.50 $48.90
3 |Remove & Replace with Concrete
8" Non-reinforced- 500 S.Y. $0.00 $0.00 $37.00 $47.90
4 |Remove & Replace with Concrete
7" Non-reinforced- 500 S.Y. $0.00 $0.00 $35.00 $46.90
Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/
5 |[Driveway 6" Non-reinforced (Locations not ...| 50 S.F. $0.00 $0.00 $5.00 $4.00
Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/
6 [4" Non-reinforced (Locations not specified) 50 S.F. $0.00 $0.00 $4.00 $4.00
7 |Gatewell Adjustment 1 Each $0.00 $0.00 $250.00 $125.00
8 |Gatewell Repair - Per Foot 2 L.F. $0.00 $0.00 $125.00 $200.00
9 |Manhole or Catch Basin Adjustment 2 each $0.00 $0.00 $250.00 $150.00
10 |Manhole or Catch Basin - Repair per Foot 2 L.F. $0.00 $0.00 $125.00 $200.00
Misc. Base Repair per CY to excavate/replace
11 |with 21AA Gravel, compacted in place 500 C.Y. $0.00 $0.00 $15.00 $1.00
12 |Installation of 6" edge drain 100 L.F. $0.00 $0.00 $8.00 $7.00
13 |Remove and Replace Curb & Gutter 100 L.F. $0.00 $0.00 $25.00 $20.00
14 |[Sidewalk Ramp, ADA, Modified w/Inserts 300 S.F. $0.00 $0.00 $10.00 $8.00
15 |Sidewalk Ramp, Detectable Warning, Retrofit,| 100 S.F. $0.00 $0.00 $9.00 $8.00
16 [Restoration Included Included Included Included Included
17 |Traffic Maintenance Included Included Included Included Included
Estimated Total Cost - Proposal D $0.00 $0.00 $575,900.00 $563,325.00




Opening Date -- 07/29/08
Date Prepared -- 07/31/09

VENDOR NAME:

CITY OF TROY
BID TABULATION

CONCRETE PAVEMENT REPAIR

ITB-COT 09-07
Page 3

PROGRESS PAYMENTS:

CONTACT INFORMATION

AWARD
Partial Contract:

COMPLETION SCHEDULE:

INSURANCE: Can Meet

Cannot Meet

PAYMENT TERMS:

WARRANTY:

EXCEPTIONS:

ACKNOWLEGEMENT:
VENDOR QUESTIONNAIRE
FORMS: Legal Staus of Bidder

Non-Collusion Affidavit
Addenda #1 & #2

ATTEST:

Marina Basta Farouk
Debra Painter

Tom Rosewarne
Linda Bockstanz

G: ITB-COT 09-07 Concrete Pavement Repair

Hrs of Oper.
Phone

100% of Contract

Proposal A
Proposal B
Proposal C
Proposal D

YorN
YorN
YorN

YorN
YorN

Hard Rock Dominic Gaglio Major Cement Dilisio Contracting
Concrete, Inc. Construction, Inc. Company Inc.
Every 2 Weeks
Bi-Weekly or once a month Every 2 Weeks Monthly
M-Sat
8 AMto 8 PM 7 AM to 6 PM 7 AMto 5 PM 9 AMto 5 PM

(734) 564-0925

(734) 216-2051 | (248) 388-1168

(586) 405-4578

X X

X X X

X X

X X

X

BY JUNE 30th OF ANY CONTRACT YEAR
XX XX XX XX
Bi-Weekly Once a Month 2 Weeks Monthly
As in Contract 1 year 1 year 1 year

Blank N/A Blank N/A
Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes
No Yes No Yes

PROPOSAL: City of Troy Concrete Pavement Repair Program for Local,
Major, Industrial Roads with an Option to Renew for Two (2) Additional
One-Year Periods.

HIGHLIGHTED AREAS DENOTES LOW TOTAL BIDDERS BY PROPOSAL

Susan Leirstein CPPB
Purchasing Director




Opening Date -- 07/29/09
Date Prepared -- 07/31/09

CITY OF TROY

BID TABULATION
CONCRETE PAVEMENT REPAIR

ITB-COT 09-07
Page 4

Lacaria Concrete &

VENDOR NAME: Florence Major Cement | Giorgi Concrete| Audia Construction
Cement Co Paving L.L.C. Companies
#0180543 - $5,000
Ck Number 343813467 343805249 100438 #15247757 - $5,000
Ck Amount $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
Proposal A: Local Road Maintenance Section 5,6,8,10,13,15,19,20,25 & scattered locations
FY2009/2010 FY2009/2010 FY2009/2010 Year 2009/2010
NO. DESCRIPTION EST. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1 |Remove & Replace with Concrete
9" Non-reinforced- 1,000 S.Y. $40.40 $45.00 $44.00 $43.66
2 |Remove & Replace with Concrete
8" Non-reinforced- 5,000 S.Y. $36.60 $37.00 $39.00 $41.10
3 |Remove & Replace with Concrete
7" Non-reinforced- 59,000 SY $32.95 $33.00 $35.50 $38.20
4 |Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/
Driveway 6" Non-reinforced (Locations not ....] 100 S.F. $3.75 $5.00 $4.11 $11.00
5 |Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/
4" Non-reinforced (Locations not specified) 100 S.F. $3.45 $4.00 $4.11 $10.00
6 |Gatewell Adjustment 2 Each $190.00 $250.00 $250.00 $500.00
7 |Gatewell Repair - Per Foot 4 L.F. $220.00 $125.00 $250.00 $250.00
8 |Manhole or Catch Basin Adjustment 40 each $215.00 $200.00 $250.00 $195.00
9 |Manhole or Catch Basin - Repair per Foot 20 L.F. $230.00 $125.00 $250.00 $150.00
10 |Misc. Base Repair per CY to excavate/replace
with 21AA Gravel, compacted in place 3,600 C.Y. $12.00 $24.00 $20.00 $19.00
11 |Installation of 6" edge drain 200 L.F. $12.00 $12.00 $10.00 $18.00
12 |Remove and Replace Curb & Gutter 200 L.F. $19.30 $15.00 $20.00 $25.00
13 |Sidewalk Ramp, ADA, Modified w/Inserts 6,000 S.F. $6.30 $9.50 $13.00 $7.00
14 |Sidewalk Ramp, Detectable Warning, Retrofit, 100 S.F. $16.80 $10.00 $30.00 $20.00
15 |Restoration Included Included Included Included Included
16 |Traffic Maintenance Included Included Included Included Included
Estimated Total Cost — Proposal A
$2,271,570.00 $2,339,200.00 $2,509,822.00 $2,638,860.00

Proposal B: Industrial Road Maintenance - Lakeview, Golfview, Wilshire, Souter, Investment, Troy Center, Tower, Rankin,

Chicago & Scattered Locations

Year 2009/2010 | Year 2009/2010 | Year 2009/2010| Year 2009/2010
NO. DESCRIPTION EST. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1 |Remove & Replace with Concrete NO BID
9" Non-reinforced- 38,000 SY $41.10 $39.00 $0.00 $45.66
2 |Remove & Replace with Concrete
8" Non-reinforced- 200 S.Y. $38.25 $37.00 $0.00 $44.66
3 |Remove & Replace with Concrete
7" Non-reinforced- 200 S.Y. $35.65 $35.00 $0.00 $44.41
4 |Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/
Driveway 6" Non-reinforced (Locations not ....] 100 S.F. $3.75 $5.00 $0.00 $11.00
5 |Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/
4" Non-reinforced (Locations not specified) 100 S.F. $3.45 $4.00 $0.00 $10.00
6 |Gatewell Adjustment 2 Each $190.00 $250.00 $0.00 $500.00
7 |Gatewell Repair - Per Foot 4 L.F. $220.00 $100.00 $0.00 $250.00
8 [Manhole or Catch Basin Adjustment 25 each $215.00 $175.00 $0.00 $195.00
9 [Manhole or Catch Basin - Repair per Foot 20 L.F. $230.00 $100.00 $0.00 $150.00
10 |Misc. Base Repair per CY to excavate/replace
with 21AA Gravel, compacted in place 2,000 C.Y. $12.00 $15.00 $0.00 $19.00
11 |Installation of 6" edge drain 100 L.F. $12.00 $10.00 $0.00 $18.00
12 |Remove and Replace Curb & Gutter 200 L.F. $19.30 $15.00 $0.00 $25.00
13 |Sidewalk Ramp, ADA, Modified w/Inserts 300 S.F. $6.30 $10.00 $0.00 $7.50
14 |Sidewalk Ramp, Detectable Warning, Retrofit, | 100 S.F. $16.80 $5.00 $0.00 $20.00
15 |Restoration Included Included Included Included Included
16_|Traffic Maintenance Included Included Included Included Included
Estimated Total Cost - Proposal B $1,621,165.00f  $1,542,075.00 $0.00 $1,813,919.00




Opening Date -- 07/29/09
Date Prepared -- 07/31/09

CITY OF TROY

BID TABULATION
CONCRETE PAVEMENT REPAIR

ITB-COT 09-07
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VENDOR NAME: Florence Major Cement | Giorgi Concrete| Lacaria Concrete &
Cement Co Paving L.L.C. Audia Construction
Companies
Proposal C: Major Road Maintenance - Rochester Road, Coolidge, and scattered locations
NO. |DESCRIPTION EST. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

1 |Remove & Replace with Concrete NO BID NO BID

9" Non-reinforced- 18,600 SY $45.95 $0.00 $0.00 $51.50
2 |Remove & Replace with Concrete

8" Non-reinforced- 200 S.Y. $38.00 $0.00 $0.00 $49.75
3 |Remove & Replace with Concrete

7" Non-reinforced- 200 S.Y. $36.00 $0.00 $0.00 $48.25
4 |Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/

Driveway 6" Non-reinforced (Locations not ....| 200 S.F. $3.75 $0.00 $0.00 $11.00
5 |Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/

4" Non-reinforced (Locations not specified) 100 S.F. $3.45 $0.00 $0.00 $10.00
6 |Gatewell Adjustment 1 Each $190.00 $0.00 $0.00 $500.00
7 |Gatewell Repair - Per Foot 2 L.F. $220.00 $0.00 $0.00 $250.00
8 |Manhole or Catch Basin Adjustment 2 each $215.00 $0.00 $0.00 $500.00
9 |Manhole or Catch Basin - Repair per Foot 2 L.F. $230.00 $0.00 $0.00 $200.00
10 |Misc. Base Repair per CY to excavate/replace

with 21AA Gravel, compacted in place 1,000 C.Y. $12.00 $0.00 $0.00 $19.00
11 |Installation of 6" edge drain 100 L.F. $12.00 $0.00 $0.00 $18.00
12 |Remove and Replace Curb & Gutter 100 L.F. $19.30 $0.00 $0.00 $25.00
13 |Sidewalk Ramp, ADA, Modified w/Inserts 300 S.F. $6.30 $0.00 $0.00 $7.50
14 |Sidewalk Ramp, Detectable Warning, Retrofit, [ 100 S.F. $16.80 $0.00 $0.00 $20.00
15 |Restoration Included Included Included Included Included
16 |Traffic Maintenance Included Included Included Included Included

Estimated Total Cost - Proposal C $890,785.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,010,650.00

Proposal D: Tri Party Concrete Repair - Big Beaver, Dequindre, John R, Crooks, Long Lake, Livernois & scattered locations

NO. |DESCRIPTION EST. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1 |Remove & Replace with Concrete NO BID NO BID
10" Non-reinforced- 10,000 SY $52.90 $0.00 $0.00 $57.75
2 |Remove & Replace with Concrete
9" Non-reinforced- 1,000 S.Y. $49.05 $0.00 $0.00 $56.00
3 |Remove & Replace with Concrete
8" Non-reinforced- 500 S.Y. $38.00 $0.00 $0.00 $54.75
4 |Remove & Replace with Concrete
7" Non-reinforced- 500 SY. $36.00 $0.00 $0.00 $52.75
Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/
5 |Driveway 6" Non-reinforced (Locations not ....] 50 S.F. $3.75 $0.00 $0.00 $11.00
Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/
6 |4" Non-reinforced (Locations not specified) 50 S.F. $3.45 $0.00 $0.00 $10.00
7 |Gatewell Adjustment 1 Each $190.00 $0.00 $0.00 $500.00
8 |Gatewell Repair - Per Foot 2 L.F. $220.00 $0.00 $0.00 $200.00
9 [Manhole or Catch Basin Adjustment 2 each $215.00 $0.00 $0.00 $500.00
10 |Manhole or Catch Basin - Repair per Foot 2 L.F. $230.00 $0.00 $0.00 $200.00
Misc. Base Repair per CY to excavate/replace
11 |with 21AA Gravel, compacted in place 500 C.Y. $12.00 $0.00 $0.00 $25.00
12 |Installation of 6" edge drain 100 L.F. $12.00 $0.00 $0.00 $20.00
13 |Remove and Replace Curb & Gutter 100 L.F. $19.30 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00
14 |Sidewalk Ramp, ADA, Modified w/Inserts 300 S.F. $6.30 $0.00 $0.00 $10.00
15 [Sidewalk Ramp, Detectable Warning, Retrofit, 100 S.F. $16.80 $0.00 $0.00 $20.00
16 [Restoration Included Included Included Included Included
17 |Traffic Maintenance Included Included Included Included Included
Estimated Total Cost - Proposal D $629,630.00 $0.00 $0.00 $713,000.00




CITY OF TROY
BID TABULATION
CONCRETE PAVEMENT REPAIR

ITB-COT 09-07
Opening Date -- 07/29/08 Page 6

Date Prepared -- 07/31/09

Lacaria Concrete &
VENDOR NAME: Florence Major Cement | Giorgi Concrete| Audia Construction
Cement Co Paving L.L.C. Companies
PROGRESS PAYMENTS: Bi-Weekly Every 2 Weeks | Every 30 Days Monthly
CONTACT INFORMATION Hrs of Oper.| Per City Ordinance | 7 AMto5PM | 7 AMto 5 PM 7 AMto 7 PM
Phone (810) 560-4141 | (248) 207-7819 | (313) 300-3599 | (313) 218-6834
AWARD 100% of Contract X X
Partial Contract: Proposal A X X
Proposal B X
Proposal C
Proposal D
COMPLETION SCHEDULE: BY JUNE 30th OF ANY CONTRACT YEAR
INSURANCE: Can Meet XX XX XX XX
Cannot Meet
PAYMENT TERMS: Bi-Weekly 2 Weeks |Every 30 Days Monthly
Mtnce Bond
WARRANTY: 1 year 1 year 1 year Blank
EXCEPTIONS: None Blank Blank None
ACKNOWLEGEMENT: YorN Yes Yes Yes Yes
VENDOR QUESTIONNAIRE YorN Yes Yes Yes Yes
FORMS: Legal Status of Bidder Y orN Yes Yes Yes Yes
Non-Collusion Affidavit YorN Yes Yes Yes Yes
Addenda #1 & #2 YorN No No No Yes

G: ITB-COT 09-07 Concrete Pav

ement Repair




Opening Date -- 07/29/09
Date Prepared -- 07/31/09

VENDOR NAME:

Ck Number
Ck Amount

CITY OF TROY
BID TABULATION

CONCRETE PAVEMENT REPAIR

ITB-COT 09-07
Page 7

Tony Angelo Cement Walter Toebe |Hartwell Cement| Angelo lafrate
Construction Co Construction Co Co Construction Co
1542500 9244200729 343805333 9227002917
$ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00

Proposal A: Local Road Maintenance Section 5,6,8,10,13,15,19,20,25 & scattered locations

Year 2009/2010

Year 2009/2010

Year 2009/2010

Year 2009/2010

NO. DESCRIPTION EST. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1 |Remove & Replace with Concrete
9" Non-reinforced- 1,000 S.Y. $56.00 $47.12 $48.95 $62.80
2 |Remove & Replace with Concrete
8" Non-reinforced- 5,000 S.Y. $50.00 $46.37 $47.10 $60.30
3 |Remove & Replace with Concrete
7" Non-reinforced- 59,000 SY $41.29 $45.87 $46.25 $50.25
4 |Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/
Driveway 6" Non-reinforced (Locations not ....] 100 S.F. $4.90 $5.20 $7.25 $8.80
5 |Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/
4" Non-reinforced (Locations not specified) 100 S.F. $4.40 $7.04 $6.25 $8.80
6 [Gatewell Adjustment 2 Each $337.00 $176.05 $200.00 $430.00
7 |Gatewell Repair - Per Foot 4 L.F. $337.00 $176.05 $200.00 $190.00
8 |Manhole or Catch Basin Adjustment 40 each $337.00 $176.05 $125.00 $320.00
9 |Manhole or Catch Basin - Repair per Foot 20 L.F. $337.00 $283.64 $125.00 $143.00
10 |Misc. Base Repair per CY to excavate/replace
with 21AA Gravel, compacted in place 3,600 C.Y. $44.00 $15.00 $5.00 $18.00
11 [Installation of 6" edge drain 200 L.F. $11.85 $9.34 $12.00 $12.10
12 |Remove and Replace Curb & Gutter 200 L.F. $19.00 $21.46 $28.00 $25.20
13 |Sidewalk Ramp, ADA, Modified w/Inserts 6,000 S.F. $14.15 $6.27 $16.00 $8.70
14 |Sidewalk Ramp, Detectable Warning, Retrofit, 100 S.F. $22.75 $31.58 $30.00 $24.10
15 |Restoration Included Included Included Included Included
16 |Traffic Maintenance Included Included Included Included Included

Estimated Total Cost — Proposal A

$3,017,027.00

$3,101,233.10

$3,148,250.00

$3,474,960.00

Proposal B: Industrial Road Maintenance - Lakeview, Golfview, Wilshire, Souter, Investment, Troy Center, Tower, Rankin,

Chicago & Scattered Locations

Year 2009/2010

Year 2009/2010

Year 2009/2010

Year 2009/2010

NO. DESCRIPTION EST. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1 |Remove & Replace with Concrete
9" Non-reinforced- 38,000 SY $53.00 $47.45 $50.95 $55.00
2 |Remove & Replace with Concrete
8" Non-reinforced- 200 S.Y. $52.00 $39.13 $47.10 $70.10
3 |Remove & Replace with Concrete
7" Non-reinforced- 200 S.Y. $51.55 $37.39 $46.25 $64.40
4 |Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/
Driveway 6" Non-reinforced (Locations not ....] 100 S.F. $4.90 $5.27 $7.25 $8.80
5 [Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/
4" Non-reinforced (Locations not specified) 100 S.F. $4.40 $4.84 $6.25 $8.80
6 |Gatewell Adjustment 2 Each $337.00 $170.80 $200.00 $430.00
7 |Gatewell Repair - Per Foot 4 L.F. $337.00 $170.80 $200.00 $190.00
8 [Manhole or Catch Basin Adjustment 25 each $337.00 $170.80 $125.00 $320.00
9 [Manhole or Catch Basin - Repair per Foot 20 L.F. $337.00 $273.14 $125.00 $143.00
10 [Misc. Base Repair per CY to excavate/replace
with 21AA Gravel, compacted in place 2,000 C.Y. $44.05 $15.00 $5.00 $18.00
11 [Installation of 6" edge drain 100 L.F. $11.85 $9.28 $12.00 $12.10
12 [Remove and Replace Curb & Gutter 200 L.F. $28.10 $20.44 $28.00 $25.20
13 |Sidewalk Ramp, ADA, Modified w/Inserts 300 S.F. $14.20 $6.30 $16.00 $8.20
14 |Sidewalk Ramp, Detectable Warning, Retrofit, 100 S.F. $22.75 $31.69 $30.00 $24.10
15 [Restoration Included Included Included Included Included
16 |[Traffic Maintenance Included Included Included Included Included

Estimated Total Cost — Proposal B

$2,154,267.00

$1,870,247.60

$1,987,545.00

$2,178,260.00




Opening Date -- 07/29/09

Date Prepared -- 07/31/09

CITY OF TROY
BID TABULATION

CONCRETE PAVEMENT REPAIR

ITB-COT 09-07
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VENDOR NAME: Tony Angelo Cement Walter Toebe |Hartwell Cement| Angelo lafrate
Construction Co Construction Company Construction Co
Co
Proposal C: Major Road Maintenance - Rochester Road, Coolidge, and scattered locations
NO. |DESCRIPTION EST. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

1 |Remove & Replace with Concrete NO BID

9" Non-reinforced- 18,600 SY $50.40 $51.06 $0.00 $62.20
2 |Remove & Replace with Concrete

8" Non-reinforced- 200 S.Y. $47.90 $39.00 $0.00 $69.80
3 |Remove & Replace with Concrete

7" Non-reinforced- 200 S.Y. $43.05 $38.82 $0.00 $57.90
4 |Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/

Driveway 6" Non-reinforced (Locations not ....] 200 S.F. $4.60 $5.50 $0.00 $8.80
5 |Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/

4" Non-reinforced (Locations not specified) 100 S.F. $4.25 $5.11 $0.00 $8.80
6 |Gatewell Adjustment 1 Each $271.00 $176.05 $0.00 $430.00
7 |Gatewell Repair - Per Foot 2 L.F. $271.00 $176.05 $0.00 $190.00
8 [Manhole or Catch Basin Adjustment 2 each $271.00 $176.05 $0.00 $320.00
9 |Manhole or Catch Basin - Repair per Foot 2 L.F. $271.00 $283.64 $0.00 $143.00
10 |Misc. Base Repair per CY to excavate/replace

with 21AA Gravel, compacted in place 1,000 C.Y. $31.00 $15.00 $0.00 $18.00
11 |Installation of 6" edge drain 100 L.F. $11.85 $9.55 $0.00 $12.10
12 [Remove and Replace Curb & Gutter 100 L.F. $18.40 $21.26 $0.00 $25.20
13 |[Sidewalk Ramp, ADA, Modified w/Inserts 300 S.F. $13.75 $6.46 $0.00 $8.50
14 |[Sidewalk Ramp, Detectable Warning, Retrofit, 100 S.F. $21.90 $31.81 $0.00 $24.80
15 |Restoration Included Included Included Included Included
16 |Traffic Maintenance Included Included Included Included Included

Estimated Total Cost — Proposal C $999,212.00 $991,538.53 $0.00 $1,213,596.00

Proposal D: Tri Party Concrete Repair - Big Beaver, Dequindre, John R, Crooks, Long Lake, Livernois & scattered locations

NO. |DESCRIPTION EST. QTY. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1 |Remove & Replace with Concrete NO BID
10" Non-reinforced- 10,000 SY $55.20 $58.50 $0.00 $64.90
2 |Remove & Replace with Concrete
9" Non-reinforced- 1,000 S.Y. $52.00 $48.95 $0.00 $65.80
3 |Remove & Replace with Concrete
8" Non-reinforced- 500 S.Y. $51.00 $44.50 $0.00 $69.30
4 |Remove & Replace with Concrete
7" Non-reinforced- 500 S.Y. $50.00 $42.18 $0.00 $58.90
Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/
5 |Driveway 6" Non-reinforced (Locations not ....] 50 S.F. $7.95 $5.56 $0.00 $8.80
Remove & Replace with Concrete Sidewalk/
6 |[4" Non-reinforced (Locations not specified) 50 S.F. $4.55 $5.15 $0.00 $8.80
7 |Gatewell Adjustment 1 Each $268.40 $179.90 $0.00 $430.00
8 |Gatewell Repair - Per Foot 2 L.F. $268.40 $179.91 $0.00 $190.00
9 |Manhole or Catch Basin Adjustment 2 each $268.40 $179.91 $0.00 $320.00
10 |Manhole or Catch Basin - Repair per Foot 2 L.F. $288.25 $291.35 $0.00 $143.00
Misc. Base Repair per CY to excavate/replace
11 |with 21AA Gravel, compacted in place 500 C.Y. $32.00 $15.00 $0.00 $18.00
12 [Installation of 6" edge drain 100 L.F. $11.85 $9.76 $0.00 $12.10
13 |Remove and Replace Curb & Gutter 100 L.F. $22.40 $21.52 $0.00 $25.20
14 |[Sidewalk Ramp, ADA, Modified w/Inserts 300 S.F. $13.70 $6.47 $0.00 $10.10
15 |Sidewalk Ramp, Detectable Warning, Retrofit, 100 S.F. $21.09 $31.84 $0.00 $24.10
16 [Restoration Included Included Included Included Included
17 |Traffic Maintenance Included Included Included Included Included
Estimated Total Cost - Proposal D $682,687.50 $695,060.74 $0.00 $799,686.00
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PROGRESS PAYMENTS:

CONTACT INFORMATION

AWARD
Partial Contract:

COMPLETION SCHEDULE:

INSURANCE: Can Meet

Cannot Meet

PAYMENT TERMS:

WARRANTY:

EXCEPTIONS:

ACKNOWLEGEMENT:
VENDOR QUESTIONNAIRE

FORMS: Legal Status of Bidder
Non-Collusion Affidavit

Addenda #1 & #2

G: ITB-COT 09-07 Concrete Pavement Repair

100% of Contract

Hrs of Oper.
Phone

Proposal A
Proposal B
Proposal C
Proposal D

Y orN
Y orN
Y orN

Y orN
Y orN

Tony Angelo Cement Walter Toebe |Hartwell Cement| Angelo lafrate
Construction Co Construction Co Co Construction Co
Bi-Weekly Bi-Weekly Monthly Payments| Per Specification
7 AM to 8 PM Dennady Bilzon 7 AMto 6 PM 7 AMto 6 PM
(248) 756-1168 (248) 640-0018 (248) 789-4156 (586) 756-1070
X X
X X
X X
X
X
BY JUNE 30th OF ANY CONTRACT YEAR
XX XX XX XX
Net 10 Days Blank Monthly Per Specification
Maintenance Bond Blank 1 year 1 year
Blank Blank Blank Will accept Proposal
A & B together/Separately
Will not accept Proposal
C & D Seperately
Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes No No No
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	All four contractors have been producing a quality product for the City.
	Recommendation
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