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April 20, 2005
TO: John Szerlag, City Manager
FROM: Brian P. Murphy, Assistant City Manager/Services

Jeanette Bennett, Purchasing Director
Carol K. Anderson, Director of Parks and Recreation

SUBJECT: Agenda Item — Standard Purchasing Resolution 2: Bid Award —
Lowest Bidders Meeting Specifications - Turfgrass Chemical
Products

RECOMMENDATION

Bid proposals were opened March 23, 2005, for the 2005 seasonal supply of
turfgrass protection products, to be used by Sylvan Glen and Sanctuary Lake
Golf Courses and the Parks Maintenance Division. City management
recommends purchases be made from the following low bidders meeting
specifications for an estimated total cost of $156,785.00.

Tri-Turf, 24016 Haggerty, Farmington Hills, Michigan 48335, 248-640-4439

Item | Product Description Estimated Unit Price | Estimated
No. Quantity Total Cost
1. Chipco 26GT Flowable 180 gallons- 36
or Approved Alt. cases $89.80 $16,164.00
Iprodione Pro 2SE
2. Daconil Weather Stik or | 180 gallons — 36
Concorde SST or cases
Approved Alt. Echo $48.40 $8,712.00
720
5. Revolution Wetting 90 gallons — 3-30 $69.50 $6.255.00
Agent gallon drums ' T
6. Insignia (Alternate) 48 Ibs.- 2 cases $125.00 $6,000.00
16. | Nature Safe (Alternate) | 2000 Ibs — 40 0.499 $998.00
bags ' '
20. | Mefanoxam AQ 20 gallons — 2 link
(Alternate) paks $425.00 $8,500.00
22. | Propiconazole 90 gallons -9
(Alternate) Link paks $230.00 $20,700.00
29. | Echo Ultimate 60 Ibs — 3 cases
(Alternate) $7.15 $429.00
30. | Echo ZN (Alternate) 25 gallons -5 $37.40 $935.00
cases
33. | Curalan EG 165 lbs — 15 $21.75 $3.588.75
cases
ESTIMATED TOTAL.: $72,281.75
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Verdicon/UHS, 15515 Knobhill Dr. Linden, Michigan 48451, 586-839-8930

Item | Product Description Estimated Quantity Unit Price Estimated
No. Total Cost
3. Banol 20 gallons — 10 $312.00 $6,240.00
cases
4. Dispatch Soil Penetrant | 330 gallons — 6- 55 $12.77 $4,214.10
Wetting Agent gallon drums '
7. Merit 75 WSP 102.4 0z — 4 cases $16.80 $1,720.32
19. Kglly s High Calcium 2,800 bags $5.50 | $15,400.00
Lime Greensgrade
21. | Primo Maxx — Link Pak F1)gkgallons — 1 link $364.00 $3,640.00
37. | Cleary’'s 3336 144 lbs — 12 cases $17.98 $2,589.12
ESTIMATED TOTAL.: $33,803.54

Great Lakes Turf, LLC., 6600 Clay Ave. SW, Grand Rapids, Michigan 49548,

616-656-9839

Item | Product Description Estimated Quantity Unit Estimated
No. Price Total Cost
8. Astron 50 gallons — 10cases $76.00 $3,800.00
9. Knife 50 gallons — 10cases $36.00 $1,800.00
10. | Renaissance 50 gallons — 10cases $37.00 $1,850.00
11. | Perk-up 15 gallons — 3 cases $76.00 $1,140.00
12. | 4-4-16 Tiger Turf 15 gallons — 3 cases

Soluble Fertilizer $17.60 $264.00
13. | 20-0-4 Carbon Power 225 gallons — 45

Soluble Fertilizer cases $15.20 $3,420.00
15. | Protesyn 75 gallons — 15cases $39.00 $2,925.00
18. \c/;Vrk;;[jeeGold 0-0-24 Reg | 5,000 Ibs — 100 bags $0.54 $2.700.00
24. | Gro-Power 45 % Mag. 40 Bags $.68 $1,360.00
34. | PK Fight 3-22-28 90 gallons — 18cases $37.60 $3,384.00
35. | White Gold 0-0-24 30 — 50 Ib bags

Greens Grade $0.74 $1,110.00
36. | Gro-Power 10-2-5 40- 50 Ib bags $0.61 $1.220.00

Fertilizer

ESTIMATED TOTAL.:

$24,973.00
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Turfgrass Inc., P.O. Box 663, South Lyon, Michigan 48178, 800-521-8873

Item | Product Description Estimated Quantity Unit Estimated
No. Price Total Cost
14. | Calphlex 150 gallons—30cases 29.00 $4,350.00
17. | K-Power 13-0-46 120 25,000 Ibs — 500

SGN bags $0.35 $8,750.00
23. | MKP 40 — 50 Ib bags $0.62 $1,240.00
25. g;gegnBrothers Nutra 40 gallons — 8 cases $30.00 $1.200.00
26. | Anderson’s Tee Time 80 50 Ib bags

Contec 9-18-18 $0.70 $2,800.00
27. GreenSpec 7-7-7 Fe7 40 — 50lb bags $0.46 $920.00

Organic Fert
28. | K-mag 35 — 55 Ib bags $0.25 $481.25
31. | Milorganite 6-2-0 Greens | 160- 50 Ib bags $0.12 $960.00

Grade
32. | Anderson’s 18-9-18 150- 50 Ib bags

Contec OG Pro $0.67 $5,025.00

ESTIMATED TOTAL.: $25,726.25

EXPLANATION OF BIDS NOT MEETING SPECIFICATIONS

Turf Grass, Inc. bid an alternate for item #5. The product bid does not conform to
the new class of block copolymer chemistry needed on sand based greens.

Lesco Inc. bid alternate soluble (sprayable) fertilizers on Items #12,13, and 25,
and Tri-Turf Inc on Item #34. These products do not contain micronutrients
equally essential for quality plant growth.

Tri-Turf Inc. bid alternates on Items #26 and 32, and Lesco, Inc. on ltem #26.
These products contain nutrient sources that are detrimental to the conditions we
currently have on both golf courses (irrigation water high in soluble salts,

bicarbonates, and chlorides).

Lesco Inc. bid alternates on Items #19, and 28, and Verdicon/UHS on ltem# 17.
Products did not meet particle size specifications, which must conform to a
greens grade (small granule material). These alternate products are agricultural

grade particle size (much larger).

J.Mollema & Son was the low bidder for Item #28, K-Mag at $10.95/bag for a
total of $383.25 for 35 bags. J Mollema requires a $400.00 minimum order
shipment, which cannot be met, as K-Mag is ordered throughout the season as
needed.
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SUMMARY

All items recommended represent the lowest acceptable bid meeting
specifications. Estimated quantities of chemicals shall be purchased at quoted
unit prices, and ordered in unit lots on an as needed basis.

Vendors quoting the same price per unit cost were awarded the bid item based
upon payment terms, and best delivery time after a verbal phone release.

The chemicals will be used by the Parks Maintenance Division and the Sylvan
Glen and Sanctuary Lake Golf Courses to maintain turfgrass. The estimated
totals for each item are based upon our anticipated use for the upcoming season.
We make every effort to minimize the amount of product we carry from one
season to the next, and only purchase quantities needed.

BUDGET
Funds for those purchases are available from the Golf Courses and Parks
Division Seed/Planting Supplies Operating Budgets.

57 Vendors Notified on MITN System
6 Bid Responses Rec'd

Prepared by: Danny T. McDonald, Superintendent of Greens



CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 05-09
Opening Date -- 3/23/05 BID TABULATION Pg1lof9
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VENDOR NAME: TRI-TURF VERDICON
EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1. |180GALS |CHIPCO 26 GT FLOWABLE or 2X 2.5 GALS
(36 CASES) | IPRODIONE PRO 2 SE 5 GALS/CASE 89.80 | $ 449.00 96.00
2. |180 GALS |DACONIL WEATHERSTIK 2X 2.5 GALS
(36 CASES) |or ECHO 720 5 GALS/CASE 48.40 | $ 242.00 67.12
3. |20GALS BANOL 2X1GAL
(10 CASES) 2 GALS/CASE 349.00 312.00 | $ 624.00
4. |330 GALS |DISPATCH SOIL PENETRANT 55 GALS
(6 DRUMS) |WETTING AGENT PER DRUM 15.45 1277 | $ 702.35
5. |90 GALS REVOLUTION WETTING 30 GALS
(3 DRUMS) |AGENT PER DRUM 69.50 | $ 2,085.00 85.00
6. |48LBS HERITAGE W.G. 4X61BS Sub Insignia
(2 CASES) |BULK PACK 24 LBSICASE 125.00 | $ 3,000.00 341.75
7. 102.4 Oz MERIT 75 W.S.P. 4X4X1602Z.
(4 CASES) 25.6 OZ./CASE 18.55 16.80 | $ 430.08
8. |50 GALS ASTRON 2X 2.5 GALS
(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE N/B N/B
9. |50 GALS. KNIFE 2X 2.5 GALS
(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE N/B N/B
10. |50 GALS RENAISSANCE 2X 2.5 GALS
(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE N/B N/B
11. |15 GALS PERK UP 2X 2.5 GALS
(3 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE N/B N/B
12. |15 GALS 4-4-16 TIGER TURF 2X2.5GALS
(3 CASES) |SOLUBLE FERTILIZER 5 GALS./CASE N/B N/B
13. |225GALS |20-0-4 CARBON POWER 2X2.5GALS
(45 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE N/B N/B
14. |150 GALS |CALPHLEX 2X2.5GALS
(30 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE N/B N/B
15. |75 GALS PROTESYN 2X2.5GALS
(15 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE N/B N/B
16. |[2000LBS |SOIL SYNERGY 12-3-8 Sub Nature Safe
(40 BAGS) |GREENS GRADE 50 LBS/BAG 0.499 | $ 24.95 N/B




CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 05-09

Opening Date -- 3/23/05 BID TABULATION Pg.20of 9
Date Prepared -- 4/20/05 CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES
VENDOR NAME: TRI-TURF VERDICON/UHS
EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY |DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
17. 25,000 LBS |K-POWER 13-0-46
(500 BAGS) (120 SGN 50 LBS/BAG N/B $ 0.315 |DMS
18. |[5,000LBS |WHITE GOLD 0-0-24
(100 BAGS) |REG-GRADE 50 LBS/BAG N/B N/B
19. KELLY'S HIGH
(2800 BAGS) |CALCIUM LIME GREENS GRADE 50 LBS/BAG N/B $ 011] $ 5.50
20. |20GALS SUBDUE MAXX 1X 10 GALS Sub Mefanoxam AQ
(2 PAK) LINK PAK 10GALSIPAK | $ 425.00 | $ 4,250.00 || $ 526.00
21. |10 GALS PRIMO MAXX 1X 10 GALS
(1 PAK) LINK PAK 10 GALS/PAK N/B $ 364.00 $  3,640.00
22. |90 GALS BANNER MAXX 1X10 GALS Sub Propiconazole
(9 PAK) LINK PAK 10GALSIPAK | $ 230.00 | $ 2,300.00 || $ 283.25
23. |40 Bags MKP 50 LBS/IBAG N/B $ 1.00
24. |40 Bags GRO-POWER - 45% Mag. 50 LBS/BAG N/B N/B
25. |40 GALS GRIGG BROTHERS 2X25GALS
(8 CASES) |NUTRA GREEN 5 GALS/CASE N/B N/B
26. |80 Bags ANDERSON'S TEE TIME 50 LBS/BAG Sub Lebanon 10-18-18
CONTEC 9-18-18 $ 0.387 |DMS N/B
27. |40 Bags GREENSPEC 50 LBS/IBAG
7-7-7 FE7 ORGANIC N/B N/B
28. |35Bags K-MAG 55 LBS/IBAG N/B N/B
29. |e0LBS DACONIL ULTRE 20 LBS/CASE Sub Echo Ultimate
(3 Cases) $ 7.15(% 143.00 || $ 9.62
30. |25GALS DACONIL ZN 2X25GALS Sub Echo ZN
(5 Cases) 5GALSICASE | $ 3740 | $ 187.00 || $ 48.10
31. |160Bags MILORGANITE 50 LBS/BAG
6-2-0 GREENS GRADE $ 0.15 $ 0.18
32. |150Bags |ANDERSON'S 18-9-18 50 LBS/BAG Sub Lebanon 18-3-18
CONTEC OG PRO $ 0.555 |DMS N/B
33. |165LBS CURALAN EG 4X2751b
(15 Cases) 11 Ibs/CASE | $ 2175 $ 239.25| $ 23.50




CITY OF TROY

Opening Date -- 3/23/05
Date Prepared -- 4/20/05

BID TABULATION
CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

ITB-COT 05-09

Pg.30f9

VENDOR NAME: TRI-TURF VERDICON/UHS
EST UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY |DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
34. |90 GALS PK FIGHT 3-22-28 2x25cas | Sub Phyto-Fos 0-22-18
(18 Cases) 5GaliCase | $ 36.00 |DMS N/B
35. |30Bags WHITE GOLD GREENS 50 LBS/BAG
GRADE 0-0-24 N/B N/B
36. |40 Bags GRO-POWER 50 LBS/BAG
10-2-5 N/B N/B
37. [144LBs CLEARY's 3336 6 X 2 Ibs/Case Sub Quali-Pro TM 85 WDG
(12 CASES) 121bsicase | $ 30.00 | $ 17.98 | $ 215.76
ESTIMATED TOTAL OF AWARDED ITEMS -- $ 72,28L.75 | $ 33,803.54
MINIMUM SHIPMENT: No Minimum ZERO
1-2 Days ONE DAY
CONTACT INFORMATION: Hrs of Oper: 8-4:30 8-5W 7:30-5 S
Phone # (248)640-4439 (586)839-8930
TERMS 2% 10 Net 30 N60, on Agency Products
WARRANTY Manufacturer Per
EXCEPTIONS Substitutions Attached Chipco 26019 Bid for
To Bid Iprodione Pro
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT: Y orN YES YES
PROPOSAL - Seasonal Requirements of Turfgrass Chemicals
ATTEST:
M. Aileen Bittner
Kevin Grubb

Danny McDonald

Linda Bockstanz

G:ITB-COT 05-09 Chemicals-Golf Courses




CITY OF TROY
BID TABULATION
CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

ITB-COT 05-09
Opening Date -- 3/23/05 Pg 4 of 9

Date Prepared - 4/20/05

VENDOR NAME: GREAT LAKES TURF LLC TURFGRASS INC
EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1. 180 GALS |CHIPCO 26 GT FLOWABLE or 2 X 2.5GALS
(36 CASES) | IPRODIONE PRO 2 SE 5 GALS/CASE N/B 97.60
2. 180 GALS DACONIL WEATHERSTIK 2 X2.5GALS
(36 CASES) |or ECHO 720 5GALSICASE | $ 52.00 69.30
3. |20GALS BANOL 2X1GAL
(10 CASES) 2 GALS/CASE N/B 327.00
4, 330 GALS DISPATCH SOIL PENETRANT 55 GALS
(6 DRUMS) |WETTING AGENT PERDRUM | $ 18.11 15.00 |DMS
5. 90 GALS REVOLUTION WETTING 30 GALS
(3 DRUMS) |AGENT PER DRUM $ 85.00 15.00
6. 48 LBS HERITAGE W.G. 4X6LBS
(2 CASES) |BULK PACK 24 LBSICASE N/B 341.74
7. 102.4 Oz MERIT 75 W.S.P. 4X4X1.602Z.
(4 CASES) 25.6 OZ./CASE N/B 17.16
8. |50 GALS ASTRON 2X2.5GALS
(10 CASES) 5GALSICASE | $ 76.00 380.00 N/B
9. [50GALS. |KNIFE 2X2.5GALS
(10 CASES) 5GALS/CASE | $ 36.00 180.00 N/B
10. |50 GALS RENAISSANCE 2X2.5GALS
(10 CASES) 5GALSICASE | $ 37.00 185.00 N/B
11. |15 GALS PERK UP 2X 2.5 GALS
(3 CASES) 5GALS/CASE | $ 76.00 380.00 N/B
12. |15GALS 4-4-16 TIGER TURF 2X2.5GALS
(3 CASES) |SOLUBLE FERTILIZER 5 GALS./CASE | $ 17.60 88.00 N/B
13. [225 GALS |20-0-4 CARBON POWER 2 X 2.5GALS
(45 CASES) 5GALS/ICASE | $ 15.20 76.00 N/B
14. |150 GALS |CALPHLEX 2X2.5GALS
(30 CASES) 5GALSICASE | $ 35.00 29.00 [$ 145.00
15. |75 GALS PROTESYN 2X 2.5 GALS
(15 CASES) 5GALS/CASE | $ 39.00 195.00
16. |2000LBS SOIL SYNERGY 12-3-8
(40 BAGS) |GREENS GRADE 50 LBS/BAG | $ 0.54
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CITY OF TROY

VENDOR NAME:

BID TABULATION
CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

GREAT LAKES TURF LLC

ITB-COT 05-09
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TURFGRASS INC

EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
17. |25,000 LBS |[K-POWER 13-0-46
(500 BAGS) |120 SGN 50 LBS/BAG N/B 0.35 | $ 17.50
18. |5,000LBS |WHITE GOLD 0-0-24
(100 BAGS) |REG-GRADE 50 LBS/BAG 054 |% 27.00 N/B
19. KELLY'S HIGH
(2800 BAGS) |CALCIUM LIME GREENS GRADE 50 LBS/BAG N/B N/B
20. |20GALS  [SUBDUE MAXX 1X10 GALS Sub Mefenoxam (2x1gal cs)
(2 PAK) LINK PAK 10 GALS/PAK 450.00 526.00
21. |10GALS PRIMO MAXX 1X 10 GALS
(1 PAK) LINK PAK 10 GALS/PAK N/B 364.00
22. |90 GALS BANNER MAXX 1X10 GALS Sub Tenacity (4x1 gal cs)
(9 PAK) LINK PAK 10 GALS/PAK 260.00 283.25
23. |40Bags MKP 50 LBS/BAG 0.80 062($ 31.00
24. |40 Bags GRO-POWER - 45% Mag. 50 LBS/BAG 0.68 $34.00
25. |40GALS GRIGG BROTHERS 2X25GALS
(8 CASES) |NUTRA GREEN 5 GALS/CASE N/B 30.00 | $ 150.00
26. |80 Bags ANDERSON'S TEE TIME 50 LBS/BAG
CONTEC 9-18-18 N/B 0.70 | $ 35.00
27. |40 Bags GREENSPEC 50 LBS/BAG
7-7-7 FE7 ORGANIC N/B 0.46 | $ 23.00
28. |[35Bags K-MAG 55 LBS/BAG N/B 025($ 13.75
29. |e60LBS DACONIL ULTRE
(3 Cases) 20 LBS/CASE 8.00 9.62
30. |[25GALS DACONIL ZN 2X2.5GALS
(5 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE N/B 48.10
31. |160Bags MILORGANITE 50 LBS/BAG
6-2-0 GREENS GRADE N/B 012] $ 6.00
32. |150Bags |ANDERSON'S 18-9-18 50 LBS/BAG
CONTEC OG PRO N/B 0.67 | $ 33.50
33. |165LBS CURALAN EG 4X2751b
(15 Cases) 11 Ibs/CASE N/B 21.90
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CITY OF TROY

VENDOR NAME:

BID TABULATION
CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

GREAT LAKES TURF LLC

ITB-COT 05-09
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TURFGRASS INC

EST UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY |DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
34. |90 GALS PK FIGHT 3-22-28 2X 2.5 Gals
(18 Cases) 5GaliCase | $ 37.60 | $ 188.00 N/B
35. [30Bags WHITE GOLD GREENS 50 LBS/BAG
GRADE 0-0-24 $ 074 | $ 37.00 N/B
36. |40 Bags GRO-POWER 50 LBS/BAG
10-2-5 $ 061 (% 30.50 N/B
37. |144LBs CLEARY's 3336 6 X 2 Ibs/Case Sub TeeOff (2x2.5 gal cs)
(12 CASES) 12 Ibs/Case 145/GA|_| $ 18.74
ESTIMATED TOTAL OF AWARDED ITEMS -- $ 24,973.00 $ 25,726.25
MINIMUM SHIPMENT: 1 TON /1 DRUM /1 CASE No Minimum
2 DAYS AFTER PHONE RELEASE Same - 2 Days
CONTACT INFORMATION: Hrs of Oper: 7-5PM 8-5pm

Phone #
TERMS
WARRANTY
EXCEPTIONS
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT: Y orN

G:ITB-COT 05-09 Chemicals-Golf Courses

(616)292-0259

(248)437-1427

Net 30

Net 30

Per Manufacturer Label

As Stated by Mfg

Substitutions Attached Substitutions Attached
To Bid To Bid
YES YES

Jeanette Bennett
Purchasing Director
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VENDOR NAME: LESCO INC J MOLLEMA & SON
EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1. 180 GALS |CHIPCO 26 GT FLOWABLE or 2 X 2.5GALS

(36 CASES) | IPRODIONE PRO 2 SE 5GALS/CASE | $ 98.00 126.38
2. 180 GALS DACONIL WEATHERSTIK 2 X 2.5 GALS

(36 CASES) |or ECHO 720 5GALS/CASE | $ 67.12 62.88
3. |20GALS BANOL 2X1GAL

(10 CASES) 2GALSICASE | $ 335.90 NO BID
4, 330 GALS DISPATCH SOIL PENETRANT 55 GALS

(6 DRUMS) |WETTING AGENT PER DRUM NO BID 21.73
5. 90 GALS REVOLUTION WETTING 30 GALS

(3 DRUMS) |AGENT PER DRUM NO BID 91.00
6. 48 LBS HERITAGE W.G. 4X6LBS

(2 CASES) |BULK PACK 24BS/CASE | $ 341.75 NO BID
7. 102.4 Oz MERIT 75 W.S.P. 4X4X160Z.

(4 CASES) 25.6 OZICASE | $ 17.21 23.11
8. |50 GALS ASTRON 2X25GALS

(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE NO BID NO BID
9. |50 GALS. |KNIFE 2X2.5GALS

(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE NO BID NO BID
10. |50 GALS RENAISSANCE 2X25GALS

(10 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE NO BID NO BID
11. |15GALS PERK UP 2X2.5GALS

(3 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE NO BID NO BID
12. [15GALS 4-4-16 TIGER TURF 2X2.5GALS

(3CASES) |SOLUBLE FERTILIZER 5GALS./CASE | $ 11.68 |DMS NO BID
13. [225 GALS |[20-0-4 CARBON POWER 2X2.5GALS

(45 CASES) 5GALS/CASE | $ 9.68 |[DMS NO BID
14. |[150 GALS |CALPHLEX 2X2.5GALS

(30 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE NO BID NO BID
15. |75 GALS PROTESYN 2X2.5GALS

(15 CASES) 5 GALS/CASE NO BID NO BID
16. |2000LBS SOIL SYNERGY 12-3-8

(40 BAGS) |GREENS GRADE 50 LBS/BAG NO BID NO BID




Opening Date -- 3/23/05
Date Prepared -- 4/20/05

CITY OF TROY

BID TABULATION
CHEMICALS - GOLF COURSES

ITB-COT 05-09

Pg. 8 of 9

VENDOR NAME: LESCO INC J MOLLEMA & SON
EST PKG UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION SIZE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
17. ]25,000LBS |K-POWER 13-0-46
(500 BAGS) |120 SGN 50 LBS/BAG NO BID NO BID
18. |5,000LBS |WHITE GOLD 0-0-24
(100 BAGS) |REG-GRADE 50 LBS/BAG NO BID NO BID
19. KELLY'S HIGH
(2800 BAGS) |CALCIUM LIME GREENS GRADE 50 LBS/BAG 0.103 |DMS NO BID
20. |20 GALS SUBDUE MAXX 1X 10 GALS
(2 PAK) LINK PAK 10 GALS/PAK 526.00 NO BID
21. 10 GALS PRIMO MAXX 1X 10 GALS
(1 PAK) LINK PAK 10 GALS/PAK 364.00 NO BID
22. |90 GALS BANNER MAXX 1X 10 GALS
(9 PAK) LINK PAK 10 GALS/PAK 283.25 NO BID
25# BAG
23. |40 Bags MKP 50 LBS/BAG NO BID $ 1.41
24. |40 Bags GRO-POWER - 45% Mag. 50 LBS/BAG NO BID NO BID
25. |40 GALS GRIGG BROTHERS 2 X 2.5 GALS
(8 CASES) |NUTRA GREEN 5 GALS/CASE 8.46 |DMS NO BID
26. |80 Bags ANDERSON'S TEE TIME 50 LBS/BAG
CONTEC 9-18-18 0.172 |DMS NO BID
27. |40 Bags GREENSPEC 50 LBS/BAG
7-7-7 FE7 ORGANIC NO BID NO BID
50# bag
28. |35Bags K-MAG 55 LBS/BAG 0.199 | DMS $ 0.22 | DMS
29. |60LBS DACONIL ULTRE
(3 Cases) 20 LBS/CASE 9.62 NO BID
30. [25GALS DACONIL ZN 2X 2.5 GALS
(5 Cases) 5 GALS/CASE 46.76 NO BID
31. |160Bags MILORGANITE 50 LBS/IBAG
6-2-0 GREENS GRADE 0.366 $ 0.139
32. |150Bags |ANDERSON'S 18-9-18 50 LBS/BAG
CONTEC OG PRO NO BID NO BID
33. |165LBS CURALAN EG 4X2.751b
(15 Cases) 11 Ibs/ICASE 24.13 $ 32.47
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VENDOR NAME: LESCO INC J MOLLEMA & SON
EST UNIT CASE UNIT CASE
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
34. |90 GALS PK FIGHT 3-22-28 2X 25 Gals
(18 Cases) 5 Gal/Case NO BID NO BID
35. |30Bags WHITE GOLD GREENS 50 LBS/BAG
GRADE 0-0-24 NO BID NO BID
36. |40 Bags GRO-POWER 50 LBS/BAG
10-2-5 NO BID NO BID
37. |1441BS CLEARY's 3336 6 X 2 Ibs/Case
(12 CASES) 12 Ibs/Case NO BID $ 27.87
ESTIMATED TOTAL OF AWARDED ITEMS -- 0
MINIMUM SHIPMENT: NONE $400.00
7-10 DAYS 1-6 DAYS
CONTACT INFORMATION: Hrs of Oper: 8-5pm 7:30-4:30
Phone # (800)321-5325 (800)234-4769
TERMS NET 30 NET 30
WARRANTY N/A BLANK
EXCEPTIONS SUBSTITUTIONS ATTACHED | |UOM CHANGES
TO BID
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT: YorN YES YES

BOLDFACE TYPE DENOTES LOWEST ACCEPTABLE BIDDERS

G:ITB-COT 05-09 Chemicals-Golf Courses
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The report below shows all fax and e-mail vendors that matched this document when it was originally issued.
It also shows all vendors that have downloaded or ordered the document and any subsequent amendments as

of 4/20/2005.

i Document Title:

” Seasonal Requirements of Chemicals for Golf Courses I

[ Date Issued:

“ 3/8/2005

l Close Date:

|| 3/23/2005

Click on the table headings for "Account Number” or "Company name" to re-sort this report by that column.

You may also click on any vendor account number to view their account information.

Acct # Company Name service | U0 Cument | | Amendments
l 14952 J’AII State Tree & Lawn, Inc. Jl E-mail ” || l
[ 17239 J[Amerisource J[ E-mail ” I l
I 13995 J|AF’AC PAPER & PACKAGING CORP. Jl Free ” 3/16/2005 ” |
l 16691 J[Asbestos Abatement Inc. Jl E-mail ” 3/21/2005 ” |
[ 11493 ”Audio Visual Equipment & Supplies, Inc. || E-mail ” 3/9/2005 }L |
[ 10927 JB & L Landscaping J E-mail ” || I
] 16987 ”Carbochem Inc. ” E-mail ” ” |
| 10073 J|Certified Products & Supply, Inc. ” Free ][ 3/10/2005 ” |
| 12597 ”Chardon Laboratories ” E-mail ” ” [

20501 ||COos/ REH, DIVOF RCH Free 3/14/2005
| 17268 ”Consolidated industries Inc. || E-mail |[ 3/16/2005 IL |
l 11938 J|Downriver Refrigeration Supply Co. J[ E-mail “ || ]
[ 11210 J[Flor—Dri Supply Co., Inc. ” E-mail [[ ][ |
[ 15570 JGreat Lakes Turf, LLC H E-mall W 3/9/2005 H l
| 10438 J|Hami|ton's of Ortonville Inc. Jl Free ” 3/10/2005 ” |
| 14226 |Hersch's Wholesale || E-mail [[ H |

11766 SEFS{\/%E@LUNGS-JUUEN SALES & E-mail
[ 15797 J[J MOLLEMA & SON INC Jl E-mail “ 3/8/2005 H I
| 20581 “j's lawn service | Free ” 3/12/2005 TL |
| 14945 J|John Deere Landscapes JL E-malil [f || |
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| 20399 ”K & K Maintenance Supply Inc. | Free “ 3/9/2005 ” |
[ 15720 “Kelli Green Lawn Service Ltd. ” E-mail ” ” |
[ 10907 ”Kemiron Companies, Inc. ” E-mail “ “ |
| 18515 ”Lansing Sanitary Supply ” E-mail H ” [
[ 10767 ”Lesco Inc. H E-mail ” 3/15/2005 ” I
| 12426 ”Luttre!l international ” E-mail | ” |
} 17093 “MCI Aquatic Management Co. ” Free ” 3/16/2005 ” ]
| 11639 ”Mike‘s Tree Surgeons, Inc. ” E-mail H ” |
| 13429 |[Multi-Source || E-mail || I !
[ 20686 “Naturally Green Lawn Service Inc. ” Free ” 3/21/2005 ” 4‘
| 11936 ”Northside True Value Hardware ” Fax “ ” ]
i 15680 ”nutri—turf [awn and tree service H Fax ” H 4|
| 10061 ”Parks Landscaping & Snow Service ” E-mail || IL 4,
’ 17410 ”Prime Turf, Inc. ” Fax ” ” 4]
| 16049 ”Pro Source One ” Fax ” 3/23/2005 ” 4]
I 11286 ”Professional Maintenance, Inc. ” E-mail ” ” |
[ 14286 ”PVS Nolwood Chemicals | E-mail I I |
| 10116 ”Rasch's Landscape Express, LLC ” E-mail ” ” |
I 11001 ”Sheldon Supply Company ” E-mail “ “ I
I 14349 ”Shemin Nurseries, Inc. “ Free ” 3/22/2005 IL 4,
‘ 15371 ”Strike Group L.L.C. H E-mail H ” 4]
l 10113 HSuIIivan Corporation | Free || 3/11/2005 }L _I
! 17956 ”Superior Surface Solutions, Inc. || E-mail ” H |
| 18557 ”Texas Refinery Corp ” E-mail ” !L 4]
[ 17813 ”The Emption Group ” E-mail ” ” |
| 12535 ”The Stansley Group ” E-mail “ H I
] 16677 ”Thomas Scientific H E-mail ” ” 4[
| 19890 ”TRI-TURF ” E-mail ” 3/21/2005 ” 4]
| 20309 I[Turfgrass Inc. || E-mail | 3/10/2005 ” J
| 10703 ”Turfgrass, Inc. ” E-mail [| ” 4]
! 10285 ”United Lawnscape, Inc. ” Fax ” 3/8/2005 “ ]
‘ 20272 ”Univar USA H E-mail H 3/11/2005 || 4'
| 14491 ”US Peroxide, Inc. || E-mail [] ” 4|
| 15735 ”\/erdicon/United Horticultural Supply [| E-mail ” 3/9/2005 ” 4|
[ 19599 [[\/WR International ” E-mail ” [] ]
{ 13921 ”WALKER LANDSCAPING, INC. ” E-mail ” 1L 4'
[ 14785 |Meingartz | E-mail ] 4/3/2005 || 4|
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