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April 8, 2011
TO: John Szerlag, City Manager
FROM: Susan A. Leirstein, Purchasing Director

Timothy L. Richnak, Public Works Director

RE: Standard Purchasing Resolution 1: Award To Low Bidders — Aggregates

Background
On March 22, 2011, proposals were competitively bid and electronically received as required by City Charter

and Code for one-year requirements of Aggregate material with an option to renew for one additional year.
Forty-nine (49) vendors were notified of the bid opportunity via the MITN website with eight (8) responses
received. After reviewing these proposals, awards are contingent upon contractors’ submission of properly
executed bid documents including insurance certificates and all other specified requirements.

Recommendation
City management recommends awarding contracts to the low bidders, at the unit prices listed below.
Aggregates are purchased on an as needed basis throughout the year based upon estimated quantities.

ITEM EST.QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE PER TON ESTIMATED TOTAL
TONS
Boulevard & Trumbell Towing. Inc.
6. 100 CRUSHED CONCRETE, 1"- 3" $ 8.48 $ 848.00
Tri-City Aggregates Inc.
2. 1,000 22A GRAVEL $ 8.00 $8,000.00
5. 2,500 FILL SAND $ 5.50 $13,750.00 $21,750.00
B & W Landscape Supply
10. 100 MASON SAND $ 9.97 $ 997.00
11. 100 LIMESTONE 1"- 3" $12.47 $1,247.00 $ 2,244.00
Richmond Transport Inc.
1. 500 6A SLAG $10.20 $5,100.00
Novak Construction
3. 300 PEA STONE $11.49 $3,447.00
4, 100 60/40 GRAVEL $12.25 $1,225.00
8. 250 CHLORIDE SAND $14.95 $3,737.50
9. 100 2NS SAND $ 8.95 $ 895.00
12. 50 LIMESTONE 3"- 6” $17.25 $ 862.50 $10,167.00
Osburn Industries, Inc.
13. 50 LIMESTONE 4"- 8” $15.85 $ 792.50
ESTIMATED TOTAL COST: $40,901.50

No bids were received for Item #7, 100 Tons CRUSHED CONCRETE, 3”- 6”. The Public Works Department
will order this material as needed using the informal three-quote process.

Fund Availability
Funds for these materials are available through the Public Works operating budgets

Prepared by: Marina Basta Farouk, Project Construction Manager
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CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 11-06
Opening Date -- 3/22/11 BID TABULATION Pg1of2
Date Reviewed -- 3/23/2011 AGGREGATES
sl
VENDOR NAME: Boulevard & Tri-City B&W Richmond
Trumbell Towing | Aggregates, Inc Landscape Transport Inc
Inc Supply
EST PRICE/ PRICE/ PRICE/ PRICE/
ITEM | QTY/TONS [DESCRIPTION TON TON TON TON
1. 500 6A SLAG No Bid No Bid $ 13.23 | $ 10.20
2. 1000 22A GRAVEL No Bid $ 8.00 | $ 933 % 12.00
3. 300 PEA STONE No Bid No Bid $ 13.74 | $ 14.75
4, 100 60/40 GRAVEL No Bid No Bid $ 1469 | $ 15.25
5. 2500 FILL SAND No Bid $ 550 $ 6.69 | $ 6.25
6. 100 CRUSHED CONCRETE, 1" - 3" $ 8.48 No Bid $ 887 | % 11.25
7. 100 CRUSHED CONCRETE, 3"-6" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8. 250 CHLORIDE SAND No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9. 100 2NS SAND No Bid No Bid $ 9.77 | $ 11.25
10. 100 MASON SAND No Bid No Bid $ 997 | $ 12.00
11. 100 LIMESTONE 1" - 3" No Bid No Bid $ 1247 | $ 15.00
12. 50 LIMESTONE 3" - 6" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
13. 50 LIMESTONE 4" - 8" No Bid No Bid $ 1772 | $ 20.00
DISCOUNT IF AWARDED ALL ITEMS - - - -
ESTIMATED TOTAL:| $ 848.00 | $ 21,750.00 [ $ 43,255.00| $ 44,625.00
ESTIMATED TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS: $ 848.00 | $ 21,750.00 | $ 2,244.00 | $ 5,100.00
DELIVERY: Within Hours 2 Hours 24 Hours 24 Hours 24 Hours
MINIMUMS: 50 Tons 50 Tons 50 Tons 50 Tons
ALL OR NONE AWARD: Y or N N N N N
CONTACT INFORMATION
Hrs of Operation 7AM-6PM 6AM-4PM M-F | 8AM-4PM M-Sat 6AM-5PM

ATTEST:

24 Hr. Phone No.

INSURANCE Can Meet
Cannot Meet

PAYMENT TERMS:

EXCEPTIONS:

(586) 939-6200

(248) 634-8277

(586) 463-0545

(810) 602-1351

XX XX XX XX
N/A Net 30 Days Net 30 Net 30 Days
immediate delivery
Pricing firm 120 days No must be made to 2% Increase

non-weight
restricted facility

in option year

PROPOSAL: One-Year Requirements of Aggregates with an Option to Renew for
One (1) Additional Year

Julie Hamilton

Diane Fisher

Jeffrey Biegler

Marina Basta Farouk
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HIGHLIGHTED AREAS DENOTES LOW BIDDERS

Susan Leirstein CPPO CPPB

Purchasing Director




CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 11-06
Opening Date -- 3/22/11 BID TABULATION Pg 2 of 2
Date Reviewed -- 3/23/2011 AGGREGATES
VENDOR NAME: Edward C. Novak Osburn Tebben
Levy Co Construction Industries, Inc Brothers Ltd
EST PRICE/ PRICE/ PRICE/ PRICE/
ITEM | QTY/TONS [DESCRIPTION TON TON TON TON
Alt: 6A Natural at
$12.50/Ton
1. 500 6A SLAG $ 1393 | $ 1350 $ 1445 | $ 16.00
2. 1000 22A GRAVEL $ 970 | $ 925 % 10.00 | $ 11.50
3. 300 PEA STONE $ 1313 | $ 1149 | $ 1385 | % 15.50
4, 100 60/40 GRAVEL $ 1428 | $ 1225 | $ 1445 | $ 16.50
Alt: Class Il GR
5. 2500 FILL SAND $ 723 % 6.25| $ 7151 % 7.25
Alt: 3X1 BF
6. 100 CRUSHED CONCRETE, 1" - 3" $ 13931 $ 1050 | $ 1053 | $ 11.50
7. 100 CRUSHED CONCRETE, 3" - 6" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8. 250 CHLORIDE SAND No Bid $ 1495 | $ 2450 | $ 22.00
9. 100 2NS SAND $ 1003 | $ 895 | % 10.20 | $ 11.00
Alt: Mortar Sand
10. 100 MASON SAND $ 1202 $ 1027 | $ 1260 | $ 11.00
11. 100 LIMESTONE 1" - 3" $ 1950 | $ 1349 $ 1360 | $ 15.00
12. 50 LIMESTONE 3" - 6" No Bid $ 17.25 No Bid No Bid
13. 50 LIMESTONE 4" - 8" No Bid $ 1950 $ 1585 | $ 22.50
DISCOUNT IF AWARDED ALL ITEMS - 5% - -
$ 45,693.00
ESTIMATED TOTAL:| $ 45,655.00 | $ 46,193.00 | $ 52,310.50| $ 55,400.00
Alt: $43,408.35
ESTIMATED TOTAL W/DISCOUNT: - $ 43,883.35 - -
ESTIMATED TOTAL AWARDED ITEMS: $ 10,167.00 | $ 792.50
DELIVERY: W.ithin Hours 24 Hours 24 Hours 24 Hours 48 Hours
MINIMUMS: 50 Tons 50 Tons 50 Tons 50 Tons
ALL OR NONE AWARD: N N N N
CONTACT INFORMATION
Hrs of Operation 7AM-5PM M-F 7AM-5PM 8AM-5PM 7AM-10PM

INSURANCE Can Meet
Cannot Meet

PAYMENT TERMS:

EXCEPTIONS:

24 Hr. Phone No.
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(313) 429-5389

(810) 358-7977

(313) 363-0077

(248) 652-7188

XX XX XX XX
Net 30 Days 30 Days N/A Net 30 Days
Item 2: 22A Limestone
See Material Blank None Avail at add'l cost
Guides for Alt Train loads - if fuel over
Bids $5 price will increase
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