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CITY COUNCIL AGENDA ITEM 

 
 
Date:  February 26, 2019 
 
To:   Mark F. Miller, City Manager 
 
From:  MaryBeth Murz, Purchasing Manager 

Frank Nastasi, Chief of Police 
  Andrew Satterfield, Police Lieutenant 
      
Subject: Standard Purchasing Resolution 2 – Award to Low Bidder Meeting Specifications – 

Gun Holsters and Lights– Police Department 
 
 
 
History-  
• Troy Police Department is currently using the Black Hawk Level III Serpa Holster and Black 

Hawk Xiphos NTx Weapon mounted lights (180 lumens) for the Officer’s duty handguns.   
• Both pieces of equipment are approximately nine (9) years old.  
• The current holster has been the focus of studies that show issues of: 

o Inability to draw the weapon - when debris (dirt, snow, or mud) gets lodged in the safety 
release, the officer will not be able to draw the weapon out of the holster.  

o Accidental discharges - The safety release button is in line with the trigger finger which had 
been linked to accidental discharges when drawing the weapon.   

o Banned on Federal shooting ranges - Due to the above issues the holster has been banned 
on all federal ranges limiting training opportunities for Troy officers. 

• In an effort to maintain officer safety and protection of citizens; the Police Department is seeking to 
replace the current holster with the Safariland Model 7360 &TS ALS/SLA holster and replace the 
current weapon mounted light with the Surefire x300 (1000 Lumens). 

o The proposed holster will maintain weapon security while eliminating the issues of failure to 
draw malfunction and potential for accidental discharge.  

o The current weapon mounted light is showing its age and beginning to malfunction.    
o Better LED technology has drastically increased Lumen capability and battery life. 

 
Purchasing 
• On February 21, 2019; a bid opening was conducted as required by City Charter/Code and bid 

proposals were received at the City’s request from firms interested in providing Gun Holsters and 
Lights for the City of Troy Police Department.   

• Companies were notified via the Michigan Intergovernmental Trade Network (MITN); 
www.mitn.info.  One Hundred and Ninety four (194) vendors were notified via the MITN website.   
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CITY COUNCIL AGENDA ITEM 

 
Purchasing (continued) 
• Six (6) bid responses were received.  Below is a detailed summary of the vendor responses. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
• A detailed description of value, weapons specifications, and quantities are detailed in the attached 

bid summary.  
• The low bidder did not offer any warranty on the holsters and lights as specified.  Therefore, Vance 

Outdoors, Inc. of Columbus. OH is the low bidder meeting specifications with an estimated total of 
$36,402.85.  Vance Outdoors Inc. also has very favorable references. 

 
Financial 
Funds are budgeted and available in the General Fund under the Police Department 
Investigative/Administrative Services Emergency Response Preparedness, account number 
101.301.11.324.7740.010 for the 2019 fiscal year for the Holster and weapon light replacement.  
 
Recommendation 
City Management recommends awarding a contract to the low bidder meeting specifications; Vance 
Outdoors, Inc. of Columbus, OH, to supply the Police Department with the Gun Holsters and Lights 
for an estimated total amount of $36,402.85. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
G: /BidAward18-19StandardPurchasingResolution2-HolstersandLights-PD 

Companies notified via MITN 194 
Troy Companies notified via MITN 5 
Troy Companies notified Active email Notification 5 
Troy Companies - Active Free 0 
Companies that viewed the bid  22 
Troy Companies that viewed the bid 0 
 

MITN provides a resourceful online platform to streamline the 
procurement process, reduce costs, and make it easier and more 
transparent for vendors to do business with the City of Troy. 
Active MITN members with a current membership and paying annual 
dues receive automatic electronic notification which allows instant access 
to Bids, RFPS and Quote opportunities with the City.   
Active MITN non-paying members are responsible to monitor and check 
the MITN website for opportunities to do business with the City. 
Inactive MITN member status can occur when a company does not 
renew their account upon expiration.  Inactive members cannot be notified 
of solicitations or access any bid information. 
 



Opening Date: 2/21/2019 CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 19-05
Reviewed Date: 2/21/2019 BID TABULATION Page 1 of 2

GUN HOLSTERS & LIGHTS

Est. 
QTY Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

98 $102.17 $10,012.66 $100.55 $9,853.90 $109.00 $10,682.00

11 $102.17 $1,123.87 $100.55 $1,106.05 $109.00 $1,199.00

11 $102.17 $1,123.87 $100.55 $1,106.05 $109.00 $1,199.00

1 $102.17 $102.17 $100.55 $100.55 $109.00 $109.00

121 $187.59 $22,698.39 $200.30 $24,236.30 $197.30 $23,873.30

Lead Time
Warranty Y or N
Insurance Met: Y or N

Exceptions:

Y or N

Acknowledgement: Y or N
Forms: Y or N
References: Y or N

Vendor Name:
CITY: Las Vegas, NV

Y

N

Botach Inc.

Columbus, OH

PROPOSAL: FURNISH GUN HOLSTERS AND LIGHTS FOR THE CITY OF TROY POLICE DEPARTMENT.

30-60 Days

N

30-60 Days
Y

4-6 Weeks
Y

Acme Sports, Inc.

Seymour, IN

Vance Outdoors, Inc.

Y

N
Y

Y

Y
Will hold Safariland price 
till 3/31/2020. Will hold 

Surefire prices till 
12/31/2019.

Y
Y

Y
Y
Y

Y
Y

Surefire x300U-A
1,000 Lumens Led Handgun Light with T-Slot 
Mounting Rail

Grand Total: $35,060.96 $36,402.85 $37,062.30

Description

Right Handed Safariland Model 7360 7TS ALS/SLA 
Mid-Ride Level III Retention Duty Holster 
Part: 7360-832-481 
Pistol: Glock 17 Gen 5
Barrel Length: 4.5” Caliber: 9mm
Light: Surefire x300u Color: Black
Material: Safariseven 
Finish: Basket Weve
Left Handed Safariland Model 7360 7TS ALS/SLA 
Mid-Ride Level III Retention Duty Holster
Part: 7360-832-482
Pistol: Glock 17 Gen 5
Barrel Length: 4.5” Caliber: 9mm
Light: Surefire x300u Color: Black
Material: Safariseven
Finish: Basket Weve
Right Handed Safariland Model 7360 7TS ALS/SLA 
Mid-Ride Level III Retention Duty Holster 
Part: 7360-832-411 
Pistol: Glock 17 Gen 5
Barrel Length: 4.5” Caliber: 9mm
Light: Surefire x300u  Color: Black
Material: Safariseven 
Finish: Plain
Left Handed Safariland Model 7360 7TS ALS/SLA 
Mid-Ride Level III Retention Duty Holster 
Part: 7360-832-412
Pistol: Glock 17 Gen 5 Barrel Length: 4.5”
Caliber: 9mmColor Light: Surefire x300u 
Color: Black Material: Safari seven
Finish: Plain



Opening Date: 2/21/2019 CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 19-05

Reviewed Date: 2/21/2019 BID TABULATION Page 2 of 2

GUN HOLSTERS & LIGHTS

Est. 
QTY Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

98 $119.30 $11,691.40

11 $119.30 $1,312.30

11 $119.30 $1,312.30

1 $119.30 $119.30

121 $216.55 $26,202.55 201.48 $24,379.08

Lead Time
Warranty Y or N
Insurance Met: Y or N
Exceptions: Y or N
Acknowledgement: Y or N
Forms: Y or N
References: Y or N

ATTEST:
Sue Riesterer
Kristine Kallek 
Larysa Figol

MaryBeth Murz,
Purchasing Manager

Late Bid submitted.
Y Y

Y Y
Y Y

Y Y
N N

30-45 Days 30 Days
Y Y

Left Handed Safariland Model 7360 7TS ALS/SLA 
Mid-Ride Level III Retention Duty Holster 
Part: 7360-832-412
Pistol: Glock 17 Gen 5 Barrel Length: 4.5”
Caliber: 9mmColor Light: Surefire x300u 
Color: Black Material: Safari seven
Finish: Plain
Surefire x300U-A
1,000 Lumens Led Handgun Light with T-Slot 
Mounting Rail

Grand Total: $40,637.85 $24,379.08

No bid

PROPOSAL: FURNISH GUN HOLSTERS AND LIGHTS FOR THE CITY OF TROY POLICE DEPARTMENT.

Description
Right Handed Safariland Model 7360 7TS ALS/SLA 
Mid-Ride Level III Retention Duty Holster 
Part: 7360-832-481 
Pistol: Glock 17 Gen 5
Barrel Length: 4.5” Caliber: 9mm
Light: Surefire x300u Color: Black
Material: Safariseven 
Finish: Basket Weve
Left Handed Safariland Model 7360 7TS ALS/SLA 
Mid-Ride Level III Retention Duty Holster
Part: 7360-832-482
Pistol: Glock 17 Gen 5
Barrel Length: 4.5” Caliber: 9mm
Light: Surefire x300u Color: Black
Material: Safariseven
Fi i h  B k t WRight Handed Safariland Model 7360 7TS ALS/SLA 
Mid-Ride Level III Retention Duty Holster 
Part: 7360-832-411 
Pistol: Glock 17 Gen 5
Barrel Length: 4.5” Caliber: 9mm
Light: Surefire x300u  Color: Black
Material: Safariseven 
Finish: Plain

No bid

No bid

No bid

Vendor Name: CMP Distributors, Inc. Kiesler Police Supply, Inc. Dinges Fire Co.

CITY: Lansing, MI Jeffersonville, IN Pinckney, MI
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